Buyer Tom Morgan

2339 OF
Board of Education Lands

Opening Date: 02/05/08

1+ Arborchem Products

e Chemicals (Div of Asplundh) Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Grass Pad Inc.

— Description Qty |JUOM|Unit Cost| Ext. Cost | Unit Cost Ext. Cost [Unit Cost| Ext. Cost
1 |2,4-D Lv,4#, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 80 |[EA No Bid $ - $ 33.88|$ 2,71040|$% 37.95($ 3,036.00
2 |2,4-D Lv #6, 30 Gal Container Brand Names Only 14 |EA No Bid $ - $ 519.00($ 7,266.00 | $ 447.00 | $ 6,258.00
3 |Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 25 |EA No Bid $ - $ 4495 |1$ 1,123.75|% 48.02|$ 1,200.50
4 |Tordon 22k Or Generic, 1g Cont le: Outpost, Triumph 50 |[EA No Bid $ - $ 86.65|$ 4,332.50 | N/B $ -

5 |Tordon 22k Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Outpost, Triumph 40 |[EA No Bid $ - $ 16750 $ 6,700.00 | N/B $ -

6 |Overdrive, 7.5 Lb Container Mfg By Basf, No Sub 14 |EA |[$269.63|$3,77482|$ 316.73|$ 4,434.22 | N/B $ -

7 |Milestone, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Dow, No Sub 5 [EA | $74245|$3,71225|% 657.75($ 3,288.75 | N/B $ -

8 [Milestone, Quart Container Mfg By Dow, No Sub 8 [EA |$ 7457 |$ 59656 |$ 66.94 | $ 535.52 | N/B $ -

9 |Crossbow, 4x1 Cases Mfg By Dow, No Sub 10 |EA No Bid $ - $ 50.50 | $ 505.00 | N/B $ -
10 [Velpar L, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Dupont, No Sub 2 |EA [$14133|$ 28266 |$% 138.05|%$ 276.10 | N/B $ -
11 |Methylated Seed Oil, 2.5 G Ctr (MSO) 150 [EA $ 19.85|$2,977.50 | $ 2228 |$ 3,342.00|$ 29.70 [ $ 4,455.00
12 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Gal Cont le: Panoramic 5 [EA $ 200.00 [ $1,000.00 | $ 255.25|% 1,276.25 | N/B $ -
13 |Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 360 [EA No Bid $ - $ 55.40 [ $ 19,944.00 | N/B $ -
14 |Grazon P+D, 30 Gal Container le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 10 |EA No Bid $ - $ 664.80|$ 6,648.00 | N/B $ -
15 |[Plateau Or Generic, 1 Qt Cont le: Panoramic 16 |EA No Bid $ - $ 75.08 [$ 1,201.28 [ N/B $ -
16 [Cimarron, Available Container Mfg By Dupont 100 [OZ | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
17 |Cimarron, 2 Oz Container Mfg By Dupont 13 [EA | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
18 |Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 3 |EA | NoBid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
19 [Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 4 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 6205($% 248.20 | N/B $ -
20 |Metsulfuron Methyl, 2 Oz Ctr Total: 100 oz 50 [EA [$ 1564 |$ 782.00 [ N/A $ - N/B $ -
21 [Metsulfuron Methyl-Availbl Ctr Total: 100 oz 100 [OZ |$ 7.82|$ 782.00]|$ 750 | $ 750.00 | N/B $ -
22 |2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 80 |(EA No Bid $ - $ 33.88|$ 2,71040|$% 37.95($ 3,036.00
23 |2,4-D Lv #6, 30 Gal Container Brand Names Only 14 |EA No Bid $ - $ 519.00($ 7,266.00 | $ 447.00 | $ 6,258.00
24 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Pbi/Grdn--No Substitute 20 |EA | No Bid $ - $ 4495($ 899.00 | $ 48.02|$ 960.40
25 [Tordon 22k Or Generic, 1g Cont le: Outpost, Triumph 50 |EA [ NoBid $ - $ 86.65|% 4,332.50 | N/B $ -
26 [Tordon 22k Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Outpost, Triumph 40 |EA | No Bid $ - $ 167.50|$ 6,700.00 | N/B $ -
27 |Overdrive, 7.5 Lb Container Mfg By Basf 14 |EA |[$269.63|$3,77482|$ 316.73|$ 4,434.22 | N/B $ -
28 |Milestone, 2.5 Container Mfg By Dow 5 [EA | $74245|$3,71225|% 657.75($ 3,288.75 | N/B $ -
29 [Milestone, Quart Container Mfg By Dow 8 |EA [$ 7457 |% 59656 |$ 66949 535.52 | N/B $ -
30 [Crossbow, 1 Gal Container Mfg By Dow 10 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 5050($% 505.00 | N/B $ -
31 [Velpar L, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 5 gallons 2 |EA [$14133|$ 28266 |$% 138.05|$%$ 276.10 | N/B $ -
32 |Methylated Seed Oil, 2.5 G Ctr Total: 375 gallons 150 [EA $ 19.85|$2,977.50 | $ 2228 |$ 3,342.00|$ 29.70 [ $ 4,455.00
33 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Gal Cont le: Panoramic 5 [EA $ 200.00 [ $1,000.00 | $ 255.25|% 1,276.25 | N/B $ -
34 [Plateau Or Generic, 1 Qt Cont le: Panoramic 16 |EA No Bid $ - $ 75.08 [$ 1,201.28 | N/B $ -
35 [Cimarron, 2 Oz Container Mfg By Dupont 13 [EA | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
36 [Cimarron, Available Container Mfg By Dupont 100 [OZ | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
37 |Grazon P+D Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 360 [EA No Bid $ - $ 55.40 [ $ 19,944.00 | N/B $ -
38 [Grazon P+D Or Generic, 30g Cnt |le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 10 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 664.80|$% 6,648.00 | N/B $ -
39 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 3 |EA | NoBid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
40 |Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 5 |EA [ NoBid $ - $ 6205($% 310.25 | N/B $ -
41 |Metsulfuron Methyl-2 Oz Ctr. Total: 100 oz 50 |[EA |$ 1564 ($ 782.00 [ N/A $ - N/B $ -
42 |Metsulfuron Methyl-Availb Ctr. Total: 100 oz 100 [0z |$ 7.82|$ 782.00]|$ 750 | $ 750.00 | N/B $ -
43 |[Tordon 22k, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 |EA No Bid $ - $ 210.68|$ 3,370.88 | N/B $ -
44 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 4 |EA No Bid $ - $ 4495 | $ 17980 | $ 48.02|$ 192.08
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Buyer Tom Morgan

2339 OF
Board of Education Lands

Opening Date: 02/05/08

23 Arborchem Products
e Chemicals (Div of Asplundh) Creston Fertilizer Co. Inc. Grass Pad Inc.
= Description Qty [UOM| Unit Cost| Ext. Cost | Unit Cost Ext. Cost [Unit Cost| Ext. Cost
45 |Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 20 |EA [ NoBid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
46 |Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 34 |EA [ NoBid $ - $ 62.05|% 2,109.70 | N/B $ -
47 |Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA | NoBid $ - $ 167.50|$% 1,340.00 | N/B $ -
48 |Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 450 gallons 180 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 61.93|% 11,147.40 | N/B $ -
49 |2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 8 |EA | NoBid $ - $ 3388|% 27104 |$ 37.95|$% 303.60
50 [Triumph, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
51 [Tordon 22k, 1 &Or 2.5 Gal Ctr Total: 60 gallons 24 |EA [ NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
52 [Stinger, .25 &/Or .5 Gal Ctrs Total: 8 gallons 16 [EA | NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
53 [2.4-D Amine, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 8 |EA | NoBid $ - - $ - $ 3795|% 303.60
54 [Forefront R&P, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 10 gallons 4 |EA | NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
55 [Methylated Seed Qil, 1 Gal Ctr Total: 25 gallons 25 |EA [ NoBid $ - - $ - $ 1244 13% 311.00
56 [Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 100 gallons 40 |EA | NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
57 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 20 |EA [ NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
58 [Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 34 |EA [ NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
59 [Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA | NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
60 [Milestone, Quart Container Total: 5 quarts 5 |EA |$ 7457 |3$ 372.85] - $ - N/B $ -
61 [Glystar, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | NoBid $ - - $ - N/B $ -
62 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 4 |EA | NoBid $ - - $ - $ 48.02|3% 192.08
63 [Tordon 22k, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 21068 |$% 3,370.88 | N/B $ -
64 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 10 gallons 4 |EA | NoBid $ - $ 4495|3% 179.80 [$ 48.02|$ 192.08
65 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) Total: 1,000 Ib 20 |EA [ NoBid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
66 [Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) Total: 1,000 Ib 34 |EA [ NoBid $ - $ 6205|% 2,109.70 | N/B $ -
67 [Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA | NoBid $ - $ 167.50|$% 1,340.00 | N/B $ -
68 [Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 450 gallons 180 [EA | No Bid $ - $ 61.93|% 11,147.40 | N/B $ -
69 [2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA | NoBid $ - $ 3388|% 27104 |$ 37.95|$% 303.60
70 [Triumph, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | No Bid $ - N/A $ - N/B $ -
Payment Terms NA 0%, 45days 0%,30days
Delivery Days ARO 7 5 14
1. Wayne/Norfolk 5.
Outpost 22K 19. Rozol BBF
(RUP) 21. 8x80z 22. LV4lb.
40. Rozol BBF (RUP) 42.
8x80z 46. Rozol BBF 1. NuForm 2. NuForm
(RUP) 47. Outpost 22K
49.L.V4lb 66. Rozol BBF
(RUP) 67 Outpost 22K 69.
Comments LVv4ib
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Buyer Tom Morgan

2339 OF

Board of Education Lands

PARTIAL AWARD

Opening Date: 02/05/08

PARTIAL AWARD

H+

Q Chemicals UAP Distribution Van Diest Supply Co.
— Description Qty |UOM| Unit Cost | Ext. Cost | Unit Cost| Ext. Cost
1 |2,4-D Lv,4#, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 80 [EA [$ 34.10($ 2,728.001$ 3273 |$ 2,618.40
2 |2,4-D Lv #6, 30 Gal Container Brand Names Only 14 |EA |[$ 52470 ($ 7,345.80|$ 524.70 | $ 7,345.80
3 |Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 25 |[EA |[$ 43.10($ 107750]1$ 4198 |$ 1,049.50
4 |Tordon 22k Or Generic, 1g Cont le: Outpost, Triumph 50 [EA |$ 8450|$ 4,225.00]1$% 8219|% 4,109.50
5 [Tordon 22k Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Outpost, Triumph 40 [EA [$ 15405|% 6,162.00]$ 15493 | $ 6,197.20
6 |Overdrive, 7.5 Lb Container Mfg By Basf, No Sub 14 |EA |[$ 258.75|$ 3,62250]$ 265.05|$ 3,710.70
7 |Milestone, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Dow, No Sub 5 |EA [$ 678.75]|% 3,393.75]|$ 680.98 [ $ 3,404.90
8 [Milestone, Quart Container Mfg By Dow, No Sub 8 [EA [$ 70.00]%$ 560.00 | $ 69.29 |$ 554.32
9 |Crossbow, 4x1 Cases Mfg By Dow, No Sub 10 [EA |$ 19820 |$ 1,982.00]$ 193.08 |$ 1,930.80
10 [Velpar L, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Dupont, No Sub 2 |EA [$ 15810 % 31620 | $ 14073 |$ 281.46
11 |Methylated Seed Oil, 2.5 G Ctr (MSO) 150 [EA $ 2250|$% 3375.00]$ 2545|$% 3,817.50
12 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Gal Cont le: Panoramic 5 [EA $ 245.00|$% 1,22500]% 189.39 | $ 946.95
13 |Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 360 [EA $ 49.15|$% 1769400]$% 51.43|$ 18,514.80
14 |Grazon P+D, 30 Gal Container le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 10 |EA $ 58950|$% 5,89500]% 617.10 |$ 6,171.00
15 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Qt Cont le: Panoramic 16 [EA |$ 6200 $ 992.00|$ 5127 (9% 820.32
16 [Cimarron, Available Container Mfg By Dupont 100 [OZ |$ 856 |% 856.00|$ 647|$ 647.00
17 |[Cimarron, 2 Oz Container Mfg By Dupont 13 |[EA |$ 1850 (% 24050 |$ 30.38|$ 394.94
18 |Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 3 |[EA [$ 7250]|$% 217.50 | N/A $ S
19 |[Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 4 |[EA |$ 59.70|$ 238.80|$ 5384 |$% 215.36
20 [Metsulfuron Methyl, 2 Oz Ctr Total: 100 oz 50 |[EA |$ 1650 ($ 825.00]$ 1294 |$ 647.00
21 [Metsulfuron Methyl-Availbl Ctr Total: 100 oz 100 [OZ |$ 825|% 825.00]$ 647|$ 647.00
22 |2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 80 [EA |$ 3410($ 2,728.00]1% 32.73|$ 2,618.40
23 |2,4-D Lv #6, 30 Gal Container Brand Names Only 14 |EA | $ 52470 |$ 7,345.80]|$ 524.70 [ $ 7,345.80
24 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container Mfg By Pbi/Grdn--No Substitute 20 |[EA | $ 4310($ 86200 |$ 41.98|$ 839.60
25 [Tordon 22k Or Generic, 1g Cont le: Outpost, Triumph 50 |[EA | $ 8450 ($ 4,22500]1% 8219|$ 4,109.50
26 [Tordon 22k Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Outpost, Triumph 40 |EA | $ 15465|9% 6,186.00]| $ 15493 |$ 6,197.20
27 |Overdrive, 7.5 Lb Container Mfg By Basf 14 |EA | $ 258.75|$ 3,62250] % 265.05|$ 3,710.70
28 |Milestone, 2.5 Container Mfg By Dow 5 [EA |$ 67875 |% 3,393.75|$ 680.98 | $ 3,404.90
29 [Milestone, Quart Container Mfg By Dow 8 |EA |[$ 70.00]$%$ 560.00 | $ 69.29|$ 554.32
30 [Crossbow, 1 Gal Container Mfg By Dow 10 [EA | $ 4955 |% 49550 |$ 4827 [$ 48270
31 [Velpar L, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 5 gallons 2 |EA |$ 15810 % 316.20 | $ 140.73|$ 281.46
32 [Methylated Seed Oil, 2.5 G Ctr Total: 375 gallons 150 [EA | $ 2250|$ 3,375.00]$% 2545($ 3,817.50
33 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Gal Cont le: Panoramic 5 [EA |$ 24500 |$ 122500 % 189.39 | $ 946.95
34 |Plateau Or Generic, 1 Qt Cont le: Panoramic 16 |[EA |$ 62.00($% 992.00|$ 51.27|$ 820.32
35 [Cimarron, 2 Oz Container Mfg By Dupont 13 [EA | $ 1850 | $ 24050 | $ 30.38|$ 394.94
36 [Cimarron, Available Container Mfg By Dupont 100 [OZ |$ 856 |%$ 856.00]$ 6.47|$ 647.00
37 |Grazon P+D Or Generic, 2.5 Gal le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 360 [EA |$ 49.15|$ 17,694.00]1$ 51.43|$ 18,514.80
38 |Grazon P+D Or Generic, 30g Cnt [le: Gunslinger, Hired Hand Etc 10 |EA | $ 58950 |$ 5,895.00]% 617.10|$ 6,171.00
39 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 3 |[EA |$ 7250]|$% 217.50 | N/A $ -
40 |Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 5 |[EA |$ 59.70|$%$ 29850 |$ 53.84|$ 269.20
41 |Metsulfuron Methyl-2 Oz Ctr. Total: 100 oz 50 |[EA | $ 1650 ($ 825.00]$ 6.47|$ 32350
42 |Metsulfuron Methyl-Availb Ctr. Total: 100 oz 100 [OZ |$ 825|% 825.00]$ 6.47|$ 647.00
43 |Tordon 22k, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 |[EA | $ 206.15|$ 3,298.40|$ 15493 |$ 2,478.88
44 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 4 |[EA |$ 4310 ]| $ 17240 1$ 4198 | $ 167.92
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Buyer Tom Morgan

2339 OF

Board of Education Lands

Opening Date: 02/05/08

3+
e Chemicals UAP Distribution Van Diest Supply Co.
= Description Qty |UOM| Unit Cost | Ext. Cost | Unit Cost | Ext. Cost
45 |Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 20 |[EA |$ 7250 |$ 1,450.00 ] N/A $ -
46 |Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 34 |[EA |$ 59.70|$ 2,02980]% 53.84|% 1,830.56
47 |Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA |$ 15405($ 1,23240]$ 15493 [$ 1,239.44
48 |Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 450 gallons 180 [EA |$ 6140 |$ 11,052.00|$% 5143 |$ 09,257.40
49 |2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 8 |EA |$ 3410(9% 27280 1% 3273 |$ 261.84
50 [Triumph, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | $ 15405|$ 2,464.80|% 15493 |$ 2,478.88
51 [Tordon 22k, 1 &Or 2.5 Gal Ctr Total: 60 gallons 24 |[EA | $ 206.15|$ 4,947.60 ] N/A $ -
52 [Stinger, .25 &/Or .5 Gal Ctrs Total: 8 gallons 16 [EA | $ 41250 |$ 6,600.00 | N/A $ -
53 [2.4-D Amine, 2.5 Gal Container Brand Names Only 8 |EA |$ 2760 |9 220.80 | N/A $ -
54 [Forefront R&P, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 10 gallons 4 [EA |$ 100.65 | $ 402.60 | N/A $ -
55 [Methylated Seed Qil, 1 Gal Ctr Total: 25 gallons 25 |[EA |$ 9.00| 3% 225.00 | N/A $ -
56 [Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 100 gallons 40 |EA |$ 6140 ([$ 2,456.00 | N/A $ -
57 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) In 50 Lb Bags 20 |[EA |$ 7250 |$ 1,450.00 ] N/A $ -
58 [Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) In 30# Buckets/Pails 34 |[EA |$ 59.70|$ 2,029.80 ] N/A $ -
59 [Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA |$ 154.05|$ 1,232.40 | N/A $ -
60 [Milestone, Quart Container Total: 5 quarts 5 |[EA |$ 70.00($% 350.00 | N/A $ -
61 [Glystar, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | $ 72.00]|$ 1,152.00 | N/A $ -
62 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container No Substitute 4 [EA |$ 4310 $ 172.40 | N/A $ -
63 |[Tordon 22k, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | $ 206.15|$% 3,29840]% 15493 |$ 2,478.88
64 [Hi-Dep, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 10 gallons 4 [EA |$ 4310 $ 17240 1% 4198 1% 167.92
65 [Kaput D (For Prairie Dogs) Total: 1,000 Ib 20 |[EA |$ 7250 |$ 1,450.00 ] N/A $ -
66 [Rozol (For Prairie Dogs) Total: 1,000 Ib 34 |[EA |$ 59.70|$ 2,02980]% 53.84|% 1,830.56
67 |Picloram 22k, 2.5 Gal Contnr Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA |$ 15405|$ 1,23240|$ 15493 |$ 1,239.44
68 [Grazon P+D, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 450 gallons 180 [EA | $ 6140 |$ 11,052.00|$% 5143 |$ 09,257.40
69 [2,4-D Lv, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 20 gallons 8 |EA |$ 3410(9% 272801$ 3273 |$ 261.84
70 [Triumph, 2.5 Gal Container Total: 40 gallons 16 [EA | $ 15405|$% 2,464.80|% 15493 |$ 2,478.88

Payment Terms 0%,30days Net 30

Delivery Days ARO 7 7

See Bid Tab for Sisg el L oLl
o Packaging and
Substitutions "
substitions.
Comments
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