
Buyer: Rita Kucera 2314 OF
Games Parks

Opening Date:12/28/07

Description Qty U/M  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price 
1 44 pg Recy + 4 self cover 180 M  $   333.66  $ 60,058.80  $   187.00  $ 33,660.00  $   191.53  $ 34,475.40  $   162.14  $ 29,185.20  $   173.43  $ 31,217.40 
2 44 pg Virg + 4 self cover 180 M  $   330.51  $ 59,491.80  $   181.00  $ 32,580.00  $   191.53  $ 34,475.40  $   149.39  $ 26,890.20  $   170.29  $ 30,652.20 
3 44 pg Recy+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   362.65  $ 65,277.00  $   216.46  $ 38,962.80  $   221.66  $ 39,898.80  $   209.17  $ 37,650.60 
4 44 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   359.66  $ 64,738.80  $   216.46  $ 38,962.80  $   206.59  $ 37,186.20  $   205.61  $ 37,009.80 
5 48 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   365.48  $ 65,786.40  $   217.00  $ 39,060.00  $   209.86  $ 37,774.80  $   188.58  $ 33,944.40  $   195.84  $ 35,251.20 
6 48 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   362.06  $ 65,170.80  $   212.00  $ 38,160.00  $   209.86  $ 37,774.80  $   174.43  $ 31,397.40  $   192.39  $ 34,630.20 
7 48 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   371.45  $ 66,861.00  $   241.00  $ 43,380.00  $   216.46  $ 38,962.80  $   199.61  $ 35,929.80  $   206.10  $ 37,098.00 
8 48 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   368.21  $ 66,277.80  $   236.00  $ 42,480.00  $   216.46  $ 38,962.80  $   184.94  $ 33,289.20  $   202.40  $ 36,432.00 
9 52 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   387.26  $ 69,706.80  $   224.25  $ 40,365.00  $   211.33  $ 38,039.40  $   208.01  $ 37,441.80 

10 52 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   383.58  $ 69,044.40  $   224.25  $ 40,365.00  $   195.24  $ 35,143.20  $   204.31  $ 36,775.80 
11 52 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   408.66  $ 73,558.80  $   235.37  $ 42,366.60  $   235.11  $ 42,319.80  $   225.77  $ 40,638.60 
12 52 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   405.14  $ 72,925.20  $   235.37  $ 42,366.60  $   209.92  $ 37,785.60  $   221.26  $ 39,826.80 
13 56 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   423.98  $ 76,316.40  $   250.34  $ 45,061.20  $   215.81  $ 38,845.80  $   227.14  $ 40,885.20 
14 56 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   420.03  $ 75,605.40  $   250.34  $ 45,061.20  $   199.65  $ 35,937.00  $   223.14  $ 40,165.20 
15 56 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   430.44  $ 77,479.20  $   249.76  $ 44,956.80  $   246.17  $ 44,310.60  $   237.71  $ 42,787.80 
16 56 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   426.66  $ 76,798.80  $   249.76  $ 44,956.80  $   228.14  $ 41,065.20  $   233.45  $ 42,021.00 
17 60 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   433.27  $ 77,988.60  $   268.18  $ 48,272.40  $   239.86  $ 43,174.80  $   225.77  $ 40,638.60 
18 60 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M  $   429.07  $ 77,232.60  $   268.18  $ 48,272.40  $   222.28  $ 40,010.40  $   220.07  $ 39,612.60 
19 60 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   463.28  $ 83,390.40  $   275.85  $ 49,653.00  $   250.98  $ 45,176.40  $   257.08  $ 46,274.40 
20 60 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M  $   459.24  $ 82,663.20  $   275.85  $ 49,653.00  $   232.92  $ 41,925.60  $   252.52  $ 45,453.60 

AWARD

 McCormick-Armstrong 

60

 Jacob North Printing 

Net 30
30

Comments

Packaging:
Plastic Banding or 
Rubber Banding 

Available
Paper Banding Not 

Available

Orders:
Price is quoted for 

180,000 pieces. If lesser 
quanity is order, price is 

subject to change.
Packaging:

Option Pricing: Bundle in 
packs of 25 will cost .459 
per bundle. Appoximately 

7,200 bundles will be 
needed.

 Herald Printing Co. 

2%,10days
30

Printing Covers

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

 The Adwood Company 

Li
ne

 #  Action Printing 

Net 30
30-60

Net 30
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Buyer: Rita Kucera 2314 OF
Games Parks

Opening Date:12/28/07

Description Qty U/M
1 44 pg Recy + 4 self cover 180 M
2 44 pg Virg + 4 self cover 180 M
3 44 pg Recy+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M
4 44 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M
5 48 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M
6 48 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M
7 48 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M
8 48 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M
9 52 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M

10 52 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M
11 52 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M
12 52 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M
13 56 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M
14 56 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M
15 56 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M
16 56 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M
17 60 pg Recy + 4 pg self cover 180 M
18 60 pg Virg + 4 pg self cover 180 M
19 60 pg Recy+6pg Gatefold cover 180 M
20 60 pg Virg+6 pg Gatefold cover 180 M

Comments

Printing Covers

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

Li
ne

 #
 Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price  Unit Price  Ext. Price 

 No Bid  $   195.00  $ 35,100.00  $     296.53  $  53,375.40  $   380.00  $ 68,400.00 
 $   244.66  $ 44,038.80  $   195.00  $ 35,100.00  $     274.96  $  49,492.80  $   375.00  $ 67,500.00 

 No Bid  $   228.00  $ 41,040.00  $     330.45  $  59,481.00  $   406.00  $ 73,080.00 
 $   263.32  $ 47,397.60  $   228.00  $ 41,040.00  $     306.03  $  55,085.40  $   405.00  $ 72,900.00 

 No Bid  $   222.00  $ 39,960.00  $     334.63  $  60,233.40  $   413.00  $ 74,340.00 
 $   288.18  $ 51,872.40  $   222.00  $ 39,960.00  $     311.18  $  56,012.40  $   407.00  $ 73,260.00 

 No Bid  $   227.00  $ 40,860.00  $     327.05  $  58,869.00  $   401.00  $ 72,180.00 
 $   315.84  $ 56,851.20  $   227.00  $ 40,860.00  $     302.68  $  54,482.40  $   400.00  $ 72,000.00 

 No Bid  $   251.00  $ 45,180.00  $     353.34  $  63,601.20  $   458.00  $ 82,440.00 
 $   293.69  $ 52,864.20  $   251.00  $ 45,180.00  $     325.70  $  58,626.00  $   452.00  $ 81,360.00 

 No Bid  $   277.00  $ 49,860.00  $     359.22  $  64,659.60  $   433.00  $ 77,940.00 
 $   290.61  $ 52,309.80  $   277.00  $ 49,860.00  $     332.96  $  59,932.80  $   432.00  $ 77,760.00 

 No Bid  $   256.00  $ 46,080.00  $     391.12  $  70,401.60  $   453.00  $ 81,540.00 
 $   266.89  $ 48,040.20  $   256.00  $ 46,080.00  $     359.56  $  64,720.80  $   447.00  $ 80,460.00 

 No Bid  $   279.00  $ 50,220.00  $     377.81  $  68,005.80  $   477.00  $ 85,860.00 
 $   302.28  $ 54,410.40  $   279.00  $ 50,220.00  $     347.41  $  62,533.80  $   477.00  $ 85,860.00 

 No Bid  $   252.00  $ 45,360.00  $     385.00  $  69,300.00  $   485.00  $ 87,300.00 
 $   325.58  $ 58,604.40  $   252.00  $ 45,360.00  $     361.00  $  64,980.00  $   478.00  $ 86,040.00 

 No Bid  $   286.00  $ 51,480.00  $     415.27  $  74,748.60  $   472.00  $ 84,960.00 
 $   355.91  $ 64,063.80  $   286.00  $ 51,480.00  $     380.99  $  68,578.20  $   471.00  $ 84,780.00 

No Bid
Standard Register

 Your Preferred Printer 

60

Packaging:
Can do paper banding, 
Woul like to alternately 

use plastic strapping. It is 
more durable and cost 

effective.
Production:

Can deliver to trimmed 
size. Must use 4,8,12 

page Signatures 
depending on your page 

count.

 V.G Reed & Sons Inc. 

Net 30

Pre-Press Specifcations:
VGR will opt to provide 
roundtrip Airfare from 

Omaha NE to Louisville KY 
for up to 2 Game & Parks 

Employees + transportation 
to and from Louisville 

airport and Hotel in place of 
mileage

 Omaha Print 

Net 30
60

 Moore Wallace North 
America Inc. DBA 

RR Donnelley 

Net 30
30

Samples:
Samples upon request.
Materials and product 

Specifcations:
Virgin only

Pre-press Specifcations:
We will overnight live 
samples, and provide 
any other samples or 
references required.
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