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Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment Abatix Corp. .-Né)lrriaéggt?al Alamar Uniforms
Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Model Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext.Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price
1 [A-M7HD14A1C14DC1 |Self Contained Breathing Apparatus 21 MSA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,076.00 | $127,596.00
2 807588 Stealth Air Bottle, Spare 60 min 21 MSA $1,589.00 | $33,369.00 | $1,284.54 | $26,975.34 [ $1,496.00| $ 31,416.00
3 10024074 Clear Command Communications System 16 MSA $ 122.60|$ 1,961.60| $ 289.31| $ 4,628.96[ $ 325.00| $ 5,200.00
4 F111C0P211B023 |Orion Multigas Detector 12 MSA $1,615.00 | $19,380.00 | $1,804.69| $21,656.28 [ $2,081.00| $ 24,972.00
5 488543 Kwik-Draw Detector Tube Pumps 16 MSA $ 279.00| $ 4,464.00 $ 218.23| $ 3,491.68( $ 249.00| $ 3,984.00
6 804136 Ethanol Detector Tubes (Alcohol) box 16 MSA $ 4500 $ 720.00( $ 3550|$ 568.000 $ 42.00| $ 672.00
7 804132 Aromatic Hydrocarbon Detector Tubes (Benzene) box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 49.50| $ 792.00
8 497664 Hexan - 20 Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 3.95( $ 63.20| $ 4752| $ 760.32
9 803945 Hydrogen Cyanide HCN-2 Dector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 59.00|$ 944.00| $ 4.62| $ 73.92| $ 55.44| % 887.04
10 487343 Trichlorethan-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 42.00| $ 672.00
11 487341 Nitrogen Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 5055|$% 808.80|$ 395 $ 63.20| $ 4752| $ 760.32
12 803943 Carbon Monoxide Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 42.00| $ 672.00
13 804134 Triethylamin-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 49.50| $ 792.00
14 487333 Carbon Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 42.00| $ 672.00
15 803948 Hydrogen Chloride Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 59.00|$ 944.00| $ 4.62| $ 73.92| $ 55.44| % 887.04
16 804589 Ethyl Mercaptan Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 50.00|$ 800.00| $ 3.95| $ 63.20| $ 4750| $ 760.00
17 804428 Ethylen-50 Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 395 $ 63.20| $ 4750| $ 760.00
18 485680 Phosphine Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 45.00|$ 720.00| $ 353 $ 56.48| $ 42.00| $ 672.00
19 10007654 Phosphoric Esters Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 77.75|$ 1,244.00| $ 6.08] $ 97.28| $ 7250| $ 1,160.00
20 10007653 HD Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 77.75|$ 1,244.00]| $ 6.08] $ 97.28| $ 7250|$ 1,160.00
21 10007650 Lewisit Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 77.75|$ 1,244.00]| $ 6.08] $ 97.28[ $ 75.00| $ 1,200.00
22 10007652 HD HN Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 77.75|$ 1,244.00]| $ 6.08] $ 97.28| $ 75.00/ $ 1,200.00
23 10007651 Cyanogen Detector Tubes, box 16 MSA $ 77.75|$ 1,244.00]| $ 6.08] $ 97.28| $ 7250| $ 1,160.00
24 Te_ster #8020 Portacount Plus Respirator Fit Tester/Portable Printer 1 TSI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
/Printer #8930

25 990810 Level A Suit Tester 12 DuPont No Bid No Bid $ 875.03| $10,500.36 No Bid No Bid

26 RS562TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated LG $ 3562|$ 997.36| $ 558.88| $15,648.64 No Bid No Bid

27 RS562TXL Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 28 XLG DuPont $ 1820 $ 509.60| $ 558.88| $15,648.64 No Bid No Bid

28 RS562T2X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 2XL $ 19.10|$ 534.80| $ 592.42| $16,587.76 No Bid No Bid

29 RS562T3X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 3XL $ 20.06|$ 561.68| $ 627.96| $17,582.88 No Bid No Bid

30 RS563TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulating LG $ 18.20|$ 819.00| $ 558.88| $25,149.60 No Bid No Bid

31 RS563TXL Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 25 XLG DuPont $ 18.20|$ 819.00| $ 558.88| $25,149.60 No Bid No Bid

32 RS563T2X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 2XL $ 11.89|$ 535.05| $ 592.42| $26,658.90 No Bid No Bid

33 RS563T3X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 3XL $ 2060|$ 927.00| $ 627.96| $28,258.20 No Bid No Bid

34 RS587S2X Level A Training Suit 9 | 2XL $ 1272|$ 114.48| $ 108.42|$ 975.78] No Bid No Bid

35 RS587S3X Level A Training Suit 2 | 3XL DuPont $ 6060|$ 121.20| $ 11493|$ 229.86 No Bid No Bid

36 RS587S4X Level A Training Suit 1 | 4XL No Bid No Bid NOt NOt No Bid No Bid

Available [ Available

37 C4528TLG CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit LG $ 20.05| $ 641.60] $ 607.39| $19,436.48 No Bid No Bid

38 C4528TXL CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 32 XLG DuPont $ 20.05| $ 641.60] $ 607.39| $19,436.48 No Bid No Bid

39 C4528T2X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 2XL $ 2124 $ 679.68] $ 643.81| $20,601.92 No Bid No Bid

40 C4528T3X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 3XL $ 2250| $ 720.00] $ 682.44| $21,838.08 No Bid No Bid

41 C4168TLG CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated LG $ 17.45| $ 279.20| $ 271.64| $ 4,346.24 No Bid No Bid
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid

Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
. . Airgas, Inc .
Emergency Response Equipment Abatix Corp. _North Central Alamar Uniforms

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Model Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price
42 C4168TXL CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 16 XLG DuPont $ 1745|$ 279.20| $ 271.64| $ 4,346.24 No Bid No Bid
43 C4168T2X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 2XL $ 1830|$ 292.80| $ 287.94| $ 4,607.04 No Bid No Bid
44 C4168T3X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 3XL $ 1925|$ 308.00] $ 305.22| $ 4,883.52 No Bid No Bid
45 99600 Personnel Cooling Vest w/spare cool pack set 28 DuPont | $ 510/ $ 142.80| $ 149.58| $ 4,188.24| No Bid No Bid

46 996030 Cool Pack set 50 DuPont | $ 240/ $ 120.00| $ 126.44| $ 6,322.00 No Bid No Bid

47 RS528TLG Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit LG $ 530/ $ 222.60| $ 218.39| $ 9,172.38] No Bid No Bid

48 RS528TXL Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit a2 XLG DuPont $ 530/ $ 222.60| $ 218.39| $ 9,172.38] No Bid No Bid

49 RS528T2X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 2XL $ 5,50/ $ 231.00| $ 231.53| $ 9,724.26] No Bid No Bid

50 RS528T3X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 3XL $ 555 $ 233.10| $ 245.38| $10,305.96 No Bid No Bid

51 RS127T8A-LG Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit LG $ 4.55( $ 7280 $ 76.05|$ 1,216.80] NoBid No Bid
52 RS127T8A-XL Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 16 XLG DuPont $ 4.55( $ 7280 $ 76.05|$ 1,216.80] NoBid No Bid
53 RS127T8A-2X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 2XL $ 4.75( $ 76.00] $ 79.55|$ 1,272.80| NoBid No Bid
54 RS127T8A-3X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 3XL $ 4.95( $ 79.20| $ 83.26| $ 1,332.16] NoBid No Bid

55 428800-30 Chemical Agent Detection 1 APD2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

56 M245A1 Chemical Agent Detectors 12 M256 Kits No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

57 M256A1 Chemical Training Kits 12 M256 Kits No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

58 TK555TLG-Butyl |1 7ot mEVET R SH THEATa IeTgs T iee LG $ 3415($ 546.40( $ 609.27| $ 9,748.32| No Bid No Bid

59 TK555TXL-Butyl [ 0 oo DOVETY ST SR Targs Visw 19bE XLG $ 3415[$ 546.40( $ 609.27| $ 9,748.32] No Bid No Bid
60 TK555T2X-Butyl |7 0 o EETETA SHE TEA G IAgE VR AR 16 | 2XL | DuPont | $ 36.10| $ 577.60] $ 645.83| $10,333.28| No Bid No Bid
61 TK555T3X-Butyl [ o oo DOVET ST SR Targ s VIsw 19bE 3XL $ 3820($ 611.20[ $ 684.58| $10,953.28| No Bid No Bid

62 TK555T4X-Butyl |1 0 oo EETETA S TEAT G A VR e 4XL $ 41.32($ 66112 $ 739.35| $11,829.60| No Bid No Bid
63 TK122TLG TK Level B Coverall Suit LG $ 330 $ 11550| $ 120.64| $ 4,222.40 No Bid No Bid

64 TK122TXL TK Level B Coverall Suit XLG $ 330 $ 11550| $ 120.64| $ 4,222.40 No Bid No Bid

65 TK122T2X TK Level B Coverall Suit 35| 2XL | DuPont | $ 350/ $ 12250| $ 127.88| $ 4,475.80 No Bid No Bid

66 TK122T3X TK Level B Coverall Suit 3XL $ 3.70| $ 129.50| $ 135.55| $ 4,744.25 No Bid No Bid

67 TK122T4X TK Level B Coverall Suit 4AXL $ 4.00( $ 140.00( $ 146.39( $ 5,123.65 No Bid No Bid

68 D1568SXL Training Suit 3 | XLG No Bid No Bid Disc Item | Disc ltem No Bid No Bid

69 D1568S2X Training Suit 3 | 2XL | DuPont No Bid No Bid Disc Item | Disc ltem No Bid No Bid

70 D1568S3X Training Suit 9 | 3XL No Bid No Bid Disc Item | Disc ltem No Bid No Bid

71 3CF-14534 Hazard Categorization Kit (Lab Safety) 12 HAZCAT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

77-PDS-20-B System |Emergency Decon Shelter 10'x18' includes part #: 3517, . . . . . .

2 Part #9202 5709, 9906, 9908, 5718, 9922, 9920, 5201, 9909 4 Zumro | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 494450 Isobutylene Calibration Gas* 6 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 11854|$ 711.24| $ 13850| $ 831.00
74 711060 Hydrogen Sulfide Calibration Gas* 8 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 11854|$ 948.32| $ 138.50| $ 1,108.00
75 711088 Phosphine Calibration Gas* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 23348| % 2,801.76] $ 273.00| $ 3,276.00
76 ALl'i;LSI;IgllLi(S)-ZZS Sirius PID Multigas Detector* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,546.00 | $ 42,552.00
77 B-60141-036 CBRN PAPR w/o Facepiece* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 537.85|$ 3,227.10| $ 654.00| $ 7,848.00
78 10072240 MSA Accountability System Base Station Kit* 4 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 91461|$ 7,316.88]| $1,089.00| $ 4,356.00
79 10058545 M7 Accountability ID Tag* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 37.02|$ 44424 $ 4200]| $ 504.00
80 10058539 M7 Control Module Reader/M7 Tag Writer* 4 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 23565| % 2,827.80] $ 269.00] $ 1,076.00

Page 2 OF 15




Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
. . Airgas, Inc .
Emergency Response Equipment Abatix Corp. _North Central Alamar Uniforms
Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Model Unit Price| Ext. Price | Unit Price| Ext.Price | Unit Price| Ext. Price
81 B-20090-001 Recharger for CBRN PAPR* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 10757|$ 1,290.84| $ 135.00| $ 1,620.00
82 S20036 Recharger Battery for CBRN PAPR* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 87.27|$ 349.08] $ 112.75|$ 1,353.00
83 B-30030-001 Recharge Battery Cap* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 1015|$ 12180( $ 1365| $ 163.80
84 B-10079-001 Carrying Case for CBRN PAPR* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 4398|$ 17592( $ 57.00| $ 684.00
85 S-30019 Web Belt for CBRN PAPR* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 2537|$% 30444($ 3150| $ 378.00
86 633638 CASE:ABS,BLK,18-1/2"LX15-1/4"WX6-7/8"D for Sirius* 12 MSA No Bid No Bid $ 16139 $ 1,936.68| $ 190.00| $ 2,280.00
Payment Terms Net 10 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 45 14 30-60
Lines 7-23 are sold in
multiples of 10 .
. . Line 83 has part no.
Comments Lines 37-44 are sold in B-30060-001
cases of 6
Line 46 sold in Pkg of 52
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Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment Conégjir;trilei?fety Bd M. Feld IIrE]g.umment Co. Elvin Safety Supplyn Inc.
Item Part Number Description Zst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
1 [A-M7HD14A1C14DC1 |Self Contained Breathing Apparatus 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 6,423.00| $134,883.00
2 807588 Stealth Air Bottle, Spare 60 min 21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,464.00( $ 30,744.00
3 10024074 Clear Command Communications System 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 333.00{ $ 5,328.00
4 F111C0OP211B023 |Orion Multigas Detector 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,037.64| $ 24,451.68
5 488543 Kwik-Draw Detector Tube Pumps 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 263.00 $ 4,208.00
6 804136 Ethanol Detector Tubes (Alcohol) box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.00 $ 672.00
7 804132 Aromatic Hydrocarbon Detector Tubes (Benzene) box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.00| $ 784.00
8 497664 Hexan - 20 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 48.00| $ 768.00
9 803945 Hydrogen Cyanide HCN-2 Dector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 55.00( $ 880.00
10 487343 Trichlorethan-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.00| $ 672.00
11 487341 Nitrogen Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 48.00| $ 768.00
12 803943 Carbon Monoxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.00| $ 672.00
13 804134 Triethylamin-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 50.00( $ 800.00
14 487333 Carbon Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.00| $ 672.00
15 803948 Hydrogen Chloride Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 56.00( $ 896.00
16 804589 Ethyl Mercaptan Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 48.00| $ 768.00
17 804428 Ethylen-50 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 48.00| $ 768.00
18 485680 Phosphine Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 42.00| $ 672.00
19 10007654 Phosphoric Esters Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 73.00| $ 1,168.00
20 10007653 HD Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 73.00| $ 1,168.00
21 10007650 Lewisit Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 76.00] $ 1,216.00
22 10007652 HD HN Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 76.00] $ 1,216.00
23 10007651 Cyanogen Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 73.00| $ 1,168.00
24 Te_ster #8020 Portacount Plus Respirator Fit Tester/Portable Printer 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
/Printer #8930

25 990810 Level A Suit Tester 12 $ 1,176.50| $14,118.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1,007.00( $ 12,084.00
26 RS562TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated LG | $ 458.28| $12,831.84 No Bid No Bid $ 555.00( $ 15,540.00
27 RS562TXL Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 28 XLG | $ 458.28( $12,831.84 No Bid No Bid $ 555.00( $ 15,540.00
28 RS562T2X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 2XL [ $ 504.11| $14,115.08 No Bid No Bid $ 583.00( $ 16,324.00
29 RS562T3X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 3XL | $ 504.11| $14,115.08 No Bid No Bid $ 612.00( $ 17,136.00
30 RS563TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulating LG | $ 459.28| $20,667.60 No Bid No Bid $ 555.00( $ 24,975.00
31 RS563TXL Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 25 XLG | $ 495.29( $22,288.05 No Bid No Bid $ 555.00( $ 24,975.00
32 RS563T2X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 2XL [ $ 505.29| $22,738.05 No Bid No Bid $ 583.00( $ 26,235.00
33 RS563T3X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 3XL | $ 505.20( $22,734.00 No Bid No Bid $ 612.00( $ 27,540.00
34 RS587S2X Level A Training Suit 9 [2XL | $ 13524 $ 1,217.16 No Bid No Bid $ 124.00| $ 1,116.00
35 RS587S3X Level A Training Suit 2 [ 3XL | $ 13524 $ 270.48 No Bid No Bid $ 132.00( $ 264.00
36 RS587S4X Level A Training Suit 1 |4XL|$ 14138 $ 141.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 C4528TLG CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit LG | $ 521.11| $16,675.52 No Bid No Bid $ 699.00| $ 22,368.00
38 C4528TXL CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 32 XLG | $ 521.11| $16,675.52 No Bid No Bid $ 699.00| $ 22,368.00
39 C4528T2X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 573.23| $18,343.36 No Bid No Bid $ 741.00| $ 23,712.00
40 C4528T3X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 573.23[ $18,343.36 No Bid No Bid $ 785.00] $ 25,120.00
41 C4168TLG CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated LG | $ 295.89| $ 4,734.24 No Bid No Bid $ 304.00] $ 4,864.00

Page 4 OF 15



Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment Conégfigtglei?fety Bd M. Feld IIrE]gwpment co. Elvin Safety Supplyn Inc.
Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
42 C4168TXL CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 16 XLG [ $ 29589| $ 4,734.24 No Bid No Bid $ 304.00 $ 4,864.00
43 C4168T2X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 2XL | $ 325.48( $ 5,207.68 No Bid No Bid $ 319.00{ $ 5,104.00
44 C4168T3X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 3XL [ $ 325.48[ $ 5,207.68 No Bid No Bid $ 325.00({ $ 5,200.00
45 99600 Personnel Cooling Vest w/spare cool pack set 28 $ 15578 $ 4,361.84 No Bid No Bid $ 154.00( $ 4,312.00
46 996030 Cool Pack set 50 $ 155.78[ $ 7,789.00 No Bid No Bid $ 131.00({ $ 6,550.00
47 RS528TLG Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit LG | $ 158.83| $ 6,670.86 No Bid No Bid $ 242.00( $ 10,164.00
48 RS528TXL Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit a2 XLG|$ 158.83| $ 6,670.86 No Bid No Bid $ 242.00( $ 10,164.00
49 RS528T2X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 174.71| $ 7,337.82 No Bid No Bid $ 250.00({ $ 10,500.00
50 RS528T3X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 17471 $ 7,337.82 No Bid No Bid $ 253.00({ $ 10,626.00
51 RS127T8A-LG Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit LG | $ 242.86|$ 3,885.76 No Bid No Bid $ 79.00] $ 1,264.00
52 RS127T8A-XL Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 16 XLG|$ 242.86|$ 3,885.76 No Bid No Bid $ 79.00] $ 1,264.00
53 RS127T8A-2X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 267.15| $ 4,274.40 No Bid No Bid $ 82.00] $ 1,312.00
54 RS127T8A-3X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 267.15( $ 4,274.40 No Bid No Bid $ 86.00| $ 1,376.00
55 428800-30 Chemical Agent Detection 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 M245A1 Chemical Agent Detectors 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 M256A1 Chemical Training Kits 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 TK555TLG-Butyl |1 7ot mEvEn i SHE TIEAT e IeTgs T iee LG | $ 459.29| $ 7,348.64] No Bid No Bid $ 595.00[ $ 9,520.00
59 TK555TXL-Butyl [ 0 oo DOVETY ST SR Targs Visw 19bE XLG | $ 459.29| $ 7,348.64] No Bid No Bid $ 595.00[ $ 9,520.00
60 TK555T2X-Butyl |7 0 oo EETETA S TEA G I VR AR 16 | 2XL | $ 505.20] $ 8,083.20] No Bid No Bid $ 630.00] $ 10,080.00
61 TK555T3X-Butyl [ o oo DOVET ST ISR Targs VIsw 19bE 3XL | $ 505.20] $ 8,083.20| No Bid No Bid $ 665.00] $ 10,640.00
62 TK555T4X-Butyl |1 0 oo EETETA S TEAT G Mg VR e 4AXL | $ 528.17| $ 8,450.72| No Bid No Bid $ 721.00[ $ 11,536.00
63 TK122TLG TK Level B Coverall Suit LG [$ 242.86| $ 8,500.10 No Bid No Bid $ 124.00( $ 4,340.00
64 TK122TXL TK Level B Coverall Suit XLG [ $ 242.86( $ 8,500.10 No Bid No Bid $ 124.00( $ 4,340.00
65 TK122T2X TK Level B Coverall Suit 35| 2XL | $ 267.15[ $ 9,350.25 No Bid No Bid $ 132.00({ $ 4,620.00
66 TK122T3X TK Level B Coverall Suit 3XL [ $ 267.15( $ 9,350.25 No Bid No Bid $ 140.00({ $ 4,900.00
67 TK122T4X TK Level B Coverall Suit AXL [$—279-29{-$9,745:15] No Bid No Bid $ 168.00f $ 5,880.00
68 D1568SXL Training Suit 3 | XLG|$ 99838 $ 299.64| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 D1568S2X Training Suit 3 | 2XL | $ 109.87($ 329.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 D1568S3X Training Suit 9 | 3XL | $ 109.87|$ 988.83] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 3CF-14534 Hazard Categorization Kit (Lab Safety) 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77-PDS-20-B System |Emergency Decon Shelter 10'x18' includes part #: 3517, . . . .
2 Part #9202 5709, 9906, 9908, 5718, 9922, 9920, 5201, 9909 4 No Bid NoBid | $20,539.00| $246,468.00| No Bid No Bid
73 494450 Isobutylene Calibration Gas* 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 161.00( $ 483.00
74 711060 Hydrogen Sulfide Calibration Gas* 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 161.00( $ 1,449.00
75 711088 Phosphine Calibration Gas* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 293.00({ $ 3,516.00
A-SIRIUS- - . . . . . .

76 AL111BO11022S Sirius PID Multigas Detector 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3,229.00( $ 12,916.00
77 B-60141-036 CBRN PAPR w/o Facepiece* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 601.00{ $ 3,606.00
78 10072240 MSA Accountability System Base Station Kit* 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,022.00{ $ 8,176.00
79 10058545 M7 Accountability ID Tag* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 41.00( $ 492.00
80 10058539 M7 Control Module Reader/M7 Tag Writer* 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 263.000 $ 3,156.00
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Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
. Continental Safety Ed M. Feld Equipment Co. .
Emergency Response Equipment Equipment Inc. Elvin Safety Supplyn Inc.
Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
81 B-20090-001 Recharger for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 111.00( $ 1,332.00
82 S20036 Recharger Battery for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 98.00( $ 392.00
83 B-30030-001 Recharge Battery Cap* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 11.00| $ 132.00
84 B-10079-001 Carrying Case for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 49.00| $ 196.00
85 S-30019 Web Belt for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 28.00( $ 336.00
86 633638 CASE:ABS,BLK,18-1/2"LX15-1/4"WX6-7/8"D for Sirius* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 180.001 $ 2,160.00
Payment Terms 30 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 6-8weeks 50-85 14

Line 4 New part number
1111COP211B023
Line 36 Not available in 4X
per Mfg
Line 68-70 Discontinued
per Mfg.

Comments
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid
All Agencies

Opening Date: 02/06/08

Emergency Response Equipment

Fisher Scientific Co

Global Protection

Hunt Cleaners Inc.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 [A-M7HD14A1C14DC1 |Self Contained Breathing Apparatus 21 $ 6,499.06| $136,480.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 807588 Stealth Air Bottle, Spare 60 min 21 $ 1,421.99| $ 29,861.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 10024074 Clear Command Communications System 16 $ 323.33] $ 5,173.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 F111C0P211B023 |Orion Multigas Detector 12 $ 1,978.29( $ 23,739.48 No Bid No Bid $ 1,912.18| $ 22,946.16

5 488543 Kwik-Draw Detector Tube Pumps 16 $ 255.59| $ 4,089.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 804136 Ethanol Detector Tubes (Alcohol) box 16 $ 42.93| $ 686.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 804132 Aromatic Hydrocarbon Detector Tubes (Benzene) box 16 $ 50.37| $ 805.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 497664 Hexan - 20 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 48.29| $ 772.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 803945 Hydrogen Cyanide HCN-2 Dector Tubes, box 16 $ 56.34| $ 901.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 487343 Trichlorethan-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.93| $ 686.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 487341 Nitrogen Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 48.29| $ 772.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 803943 Carbon Monoxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.93| $ 686.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 804134 Triethylamin-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 50.37| $ 805.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 487333 Carbon Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.93| $ 686.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 803948 Hydrogen Chloride Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 56.34| $ 901.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 804589 Ethyl Mercaptan Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 48.29| $ 772.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 804428 Ethylen-50 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 48.29| $ 772.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 485680 Phosphine Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.93| $ 686.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 10007654 Phosphoric Esters Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.78| $ 1,180.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 10007653 HD Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.78| $ 1,180.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 10007650 Lewisit Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 77.20| $ 1,235.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 10007652 HD HN Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 77.20| $ 1,235.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 10007651 Cyanogen Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.78| $ 1,180.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 /;fis;grﬁ%";% Portacount Plus Respirator Fit Tester/Portable Printer 1 $ 9,393.71| $ 939371 $ 9,380.68| $  9,380.68| No Bid No Bid

25 990810 Level A Suit Tester 12 $ 087.76[ $ 11,853.12| $ 944.65| $ 11,335.80| $ 924.00 $ 11,088.00
26 RS562TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated LG | $ 624.64| $ 17,489.92($ 603.34| $ 16,893.52| $ 504.50| $ 14,126.00
27 RS562TXL Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 28 XLG | $ 62464 $ 17,489.92| $ 603.34| $ 16,893.52| $ 504.50| $ 14,126.00
28 RS562T2X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 2XL [ $ 66211 $ 18,539.08| $ 639.53| $ 17,906.84| $ 529.73| $ 14,832.44
29 RS562T3X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 3XL | $ 701.85| $ 19,651.80| $ 677.92( $ 18,981.76| $ 556.22| $ 15,574.16
30 RS563TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulating LG | $ 624.64| $ 28,108.80( $ 603.34| $ 27,150.30( $ 504.50( $ 22,702.50
31 RS563TXL Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 25 XLG | $ 624.64( $ 28,108.80| $ 603.34| $ 27,150.30( $ 504.50( $ 22,702.50
32 RS563T2X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 2XL [ $ 66211 $ 29,79495| $ 639.53| $ 28,778.85[ $ 529.73| $ 23,837.85
33 RS563T3X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 3XL | $ 701.85| $ 31,583.25| $ 677.92( $ 30,506.40( $ 556.22| $ 25,029.90
34 RS587S2X Level A Training Suit 9 | 2XL | $ 121.18[ $ 1,09062| $ 117.05| $ 1,053.45( $ 126.50| $ 1,138.50
35 RS587S3X Level A Training Suit 2 | 3XL | $ 12845($ 256.90| $ 124.07| $ 248.14| $ 13283 $ 265.66
36 RS587S4X Level A Training Suit 1 | 4XL No Bid No Bid $ 133.07| $ 133.07( $ 146.44| $ 146.44
37 C4528TLG CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit LG | $ 113.14| $ 3,620.48| $ 109.28| $ 3,496.96| $ 11237| $ 3,595.84
38 C4528TXL CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 32 XLG | $ 113.14| $ 3,620.48| $ 109.28| $ 3,496.96| $ 11237| $ 3,595.84
39 C4528T2X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 119.93| $ 3,837.76| $ 115.84| $ 3,706.88| $ 117.93| $ 3,773.76
40 C4528T3X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 127.12]| $ 4,067.84| $ 122.78| $ 3,928.96| $ 126.08] $ 4,034.56
41 C4168TLG CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated LG | $ 51.11]| $ 817.76| $ 48.88| $ 782.08| $ 46.65| $ 746.40

Page 7 OF 15




Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid
All Agencies

Opening Date: 02/06/08

Emergency Response Equipment

Fisher Scientific Co

Global Protection

Hunt Cleaners Inc.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

42 C4168TXL CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 16 XLG | $ 51.11] $ 817.76| $ 48.88( $ 782.08( $ 46.65| $ 746.40
43 C4168T2X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 2XL | $ 53.64| $ 858.24| $ 5181 $ 828.96( $ 48.98| $ 783.68
44 C4168T3X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 3XL [ $ 56.86| $ 909.76| $ 54.92| $ 878.72( $ 5144 $ 823.04
45 99600 Personnel Cooling Vest w/spare cool pack set 28 $ 28.14| $ 78792 $ 16148 $ 4521.44| ¢ 11435| $ 3,201.80
46 996030 Cool Pack set 50 $ 35.33[ $ 1,766.50| $ 136.50| $ 6,825.00| $ 91.28]| $ 4,564.00
47 RS528TLG Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit LG | $ 244.08| $ 10,251.36( $ 235.76| $ 9,901.92| $ 158.86| $ 6,672.12
48 RS528TXL Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 42 XLG [ $ 244.08] $ 10,251.36| $ 235.76| $ 9,901.92| $ 158.86| $ 6,672.12
49 RS528T2X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 2XL | $ 258.73[ $ 10,866.66( $ 24991 $ 10,496.22| $ 166.80| $ 7,005.60
50 RS528T3X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 3XL [$ 27455| $ 11,531.10]| $ 264.90| $ 11,125.80| $ 175.14( $ 7,355.88
51 RS127T8A-LG Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit LG | $ 85.000 $ 1,360.00| $ 82.10( $ 1,313.60[ $ 73.17] $ 1,170.72
52 RS127T8A-XL Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 16 XLG | $ 85.000 $ 1,360.00| $ 82.10( $ 1,313.60[ $ 73.17] $ 1,170.72
53 RS127T8A-2X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 88.91| $ 142256 $ 85.88( $ 1,374.08[ $ 76.83] $ 1,229.28
54 RS127T8A-3X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 93.06| $ 1,488.96| $ 89.89( $ 1,438.24( $ 80.67| $ 1,290.72
55 428800-30 Chemical Agent Detection 1 No Bid No Bid $10,909.09( $ 10,909.09 No Bid No Bid

56 M245A1 Chemical Agent Detectors 12 No Bid No Bid $ 260.18| $ 260.18 No Bid No Bid

57 M256A1 Chemical Training Kits 12 $ 653.59| $ 7,843.08( $ 639.48| $ 639.48 No Bid No Bid

58 TK555TLG-Butyl [ 7 o et BETE A SHiE VTEAR S IETgs VIETT 19= LG |$ 673.03] $ 10,768.48| $ 657.74[ $ 10523.84]| $ 540.54]| $ 8,648.64
59 TKEE5TXL-Butyl | S OTTTeeT CEVET 74 ST WAl T ger VIew Tace XLG | §  673.03] § 10,768.48] § _657.74] $ _ 10.523.84] $_540.54] $ 8.648.64
60 TK555T2X-ButyI R UTTTATTeT CE VT A S WISATA TG VI e 16 [2XL [§  713.42] $ 11414.72| $_697.20] § _ 11.15520] $_567.57| $ 9.081.12
61 TK555T3X-But§I PRUGmTETIeT TeveT A ST WreAT e g view Terte 3XL | $ 756.22 $ 12.099.52 $ 739.03 $ 11.824.48 $ 595.95 $ 9.535.20
62 TK555T4X-Butyl |1 0 oo EETET S TR Mg VR e 4XL | $ 816.72| $ 13,067.52[ $ 798.16|$ 12,77056| $ 625.75| $ 10,012.00
63 TK122TLG TK Level B Coverall Suit LG [ $ 67.30{ $ 2,355.50( $ 65.11| $ 2,278.85| $ 65.46| $ 2,291.10
64 TK122TXL TK Level B Coverall Suit XLG | $ 67.30{ $ 2,355.50( $ 65.11| $ 2,278.85| $ 65.46| $ 2,291.10
65 TK122T2X TK Level B Coverall Suit 35 [ 2XL | $ 67.30{ $ 2,355.50( $ 69.02| $ 2,415.70| $ 68.74] $ 2,405.90
66 TK122T3X TK Level B Coverall Suit 3XL [ $ 7487 $ 2,62045( $ 73.17| $ 2,560.95| $ 72.17] $ 2,525.95
67 TK122T4X TK Level B Coverall Suit AXL | $ 80.86] $ 2,830.10| $ 79.02| $ 2,765.70| $ 75.78| $ 2,652.30
68 D1568SXL Training Suit 3 | xLG| NoBid No Bid NoSuch | NoSuchPart | ¢ g5l ¢ 20.40

Part No. No.

69 D156852X Training Suit 3 |2xt| NoBid No Bid s;)rtsljgh No Sﬁgh Part |'s  714| s 21.42
70 D1568S3X Training Suit 9 |3xL| NoBid No Bid g;’rtsﬁgh No Sﬁgh Pat |s  g33|s 74.97
71 3CF-14534 Hazard Categorization Kit (Lab Safety) 12 $ 3,131.15| $ 37,573.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 77'P%§1}f2;32()823’5tem E%‘;rggggg ggg‘;” ;hlegegglzozxggz'gdgggf %agr(t);i L I $32,765.85 | $ 98,207.55| $17,011.25| $  68,045.00| No Bid No Bid

73 494450 Isobutylene Calibration Gas* 6 $ 136.34| $ 409.02 No Bid No Bid $ 171.46| $ 1,028.76
74 711060 Hydrogen Sulfide Calibration Gas* 8 $ 136.34| $ 1,227.06 No Bid No Bid $ 148.88| $ 1,191.04
75 711088 Phosphine Calibration Gas* 12 $ 26951 $ 3,234.12 No Bid No Bid $ 194.75| % 2,337.00
76 ALl'i;I.SI;IgllL;.(S)-ZZS Sirius PID Multigas Detector* 12 $ 3,368.91| $ 13,475.64 No Bid No Bid $ 258154 $ 30,978.48
77 B-60141-036 CBRN PAPR w/o Facepiece* 12 $ 58362 $ 3,501.72 No Bid No Bid $ 1,036.96| $ 12,443.52
78 10072240 MSA Accountability System Base Station Kit* 4 $ 99244 $ 7,939.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

79 10058545 M7 Accountability ID Tag* 12 $ 40.16| $ 481.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

80 10058539 M7 Control Module Reader/M7 Tag Writer* 4 $ 255.71| $ 3,068.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Buyer:

Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid
All Agencies

Opening Date: 02/06/08

Emergency Response Equipment

Fisher Scientific Co

Global Protection

Hunt Cleaners Inc.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
81 B-20090-001 Recharger for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 116.71| $ 1,400.52 No Bid No Bid $ 12734 $ 1,528.08
82 S20036 Recharger Battery for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 9471 $ 378.84 No Bid No Bid $ 207.02( $ 2,484.24
83 B-30030-001 Recharge Battery Cap* 12 $ 11.01] $ 132.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 B-10079-001 Carrying Case for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 47.72| $ 190.88 No Bid No Bid $ 22947( % 2,753.64
85 S-30019 Web Belt for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 2753 $ 330.36 No Bid No Bid $ 80.99| $ 971.88
86 633638 CASE:ABS,BLK,18-1/2"LX15-1/4"WX6-7/8"D for Sirius* 12 $ 175.12| $ 2,101.44 No Bid No Bid $ 76.91| $ 922.92

Payment Terms 0%,30days Net 30

Delivery Days ARO 21-30 15-45

Comments

Line 24 8020=$9011.36
8930=%$382.35
Lines 37-44 sold 6/cs
Lines 64-67 sold 2/case
76. AL111B01100220500
83. B30060-001

24. #8020 $9011.36
#8030 $369.32
55. Delivery 60-90 days ARO
73. FSI DAT 35355
w/accessories listed
delivery 8 weeks ARO

Line 4 950-R111-MABC2, 930-02-000,
671-034-002, and 672-990-012 & 3M
Lines 26-54 are all Lakeland Brand see
bid tab for P/N
Lines 58-70 are all Lakeland Brand see
bid tab for P/N
Line 73 585-110-023
Line 74-86 are all 3M Brand see bid tab
for P/IN
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Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment IBT Inc. McConnell Group Memco, Inc.
Item Part Number Description Zst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
1 [A-M7HD14A1C14DC1 [Self Contained Breathing Apparatus 21 No Bid No Bid $ 6,450.00| $135,450.00( $ 6,649.50( $139,639.50
2 807588 Stealth Air Bottle, Spare 60 min 21 $ 1,348.98| $28,328.58 | $ 1,538.35( $ 32,305.35| $ 1,421.99| $ 29,861.79
3 10024074 Clear Command Communications System 16 $ 31445($ 5,031.20( $ 255.70| $ 4,091.20| $ 323.33( $ 5,173.28
4 F111C0P211B023 |Orion Multigas Detector 12 $ 2,021.09| $24,253.08 | $ 2,101.95( $ 25,223.40| $ 2,057.85| $ 24,694.20
5 488543 Kwik-Draw Detector Tube Pumps 16 $ 24857|$ 3977.12| $ 283.95( % 4543.20] $ 25559| $ 4,089.44
6 804136 Ethanol Detector Tubes (Alcohol) box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 48.00| $ 768.00| $ 4142 $ 662.72
7 804132 Aromatic Hydrocarbon Detector Tubes (Benzene) box 16 $ 49.94( $  799.04( $ 56.25| $ 900.00| $ 48.53( $ 776.48
8 497664 Hexan - 20 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 4794 $ 767.04( $ 54.00( $ 864.00| $ 46.59( $ 745.44
9 803945 Hydrogen Cyanide HCN-2 Dector Tubes, box 16 $ 55.93| $ 894.88| $ 63.00( $ 1,008.00| $ 54.36[ $ 869.76
10 487343 Trichlorethan-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 48.00| $ 768.00| $ 4142 $ 662.72
11 487341 Nitrogen Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 4794 $ 767.04( $ 54.00( $ 864.00| $ 46.59( $ 745.44
12 803943 Carbon Monoxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 48.00| $ 768.00| $ 4142 $ 662.72
13 804134 Triethylamin-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 56.25( $ 900.00| $ 48.53( $ 776.48
14 487333 Carbon Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 4094 $  799.04( $ 48.00| $ 768.00| $ 4142 $ 662.72
15 803948 Hydrogen Chloride Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 63.00( $ 1,008.00| $ 41.42( $ 662.72
16 804589 Ethyl Mercaptan Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 55.93| $ 894.88| $ 54.00( $ 864.00| $ 46.59( $ 745.44
17 804428 Ethylen-50 Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 4794 $ 767.04( $ 54.00( $ 864.00| $ 46.59( $ 745.44
18 485680 Phosphine Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 4794 $ 767.04( $ 48.00| $ 768.00| $ 4142 $ 662.72
19 10007654 Phosphoric Esters Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 42.62| $ 68192 $ 82.50( $ 1,320.00| $ 71.18| $ 1,138.88
20 10007653 HD Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.24| $ 1,171.84| $ 82.50( $ 1,320.00| $ 71.18| $ 1,138.88
21 10007650 Lewisit Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.24| $ 1,171.84| $ 86.25( $ 1,380.00| $ 74.42| $ 1,190.72
22 10007652 HD HN Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 76.57| $ 1,225.12| $ 86.25( $ 1,380.00| $ 74.42| $ 1,190.72
23 10007651 Cyanogen Detector Tubes, box 16 $ 73.24| $ 1,171.84| $ 82.50( $ 1,320.00| $ 71.18| $ 1,138.88
24 /-Igfisr:teerr##%%z:%% Portacount Plus Respirator Fit Tester/Portable Printer 1 No Bid No Bid $ 946734 $ 9,467.34 No Bid No Bid
25 990810 Level A Suit Tester 12 $ 976.74| $11,720.88( $ 975.50| $ 11,706.00| $ 923.66( $ 11,083.92
26 RS562TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated LG | $ 533.30| $14,932.40| $ 623.50( $ 17,458.00| $ 589.94| $ 16,518.32
27 RS562TXL Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 28 XLG | $ 533.30( $14,932.40| $ 623.00| $ 17,444.00{ $ 589.94| $ 16,518.32
28 RS562T2X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 2XL [ $ 559.97| $15,679.16| $ 660.50| $ 18,494.00 $ 625.33| $ 17,509.24
29 RS562T3X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 3XL | $ 587.97| $16,463.16[ $ 700.50| $ 19,614.00| $ 662.86 $ 18,560.08
30 RS563TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulating LG | $ 533.30| $23,998.50| $ 623.50( $ 28,057.50| $ 589.94| $ 26,547.30
31 RS563TXL Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 25 XLG | $ 533.30( $23,998.50| $ 623.50| $ 28,057.50| $ 589.94| $ 26,547.30
32 RS563T2X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 2XL | $ 559.97| $25,198.65| $ 660.50] $ 29,722.50( $ 625.33[ $ 28,139.85
33 RS563T3X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 3XL [ $ 587.97| $26,458.65| $ 700.50| $ 31,522.50| $ 662.86] $ 29,828.70
34 RS587S2X Level A Training Suit 9 | 2XL | $ 14041 $ 1,263.69| $ 121.00/ $ 1,089.00( $ 114.45( $ 1,030.05
35 RS587S3X Level A Training Suit 2 [ 3XL | $ 14743|$ 294.86|$ 132.00( $ 264.00 $ 121.32( $ 242.64
36 RS587S4X Level A Training Suit 1 |4XL|$ 154.80 No Bid N/A N/A $ 131.02| $ 131.02
37 C4528TLG CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit LG [ $ 118.72| $ 3,799.04| $ 112.95($ 3,614.40| $ 106.86] $ 3,419.52
38 C4528TXL CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 32 XLG | $ 118.72| $ 3,799.04| $ 112.95($ 3,614.40| $ 106.86] $ 3,419.52
39 C4528T2X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 2XL | $ 12466 $ 3,989.12| $ 119.70| $ 3,830.40( $ 113.27( $ 3,624.64
40 C4528T3X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 3XL [ $ 130.90| $ 4,188.80| $ 126.85| $ 4,059.20| $ 120.06] $ 3,841.92
41 C4168TLG CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated LG | $ 77.35| $ 1,237.60[ $ 50.50| $ 808.00| $ 47.79| $ 764.64
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Buyer: Tom Morgan 2308 OF Rebid Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment IBT Inc. McConnell Group Memco, Inc.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
42 C4168TXL CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 16 XLG | $ 7735 $ 1,237.60( $ 50.50| $ 808.00( $ 47.79] $ 764.64
43 C4168T2X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 2XL [ $ 81.22| $ 1,299.52 $ 53.50| $ 856.00( $ 50.66| $ 810.56
44 C4168T3X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 3XL | $ 85.28| $ 1,364.48( $ 56.75| $ 908.00( $ 53.70| $ 859.20
45 99600 Personnel Cooling Vest w/spare cool pack set 28 $ 12087 $ 3,38436[$ 166.75|$ 4,669.00| $ 161.12( $ 4,511.36
46 996030 Cool Pack set 50 $ 96.45| $ 4,82250($ 141.00( $ 7,050.00| $ 146.03| $ 7,301.50
47 RS528TLG Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit LG | $ 167.93| $ 7,053.06] $ 24350 $ 10,227.00| $ 230.52( $ 9,681.84
48 RS528TXL Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 42 XLG [ $ 16793| $ 7,053.06| $ 243.50( $ 10,227.00| $ 230.52]| $ 9,681.84
49 RS528T2X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 2XL | $ 17633 $ 7,405.86| $ 258.10| $ 10,840.20( $ 244.36( $ 10,263.12
50 RS528T3X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 3XL [ $ 185.14( $ 7,775.88]| $ 273.60| $ 11,491.20| $ 259.01| $ 10,878.42
51 RS127T8A-LG Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit LG | $ 77.35| $ 1,237.60| $ 84.80( $ 1,356.80| $ 80.28| $ 1,284.48
52 RS127T8A-XL Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 16 XLG | $ 77.35| $ 1,237.60| $ 84.80( $ 1,356.80| $ 80.28| $ 1,284.48
53 RS127T8A-2X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 2XL [ $ 81.22| $ 1,299.52| $ 88.70( $ 1,419.20| $ 83.97| $ 1,343.52
54 RS127T8A-3X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 3XL | $ 85.28| $ 1,364.48| $ 92.85[$ 1,485.60| $ 87.89| $ 1,406.24
55 428800-30 Chemical Agent Detection 1 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
56 M245A1 Chemical Agent Detectors 12 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
57 M256A1 Chemical Training Kits 12 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
58 TK555TLG-Butyl |1 7ot mEVEr R SH TEAR e 1= T iee LG | $ 571.40($ 9,142.40[ $ 679.25[$ 10,868.00( $ 675.29| $ 10,804.64
59 TK555TXL-Butyl [ 0 oo DOVETY ST SR Targs Visw 19bE XLG|$ 571.40]$ 9,142.40[ $ 679.25[ $ 10,868.00[ $ 675.29| $ 10,804.64
60 TK555T2X-Butyl |7 0 o EETETA SHE TEA G IAgE VR AR 16 | 2XL | $ 599.97| $ 9,599.52] $ 720.00] $ 11,520.00] $ 715.80[ $ 11,452.80
61 TK555T3X-Butyl [ o oo DOVETY ST ISR Targs Visw 19bE 3XL | $  629.97| $10,079.52| $ 763.20| $ 12,211.20{ $ 758.74| $ 12,139.84
62 TK555T4X-Butyl |1 0 o m EETETA S TEA G A VR e 4XL | $ 661.47| $10,583.52| $ 824.25|$ 13,188.00{ $ 819.45[ $ 13,111.20
63 TK122TLG TK Level B Coverall Suit LG | $ 69.20| $ 2,422.00( $ 67.25| $ 2,353.75( $ 63.67 $ 2,228.45
64 TK122TXL TK Level B Coverall Suit XLG | $ 69.20| $ 2,422.00( $ 67.25| $ 2,353.75( $ 63.67 $ 2,228.45
65 TK122T2X TK Level B Coverall Suit 35 [ 2XL | $ 72.66| $ 2,543.10( $ 71.30| $ 2,495.50( $ 6749 $ 2,362.15
66 TK122T3X TK Level B Coverall Suit 3XL | $ 76.29|1 $ 2,670.15( $ 75.60| $ 2,646.00( $ 7154 $ 2,503.90
67 TK122T4X TK Level B Coverall Suit 4XL | $ 80.11| $ 2,803.85( $ 81.65| $ 2857.75( $ 7727 $ 2,704.45
68 D1568SXL Training Suit 3 [ XLG No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
69 D1568S2X Training Suit 3 | 2XL No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
70 D1568S3X Training Suit 9 | 3XL No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid
71 3CF-14534 Hazard Categorization Kit (Lab Safety) 12 No Bid No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid

77-PDS-20-B System |Emergency Decon Shelter 10'x18" includes part #: 3517, . . . .

2 Part #9202 5709, 9906, 9908, 5718, 9922, 9920, 5201, 9909 4 No Bid No Bid NIA NIA No Bid No Bid

73 494450 Isobutylene Calibration Gas* 6 $ 15739($ 94434 $ 146.15| $ 876.90| $ 141.65( $ 849.90
74 711060 Hydrogen Sulfide Calibration Gas* 8 $ 15739 $ 1,250.12( $ 146.15|$ 1,169.20| $ 141.65( $ 1,133.20
75 711088 Phosphine Calibration Gas* 12 $ 31111|$ 3,733.32| $ 28885|$ 3,466.20( $ 280.00| $ 3,360.00

A-SIRIUS- iy . .

76 AL111BO11022S Sirius PID Multigas Detector 12 $ 3,009.30| $36,111.60 N/A N/A $ 3,125.27( $ 37,503.24
77 B-60141-036 CBRN PAPR w/o Facepiece* 12 $ 607.25|$ 7,287.00 $ 648.30|$ 7,779.60| $ 632.26| $ 7,587.12
78 10072240 MSA Accountability System Base Station Kit* 4 $ 953.19| $ 3,812.76( $ 1,102.40| $ 4,409.60| $ 992.44| $ 3,969.76
79 10058545 M7 Accountability ID Tag* 12 $ 48.77|$ 585.24( $ 46.60| $ 559.20| $ 40.17( $ 482.04
80 10058539 M7 Control Module Reader/M7 Tag Writer* 4 $ 27169|$ 1086.76] $ 284.10| $ 1,136.40| $ 255.71| $ 1,022.84
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid

Opening Date: 02/06/08

All Agencies
Emergency Response Equipment IBT Inc. McConnell Group Memco, Inc.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price Unit Price | Ext. Price
81 B-20090-001 Recharger for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 13435($ 161220($ 129.70| $ 1556.40| $ 12645( $ 1,517.40
82 S20036 Recharger Battery for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid $ 105.25($ 1,263.001 $ 102.59| $ 1,231.08
83 B-30030-001 Recharge Battery Cap* 12 No Bid No Bid $ 12.80| $ 153.60( $ 11.93] $ 143.16
84 B-10079-001 Carrying Case for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 62.77|$ 753.24( $ 55.35| $ 664.20| $ 51.70| $ 620.40
85 S-30019 Web Belt for CBRN PAPR* 12 $ 36.21| $ 43452 $ 31.95| $ 383.40| $ 29.83| $ 357.96
86 633638 CASE:ABS,BLK,18-1/2"LX15-1/4"WX6-7/8"D for Sirius* 12 $ 197.90| $ 2,374.80( $ 180.00| $ 2,160.00| $ 188.59| $ 2,263.08

Payment Terms 0% 30 Days Net 30

Delivery Days ARO 30

Comments

Lines 25-67 Quoted as
Lakeland Brand see bid
tab for P/N
Lines 82&83 P/N not
recognized.

Lines 68-70 Dupont has
discontinued D1568S

Page 12 OF 15




Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid

All Agencies
. New England Fire EQP
Emergency Response Equipment Apparatus W.S Darley & Co.
Item Part Number Description Zst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price
1 [A-M7HD14A1C14DC1 |Self Contained Breathing Apparatus 21 No Bid No Bid $ 3,924.00| $82,404.00
2 807588 Stealth Air Bottle, Spare 60 min 21 $ 550.00( $11,550.00| $ 1,035.00| $21,735.00
3 10024074 Clear Command Communications System 16 No Bid No Bid $ 308.00| $ 4,928.00
4 F111COP211B023 |Orion Multigas Detector 12 No Bid No Bid $ 1,926.00| $23,112.00
5 488543 Kwik-Draw Detector Tube Pumps 16 No Bid No Bid $ 310.00| $ 4,960.00
6 804136 Ethanol Detector Tubes (Alcohol) box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 52.00/ $ 832.00
7 804132 Aromatic Hydrocarbon Detector Tubes (Benzene) box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 60.00{ $ 960.00
8 497664 Hexan - 20 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00( $ 928.00
9 803945 Hydrogen Cyanide HCN-2 Dector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 67.00( $ 1,072.00
10 487343 Trichlorethan-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 53.00/ $ 848.00
11 487341 Nitrogen Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00( $ 928.00
12 803943 Carbon Monoxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 53.00/ $ 848.00
13 804134 Triethylamin-5 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 60.00( $ 960.00
14 487333 Carbon Dioxide Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 53.00( $ 848.00
15 803948 Hydrogen Chloride Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 67.00( $ 1,072.00
16 804589 Ethyl Mercaptan Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00( $ 928.00
17 804428 Ethylen-50 Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00( $ 928.00
18 485680 Phosphine Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 53.00( $ 848.00
19 10007654 Phosphoric Esters Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 88.00 $ 1,408.00
20 10007653 HD Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 88.00 $ 1,408.00
21 10007650 Lewisit Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 91.00( $ 1,456.00
22 10007652 HD HN Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 91.00{ $ 1,456.00
23 10007651 Cyanogen Detector Tubes, box 16 No Bid No Bid $ 88.00 $ 1,408.00
24 Te_ster #8020 Portacount Plus Respirator Fit Tester/Portable Printer 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
/Printer #8930

25 990810 Level A Suit Tester 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 RS562TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated LG No Bid No Bid $ 622.00| $17,416.00
27 RS562TXL Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 28 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 622.00| $17,416.00
28 RS562T2X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 660.00| $18,480.00
29 RS562T3X Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulated 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 700.00| $19,600.00
30 RS563TLG Tychem Responder Level A Suit Encapsulating LG No Bid No Bid $ 623.00| $28,035.00
31 RS563TXL Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 45 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 623.00| $28,035.00
32 RS563T2X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 660.00| $29,700.00
33 RS563T3X Haz-Mat Responder Level A Suit 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 700.00| $31,500.00
34 RS587S2X Level A Training Suit 9 | 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 121.00| $ 1,089.00
35 RS587S3X Level A Training Suit 2 | 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 131.00| $ 262.00
36 RS587S4X Level A Training Suit 1 | 4XL No Bid No Bid $ 145.00( $ 145.00
37 C4528TLG CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit LG No Bid No Bid $ 677.00( $21,664.00
38 C4528TXL CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 32 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 677.00( $21,664.00
39 C4528T2X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 718.00( $22,976.00
40 C4528T3X CPF IV Level B Encapsulating Suit 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 761.00( $24,352.00
41 C4168TLG CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated LG No Bid No Bid $ 303.00( $ 4,848.00
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid

All Agencies
. New England Fire EQP
Emergency Response Equipment Apparatus W.S Darley & Co.
Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price
42 C4168TXL CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 16 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 303.00| $ 4,848.00
43 C4168T2X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 321.00| $ 5,136.00
44 C4168T3X CPF IV Level B Non-encapsulated 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 340.00| $ 5,440.00
45 99600 Personnel Cooling Vest w/spare cool pack set 28 No Bid No Bid $ 160.00| $ 4,480.00
46 996030 Cool Pack set 50 No Bid No Bid $ 62.00| $ 3,100.00
47 RS528TLG Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit LG No Bid No Bid $ 242.00| $10,164.00
48 RS528TXL Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit a2 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 242.00| $10,164.00
49 RS528T2X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 258.00| $10,836.00
50 RS528T3X Responder Level B+ Encapsulating Suit 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 274.00| $11,508.00
51 RS127T8A-LG Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit LG No Bid No Bid $ 85.00( $ 1,360.00
52 RS127T8A-XL Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 16 XLG No Bid No Bid $ 85.00( $ 1,360.00
53 RS127T8A-2X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 89.00| $ 1,424.00
p p g
54 RS127T8A-3X Responder Level B Non-encapsulating Suit 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 92.00( $ 1,472.00
55 428800-30 Chemical Agent Detection 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
56 M245A1 Chemical Agent Detectors 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 M256A1 Chemical Training Kits 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 TK555TLG-BU'[yI Ili' le’:lllllllal TUCTT LTVET A OSUIT W/ITATU A IGIHC VICW TAaltT LG NO Bld NO B|d $ 1,00100 $16‘01600
59 TK555TXL-BUty| Il:\- \::JIIIIIICU TUCT LTVET A SUTT WITAT A TAryt ViIcTv TatT™ XLG NO B|d NO Bld $ 1100100 $16,01600
60 TK555T2X-Buty| Ili' le’:lllllllal TUTT LTVET A OSUIT W/ITATU A IGIHC VICW TAaltT 16 2XL NO Bld NO B|d $ 1,04200 $16‘67200
61 TK555T3X-BUty| Il:\- \::JIIIIIICU TUCT LTVET A SUTT WITAT A TAryt VITTv TatT 3XL NO B|d NO Bld $ 1109400 $17’50400
62 TK555T4X-Buty| Ili' le’:lllllllal TUCTT LTVET A OSUIT W/ITATU A IGIHC VICW TAaltT 4XL NO Bld NO B|d $ 1,14800 $18‘36800
63 TK122TLG TK Level B Coverall Suit LG No Bid No Bid $ 135.00| $ 4,725.00
64 TK122TXL TK Level B Coverall Suit XLG No Bid No Bid $ 135.00| $ 4,725.00
65 TK122T2X TK Level B Coverall Suit 35 [ 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 143.00| $ 5,005.00
66 TK122T3X TK Level B Coverall Suit 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 151.00| $ 5,285.00
67 TK122T4X TK Level B Coverall Suit 4XL No Bid No Bid $ 163.00| $ 5,705.00
68 D1568SXL Training Suit 3 | XLG No Bid No Bid $ 30.00| $ 90.00
69 D1568S2X Training Suit 3 | 2XL No Bid No Bid $ 30.00| $ 90.00
70 D1568S3X Training Suit 9 | 3XL No Bid No Bid $ 38.00| $ 342.00
71 3CF-14534 Hazard Categorization Kit (Lab Safety) 12 No Bid No Bid $ -
77-PDS-20-B System |Emergency Decon Shelter 10'x18" includes part #: 3517, . .
2 Part #9202 5709, 9906, 9908, 5718, 9922, 9920, 5201, 9909 4 No Bid NoBid | $22,746.00| $90,984.00
73 494450 Isobutylene Calibration Gas* 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 711060 Hydrogen Sulfide Calibration Gas* 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 711088 Phosphine Calibration Gas* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 AquzLSI;IgllLi(S)-ZZS Sirius PID Multigas Detector* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77 B-60141-036 CBRN PAPR w/o Facepiece* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78 10072240 MSA Accountability System Base Station Kit* 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 10058545 M7 Accountability ID Tag* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 10058539 M7 Control Module Reader/M7 Tag Writer* 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Buyer: Tom Morgan

2308 OF Rebid

All Agencies
. New England Fire EQP
Emergency Response Equipment Apparatus W.S Darley & Co.

Item Part Number Description [(Egst; Sizes| Unit Price | Ext. Price | Unit Price | Ext. Price

81 B-20090-001 Recharger for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

82 S20036 Recharger Battery for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

83 B-30030-001 Recharge Battery Cap* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 B-10079-001 Carrying Case for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

85 S-30019 Web Belt for CBRN PAPR* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

86 633638 CASE:ABS,BLK,18-1/2"LX15-1/4"WX6-7/8"D for Sirius* 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Payment Terms 0%, 0 days

Delivery Days ARO

Comments

Line 2 SCI Bottle add:
w/valve add $175.00
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No Bid

Heiman Fire Equipment
Laerdal
Medivac Vehicles, Inc.
Midwest Screen Print & Embroidery

Invalid Bid

Edwards and Cromwell Spill Control

Opening Date: 02/06/08



