
DATE: December 18, 2007 
 
TO:  All Vendors 
 
FROM: Rita Kucera, Buyer 

State Purchasing Bureau 
 
SUBJECT: ITB # 2300 OF 
 
 
The State of Nebraska is rejecting all bids received on the above-
referenced Invitation to Bid for Plate Material and Related Chemistry. 
 
Your firm will be given the opportunity to respond if new bids are 
solicited with revised specifications. 
 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with the State of 
Nebraska.
 



Buyer:  Rita Kucera 2300 OF
State Print Shop

Opening Date: 12/13/07

Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price

1 AB Dick Megapro 12" x 200' 8ml poly plate 53936-M.
Estimated annual usage:  30 rolls.  No Bid  ABDick  $        271.88  N/A 

2 AB Dick Megapro 15-29/32" x 200' 8ml poly plate 53942-M.
Estimated annual usage: 35 rolls.  No Bid  ABDick  $        360.25  N/A 

3 AB Mega Plate Activator 38750  (Sold in 4 gal per case). Estimated 
annual usage:  64 gallons.  No Bid  ABDick  $          62.54  N/A 

4 AB Mega Plate Stabilizer 28756 (Sold in 4 gal per case). Estimated 
annual usage:  28 gallons.  No Bid  ABDick  $          55.52  N/A 

5
AB Dick (41336), MegaPlus, or Mitsubishi Silvermaster Ver. III-8ml 
poly plate material 12" x 200' (Sold 2 rolls per case). 
Estimated annual usage: 64 rolls

 No Bid  $      187.53  ABDick  $        174.72  N/A 

6
AB Dick (41328), Megaplus, or Mitsubishi Silvermaster Ver. III-
8ml poly plate material 15.9' x 200' (Sold 2 rolls per case).
Estimated annual usage: 8 rolls.

 Mitsubishi  $      225.48  ABDick  $        231.50  N/A 

7 Silvermaster SLM-OA2 Fountain Additive (Sold per liter). 
Estimated annual usage 11 liters  Mitsubishi  $        14.87  ABDick 38704  $          15.05  N/A 

8 Silvermaster SLM-OD50 Fountain Solution (Sold 2, 5ltr per case)
Estimated annual usage: 30 liters.  Mitsubishi  $      195.80 

 ABDick #38778 
(price per gallon 

not liter) 
 $          32.00  N/A 

9
AGFA Azura Chemistry-Free Digital Thermal Plate (R95BM000) 20 
1/16 x 15 3/4- .008 (50 per Box).
Estimated annual usage: 13 Boxes.

 Pro T (Fugi)  $      258.57  No Bid  Z  AGFA Azura  $     222.70 

10
AGFA Azura Chemistry-Free Digital Thermal Plate (PIVYX1000 ) 
17 3/8 x 18 7/32- .008 (50 per Box).
Estimated annual usage: 9 Boxes.

 Pro T (Fugi)  $      261.11  No Bid  AGFA Azura  $     222.40 

11
AGFA Azura Chemistry-Free Digital Thermal Plate (PBZGL000 ) 21 
21/32 x 25 19/32 - .008 (50 per Box).
Estimated annual usage: 13 Boxes.

 Pro T (Fugi)  $      453.52  No Bid  AGFA Azura  $     389.40 

14 AGFA Azura Gum WG100 Gum Wash/Solution 
Estimated annual usage:  10 gallons.  Not Required  No Bid  AGFA Azura  $     133.40 

No Bid
Heidelberg

Description

Fujifilm Graphic SystemsPlate Material and Chemistry PressTek Inc.

Shipping Explanation:
Min order $50.00 Weight 2lb

Shipping method regular UPS 
Total $17.95 + $50.00=$67.95

7
2%,10 days

Comments

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

10
Net 30

2-7 
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