
Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
Coffee, blended ground, regular  74 cs  $                       122.13  $           9,037.62 

Coffee, blended ground, decaf Maxwell house or equivalent Case 
pack 24 1# per case 5 cs  $                         79.79  $              398.95 

Coffee, premium, regular  Maxwell house or equivalent        353 cs  $                       100.18  $         35,363.54 

Coffee, premium, decaf 273 cs  $                       106.43  $         29,055.39 

Coffee, blended, ground, bagged Case Pack 24-14 oz per case 2 cs  $                         77.12  $              154.24 

Coffee, instant, regular Case Pack 6/100cs 4 cs  $                         63.29  $              253.16 

Coffee, instant, decaf Case Pack 6/100cs or 10/100/cs    20 cs  $                         53.17  $           1,063.40 

Coffee, 100% Columbian grind Case Pack 120/1.75oz/cs 70 cs  $                         53.70  $           3,759.00 

Coffee, Freeze dried, decaf            Case Pack 8 oz 2 cs  $                       132.00  $              264.00 

QTY U/MBeverages

1.75oz=1pot
7440oz

Nestles
12/8oz

480 cups

S&D Coffee
128/1.75oz

0.043$                                                        

Nestle
6/80 cnt

0.111$                                                        
1pk=1cup

1000 cnt
0.063$                                                        

1pk=1cup
1000 cups

0.040$                                                        
5.4oz=384oz

11,520oz

Nestle

8675

Folgers
30/5.4oz

293 pots or 17,580oz

Nescafe
5/14oz

0.069$                                                        

1.5oz=60oz
192pots or 11,520oz

8675oz

Nescafe
5/14oz

0.074$                                                        

Lincoln Poultry

Folgers
6/44oz

0.042$                                                        
.9oz=60oz

Hills Bros
24/12 oz

0.042$                                                        

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

9

Li
ne

 #

1

2
Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

3

Dilution Ratio:

4

5

6

7

8
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
QTY U/MBeverages

Lincoln Poultry
Li

ne
 #

Coffee, frozen liquid regular 671 cs  $                         64.02  $         42,957.42 

Coffee, frozen liquid, decaf  Case Pack 2/2 liters/case 183 cs  $                         71.45  $         13,075.35 

Coffee, frozen liquid,  Case Pack 3/1.75 liters/cs 5 cs  $                         68.82  $              344.10 

Tea, instant, regular Case Pack 12/6.75oz/cs 2 cs  No Bid 

Tea, Nestea pak                      Case Pack 12/7.5 oz/cs 2 cs  No Bid 

Tea, spray dried, instant, decaf     Case Pack 12/2 oz 184 cs  $                         17.29  $           3,181.36 

Tea, spray dried, instant, reg     Case Pack 12/6 3/4oz jars/cs 5 cs  No Bid 

Tea, brewer's pak, Lipton Nestea Bag #4410, Regular   Case Pack 
24/3oz pkg/cs 18 cs  $                         21.96  $              395.28 

Tea bag, decaf, individual  Case Pack 5/100 cs 30 cs  $                         25.45  $              763.50 

5/100cnt
0.051$                                                        

1pk=1cup
500 cups

0.014$                                                        
3oz = 384 oz

9216oz

Nestle

Lipton
24/3oz

5760oz

Lipton
6/3oz

0.018$                                                        

54:1
9768oz

9768oz

 Vitality 
3/1.75lt.

0.042$                                                        

Vitality
3/1.75lt.

0.044$                                                        
54:1

3/1.75lt.
0.0393$                                                      

54:1
9768oz

Vitality

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
QTY U/MBeverages

Lincoln Poultry
Li

ne
 #

Tea bag, orange pekoe  Case Pack 10/100/cs 18 cs  $                         29.06  $              523.08 

Tea bag, regular, individual Case Pack 96/1oz/cs 601 cs  $                         17.60  $         10,577.60 

Tea, unsweetened, decaf           Case Pack 4/1 gallon 405 cs  $                         13.31  $           5,390.55 

Ice tea mix bag in a box Case Pack 3-5 gal 767 cs  $                         19.26  $         14,772.42 

Hot chocolate, Nestles #4496    Case Pack 12/1.75#/cs 5 cs  $                         44.73  $              223.65 

Cocoa Mix Case Pack 6/50 ct/cs 61 cs  $                         36.81  $           2,245.41 

Cocoa mix diet-no sugar Case Pack 6/50 ct/cs 8 cs  $                         35.43  $              283.44 

Cappuccino, variety flavor  Case Pack 2/ 6# bags/cs 11 cs  $                         26.62  $              292.82 
Flavor
Flavor
Flavor

Drink mix  Case Pack 12/26 oz cans/cs 56 cs  $                         13.04  $              730.24 

 Cappuccino 
 French Vanilla 

 Others 
 Superior 

12/26oz
0.026$                                                        

1pk=2gallon
24gl or 3072oz

0.118$                                                        
1pk=1cup
300cups

Diamond Crystal

 6/2lb 
0.102$                                                        

 4gm/oz 
 1560oz 

1pk=1cup
300cups

Nestle
6/50cnt

1920oz

Nestle
6/50cnt

0.123$                                                        

Nestle
12/1.75#

0.140$                                                        

5gallon
0.030$                                                        

5:1
3840oz

0.026$                                                        
5:1

3072

Vitality

1oz = 128oz
12,228oz

Vitality
4/1gallon

1000 cups

Pocahantas
96/1oz

0.009$                                                        

Lipton
10/100

0.029$                                                        
1pk=1cup

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
QTY U/MBeverages

Lincoln Poultry
Li

ne
 #

Drink mix, artificially sweetened Case Pack 12/2 oz 310 cs  $                         27.76  $           8,605.60 

Punch, frozen concentrate Case Pack 1 1/2 gallon con 2 cs  $                         33.99  $                67.98 

Juice, orange, 100%concentrate   Case Pack 3-5 gallon 730 cs  $                         40.79  $         29,776.70 

Juice, orange, 50%concentrate Case Pack 3-5 gallon 2 cs  $                         34.50  $                69.00 

Juice, apple, 35% concentrate Case Pack 3-5 gallon 1062 cs  $                         22.18  $         23,555.16 

Juice, cranapple, 35%  Case Pack 3-5 gallon 877 cs  $                         34.68  $         30,414.36 

Juice, pineapple, 35% Case Pack 3-5 gallon 732 cs  $                         24.42  $         17,875.44 

Juice, grapefruit, 35% Case Pack 3-5 gallon 300 cs  $                         21.90 $6,570.00 

Juice, grape, 35% Concentrate      Case Pack 3-5 gallon 1092 cs  $                         25.20  $         27,518.40 

1920

Vitality
3gal

0.079$                                                        
4:1

3gal
0.068$                                                        

4:1
1920oz

0.076$                                                        
4:1

1920oz

Vitality

4:1
1920

Vitality
3gal

1920

Vitality
3gal

0.108$                                                        

Vitality
3gal

0.069$                                                        
4:1

3gal
0.108$                                                        

4:1
1920oz

0.128$                                                        
4:1

1920

Vitality

5:1
2304oz

Vitality
3gal

24gal or 3072oz

Vitality
6/64oz

0.089$                                                        

Diamond Crystal
12/2oz

0.054$                                                        
1pk=2gallon

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

36
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
QTY U/MBeverages

Lincoln Poultry
Li

ne
 #

Orange drink, 0% juice Case Pack 3-5 gallon           31 cs  $                         20.54  $              636.74 

Grape drink, 0% juice Case Pack 3-5 gallon 13 cs  $                         18.83  $              244.79 

Fruit punch, 0% juice Case Pack 3-5 gallon 100 cs  $                         17.73  $           1,773.00 

Lemon drink, 0% juice Case Pack 3-5 gallon 55 cs  $                         20.53  $           1,129.15 

Express pack orange juice Case Pack 4/3 liter 197 cs  $                         67.28  $         13,254.16 

Express pack lemonade Case Pack 4/3 liter 7 cs  $                         24.60  $              172.20 

Express pack apple juice Case Pack 4/3 liter 114 cs  $                         55.14  $           6,285.96 

Express pack grape juice Case Pack 4/3 liter 59 cs  $                         36.48  $           2,152.32 

Express pk cranberry juiceCase Pack 4/3 liter 76 cs  $                         50.53  $           3,840.28 

Express pk pas-o-guava Case Pack 4/3 liter 7 cs  $                         30.39  $              212.73 

0.075$                                                        
5:1

2434

4:1
2028

Vitality
4/3lt.

2434oz

Vitality
4/3lt.

0.150$                                                        

Vitality
4/3lt.

0.090$                                                        
5:1

4/3lt.
0.136$                                                        

5:1
2434

0.061$                                                        
5:1

2434oz

Vitality

4:1
2434oz

Vitality
4/3lt.

3840

Vitality
4/3lt.

0.166$                                                        

Vitality
5gal

0.032$                                                        
5:1

5gal
0.028$                                                        

5:1
3840

0.029$                                                        
5:1

3840

Vitality

5:1
3840

Vitality
5gal

Vitality
5gal

0.032$                                                        

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

46

44

45

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy 2248 OF
All Agencies

Opening Date: 11/1/07

Unit Price Ext. Price
QTY U/MBeverages

Lincoln Poultry
Li

ne
 #

Express pack peach Case Pack 4/3 liter 2 cs  $                         50.77  $              101.54 

Express pack fruit punch Case Pack 4/3 liter 2 cs  $                         46.48  $                92.96 

Express pack grapefruit Case Pack 4/3 liter 2 cs  No Bid 

Express pk raspberry lemonade Case Pack 4/3 liter 2 cs  $                         39.00  $                78.00 

Comments

 (#35).Grapefruit Not Available. Alternate 
Flavors available in 20% juice all 4:1 

Peach, Papaya, Raspberry $21.90 unit 
price 1920oz   (#38). Grape is not 

available alternate flavor=Pink Lemonade. 

1

0.096$                                                        
5:1

2434
Monthly Due on the 10th

Vitality
4/3lt.

2434

Vitality
4/3lt.

0.115$                                                        
5:1

4/3lt.
0.125$                                                        

5:1
2434

Vitality

Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:

Yield Factor:

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving

Brand:
Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:

Pack Size Bidding:
Price per 6oz serving
Dilution Ratio:
Yield Factor:

50

47

48

49

Brand:

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

NO BID
Farmer Bros. Co

Pegler Sysco
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