Buyer: Connie Heinrichs

2195 OF

Opening Date: 10/02/07

All Agencies
PRIMARY SECONDARY
AWARD AWARD - GAS
ONLY
% Description 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab 4X4 Anderson Ford | Performance Dodge Sid Dillon Chev Buick
5 |Dual Rear Wheels Pont
Base Price $28,549.00 $30,202.00 $29,807.00
Base Price - Gasoline Only $23,483.00
Make: Ford Dodge Chevrolet
Model: F-350 RC Ram Silverado
1 |GVYWR: 12600 11500 11400
Series, Code, Trim Level: XLT 3500'D18H62' 'SLT' 3500-CK30903-LT
Engine 6.4 V-8 Diesel 6.7L C“”?m'”s Turbo 6.6L Duramax
Diesel
EPA N/A NA @ this time
Comments
2 |E85 model price N/A N/A N/A
Ly 6 6.0L Vortec
Engine (other gas). ($3,500.00) ($6,719.00) Requires MYD Trans
3 ($6027.00)
Specify Engine Size: 5.4 Liter V-8 5.7L V-8 Hemi
4 Engine (other gas). ($2,500.00) N/A N/A
Specify Engine Size: 6.8 Liter V-10
Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or Gasoline Engine N/A
dealer installed $79.00
5 | Model:
Warranty:
Specify Engine Size:
6 |Air-Conditioning (deduct) N/A STD ($597.00)
7 I(:drggLél)Jtomatlc to Manual Four-Speed Transmission ($650.00) 6-speed ($1386.00) N/A
8 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar support N/A ($356.00) N/A
(deduct)
9 |Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering (deduct) N/A N/A N/A
10 |Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim $750.00 N/A N/A
2 electric remote controlled outside mirrors, swing away
11 type. 6" X 9" (deduct) N/A STD N/A
12 [Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6x8 $450.00 N/A $297.00
Heavy duty alternator, optional, minimum 105 amp N/A STD STD
13 |alternator.
Bidder state amps: 136 Amp 125
14 Heavy duty battery optional. (2)$V5Vg20D \';lsgASSTD STD
Bidder state CCA: 750 Amp W/ Diesel 2=730 cca
15 |Deduct for no sliding rear-vision window (deduct) ($90.00) STD ($109.00)
16 |Deduction for no lid on Utility Body (deduct) ($500.00) No Bid ($497.00)
17 |Second Power Outlet $250.00 STD STD
Dgcreased p|ckl_Jp box length of approximately 6 ¥ feet N/A N/A N/A
18 |with corresponding wheelbase.
Bidder state wheelbase:
19 |Single rear wheels (deduct) ($250.00) N/A ($457.00)
GVWR (NOTE: Five wheels and tires will be required
20 |meeting same requirements as defined in the N/A STD 9900

Specifications)
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E Description 1 Ton Diesel Regular Cab 4X4 Anderson Ford | Performance Dodge Sid Dillon Chev Buick
-5 |Dual Rear Wheels Pont
Chassis with eight foot Utility Body (see
ATTACHMENT) Single wheel (Color of Utility Body to $34,249.00 No Bid $5,494.00
21 |match manufacturer color charts)
Knapheide, 0OSB96V Omaha
State make and model Omabha Standard STD/696J Knapheide
Chassis with eight foot Utility Body (see
ATTACHMENT) Dual wheel (Color of Utility Body to $34,449.00 No Bid $6,594.00
match manufacturer color charts)
22
Knapheide Omabha Standard
State make and model Omaha Stand'ard 0OSB96D54V or
Knapheide 696 D45J
23 [Chassis Cab with no Utility Box (With single wheels.) $28,179.00 No Bid ($5,494.00)
24 [Chassis Cab with no Utility Box (With dual wheels.) $28,379.00 No Bid ($6,594.00)
25 |Cargo light N/A STD $97.00
26 Staqqlard Paint - A'FtaCh List and Identify as No N/C See attached list NC-see attached
Additional Cost Paints
For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge
27 |#PY5269, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A N/C N/A NC-9W3
code (9W3)
o8 Ex?ra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost N/A See attached list See attached $297.00
Paints $198.00
29 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer $85.00 Inc. in Bid $97.00
30 |Equipment & engine service repair manual. $400.00 $495.00 $297.00
. . . . N/A @ this time
31 |Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM $650.00 $112.50 $897.00 when available
32 |Equipment & engine parts manual $400.00 N/A N/A
33 |Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM N/A $375.00 N/A
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment
outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would
34 be for vehicles bought by political entities and other e CEROI $400.00
Divisions of Government.
Payment Terms 100%,30 0% 0%,15
Delivery Time ARO 90-120 90-120 45-120
Wiring Manual-

Comments

$75.00 4.D. Diesel
Engine-Dual 750
AMP Std. Gas
Engine 750 Amp-
Option $53.00
(1.F.) Sidemoldings
N/A Factory
Aftermarket $160.00
(1.K.) Rubber floor
Mats-Aftermarket
(1.P.) Skid pate Fuel
tank-N/A

*See attached letter for
clarification. (1.P)Fuel
Tank-comes standard
with D.O.T. Federal
approved & required
factory installed shield.
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