
Buyer: Mary Lanning 2054 OF
Corrections-CSI

Opening Date: 06/15/07

PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL 
AWARD PARTIAL AWARD PARTIAL AWARD

Upholstery fabric CF Stinson Inc. Douglass 
Industries

Mayer-Paetz   Fabrics 
Inc Momentum Fabrics 

Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Panel Fabric

A1 Equal Genesis/alternate $8.78 no bid $10.45 Meander  $9.01
A2 Grasscloth no bid no bid $9.95 Tracery   $9.01
A3 Gemini no bid no bid $10.45 Universe  $9.01
A4 Copa no bid no bid $9.45
A5 Sparkle Asterisk                $10.86 no bid $9.95
A6 MultiCrepe Ringer                    $9.22 no bid no bid
B1 Axis Too $8.95 no bid no bid
B2 Reflectance $10.35 no bid no bid
B3 Sketch Linea                   $14.95 no bid no bid
B4 Seabreeze Celebration           $14.95 no bid no bid
B5 Mira $10.78 no bid no bid
B6 Counterpoint $10.45 no bid no bid
B7 Del Mar $10.95 no bid no bid
B8 Traffic $11.11 no bid no bid
B9 Luther $11.95 no bid no bid
B10 Terrain $12.75 no bid no bid
B11 Roundabout $12.95 no bid no bid

Seating Fabric
C1 Wave Length no bid no bid $8.95 Origin $10.49
C2 Carat no bid no bid $11.95 Basis $10.18
C3 Structure no bid no bid $11.45 Era   $15.11
C4 Charleston no bid no bid $12.45 Expo   $10.81
C5 Astro no bid no bid $11.45 Perk  $10.97
C6 Forte New Hempstead      $9.07 no bid $5.95
C7 Cross Check Loft                        $8.45 no bid $7.95
C8 Contrax no bid no bid $16.95
C9 Foundation New Hempstead      $9.07 no bid $8.95
D1 Confetti $9.27 no bid no bid
D2 Enduro $11.11 no bid no bid
D3 Impact $8.82 no bid no bid
D4 Spin $10.45 no bid no bid
D5 Zip $10.61 no bid no bid
E1 Insight Vision                  $11.09 no bid no bid $10.65
E2 Blink no bid no bid no bid no bid

E3 Caliber no bid no bid no bid $14.31

E4 Wit Transcend              $8.95 no bid no bid $15.21
F1 Del Mar no bid $11.00 no bid
F2 Sherpa no bid $7.49 no bid
F3 Shire no bid $7.49 no bid
F4 Channel no bid $9.40 no bid
F5 Kendall no bid $11.16 no bid
F6 Gunn no bid $18.20 no bid
F7 Suedegard/Crypton $19.25 $17.56 $17.95
G1 All Season  (vinyl) Colorguard           $12.22 Colorguard$11.25 $12.95

Discount from standard pricing see bid sheet  15% off wholesale 15.00% 15.00%
two page card per 100 $2.00/card face or $4.00 $2.97 / each $275.00 $2.50/ card 1000 min.
one page card per 100 $2.00 or $2.00/card face $2.25 / each $150.00 $1.25/ card 1000 min.

0% net 30 days 30 days 0% 30 days
3-5 days / 7-10 days 3-5 days
min. order for card this type is 
750 cards
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