
Buyer: Tom Morgan 1891OF Ammunition Opening Date: 03/22/07 
CENTRAL STATES 

TACTICAL HORNADY ULTRAMAX

230 grain full metal jacket $215.00 $179.60
Brand & Model Remington L45AP4 Speer 53653
180 grain full metal jacket $196.69  $149.60
Brand & Model Remington L40SW3  Speer 53652

3 .45 cal duty
230 grain brass jacketed hollow point-
Remington Golden Saber 230 grain 
Index #GSB45APB - No Substitutes

$344.65  no bid

4 .40 cal duty
180 grain brass jacketed hollow point-
Remington Golden Saber Index 
#GSB40SWB-NO SUBSTITUTIONS

$284.50  no bid

5 9mm duty
124 grain brass jacketed hollow point-
Remington Golden Saber Index 
#GSB9MMD-No Substitutions

$293.80  no bid

124 grain ball ammunition-Winchester 
R9MM2 or equal $191.75  $123.80

Brand & Model Remington L9MM2  Speer 53651

7 9mm duty
147 grain brass jacketed hollow point-
Remington Golden Saber Index 
#GS9MMC-No Substitutions

$293.80  no bid

147 grain ball ammunition-Winchester 
USA9MM1 or equal $183.15  $130.70

Brand & Model Remington L9MM9  Speer 53620
   

55 grain full metal jacket-new casings $259.70 $186.80 $242.00
Brand & Model Remington L223R Hornady # 9754 Federal AE223
55 grain ballistic tip-new casings-
Federal T223F or equal $495.00 $447.00 $487.00

Brand & Model Remington PRA223RC Hornady TAP Urban 
#83276 Federal T223F 

Comments TAP is ballistic tip Ballistic tip not bonded
55 grain pointed soft point-new casings 
Winchester RA223R-PSP $469.10  $390.00

Brand & Model Remington R223R1 Federal T223A
  

7.5 or 8 shot-Winchester TRGT127 OR 
48VIXJ31 or equal $185.00  $144.00

Brand & Model Remington GL128   
8shot  Federal TGL12

13 00 Buck 8 pellet-Remlington index/EDI number 
RR128B00-No Substitutes $327.75  no bid

9 pellet-duty $367.10  $308.00
Brand & Model Remington SPL1200  Federal LE12700 5/box
9 pellet reduced recoil-practice $324.80  $288.00

Brand & Model Remington RR12BK00  Federal LE13200 5/box

16 pellet-Winchester XB121 or equal $310.00  no bid
Brand & Model Remington 12B1   
1 oz hollow point-Winchester 
RA12R515 or equal $320.90  $320.00

Brand & Model Remington SP12RSB Federal F127RS
1 oz hollow point-reduced recoil $317.75  $304.00
Brand & Model Remington RR12RSB Federal LE127RS

9,40,45 practice up to 
120 days, .223 all up to 
150 days ARO

Invoiced by the box of 
20 or 50. Delivery 30-
60 days ARO

 Due to war, delivery will 
vary.
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