Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1882 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 03/21/07

Monarch Oil, Inc.

Sem Materials LP

v o , . Flint Hills Resources, LP | Hills Materials Company Jebro Incorporated
5 Liquid Asphaltic Road Ol Qy |UM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price] Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 |D- 1 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 774 1 TN | No Bid No Bid $171.00] $ 132,354.00] $§ 187.20( $ 144,892.80 N/B
2 |D-1 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 2698 TN | $364.72] $ 984,014.56| No Bid $352.00] $ 949,696.00] $ 408.00] $ 1,100,784.00 N/B
3 [D-1 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 200 [ TN | $321.20] $  64,240.00] No Bid $315.00] $ 63,000.00 N/B
4 [D-1 HFMS-2P ROAD OIL 193 | TN | No Bid No Bid $365.001 $  70,445.00 N/B
5 |D-2 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 17 | TN | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 18240| $ 3,100.80 N/B
6 |D-3 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 1047] TN | No Bid No Bid $146.00] $ 152,862.00] $ 194.40] $ 203,536.80 N/B
7 |D-3 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 4423| TN | $380.46( $ 1,682,774.58| No Bid $32450] $ 1,435,26350| $§ 422.40( $ 1,868,275.20 N/B
8 [D-3 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 75 | TN [ $351.85| $ 26,388.75| No Bid $275.001 $  20,625.00 N/B
9 |D-4 MC-250 ROAD OIL 105 | TN | $530.78[ $ 55,731.90] No Bid $467.00] $ 49,035.00 N/B
10 [D-4 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 1477] TN | $326.41] $ 482,107.57| No Bid $290.00] $ 428,330.00 N/B
11 [D-4 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 980 | TN | $374.86] $ 367,362.80] NoBid $315.00] $ 308,700.00 N/B
12 [D-4 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 4733] TN | $355.37| $ 1,681,966.21| No Bid $335.00] $ 1,585,555.00] $ 420.00] $ 1,987,860.00| $384.00] $ 1,817,472.00
13 [D-5 MC-250 ROAD OIL 122 | TN | $538.60f $ 65,709.20] No Bid No Bid N/B
14 [D-5 HFE-500 ROAD OIL 326 | TN | NoBid $438.81| $ 143,052.06|] No Bid N/B
15 [D-5 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 98 | TN [ $43155| $ 42,291.90| $438.81( $ 43,003.38( No Bid N/B
16 [D-5 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 102 | TN | No Bid $219.82| $ 22,421.64] NoBid $ 271.20] $  27,662.40 N/B
17 [D-5 CRS-2L ROAD OIL 1165| TN | No Bid $447.82| $ 521,710.30| No Bid N/B
18 [D-6 MC-250 ROAD OIL 93 | TN | $543.95[ $ 50,587.35| No Bid $485.001 $  45,105.00 N/B
19 [D-6 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 89 | TN [ NoBid No Bid $200.00] $ 17,800.00] $ 273.60( $  24,350.40 N/B
20 |D-6 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 2696 TN | $340.33]| $ 917,529.68| No Bid $305.00] $ 822,280.00 N/B
21 |D-6 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 73 | TN | $390.27( $  28,489.71] NoBid $376.00] $ 27,448.00 N/B
22 |D-6 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 1434] TN | $387.73] $ 556,004.82| No Bid $375.00] $ 537,750.00] $ 456.00] $ 653,904.00] $420.00] $ 602,280.00
23 |D-7 CMS-1 ROAD OIL 444 | TN | $372.49] $ 165,385.56| No Bid No Bid N/B
24 |D-7 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 77 | TN | NoBid No Bid No Bid $ 24720] $  19,034.40 N/B
25 |D-7 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 50 | TN [ $332.60| $ 16,630.00| No Bid No Bid N/B
26 |D-7 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 145 | TN | $376.87| $ 54,646.15| No Bid No Bid N/B
27 |D-7 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 142 | TN | $412.60f $ 58,589.20| No Bid No Bid N/B
28 |D-7 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 1981] TN | $389.07| $ 770,747.67| No Bid No Bid $ 453.60] $ 898,581.60| $396.00] $ 784,476.00
29 |D-8 MC-250 ROAD OIL 170 | TN | $521.77{ $ 88,700.90| No Bid $469.00] $ 79,730.00 N/B
30 |D-8 CSS/SS-1H 50/50 ROAD OIL 1534] TN | No Bid No Bid $168.00] $ 257,712.00] $ 235.20] $ 360,796.80 N/B
31 |D-8 HFE-150 ROAD OIL 88 | TN| $325.75( $  28,666.00| No Bid $270.00] $ 23,760.00 N/B
32 |D-8 HFE-300 ROAD OIL 774 ) TN | $335.76{ $ 259,878.24| No Bid $290.00] $ 224,460.00 N/B
33 |D-8 HFE-1000 ROAD OIL 245 TN | $394.32] $§ 96,608.40| No Bid $321.00] $ 78,645.00 N/B
34 |D-8 CRS-2P ROAD OIL 2328 TN | $385.78] $ 898,095.84| No Bid $343.00] $ 798,504.00] $ 453.60] $ 1,055,980.80 N/B
35 |CMS-1 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $340.00] $ 340.00( No Bid No Bid N/B
36 |CRS-2L FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 | TN| NoBid No Bid No Bid N/B
37 |CRS-2P FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $354.00] $ 354.00( No Bid $360.00| $ 360.00f $ 600.00| $ 600.00| $360.00] $ 360.00
38 |CSS/SS-1H 50/50 FOB PLANT LOCA 1 | TN| NoBid No Bid $295.00| $ 295.00( $ 600.00] $ 600.00 N/B
39 |HFMS-2P FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 | TN| NoBid No Bid No Bid N/B
40 |HFE-1000 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $389.00] $ 389.00| No Bid No Bid N/B
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1882 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 03/21/07

Flint Hills Resources, LP

Hills Materials Company

Jebro Incorporated

Monarch Oil, Inc.

Sem Materials LP
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D . . . .
5 Liquid Asphaltic Road Ol Qy |UM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price] Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

41 [HFE-150 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $306.00] $ 306.00( No Bid No Bid N/B

42 |HFE-300 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $350.00] $ 350.00|] No Bid No Bid N/B

43 |HFE-500 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 | TN | NoBid No Bid No Bid N/B

44 [MC-250 FOB PLANT LOCATION 1 [TN] $475.00] $ 475.00| NoBid No Bid N/B

Total $ 2,813,149.79 $ 730,187.38 $ 2,873,280.50 $ 3,320,589.60 $ 3,204,588.00
Payment Terms 0%, 30 100%, 30
Delivery Days ARO 1 per specifications 1 as needed per spec 1
No Bids

Vance Brothers, Inc.




