Buyer: Doug Holz

State Print Shop

Opening Date: 3/14/07

1866 OF
AWARD
Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
. Price Per . Price Per '
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Pncg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Eer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled
1 85" x 11" 150000/ M | $529 | s489 | ves| 30 | o2/86 | STecycled-CreatWhie 5758 | ves | 30 | @ Xerox
(Virgin - Impact, 93 Brignt)
2 8.5"x 11" 3HP 6000/M | $559 | $519 | Yes | 30 92186 Gt SE R $798 | Yes | 30 | @ Xerox
(Virgin - Impact, 93 Brignt)
Premium No. 4 Xerographic 20# Copier ) f
Paper, Smooth, White. Must contain PC 3 8.5"x 11" Xprs Pac 14,000/ M $5.49 $5.19 Yes 30 92 /86 (&;Tzd?; ; a(i;egg \g:]igit) NoBid | Yes | 30 92 Xerox
recycled content (30% minimum) Brightness 92 Y -
(minimum). Laser, and High Speed Copier 4 | 85'x11" 3P XprsPac | 3000 | $579 | $549 | Yes | 30 | oasge |  Recyeled-CreatWhite NoBid | Yes | 30 | 92 Xerox
Guaranteed, Ink Jet Compatible. (Virgin - Impact, 93 Brignt)
5 85" x 14" 3000/M | $673 | $622 | ves | 30 | opsee | Recycled- GreatWhite $1017 | Yes | 30 | 92 Xerox
(Virgin - Impact, 93 Brignt)
B ’ Recycled - Great White
6 11"x 17 1,000/ M $10.58 $9.78 Yes 30 92/86 (Virgin - Impact, 93 Brign) $15.76 | Yes | 30 92 Xerox
No.1 bond paper, 20# White watermarked 7 8.5"x 11" 1,200/ M $9.66 Yes 30 92/91 Hammermill Bond $10.80 | Yes | 0 | $92.00 Xerox
(smooth or wove finish). Recycled, 87 bright - - - -
(minimurm) Opacity 86 (minimurm) 8 85"x 14 25/M $12.29 Yes 30 92/91 Hammermill Bond NoBid | Yes | 0 [ $92.00 Xerox
9 11" x 17" 100/ M $19.32 Yes 30 92/91 Hammermill Bond NoBid | Yes | 0 [ $92.00 Xerox
Hammermill Fore MP Color; Xerox, Blue, Green, Yellow,
10 8.5"x 11" 9,000/ M $6.09 Yes 30 N/A /87 All Colors ’ $7.90 Yes | 30 N/A Pink, Canary, Goldenrod,
Ivory
Hammermill Fore MP Color; Xerox, Blue, Green, Yellow,
11 8.5"x 11" 3HP 100/ M $6.39 Yes 30 N/A |87 ’ $8.30 Yes | 30 N/A Pink, Canary, Goldenrod,
. All Colors
No. 1 Bond / Xerographic Paper, Ivory
Multipurpose, 204, Colors. Must contain PC
recycled content (30% minimum). Brightness 92
(minimum). Opacity 90 (minimum) . . Xerox, Blue, Green, Yellow,
12 85" x 14" 175/M | $7.75 Yes | 30 | Nmaser Hammem/;::' chlstP Cos $11.00 | Yes | 30 | NA | Pink Canary, Goldenrod,
Ivory
Hammermill Fore MP Color; Xerox, Blue, Green, Yellow,
13 1" x 17" 15/M $12.18 Yes 30 N/A |87 All Colors ! $22.79 Yes | 30 N/A Pink, Canary, Goldenrod,
Ivory
28# Color Copier Paper Super Premium No. 1| 14 8.5"x 11" 75/M $13.01 | Yes 98/93 Exact Digital Hyper Wht $13.16 | Yes | 0 98 Xerox
Ultra Smooth White. Must be Laser and Inkjet = ¢ 85"x 14" 1/M $1656 | Yes 98/93 | Exact Digital Hyper Wht $1699 | Yes | 0 | 98 Xerox
Guaranteed. Preference may be given to paper - - —
bid with PC recycled content. Brightness 98 16 11"x 17 60/M $26.02 | Yes 98/93 Exact Digital Hyper Wht $26.32 | Yes 0 98 Xerox
(minimum). Capacity 95 (minimum) 17 12"x 18" 5/M $30.05 | Yes 98/93 Exact Digital Hyper Wht $3383 [ Yes | 0 98 Xerox
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AWARD
Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
. Price Per . Price Per '
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Prlcg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Eer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled

Text, 504 Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or 18 8.5"x 11" 1/M $5.20 Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content| 19 11" x 17" 1/M $10.23 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
(30% minimum). Brightness 84 (minimum) 20 23"x 35" 5/M $4418 | Yes [ 0 |92/90t093 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Opacity 94 (minimum) 21 25" x 38" 3/M $51.98 | Yes | 0 [92/90t093 Williamsburg No Bid 0

22 8.5"x 11" 3,000/ M $5.95 Yes 0 92/90t0 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0

23 8.5"x 11" 3HP 500/M $6.25 Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Teﬁ“» 62#_ Uhf)‘“:;ted Offs?t»F“’gh'te (Sflnzom or | 24 8.5"x 14" 60/M $758 | Yes | 0 [92/90t093 Williamsburg No Bid 0
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content — — -
(30% minimum). Brightness 84 (minimum) 25 11"x 17 750/ M $11.90 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Opacity 94 (minimum) 26 17.5"X 22.5" 1/M $25.20 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0

27 23"x 35" 150/ M $51.41 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0

28 25" x 38" 120/ M $60.48 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0

29 8.5"x 11" 7IM $6.95 Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Teﬁ“» 72#_ Uhf)‘“:;ted Offs?t»F“’gh'te (Sflnzom o [ 39 11"x17" 22/M $1389 | Yes [ 0 [92/90t093 Wiliamshurg No Bid 0
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - " — -
(30% minimum) Brightness 84 (minimum) 31 17.5"x22.5 1/M $29.23 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Opacity 94 (minimum) 32 23"x 35" 35/M $59.98 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0

33 25"x 38" 45/M $70.56 | Yes 0 92/90to 93 Williamsburg No Bid 0
Cover, 65# Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or | 34 8.5"x 11" 300/ M $15.58 | Yes 0 96 /97 Accent Opaque $12.72 | Yes 0 Xerox
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content . .
(30% minimunm). Brightness 84 (minimurm) 35 11"x 17 85/M $31.15 | Yes 0 96 /97 Accent Opaque No Bid 0
Opacity 94 (minimum) 36 23"x 35" 20/M $131.91 | Yes | 0 96/97 Accent Opague No Bid 0

37 8.5"x 11" 3,000/ M $7.27 Yes 10 96 /94 Exact Premium #1 Opaque $1316 | Yes | 0 Xerox
24# Premium or Super Premium No. 1,
Laser Print, Smooth, White, Must be Laser 38 8.5"x 11" 3HP 1/M $7.57 Yes 10 96 /94 Exact Premium #1 Opaque $1373 | Yes | 0 Xerox
and inkjet Guaranteed. Preference may be givel
to paper bid with PC recycled content Brightness| 39 8.5"x 14" 1/M $9.25 Yes [ 10 96/94 | Exact Premium #1 Opague $1699 | Yes [ 0 Xerox
90 (minimum) Opacity 92 (minimum)

40 11" x 17" 7IM $14.54 Yes 10 96 /94 Exact Premium #1 Opaque $2632 | Yes | 0 Xerox

41 8.5"x 11" 30/M $6.39 Yes 30 N/A 87 Springhill Opaque Colors No Bid

R " Springhill Opaque Colors; All )

Text, 504 Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth o 42 11"x 17 6/M $12.78 Yes 30 N/A 187 Colors No Bid
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled Soringhil Colors: Al
content (30% minimurm) Springhill, Exact, 43 23'x 35" 1/M $54.22 Yes | 30 | najgy [SPOTIEREATEEOCE No Bid
Torchglow, or equivalent oS

44 25"x 38" 3/M $63.79 Yes | 30 | nasgr |SPinanit Ogg;‘)‘:: Colors; Al No Bid
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Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Prlcg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Eer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled
45 85"x 11" 20/M | $7.34 ves | 20 | sy |SPNONl 082%1:: Colors; Al No Bid
Text, 60# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - Springhill Opague Colors; All '
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 46 WX BIM Wik 2 <y R Colors No Bid
equivalent Springhil Opague Colors; Al
47 23'x 35" 20/M | $6345 Yes | 30 | Nasg7 |>PrmontERAGUeLO0N; No Bid
Colors
48 85"x 11" 100/M | $857 Yes | 20 | sy |SPNONI 082%1:: Colors; Al No Bid
Text, 70# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - Springhill Opague Colors; All '
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 49 WX 125/M il 2 <y R Colors No Bid
equivalent Springhill O Colors; All
50 23'x 35" 16/M | $7403 Yes | 30 | wasg7 |>PrmontERAGUeLOON; No Bid
Colors
51 85"x 11" 500/M | $14.35 Yes | 30 | NiAss7 CES\?S: gj}gf:”ﬁ’&?gfs No Bid
Cover, 65# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or .
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content B ’ Exact Wausau Opaque .
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 52 Wix1r 120/M W M2 <y R Cover Colors: All Colors No Bid
equivalent Exact W o
53 23"x 35" 55/M | $123.46 ves | 30 | Nass7 xact rausau upague No Bid
Cover Colors: All Colors
Text, 604 Offset, Bright Colors (smooth or 54 8.5"x 11" 150/ M $10.53 Yes 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
finish). Must contain PC recycled content (30% | 55 8.5"x 14" 5/IM $13.41 Yes 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
minimum where available) Astrobrights or 56 11" x 17" 5/M $21.06 Yes [ 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
equivalent 57 23" 35" 5/M $91.04 Yes | 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
Cover, 65# Offset, Bright Colors (smooth or 58 8.5"x 11" 30/M $20.87 Yes 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
finish). Must contain PC recycled content (30% 9 . 6/ 4174 v ” Astrobriahts: All Col »
minimum where available) Astrobrights or 3 1x17 16/M $41. = SR Do No B
equivalent 60 23"x 35" 5/M $179.39 Yes | 30 Astrobrights; All Colors No Bid
Cover, 80# Uncoated Offset, White, super 61 8.5"x 11" 100/ M $18.87 | Yes 96 /99 Accent Opaque Cover $29.90 | Yes 0 Xerox
smooth finish. Must contain PC recycled 62 . 20/ 775 | v 96199 29.90 0
content (30% minimum) Brightness 92 1x17 M $37. = $29. Yes Xerox
(minimum) Opacity 99 (minimum) 63 23"x 35" 3IM $162.75 | Yes 96/99 No Bid
) _ 64 8.5"x 11" 40/M $13.15 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index $18.23 | Yes Xerox
Index, 96#, White Must contain PC recycled | g X1 90/M | $26.29 Yes | 10 | 90/95:98 Springhill Index $5040 | Yes Xerox
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 - - — -
(minimum) 66 22.5"x35 15/M $108.75 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index No Bid
67 24" x 36" 5/M $125.48 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index No Bid
) _ 68 8.5"x 11" 1/M $16.24 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index $22.20 | Yes Xerox
Index, 110#, White Must contain PC recycled  |~gq X1 3/M $32.48 Yes | 10 | 90/95-98 Springhill Index No Bid
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 - - — -
(minimum) 70 22.5"x35 1/M $134.64 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index No Bid
71 24" x 36" 3/M $147.32 Yes 10 90/95-98 Springhill Index No Bid

Page 3 of 14




Buyer: Doug Holz

State Print Shop

Opening Date: 3/14/07

1866 OF
AWARD
Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
. Price Per . Price Per '
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Prlcg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Eer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled
_ 72 8.5"x 11" 60/M $14.37 Yes N/A/98 | Springhill Index, All Colors $20.70 | Yes Xerox
Index, 964, Colors Must contain PC recycled ™75 X1 12/M | $28.74 Yes N/A/98 | Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 - - — -
(minimum) 74 22.5"x 35 1/M $118.96 Yes N/A 198 Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
75 24" x 36" 1/M $130.73 Yes N/A 198 Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
_ 76 8.5"x 11" 175/M $17.07 Yes N/A 198 Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
Index, 110#, Colors Must contain PC recycled ™27 X1 1/M $34.15 Yes N/A/98 | Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 - - — -
(minimum) 78 22.5"x 35 5/M $141.66 Yes N/A 198 Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
79 24" x 36" 1/M $155.00 Yes N/A 198 Springhill Index, All Colors No Bid
80 23"x 35" 1/M $86.03 $66.05 | Yes 10 No Bid
#2 Gloss TEXT, 70#, White.Must contain PC | 81 24" x 36" 1/M $92.53 | $7049 | Yes | 10 No Bid
recycled content (10% minimum).Brightness 89 | 82 25" x 38" 40/M $101.21 | $77.70 | Yes 10 No Bid
(minimum) Opacity 93 (minimum) 83 26" x 40" 1M NIQ NQ | ves| 10 No Bid
84 28" x 40" 1/M $120.00 | $9158 | Yes 10 No Bid
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss
85 85"X 11 40/M $14.79 $1191 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Gloss $41.00 | Yes | 0O %0 Xerox
K . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
86 11" X 17 21/M $29.58 $23.82 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
. . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
87 23"x 35 100/M $98.31 $75.48 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
#2 Gloss TEXT, 80#, White. Must contain PC ) ) N
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 88 24" x 36" /M | $10554 | $8056 | ves | 10 | R 9219 i S e No Bid
i . - V: 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Gloss
(minimum) Opacity 95 (minimum)
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
89 25" x 38 100/M $115.66 | $88.80 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
90 26" x 40 1/M N/Q N/Q Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
. .\ R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
91 28" x 40 35/M $135.91 | $104.90 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Gloss No Bid
. . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
92 23"x 35 7IM $122.18 | $93.80 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
R . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
93 24" x 36 7IM $131.57 | $101.01 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
#2 Gloss TEXT, 100#, White.Must contain PC ) ) N
recycled content (10% minimum).Brightness 89 | 94 25" x 38" 15/M | $14458 | $11100 | ves | 10 | R 92/% i S e No Bid
i . - V: 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Gloss
(minimum) Opacity 96 (minimum)
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Gloss )
95 26" x 40 1/M N/Q N/Q Yes 10 V- 90/96 W il e No Bid
9 28" x 40" 7IM | $17060 | $13098 | Yes | 10 5: 92196 R: Steriing Closs No Bid

: 90/96

V: Omaha Paper Gloss
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AWARD
Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
) Price Per ) Price Per .
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Pncg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Rer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled
. . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
97 23"x 35 1/M $83.65 $66.05 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
R . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
98 24" x 36 1/M $89.97 $70.49 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
#2 Matte TEXT, 704, White. Must contain PC ) ) N
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 99 25" x 38" 1M $9841 | 7770 | ves | 10 | R 92/% i SEE No Bid
i . - V: 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk
(minimum) Opacity 93.5 (minimum)
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
100 26" x 40 1/M N/Q N/Q Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
. .\ R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
101 28" x 40 1/M $116.68 | $92.13 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
. . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
102 23"x 35 13/M $95.59 $75.48 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
R . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
103 24" x 36 30/M $102.62 | $81.03 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
#2 Matte TEXT, 80#, White. Must contain PC ) ) N
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 104 25" x 38" 36/M | $11246 | $8880 | ves | 10 | R 92/% i SEE No Bid
i . - V: 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk
(minimum) Opacity 95 (minimum)
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
105 26" x 40 1/M N/Q N/Q Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
. .\ R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
106 28" x 40 1/M $132.15 | $104.34 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
. . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
107 23"x 35 5/M $118.80 | $93.80 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
R . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
108 24" x 36 8/M $127.93 | $101.01 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
#2 Matte TEXT, 1004, White. Must contain PC ) ) N
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 109 25" x 38" 22im | 14058 | $11000 | ves | 10 | R 92/% e Sl il No Bid
e . - V: 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk
(minimum) Opacity 96.5 (minimum)
" . R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
110 26" x 40 1/M N/Q N/Q Yes 10 V- 90/96 V) Ommahapaper SIR No Bid
. .\ R: 92/96 R: Sterling Dull )
11 28" x 40 1/M $165.88 | $130.98 | Yes 10 V- 90/96 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
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Buyer: Doug Holz

State Print Shop
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1866 OF
AWARD
Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
. Price Per . Price Per '
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Pncg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Rer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled
” " R: 92/98 i
112 85"X11 8/M $25.00 $19.25 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 No Bid
Wy g R: 92/98
113 11" x 17 16/M $50.00 $38.50 | Yes 10 $77.30 | Yes | O 90 Xerox
V: 90/98
"y QEn R: 92/98 i
114 23"x 35 20/M $184.24 | $144.33 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 No Bid
#2 Gloss COVER, 80#, White. Must contain PC R 92/98
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 [ 115 24" x 36" 14/M $197.61 | $155.25 | Yes 10 V: 90/ 98 No Bid
(minimum) .
" . R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
116 25" x 38 17/M $216.93 | $164.28 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 W el e e No Bid
" . R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
117 26" x 40 3/M $237.73 | $186.30 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 W el e e No Bid
. .\ R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
118 28" x 40 1/M $255.56 | $200.68 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 V: Omaha Paper Gloss No Bid
. . R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
119 23"x 35 8/M $230.30 | $178.25 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 W el e e No Bid
R . R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
120 24" x 36 5/M $246.64 | $190.90 [ Yes 10 V- 90/98 W el e e No Bid
#2 Gloss COVER, 1004, White. Must contain ) ) N
PC recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness | 121 25" x 38" 7iM| 21190 | $20079 | Yes | 10 | R 92/98 | R SterlingDul No Bid
e V: 90/98 V: Omaha Paper Gloss
89 (minimum)
" . R: 92/98 R: Sterling Dull )
122 26" x 40 2IM $298.16 | $230.00 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 W el e e No Bid
. .\ R: 92/98 | R: Sterling Dull V: )
123 28" x 40 1/M $319.45 | $247.83 | Yes 10 V- 90/98 Omaha Paper Gloss No Bid
124 23"x 35" 2IM $189.20 | $154.33 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
#2 Matte COVER, 80#, White. Must contain PC | 125 24" x 36" 2/M $202.93 | $165.25 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 126 25" x 38" 20/M $222.77 | $174.28 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
(minimum) Opacity 98 (minimum) 127 26" x 40" 1/M $244.13 | $196.30 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Sik No Bid
128 28" x 40" 1/M $262.44 | $210.68 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
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1866 OF
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Business Paper Omaha Paper Xerox
. Price Per . Price Per '
Description Line Sizes Est. Annual M Pncg Eer ANSI| %PC | Brt/Opety Brand/Sheet, Colors, M Prlcg Eer anst | wpc Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors,
Item Useage M Virgin Comments M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled Recycled

129 23"x 35" 1/M $236.50 | $188.25 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
4#2 Matte COVER, 100#, White. Must contain | 130 24" x 36" 2IM $253.28 | $200.90 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
PC recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness | 131 25" x 38" 2IM $279.22 | $219.79 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
89 (minimum) 132 26" x 40" 1M $305.16 | $240.00 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid

133 28" x 40" 1/M $328.05 | $257.83 | Yes V: 90 V: Omaha Paper Silk No Bid
Chipboard, 23" X 35", Must contain PC recycled| 134 | .022 thickness, bundles 4/M $18.70 $74.80 Yes No Bid
content 135| .026 thickness, cartons 40/M $2152 | $860.80 [ Yes No Bid
Manila Tags, 24" X 36", 150#, Must contain PC ) L )
recycled content 136 packed in cartons 6/M $225.00 | Yes Springhill Tag No Bid

Payment Terms

2 % 30 Days

Delivery Days ARO

2-5
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Buyer: Doug Holz

State Print Shop

Opening Date: 3/14/07

1866 OF
Business Paper Xpedex
Line Est. Annual Price Per Price Per Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors
Description Sizes ) M - .~ | ANSI|%PC ' '
Item Useage M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled
1 8.5"x 11" 150,000/ M $5.69 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay / Tidax X-Press Packs
2 8.5"x 11" 3HP 6,000/ M $6.20 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay / Tidax X-Press Packs
Premium No. 4 Xerographic 20# Copier
Paper, Smooth, White. Must contain PC 3 8.5"x 11" Xprs Pac 14,000/ M $6.20 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay/Tidax X-Press Packs
recycled content (30% minimum) Brightness 92
(minimum). Laser, and High Speed Copier 4 | 85"x11" 3HP Xprs Pac 3,000 $6.08 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay/ Tidax X-Press Packs
Guaranteed, Ink Jet Compatible.
5 8.5"x 14" 3,000/ M $7.90 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay / Tidax X-Press Packs
6 11" x 17" 1,000/ M $12.40 Yes | 30 | 92/86 |Relay / Tidax X-Press Packs
No.1 bond paper, 20# White watermarked 7 8.5"x 11" 1,200/M $19.04 Yes | 30 96 | 24# Via Smooth White Bright
(smooth or wove finish). Recycled, 87 bright —
(minimum) Opacity 86 (minimum) 8 8.5"x 14 5IM
9 11" x 17" 100/M
Haml 4MP Blue, Buff, Green,
" . Canary, Cherry, Cream,
10 8.5"x 11 9,000/ M $7.30 Yes Goldenrod, vory, Tan,
Salmon
Haml 4MP Blue, Buff, Green,
1 85"x 11" 3HP 100/M | $7.75 Yes Canary, Cherry, Cream,
. Goldenrod, Ivory, Tan,
No. 1 Bond / Xerographic Paper, Salmon
Multipurpose, 204, Colors. Must contain PC
recycled content (30% minimum). Brightness 92 Haml 4MP Blue. Buff G
(minimum). Opacity 90 (minimum) arCnanary Crl:eer]ry uc;eaﬁen’
12 8.5"x 14 175/M $10.15 Yes Goldenrod, Ivory, Tan,
Salmon
Haml 4MP Blue, Buff, Green,
" " Canary, Cherry, Cream,
13 11"x 17 15/M $15.96 Yes
Goldenrod, Ivory, Tan,
Salmon
28# Color Copier Paper Super Premium No. 1] 14 8.5"x 11" 75/M $17.06 | Yes | 0 % Haml Color Copy
Ultra Smooth White. Must be Lager and Inkjet 15 8.5 x 14" /M $21.70 | Yes 0 98 Haml Color Copy
Guaranteed. Preference may be given to paper ——
bid with PC recycled content. Brightness 98 16 11'x17 60/M $34.12 | Yes | © 98 Haml Color Copy
(minimum). Capacity 95 (minimum) 17 12"x 18" 5/M $39.37 | Yes 0 98 Haml Color Copy
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Buyer: Doug Holz

State Print Shop

Opening Date: 3/14/07

1866 OF
Business Paper Xpedex
Line Est. Annual Price Per Price Per Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors
Description Sizes ) M - .~ | ANSI|%PC ' '
Item Useage M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled

Text, 50¢ Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or | 18 8.5"x 11" 1/M $7.97 | Yes Springhill
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content| 19 11"x 17" 1/M $15.94 | Yes Springhill
(30% minimum). Brightness 84 (minimum) 20 23" 35" 5/M $57.78 | Yes Springhill
Opacity 94 (minimum) 21 25" x 38" 3/M $67.98 | Yes Springhil

22 8.5"x 11" 3,000/ M $7.80 Yes Springhill

23 8.5"x 11" 3HP 500/ M $8.48 Yes Springhill
Text, 60# Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or 2% 8.5"x 14" 60/ M $9.00 Yes Springhil
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content — —
(30% minimum). Brightness 84 (minimum) % W17 750/M $1557 | Yes Springhill
Opacity 94 (minimum) 26 17.5"X 22.5" 1/M $32.96 | Yes Springhill

27 23" x 35" 150/ M $67.24 | Yes Springhill

28 25" x 38" 120/ M $79.10 | Yes Springhill

29 8.5"x 11" 7IM $9.32 Yes Springhill
Text, 70# Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or 30 11" x 17" 22/ M $18.64 Yes Springhil
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - " —
(30% minimum) Brightness 84 (minimum) 81 175'x225 1/M $39.22 | Yes Springhill
Opacity 94 (minimum) 32 23"x 35" 35/M 80.48. | Yes Springhill

33 25" x 38" 45/M $94.66 | Yes Springhill
Cover, 65# Uncoated Offset, White (smooth or | 34 8.5"x 11" 300/M $1853 | Yes Accent
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content o
(30% minimum). Brightness 84 (minimum) 3 17 85/M $39.00 | Yes Accent
Opacity 94 (minimum) 36 23"x 35" 20/M $150.40 | Yes Accent

37 8.5"x 11" 3,000/ M $11.10 Yes Haml Laser Print
244 Premium or Super Premium No. 1,
Laser Print, Smooth, White, Must be Laser 38 8.5"x 11" 3HP 1/M $12.75 | Yes Haml Laser Print
and inkjet Guaranteed. Preference may be givel
to paper bid with PC recycled content Brightness| 39 8.5"x 14" 1M $1556 | Yes Haml Laser Print
90 (minimum) Opacity 92 (minimum)

40 11" x 17" 7IM $24.46 | Yes Haml Laser Print

41 8.5"x 11" 30/M
Text, 50# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or 42 11" x17 6/M
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled
content (30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, 43 23" x 35" 1/M $70.90 Yes Springhill
Torchglow, or equivalent

44 25" x 38" 3/M $83.40 Yes Springhill
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State Print Shop

Opening Date: 3/14/07

1866 OF
Business Paper Xpedex
Line Est. Annual Price Per Price Per Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors
Description Sizes ) M - .~ | ANSI|%PC ' '
Item Useage M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled
45 8.5"x 11" 250/ M $9.61 Yes Springhill
Text, 60# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - -
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 46 Wiy 25/M $20.92 ves Springhill
equivalent
47 23" x 35" 20/M $82.95 Yes Springhill
48 8.5"x 11" 100/ M $11.50 | Yes Springhill
Text, 70# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content - -
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 49 Wiy 125/M $23.00 | Yes Springhill
equivalent
50 23" x 35" 16/M $97.62 Yes Springhill
51 8.5"x 11" 500/ M $82.95 Yes
Cover, 65# Offset Opaque, Colors (smooth or
vellum finish). Must contain PC recycled content -
(30% minimum) Springhill, Exact, Torchglow, or 52 Wiy 120/M
equivalent
53 23" x 35" 55/M $179.40 Yes
Text, 60# Offset, Bright Colors (smooth or o4 8.5 x 11" 150/ M
finish). Must contain PC recycled content (30% | 55 8.5"x14" 5/M
minimum where available) Astrobrights or 56 11"x 17" 5/M
equivalent 57 23"x 35" 5/M
Cover, 65# Offset, Bright Colors (smooth or 58 8.5"x 11" 30/M
finish). Must contain PC recycled content (30% 9 - 6/
minimum where available) Astrobrights or 3 1x17 16/M
equivalent 60 23"x 35" 5/M
Cover, 80# Uncoated Offset, White, super 61 8.5"x 11" 100/ M
smooth finish. Must contain PC recycled 62 - 20/
content (30% minimum) Brightness 92 1x1r M
(minimum) Opacity 99 (minimum) 63 23" x 35" 3/M
) ‘ 64 8.5"x 11" 40/ M $17.37 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
Index, 90#, White Must contain PC recycled  ["gg 1" x17" 0/M | $3474 Yes | 10 | 90 Springhill
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 — —
(minimurm) 66 22.5"x 35 15/M $143.70 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
67 24" x 36" 5/M $169.18 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
) ‘ 68 8.5"x 11" 1/M $23.14 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
Index, 110#, the Must cpntaln PC recycled 69 " x17" 3/M $45.90 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 —— —
(minimurm) 70 22.5"x 35 1/M $179.13 Yes | 10 90 Springhill
71 24" x 36" 3/M
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Business Paper Xpedex
Line Est. Annual Price Per Price Per Brt/ Brand/Sheet, Colors
Description Sizes ) M - .~ | ANSI|%PC ' '
Item Useage M Virgin Opcty Comments
Recycled
‘ 72 8.5"x 11" 60/M $18.28 Yes | 10 Springhill; Springhill colors
Index, 90#, Colprs Must cpntaln PC recycled 73 " x17" 2/M
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 —— ———
(minimum) T4 22.5"x 35 1/M $151.20 Yes | 10 Springhill; Springhill colors
75 24" x 36" 1/M
‘ 76 8.5"x 11" 175/ M $19.51 Yes | 10 Springhill; Springhill colors
Index, 110#, quqrs Must pontaln PC recycled 77 " x17" /M
content (10% minimum) Brightness 90 — ———
(minimum) 78 22.5"x 35 5/M $179.13 Yes | 10 Springhill; Springhill colors
79 24" x 36" 1/M
80 23"x 35" 1/M
#2 Gloss TEXT, 70#, White.Must contain PC | 81 24" x 36" 1/M
recycled content (10% minimum).Brightness 89 | 82 25" x 38" 40/ M
(minimum) Opacity 93 (minimum) ) 26" x 40" 1M
84 28" x 40" 1/M
85 8.5"X 11" 40/M
86 11" X 17" 21/M
87 23"x 35" 100/M
#2 Gloss TEXT, 80#, White. Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 88 24" x 36" 40/ M
(minimum) Opacity 95 (minimum)
89 25" x 38" 100/M
90 26" x 40" 1/M
91 28" x 40" 35/M
92 23"x 35" 7/M
93 24" x 36" 7/M
#2 Gloss TEXT, 100#, White.Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum).Brightness 89 | 94 25" x 38" 15/M
(minimum) Opacity 96 (minimum)
95 26" x 40" 1/M
96 28" x 40" 7IM
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Business Paper Xpedex
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Recycled
97 23"x 35" 1/M
98 24" x 36" 1/M
#2 Matte TEXT, 704, White. Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 99 25" x 38" 1/M
(minimum) Opacity 93.5 (minimum)
100 26" x 40" 1/M
101 28" x 40" 1/M
102 23"x 35" 13/M
103 24" x 36" 30/M
#2 Matte TEXT, 80#, White. Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 104 25" x 38" 36/M
(minimum) Opacity 95 (minimum)
105 26" x 40" 1/M
106 28" x 40" 1/M
107 23" x 35" 5/M
108 24" x 36" 8/M
#2 Matte TEXT, 100#, White. Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 109 25" x 38" 22/M
(minimum) Opacity 96.5 (minimum)
110 26" x 40" 1/M
111 28" x 40" 1/M
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Recycled
112 8.5"X 11" 8/M
113 11" x 17" 16/ M
114 23"x 35" 20/M
#2 Gloss COVER, 80#, White. Must contain PC
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 115 24" x 36" 14/M
(minimum)
116 25" x 38" 17/M
117 26" x 40" 3/M
118 28" x 40" 1/M
119 23"x 35" 8/M
120 24" x 36" 5/M
#2 Gloss COVER, 1004, White. Must contain
PC recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness | 121 25" x 38" 17/M
89 (minimum)
122 26" x 40" 2/M
123 28" x 40" 1/M
124 23"x 35" 2/M
#2 Matte COVER, 80#, White. Must contain PC | 125 24" x 36" 2/M
recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness 89 | 126 25" x 38" 20/M
(minimum) Opacity 98 (minimum) 127 26" x 40" 1M
128 28" x 40" 1/M
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Recycled
129 23"x 35" 1/M
#2 Matte COVER, 100#, White.Must contain | 130 24" x 36" 2/M
PC recycled content (10% minimum) Brightness | 131 25" x 38" 2IM
89 (minimum) 132 26" x 40" 1M
133 28" x 40" 1/M
Chipboard, 23" X 35", Must contain PC recycled| 134 | .022 thickness, bundles 4/M
content 135| .026 thickness, cartons 40/M
Manila Tags, 24" X 36", 150#, Must contain PC )
recycled content 136 packed in cartons 6/M
Payment Terms Net
Delivery Days ARO 30
No Bid:
Bach
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