PARTIAL
AWARD

PARTIAL
AWARD

Group 1 Group 2

Vendor Total Bid Vendor Total Bid
CED $33,934.36 CED $50,189.28
Competitive Edge $36,241.88 Competitive Edge 0
Crescent $41,092.25 Crescent $26,214.05

PARTIAL
GE Supply $33,226.23 AWARD GE Supply $17,010.46
Graybar $40,321.91 Graybar $25,719.45
Scott Electric $0.00 Scott Electric $0.00
Sunshine Lighting $0.00 Sunshine Lighting $52,926.74
Voss Lighting $41,618.05 Voss Lighting $19,587.70
WESCO Distribution $33,997.43 WESCO Distribution $28,816.59
Group 3 Group 4

Vendor Total Bid Vendor Total Bid
CED 253.63 CED 617.49
Competitive Edge 149.97 Competitive Edge 731.12
Crescent 357.36 Crescent 1458.32
GE Supply 371.48 GE Supply 1735.09
Graybar $357.06 Graybar $1,708.58
Scott Electric $150.77 Scott Electric $0.00
Sunshine Lighting $0.00 Sunshine Lighting $0.00

s PARTIAL L

Voss Lighting $131.78 AWARD Voss Lighting $660.35
WESCO Distribution $169.39 WESCO Distribution $825.69

Vendor Group 1/Brand Bid jroup 2/Brand Bi Group 3/Brand Bid Group 4/Brand Bid
CED Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania Sylvania
Competitive Edge Eiko No Bid Eiko Eiko
Crescent GE GE GE GE
GE Supply GE GE GE GE
Graybar GE GE GE GE
Scott Electric No Bid No Bid GE No Bid
Sunshine Lighting No Bid Universal No Bid No Bid
Voss Lighting PHILIPS ADVANCE Eiko Eiko
WESCO Distribution PHILIPS ADVANCE Eiko Eiko




Rejected Bids

Echo Electric Supply - Not Signed HD Supply/Hughes - Incomplete Bid Response



1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS
EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007
2:00 PM
STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: CED

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 1.07| 11183.64 Sylvania
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 0.76  4240.80 Sylvania
3/F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 1.07) 2311.20 Sylvania
4/ F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 6.36  0.4365 3.58 3870.57 Sylvania
5/F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 5.94| 0.4140 3.48| 1253.10|Sylvania
6 LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP | Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 29.74  7940.58 Sylvania
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 3.32 876.48 Sylvania
8 60A-130V[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 123 0.7178 0.35 83.31 Sylvania
9/150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 1.64 0.6808 0.52 74.34 Sylvania
10 100A-130V/[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 123 0.7178 0.35 83.31 Sylvania
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 5.51/ 0.6808 1.76 175.88| Sylvania
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 8.85 0.6808 2.82 271.19|Sylvania
13 F9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 5.63| 0.6586 1.92 153.77|Sylvania
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 57.84 0.6808 18.46, 1366.23 Sylvania
15 15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 2.44,  0.6586 0.83 49.98| Sylvania
TOTALS 33934.36
Price List # 07-01 Date: 3-1-07
Group 2 - Ballast
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/ GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 5191  0.4895 26.50 27878.06 Sylvania
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 5499  0.5335 25.65 16674.34 Sylvania
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 61.37 0.4895 31.33] 3195.60 Sylvania
4/ GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 5191  0.4895 26.50 689.00| Sylvania
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 7151  0.4895 36.51 1752.28|Sylvania
TOTALS 50189.28
Price List # 07-01 Date: 3-1-07
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.65| 0.2225 0.51 30.32|Sylvania
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.37  0.2225 0.29 5.75 Sylvania
3 Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 14.68 0.5060 7.25 217.56|Sylvania
TOTALS 253.63
Price List # 07-01 Date: 3-1-07
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
17414Y Mini Lamp 72 0.00|Sylvania
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.31 0.2225 0.24 609.79|Sylvania
3/24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.62| 0.2225 0.48 4.82 Sylvania
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.37| 0.2225 0.29 2.88|Sylvania
5/7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 0.00|Sylvania
TOTALS 617.49
Price List # 07-01 Date: 3-1-07
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS

EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007
2:00 PM

STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: Competitive Edge

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent

Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price |[Brand
1 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 3.73 0.60 1.49 15594.38|Eiko
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 2.48 0.60 0.99 5535.36 Eiko
3 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 3.73 0.60 149 3222.72|Eiko
4/ F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 4.15 0.60 1.66 1792.80 Eiko
5 F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 0.00 Eiko
6 LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP  |Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 84.95 0.60 33.98 9072.66 Eiko
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 0.00 Eiko
8 60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 0.00 Eiko
9 150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 0.00 Eiko
10 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.00 0.60 0.40 96.00 Eiko
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 2.24 0.60 0.90 89.60 Eiko
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 0.00 Eiko
13 F9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | | Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 3.84 0.60 1.54 122.88 Eiko
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 23.15 0.60 9.26 685.24 Eiko
15 15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 1.26 0.60 0.50 30.24 Eiko
TOTALS 36241.88

Price List # ELP 2005 D

Date: 5/1/2005

Group 2 - Ballast

Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price |[Brand
1 GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 650
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102
4 GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48
TOTALS 0.00
Price List # Date:
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price |[Brand
1 1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.605 0.60 0.24 14.52 Eiko
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.461 0.60 0.18 3.69 Eiko
3 Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 10.980 0.60 4.39 131.76 Eiko
TOTALS 149.97

Price List# ELP 2005 D

Date: 5/1/2005

Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature

Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price |[Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72 0.00 Eiko
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.518 0.60 0.21 524.22 Eiko
3/24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.414 0.60 0.57 5.66 Eiko
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.461 0.60 0.18 1.84 Eiko
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 0.997 0.60 0.40 199.40 Eiko

TOTALS 731.12

Price List # ELP 2005 D

Date: 5/1/2005
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS
EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007

2:00 PM

STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: Crescent Electric

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 4.74 0.735 1.26 13128.76 GE
2|F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 4.31 0.735 1.14] 6373.20/GE
3/F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 4.74 0.735 1.26, 2713.18 GE
4/F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 6.87 0.735 1.82] 1966.19|GE
5/F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 5.93 0.735 1.57 565.72|GE
6/LUL000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP | Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 181.42 0.735 48.08/ 12836.37|GE
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 18.59 0.735 4.93 1300.56|GE
8/60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.17 0.735 0.31 74.41 GE
9/150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 9.38 0.735 2.49 352.97 GE
10 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.17 0.735 0.31 74.41 GE
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 6.56 0.735 1.74 173.84 GE
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 8.54 0.735 2.26 217.26 GE
13 F9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 5.46 0.735 1.45 115.75/GE
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 59.05 0.735 15.65 1157.97 GE
15 15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 2.62 0.735 0.69 41.66 GE
TOTALS 41092.25
Price List # 9200 D / 9200 - PRO Date: Dec 2006
Group 2 - Ballast
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/ GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 50.34 0.735 13.34 14033.79/GE
2/GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 650 55.64 0.735 14.74  9583.99 GE
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 55.62 0.735 14.74  1503.41 GE
4/GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 50.34 0.735 13.34 346.84 GE
5/GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 58.65 0.735 15.54 746.03 GE
TOTALS 26214.05
Price List # PH 3200 D Date: Dec 2006
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.95 0.455 0.52 31.07|GE
2/44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.40 0.455 0.22 4.36 GE
3|Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 17.17 0.375 10.73 321.94 GE
TOTALS 357.36
Price List# PH 3200 D SS14200-d Date: Dec 2006
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/7414Y Mini Lamp 72 8.71 0.455 4.75 341.78 GE
2/85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.53 0.455 0.29 730.79 GE
3/24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.38 0.455 0.75 7.52/GE
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.40 0.455 0.22 2.18 GE
57876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.38 0.455 0.75 376.05 GE
TOTALS 1458.32
Price List # M 5200 D Date: Dec 2006
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS BID OPENING VENDOR: GE Supply
AND BALLASTS February 8, 2007
EVALUATION LIST 2:00 PM

STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Item Description Estimated Usage | List Price Discount| Net Price Ext Price |Brand
1/ F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 1.01 10556.52 |GE
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 0.70 3906.00 GE
3 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 1.01 2181.60 GE
4|F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 1.34 1447.20 |GE
5 F32T8/XL/SP41ECQ| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 1.35 486.00 |GE
6 LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP | Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 181.42 .756 4427 | 11819.15 |GE
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 3.52 929.28 |GE
8 60A-130V[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.17 .725 0.32 77.22 |GE
9 150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 3.65 741 0.95 134.24 |GE
10/ 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.17 .725 0.32 77.22 |GE
11/20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 6.56 741 1.70 169.90 GE
12/200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 8.54 .741 2.21 212.34 |GE
13 FOBX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | |Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 5.46 725 1.50 120.12 |GE
14/LU100/MED/[*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 59.05 .756 14.41 1066.21 |GE
15/15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 2.62 725 0.72 43.23 |GE
TOTALS 33226.23
Price List # 9200 D Date: 12-2006
Group 2 - Ballast
Item Description Estimated Usage | List Price Discount| Net Price Ext Price |Brand
1/GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 8.11 8531.72 |GE
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 10.47 6805.50 GE
3 GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 9.41 959.82 |GE
4/GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 8.11 210.86 |GE
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 10.47 502.56 |GE
TOTALS 17010.46
Price List # Bal 7200 D Date: 12-2006
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projection
Item Description Estimated Usage | List Price Discount| Net Price | Ext Price Brand
11819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 1.05 411 0.62 37.11 |GE
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.40 411 0.24 471 |GE
3 Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 17.17 .36 10.99 329.66 |GE
TOTALS 371.48
Price List# M 5200 D PH 3200 D Date: 12-2006
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage | List Price Discount| Net Price | Ext Price Brand
17414Y Mini Lamp 72 8.71 411 5.13 369.37 |GE
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 .53 411 0.31 789.79 |GE
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.38 411 0.81 8.13 |GE
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 .40 411 0.24 236 GE
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.92 411 1.13 565.44 |GE
TOTALS 1735.09
Price List # M 5200 D Date: 12-2006
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS
EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007
2:00 PM
STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: Graybar

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 4.74 0.74 1.23| 12881.04|GE
2|F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 4.31 0.74 1.12. 6252.95 GE
3|F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 4.74 0.74 1.23] 2661.98/GE
4/F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 6.87 0.74 1.79) 1929.10/GE
5/F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 5.93 0.74 1.54 555.05 GE
6/LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP  Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 181.42 0.74 47.17) 12594.18|GE
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 18.59 0.74 483 1276.02 GE
8/60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.21 0.74 0.31 75.50 GE
9/150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 9.38 0.74 2.44 346.31 GE
10 100A-130V/[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.21 0.74 0.31 75.50 GE
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 6.56 0.74 1.71 170.56 GE
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 8.54 0.74 2.22 213.16 GE
13 FIBX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 5.46 0.74 1.42 113.57 GE
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 59.05 0.74 15.35 1136.12 GE
15/15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 2.62 0.74 0.68 40.87 GE
TOTALS 40321.91
Price List# 9200 D Date: 12/06
Group 2 - Ballast
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 50.34 0.74 13.09 13769.00 GE
2|/GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 55.64 0.74 14.47  9403.16 GE
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 55.62 0.74 1446 1475.04 GE
4/GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 50.34 0.74 13.09 340.30 GE
5/GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 58.65 0.74 15.25 731.95 GE
TOTALS 25719.45
Price List # B-7200-D Date: 12/06
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.95 0.42 0.55 33.06|GE
2/44|13-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.40 0.42 0.23 4.64 GE
3|Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 17.17 0.38 10.65 319.36 GE
TOTALS 357.06
Price List # PH3200D Date: 12/06
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/7414Y Mini Lamp 72 8.71 0.42 5.05 363.73/GE
2/85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.53 0.42 0.31 777.72 GE
3/24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.38 0.42 0.80 8.00 GE
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.40 0.42 0.23 2.32/GE
57876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.92 0.42 1.11 556.80 GE
TOTALS 1708.58
Price List # M5200D Date: 12/06

G:\Purchasing\COMMODITIES\Bid Tabs\2007 Bid Tabs\1826 OF Light Bulbs & Ballast



1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS
EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007
2:00 PM
STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: Scott

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/ F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 0
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 0
3/ F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 0
4 F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 0
5 F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 0
6 LUL1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP  Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 0
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 0
8/ 60A-130V[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 0
9/150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 0
10 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 0
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 0
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 0
13 F9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 0
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 0
15 15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 0
TOTALS 0
Price List # Date:
Group 2 - Ballast
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/ GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 0
2 GE-432-120-N|PROLINET8 Electronic Ballast 650 0
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 0
4 GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 0
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 0
TOTALS 0
Price List # Date:
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0
3 Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 38.66 0.87 5.03 150.774/GE
TOTALS 150.77
Price List# PH3200D Date: 12-06
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 7414Y Mini Lamp 72 0
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0
57876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 0
TOTALS 0
Price List # Date: 12-06
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS
AND BALLASTS
EVALUATION LIST

BID OPENING
February 8, 2007
2:00 PM

STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

VENDOR: Sunshine Lighting

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent

Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price |Discount |[Net Price | Ext Price |Brand
1/ F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580
3/F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160
4/F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080
5|F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360
6 LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP  Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264
8/60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240
9/150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142
10 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240
11/20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100
12/200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96
13 FO9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | |Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74
15/15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60
TOTALS 0.00
Price List # Date:
Group 2 - Ballast
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price |Discount |[Net Price | Ext Price |Brand
1/GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 120.73 0.75 30.18| 31751.99 univers
2/ GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 101.80 0.75 25.45 16542.50 univers
3 GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 123.48 0.75 30.87| 3148.74 |univers
4|GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 120.73 0.75 30.18 784.75 univers
5/GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 58.23 0.75 14.56 698.76 univers
TOTALS 52926.74
Price List# DPS 0102 L Date: 1/2/07
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price |Discount |[Net Price | Ext Price |Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60
2/44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20
3 |Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30
TOTALS 0.00
Price List # Date:
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price |Discount |[Net Price | Ext Price |Brand
17414Y Mini Lamp 72
2/85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530
3|24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10
4|44 Eiko Miniature lamp 10
5/7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500
TOTALS 0.00
Price List # Date:
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1826-OF LIGHT BULBS BID OPENING VENDOR: Voss Lighting
AND BALLASTS February 8, 2007
EVALUATION LIST 2:00 PM
STATE PURCHASING BUREAU
Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 1.48 15468.96/Phillips
2 F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 0.70  3906.00 Phillips
3/ F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 1.02 2203.20|Phillips
4 F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 1.39  1501.20|Phillips
5 F32T8/XL/SP41ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 11.54 0.65 4.04 1454.04 Phillips
6/LU1000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP  Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 305.64 0.85 45.85| 12240.88|Phillips
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 3.28 865.92| Phillips
8/60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.66 0.85 0.25 59.76 Phillips
9 150A21/135WMI/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 17.94 0.85 2.69 382.12|Phillips
10 100A-130V/[*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.66 0.85 0.25 59.76 Phillips
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 10.46 0.85 1.57 156.90 Phillips
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 11.96 0.85 1.79 172.22|Phillips
13 FI9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | |Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 8.98 0.85 1.35 107.76 Phillips
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 115.59 0.65 40.46| 2993.78|Phillips
15/15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 5.06 0.85 0.76 45.54 | Phillips
TOTALS 41618.05
Price List# PS 100U Date: 12/06
Group 2 - Ballast
Iltem Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 10.06, 10583.12 Adv.
2|/GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 10.71 6961.50 Adv.
3/GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 11.32) 1154.64 Adv.
4/ GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 10.06 261.56 | Adv.
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 13.06 626.88|Adv.
TOTALS 19587.70
Price List# 159-CC Date: 1/07
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projectio
Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price A Ext Price Brand
1/1819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.61 0.64 0.22 13.18 Eiko
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.46 0.64 0.17 3.31 Eiko
3/Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 10.98 0.65 3.84 115.29 Eiko
TOTALS 131.78
Price List# ELP 2005 Date: May 2005
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage List Price Discount Net Price @ Ext Price Brand
1/7414Y Mini Lamp 72 0.00
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.52 0.64 0.19 473.62 Eiko
3/24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 1.41 0.64 0.51 5.08 Eiko
4144 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.46 0.64 0.17 1.66|Eiko
57876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 1.00 0.64 0.36 180.00 Eiko
TOTALS 660.35
Price List# ELP 2005 R MIW Date: May 2005
G:\Purchasing\COMMODITIES\Bid Tabs\2007 Bid Tabs\1826 OF Light Bulbs & Ballast 1



1826-OF LIGHT BULBS BID OPENING VENDOR: Wesco
AND BALLASTS February 8, 2007
EVALUATION LIST 2:00 PM

STATE PURCHASING BUREAU

Group 1 - Lamps, Flourescent, Incandescent
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 F32T8/SP41/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 10,452 1.04| 10870.08|Phillips
2|F34CW/RS/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 5,580 0.72| 4017.60|Phillips
3 F32T8/SP35/ECO|LAMP T8 Bipin Base 2,160 1.04 2246.40|Phillips
4/F32T8/SPX50/ECO| T8 32 W Bipin Base 1,080 1.48 1598.40 Phillips
5 F32T8/XL/SP41ECQ| T8 32 W Bipin Base 360 11.54 0.65 4.04  1454.04 Phillips
6/LUL000/ECO|CLEAR E25MOG HPS LAMP | Sodium Lucalox Lamp 267 305.64 0.86 42,79 11424.82 Phillips
7 F35CW/U/6/WM/ECO|FLUOR LAMP T12 34 W Med Bipin Base 264 3.26 860.64 Phillips
8/60A-130V|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 0.44 105.60| Phillips
9 150A21/135WM/TS-120V|LAMP Incadescent Lamp 142 2.77 0.86 0.39 55.07 Phillips
10 100A-130V/|*IF A19 MED LAMP Incadescent Lamp 240 1.66 0.86 0.23 55.78 Phillips
11 20T6-1/2DC/F| 120V DC BAY LAMP Incadescent Lamp 100 10.46 0.86 1.46 146.44 Phillips
12 200PS30/23/24PK-130V| IF RS LAMP Incadescent Lamp 96 11.96 0.86 1.67 160.74|Phillips
13 F9BX/SPX41/840|LOW WATT BIAX PLUG | |Compact Fluorescent Plug in 80 8.98 0.86 1.26 100.58 Phillips
14 LU100/MED/|*CLR E17MED HPS LMP Sodium Lucalox Lamp 74 82.89 0.86 11.60 858.74 | Phillips
15 15T7C| 120V CLR T7 CAND LAMP Incadescent Lamp 60 5.06 0.86 0.71 42.50 Phillips
TOTALS 33997.43
Price List # PS-100-U Date: 12/01/06
Group 2 - Ballast
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
1 GE-232-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 1052 43.53 0.61 16.98 17859.49 Advance
2|/GE-432-120-N|PROLINETS8 Electronic Ballast 650 12.35/ 8027.50 Advance
3 GE-332-MAX-N/ULTRA Electronic Ballast 102 46.79 0.61 18.25 1861.31 Advance
4/ GE-132-MAX-N/ULTRA| Electronic Ballast 26 41.33 0.61 16.12 419.09|Advance
5 GE-240-RS-MV-N|PROLINET12 Electronic Ballast 48 34.68 0.61 13.53 649.21 Advance
TOTALS 28816.59
Price List# 159 D Date: 1/07
Group 3 - Lamps, Special, Photo, and Projection
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
11819|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Indicator 60 0.242 1.13 0.27 16.41 Eiko
2 44|T3-1/4 Mini Bay Radio & TV 20 0.184 1.13 0.21 4.16|Eiko
3 Eiko EYB VOS EYB A/V-STTV LAMP 30 4.39 1.13 4.96 148.82 Eiko
TOTALS 169.39
Price List # ELP-2005-D Date: 5-1-2005
Group 4 - Lamps, Automotive, Sealed Beam and Miniature
Item Description Estimated Usage |List Price Discount Net Price | Ext Price Brand
17414Y Mini Lamp 72 0.00|Eiko
2 85| 28V .04A T1-3/4 Wedge Lamp 2530 0.207 1.13 0.23 591.79|Eiko
3 24PSB5 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.565 1.13 0.64 6.38|Eiko
444 Eiko Miniature lamp 10 0.184 1.13 0.21 2.08|Eiko
5 7876 Eiko Miniature lamp 500 0.399 1.13 0.45 225.44|Eiko
TOTALS 825.69
Price List # eLP-2005-D Date: 5-1-2005
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