Buyer: Doug Holz 1730 OF Opening Date: 11/13/06
Common Fishes of Nebraska
AWARD
COMMON HSI GLOBAL HSI GLOBAL TOWNSEND
FISHES OF | GATEWAY PRESS| 100GM COATED 120GM COATED COMMUNICATIONS
Line] NEBRASKA PAPER PAPER
DESCRIPTION U_mt Exte_nded U_mt Exte_nded U_nlt Exte_nded Unit Price Exte_nded
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 36 PG RECY,

100M-124.999M|$256.25($32,031.00] $91.00|$11,374.90|$113.00{%$14,124.89| $136.946|%$17,255.00
36 PG RECY,

2 |125M-149.999M|$229.43|$34,414.00| $90.90($13,634.91($113.60($17,039.89| $134.301|%$20,145.00
36 PG RECY,

3 [150M-174.999M($211.55|$37,022.00( $90.50|$15,837.41($113.10|$19,792.39| $131.344|%$22,985.00
36 PG RECY,

4 175M-200M |$198.77|$39,754.00| $90.00|$18,000.00/$112.50|%$22,500.00| $128.850(%$25,770.00
40 PG RECY,

5 |100M-124.999M|$258.62|$32,327.00/$101.00($12,624.90($126.00|$15,749.87| $149.281|%$18,660.00
40 PG RECY,

6 [125M-149.999M($231.88|$34,782.00{$100.90|%$15,134.90($126.20|$18,929.87| $145.701|%$21,855.00
40 PG RECY,

7 |[150M-174.999M|$214.05|$37,459.00($100.50|$17,587.40($125.60|$21,979.87| $142.744|%$24,980.00
40 PG RECY,

8 175M-200M |$201.31|$40,263.00/$100.00|$20,000.00/$125.00|$25,000.00| $140.150(%$28,030.00
44 PG RECY,

9 [100M-124.999M|$315.84|$39,480.00{$111.00|%$13,874.89|$138.75|$17,343.61| $168.761|%$21,095.00
44 PG RECY,

10 [125M-149.999M($281.08|$42,162.00{$110.90|$16,634.89($138.60|$20,789.86| $164.368|%$24,655.00
44 PG RECY,

11 [150M-174.999M($257.91|$45,133.00($110.50|$19,337.39($138.10|$24,167.36| $160.772]|%$28,135.00
44 PG RECY,

12 175M-200M |$241.35|$48,271.00|$110.00($22,000.00|$137.50|$27,500.00| $157.750|%$31,550.00
48 PG RECY,

13 |100M-124.999M|$278.52|$34,815.00/$121.00($15,124.88($151.30($18,912.35| $163.625|%$20,455.00
48 PG RECY,

14 [125M-149.999M($250.38|$37,557.00($120.90|$18,134.88($151.10|$22,649.85| $159.334|%$23,900.00
48 PG RECY,

15 [150M-174.999M($231.63|$40,535.00($120.50|$21,087.38($150.50|$26,337.35| $156.363|$27,365.00
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Buyer: Doug Holz 1730 OF Opening Date: 11/13/06
Common Fishes of Nebraska

AWARD
COMMON HSI GLOBAL HSI GLOBAL TOWNSEND
FISHES OF | GATEWAY PRESS| 100GM COATED 120GM COATED COMMUNICATIONS
Line| NEBRASKA PAPER PAPER
48 PG RECY,

16 175M-200M  |$218.22|$43,643.00{$120.00{$24,000.00{$150.00{$30,000.00 $154.625|%$30,925.00

52 PG RECY,
17 [100M-124.999M|$333.46|$41,682.00|$131.00|$16,374.87|$163.70|$20,462.34| $183.895|$22,985.00

52 PG RECY,
18 |125M-149.999M|$296.09| $44,413.00/$130.90($19,634.87($163.60| $24,539.84| $180.235|$27,035.00

52 PG RECY,
19 |150M-174.999M|$271.17]|$47,454.00/$130.50($22,837.37($163.10| $28,542.34| $177.258]$31,020.00

52 PG RECY,
20 175M-200M | $253.37]$50,673.00/$130.00{$26,000.00{$162.50| $32,500.00| $174.725]|$34,945.00

36 PG VIRGIN
21 [100M-124.999M[$253.10{$31,637.00{ $91.00|$11,374.90|$113.00|$14,124.89

36 PG VIRGIN
22 |125M-149.999M|[$226.39| $33,958.00| $90.90|$13,634.91|$113.60{$17,039.89

36 PG VIRGIN
23 |150M-174.999M|$208.59| $36,502.00| $90.50|$15,837.41|$113.10{$19,792.39

36 PG VIRGIN
24 175M-200M  [$195.87]$39,174.00{ $90.00{$18,000.00{$112.50{$22,500.00

40 PG VIRGIN
25 |100M-124.999M[$255.38($31,922.00{$101.00| $12,624.90|$126.00| $15,749.87

40 PG VIRGIN
26 |125M-149.999M|$228.73] $34,309.00|$100.90| $15,134.90|$126.20{ $18,929.87

40 PG VIRGIN
27 [150M-174.999M|$210.96|$36,918.00|$100.50|$17,587.40|$125.60|$21,979.87

40 PG VIRGIN
28 175M-200M |$198.26]$39,658.00{$100.00{$20,000.00{$125.00{$25,000.00

44 PG VIRGIN
29 |100M-124.999M[$311.99| $38,988.00|$111.00|$13,874.89]|$138.75($17,343.61

44 PG VIRGIN
30 [125M-149.999M[$277.38($41,606.00{$110.90| $16,634.89|$138.60| $20,789.86

44 PG VIRGIN
31 [150M-174.999M[$254.30{$44,502.00{$110.50| $19,337.39|$138.10| $24,167.36
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Buyer: Doug Holz 1730 OF Opening Date: 11/13/06
Common Fishes of Nebraska

AWARD
COMMON HSI GLOBAL HSI GLOBAL TOWNSEND
FISHES OF | GATEWAY PRESS| 100GM COATED 120GM COATED COMMUNICATIONS
Line| NEBRASKA PAPER PAPER
44 PG VIRGIN

32 175M-200M |$237.81]|$47,561.00{$110.00{$22,000.00{$137.50{$27,500.00

48 PG VIRGIN
33 |100M-124.999M|$274.59| $34,232.00|$121.00| $15,124.88|$151.30($18,912.35

48 PG VIRGIN
34 |125M-149.999M[$246.56( $36,984.00($120.90| $18,134.88|$151.10| $22,649.85

48 PG VIRGIN
35 |150M-174.999M([$227.87($39,878.00{$120.50| $21,087.38|$150.50| $26,337.35

48 PG VIRGIN
36 175M-200M |$214.53]|$42,905.00{$120.00{$24,000.00{$150.00{$30,000.00

52 PG VIRGIN
37 |100M-124.999M{$329.04($41,130.00{$131.00|$16,374.87|$163.70| $20,462.34

52 PG VIRGIN
38 [125M-149.999M|$293.08|$43,962.00{$130.90|$19,634.87|$163.60| $24,539.84

52 PG VIRGIN
39 |150M-174.999M{$309.11[$54,093.00{$130.50| $22,837.37|$163.10| $28,542.34

52 PG VIRGIN
40 175M-200M | $251.98]$50,397.00|$130.00{$26,000.00{$162.50| $32,500.00

NO BID
Standard Register

INVALID BIDS
Marcalm Trade Pte Ltd - No ITB Cover
Sheet.
HSI Global 100 GM Coated Paper - Not
able to meet required delivery time.
HSI Global 120 GM Coated Paper - Not
able to meet required delivery time.
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Buyer: Doug Holz 1730 OF Opening Date: 11/13/06
Common Fishes of Nebraska

COMMON PHILLIPS
FISHES OF JACOB NORTH OMAHA PRINT BROTHER
Line| NEBRASKA PRINTING
DESCRIPTION U_nlt Exte_nded U!’]It Exte_nded U_mt Exte_nded
Price Price Price Price Price Price

(100M) [(Z00M)
1 | 36 PG RECY, [$172.95$17,295.00
100M-124.999M|$160.50 [$20,060.00 | $190.00| $23,750.00|$190.00| $23,749.81

(125M) |(125M)
36 PG RECY, |$160.50 |$20,060.00
2 [125M-149.999M|$152.77 |$22,915.00 | $183.00| $27,450.00| $182.00| $27,229.82
(I50M) |(150M)
36 PG RECY, [$152.77 |$22.915.00
3 [150M-174.999M|$146.27 |$25.597.00 [NO BID [NOBID  |$175.00{$30,624.83

(175M) [(175M)
36 PG RECY, |$146.27$25,597.00
4 175M-200M ]$141.83[$28,365.00 [NO BID |NO BID $172.00{$34,400.00

(T0OM) [(Z00M)
40 PG RECY, [$185.50 [$18,550.00
5 |100M-124.999M|$171.97 |$21.496.00 |$206.00| $25,750.00|$226.00| $28,249.77

(125M) |(125M)
40 PG RECY, |[$171.97 [$21,496.00
6 |125M-149.999M|$164.00 |$24,600.00 [NO BID [NOBID  |$217.00{$32,549.78
(I50M) |(150M)
40 PG RECY, |$164.00 |$24,600.00
7 |150M-174.999M|$156.51 |$27,388.00 [NO BID [NOBID  |$208.00{$36,399.79

(175M) [(175M)
40 PG RECY, |$156.51($27,388.00
8 175M-200M |$151.68 [$30,335.00 [$183.00| $36,600.00|$204.00| $40,800.00

(T0OM) |(100M)
44 PG RECY, [$209.25 [$20,925.00
9 |100M-124.999M|$195.80 |$24,475.00 |$242.00] $30,250.00|$242.00| $30,249.76

(125M) [(125M)
44 PG RECY, [$195.80 |$24,475.00
10 |125M-149.999M|$188.17 |$28,225.00 |[NO BID [NO BID  |$229.00|$34,349.77
(I50M) [(150M)
44 PG RECY, ($188.17 [$28,225.00
11 [150M-174.999M|$180.43 |$31,575.00 |[NO BID [NOBID  |$223.00|$39,024.78
(75M) [(175M)
44 PG RECY, [$180.43|$31,575.00
12 | 175M-200M |$175.63|$35,125.00 |[NO BID [NOBID  |$215.00|$43,000.00
(TOOM) [(100OM)
48 PG RECY, [$204.95 [$20,495.00
13 |100M-124.999M|$191.97 |$23,996.00 | $222.00] $27,750.00| $250.00| $31,249.75
(125M) [(125M)
48 PG RECY, [$191.97 [$23,996.00
14 |125M-149.999M|$184.57 |$27,685.00 |[NO BID [NO BID  |$237.00|$35,549.76
(I50M) [(150M)
48 PG RECY, |$184.57 [$27,685.00
15 |150M-174.999M|$177.14 |$30,998.00 |[NO BID [NOBID  |$228.00|$39,899.77
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Buyer:

Line

Doug Holz

1730 OF
Common Fishes of Nebraska

Opening Date: 11/13/06

COMMON
FISHES OF
NEBRASKA

JACOB NORTH

OMAHA PRINT

PHILLIPS
BROTHER
PRINTING

16

48 PG RECY,
175M-200M

(I75M)
$177.14
$172.50

(I75M)
$30,998.00
$34,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

$223.00

$44,600.00

17

52 PG RECY,
100M-124.999M

(TOOM)
$234.95
$218.92

(ZOOM)
$23,495.00
$27,365.00

$267.00

$33,375.00

$271.00

$33,874.73

18

52 PG RECY,
125M-149.999M

T25M)
$218.92
$209.17

(T25M)
$27,365.00
$31,375.00

NO BID

NO BID

$258.00

$38,699.74

19

52 PG RECY,
150M-174.999M

(150M)
$209.17
$200.60

(150M)
$31,375.00
$35,105.00

NO BID

NO BID

$248.00

$43,399.75

20

52 PG RECY,
175M-200M

(I75M)
$200.60
$194.88

(I75M)
$35,105.00
$38,975.00

$236.00

$47,200.00

$244.00

$48,800.00

21

36 PG VIRGIN
100M-124.999M

(1O0M)
$172.95
$160.50

(100M)
$17,295.00
$20,060.00

$172.00

$21,500.00

$183.00

$22,874.82

22

36 PG VIRGIN
125M-149.999M

(I25M)
$160.50
$152.77

(125M)
$20,060.00
$22,915.00

$163.00

$24,450.00

$175.00

$26,259.83

23

36 PG VIRGIN
150M-174.999M

(150M)
$152.77
$146.27

(150M)
$22.915.00
$25.597.00

$156.00

$27,300.00

$170.00

$29,749.83

24

36 PG VIRGIN
175M-200M

(I75M)
$146.27
$141.83

(I75M)
$25,597.00
$28,365.00

$156.00

$30,200.00

$167.00

$33,400.00

25

40 PG VIRGIN
100M-124.999M

(100M)
$185.50
$171.97

(1O0M)
$18,550.00
$21.496.00

$184.00

$23,000.00

$219.00

$27,374.78

26

40 PG VIRGIN
125M-149.999M

(I25M)
$171.97
$164.00

(125M)
$21,496.00
$24,600.00

$174.00

$26,100.00

$209.00

$31,349.79

27

40 PG VIRGIN
150M-174.999M

(I50M)
$164.00
$156.51

(T50M)
$24,600.00
$27,388.00

$167.00

$29,225.00

$203.00

$35,524.80

28

40 PG VIRGIN
175M-200M

(175M)
$156.51
$151.68

(175M)
$27,388.00
$30,335.00

$162.00

$32,400.00

$199.00

$39,800.00

29

44 PG VIRGIN
100M-124.999M

(TOOM)
$209.25
$195.80

(TOOM)
$20,925.00
$24,475.00

$225.00

$28,125.00

$233.00

$29,124.77

30

44 PG VIRGIN
125M-149.999M

(125M)
$195.80
$188.17

(125M)
$24,475.00
$28,225.00

$211.00

$31,650.00

$223.00

$33,449.78

31

44 PG VIRGIN
150M-174.999M

(I50M)
$188.17
$180.43

(I50M)
$28,225.00
$31,575.00

$201.00

$35,175.00

$217.00

$37,974.78
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Buyer:

Line

Doug Holz

1730 OF
Common Fishes of Nebraska

Opening Date: 11/13/06

COMMON
FISHES OF
NEBRASKA

JACOB NORTH

OMAHA PRINT

PHILLIPS
BROTHER
PRINTING

32

44 PG VIRGIN
175M-200M

(I75M)
$180.43
$175.63

(I75M)
$31,575.00
$35,125.00

$194.00

$38,800.00

$213.00

$42,600.00

33

48 PG VIRGIN
100M-124.999M

(TOOM)
$204.95
$191.97

(ZOOM)
$20,495.00
$23,996.00

$197.00

$24,625.00

$241.00

$30,124.76

34

48 PG VIRGIN
125M-149.999M

(125M)
$191.97
$184.57

(125M)
$23,996.00
$27,685.00

$188.00

$28,200.00

$231.00

$34,649.77

35

48 PG VIRGIN
150M-174.999M

(I50M)
$184.57
$177.14

(I50M)
$27,685.00
$30,998.00

$182.00

$31,850.00

$225.00

$39,374.77

36

48 PG VIRGIN
175M-200M

(I75M)
$177.14
$172.50

(I75M)
$30,998.00
$34,500.00

$177.00

$35,400.00

$220.00

$44,000.00

37

52 PG VIRGIN
100M-124.999M

(TO0M)
$234.95
$218.92

(TO0M)
$23,495.00
$27,365.00

$238.00

$29,750.00

$261.00

$32,624.74

38

52 PG VIRGIN
125M-149.999M

(I25M)
$218.92
$209.17

(125M)
$27,365.00
$31,375.00

$225.00

$33,750.00

$251.00

$37,649.75

39

52 PG VIRGIN
150M-174.999M

(150M)
$209.17
$200.60

(150M)
$31,375.00
$35,105.00

$216.00

$37,800.00

$245.00

$42,874.75

40

52 PG VIRGIN
175M-200M

(I75M)
$200.60
$194.88

(175M)
$35,105.00
$38,975.00

$209.00

$41,800.00

$241.00

$48,200.00
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