
Buyer:  Todd Dlouhy 1706 OF
Dept of Roads Logistic

Opening Date:  11/02/06

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Patching D-1 302 Sup.Lincoln 10 TN  $       88.96  $     889.60  no bid  no bid  $       72.50  $     725.00 $             -   

2 Patching D-1 Auburn 20 TN  $       95.09  $  1,901.80  no bid  no bid  $       77.75  $  1,555.00  $       83.00  $  1,660.00 
3 Patching D-1 Beatrice 10 TN  $       90.08  $     900.80  no bid  no bid  $       75.00  $     750.00  $       81.00  $     810.00 
4 Patching D-1 David City 10 TN  $       91.43  $     914.30  no bid  no bid  $       72.50  $     725.00  $       77.00  $     770.00 
5 Patching D-1 Dorchester 15 TN  $       90.86  $  1,362.90  no bid  no bid  $       72.00  $  1,080.00  $       79.00  $  1,185.00 
6 Patching D-1 Fairbury 15 TN  $       91.95  $  1,379.25  no bid  no bid  $       73.25  $  1,098.75  $       83.00  $  1,245.00 

Patching D-1 Falls City 7 TN  $       99.50  $     696.50  no bid  no bid  $       75.50  $     528.50 $             -   

Patching D-1 Greenwood 8 TN  $       88.96  $     711.68  no bid  no bid  $       70.00  $     560.00 $             -   

9 Patching D-1 Nebr.City 18 TN  $       93.22  $  1,677.96  no bid  no bid  $       75.00  $  1,350.00  $       79.00  $  1,422.00 
10 Patching D-1Palmyra 26 TN  $       89.63  $  2,330.38  no bid  no bid  $       72.00  $  1,872.00  $       75.00  $  1,950.00 
11 Patching D-1 Pawnee City 15 TN  $       95.47  $  1,432.05  no bid  no bid  $       76.00  $  1,140.00  $       83.00  $  1,245.00 

Patching D-1 Salt Valley-Lincoln 16 TN  $       88.17  $  1,410.72  no bid  no bid  $       71.00  $  1,136.00 $             -   

13 Patching D-1 Seward 17 TN  $       88.85  $  1,510.45  no bid  no bid  $       70.00  $  1,190.00  $       77.00  $  1,309.00 
14 Patching D-1 Tecumseh 15 TN  $       93.07  $  1,396.05  no bid  no bid  $       72.00  $  1,080.00  $       79.00  $  1,185.00 

Patching D-1 Wahoo 8 TN  $       88.30  $     706.40  no bid  no bid  $       70.00  $     560.00 $             -   

16 Patching D-2 Blair 11 TN  $       91.31  $  1,004.41  no bid  no bid  $       74.75  $     822.25  $       80.00  $     880.00 
17 Patching D-2 Elkhorn 14 TN  $       92.54  $  1,295.56  no bid  no bid  $       73.00  $  1,022.00  $       79.00  $  1,106.00 
18 Patching D-2 Fremont 42 TN  $       92.06  $  3,866.52  no bid  no bid  $       76.00  $  3,192.00  $       81.00  $  3,402.00 
19 Patching D-2 Omaha 10 TN  $       92.32  $     923.20  no bid  no bid  $       73.25  $     732.50  $       79.00  $     790.00 
20 Patching D-2 Papillion 10 TN  $       92.00  $     920.00  no bid  no bid  $       73.25  $     732.50  $       79.00  $     790.00 
21 Patching D-2 Plattsmouth 15 TN  $       91.94  $  1,379.10  no bid  no bid  $       74.25  $  1,113.75  $       79.00  $  1,185.00 
22 Patching D-3 Albion 15 TN  $       99.50  $  1,492.50  no bid  no bid  $       82.50  $  1,237.50  $       88.00  $  1,320.00 
23 Patching D-3 Bloomfield 20 TN  $     104.41  $  2,088.20  no bid  no bid  $       77.00  $  1,540.00  $       85.00  $  1,700.00 
24 Patching D-3 Columbus 15 TN  $       94.33  $  1,414.95  no bid  no bid  $       79.00  $  1,185.00  $       90.00  $  1,350.00 
25 Patching D-3 Hartington 35 TN  $     101.64  $  3,557.40  no bid  no bid  $       76.00  $  2,660.00  $       82.00  $  2,870.00 
26 Patching D-3 Humphrey 15 TN  $       97.45  $  1,461.75  no bid  no bid  $       78.00  $  1,170.00  $       87.00  $  1,305.00 
27 Patching D-3 Laurel 35 TN  $       98.99  $  3,464.65  no bid  no bid  $       76.00  $  2,660.00  $       79.00  $  2,765.00 
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28 Patching D-3 Lyons 30 TN  $       92.69  $  2,780.70  no bid  no bid  $       78.00  $  2,340.00  $       79.00  $  2,370.00 
29 Patching D-3 Neligh 20 TN  $     102.14  $  2,042.80  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $  1,640.00  $       87.00  $  1,740.00 
30 Patching D-3 Niobrara 20 TN  $     107.06  $  2,141.20  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $  1,640.00  $       87.00  $  1,740.00 
31 Patching D-3 Norfolk 15 TN  $       97.73  $  1,465.95  no bid  no bid  $       85.00  $  1,275.00  $       84.00  $  1,260.00 
32 Patching D-3 So.Sioux City 30 TN  $     101.14  $  3,034.20  no bid  no bid  $       75.00  $  2,250.00  $       78.00  $  2,340.00 
33 Patching D-3 Wayne 35 TN  $       96.98  $  3,394.30  no bid  no bid  $       80.00  $  2,800.00  $       80.00  $  2,800.00 
34 Patching D-3 West Point 15 TN  $       92.32  $  1,384.80  no bid  no bid  $       79.00  $  1,185.00  $       81.00  $  1,215.00 
35 Patching D-4 Aurora 14 TN  $       94.33  $  1,320.62  no bid  no bid  $       75.50  $  1,057.00  $       81.00  $  1,134.00 
36 Patching D-4 Central City 15 TN  $       96.46  $  1,446.90  no bid  no bid  $       83.00  $  1,245.00  $       85.00  $  1,275.00 
37 Patching D-4 Fullerton 15 TN  $       98.36  $  1,475.40  no bid  no bid  $       80.00  $  1,200.00  $       87.00  $  1,305.00 
38 Patching D-4 Geneva 15 TN  $       93.32  $  1,399.80  no bid  no bid  $       77.00  $  1,155.00  $       83.00  $  1,245.00 
39 Patching D-4 Grand Island 15 TN  $       97.10  $  1,456.50  no bid  no bid  $       79.50  $  1,192.50  $       90.00  $  1,350.00 
40 Patching D-4 Greeley 15 TN  $     102.52  $  1,537.80  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $  1,230.00  $       95.00  $  1,425.00 
41 Patching D-4 Hastings 13 TN  $       97.86  $  1,272.18  no bid  no bid  $       77.00  $  1,001.00  $       92.00  $  1,196.00 
42 Patching D-4 Hebron 15 TN  $       95.72  $  1,435.80  no bid  no bid  $       80.00  $  1,200.00  $       87.00  $  1,305.00 
43 Patching D-4 Kearney 30 TN  $     102.02  $  3,060.60  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $  2,460.00  $       80.00  $  2,400.00 
44 Patching D-4 Loup City 15 TN  $     103.53  $  1,552.95  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $  1,230.00  $       82.00  $  1,230.00 
45 Patching D-4 Ord 15 TN  $     105.17  $  1,577.55  no bid  no bid  $       85.00  $  1,275.00  $       87.00  $  1,305.00 
46 Patching D-4 Osceola 15 TN  $       93.83  $  1,407.45  no bid  no bid  $       75.00  $  1,125.00  $       83.00  $  1,245.00 
47 Patching D-4 Ravenna 15 TN  $     100.63  $  1,509.45  no bid  no bid  $       80.00  $  1,200.00  $       80.00  $  1,200.00 
48 Patching D-4 Red Cloud 15 TN  $     102.40  $  1,536.00  no bid  no bid  $       83.00  $  1,245.00  $       90.00  $  1,350.00 
49 Patching D-4 St. Paul 15 TN  $     100.00  $  1,500.00  no bid  no bid  $       85.00  $  1,275.00  $       85.00  $  1,275.00 
50 Patching D-4 Superior 28 TN  $     100.00  $  2,800.00  no bid  no bid  $       88.00  $  2,464.00  $       90.00  $  2,520.00 
51 Patching D-4 York 16 TN  $       91.81  $  1,468.96  no bid  no bid  $       77.00  $  1,232.00  $       79.00  $  1,264.00 
52 Patching D-7 McCook 30 TN  $     113.74  $  3,412.20  no bid  no bid  $       95.00  $  2,850.00  $       80.00  $  2,400.00 
53 Patching D-7 Minden 15 TN  $     101.77  $  1,526.55  no bid  no bid  $       93.00  $  1,395.00  $       80.00  $  1,200.00 
54 Lincoln Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $       83.18  $       83.18  no bid  no bid  $       74.50  $       74.50  $       70.00  $       70.00 
55 Sioux City Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  $       82.00  $       82.00  $       74.00  $       74.00 
56 North Platte Per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid  $       89.00  $       89.00  $       77.00  $       77.00 

Omaha per Ton FOB Plant 1 TN  $             -    $             -    $             -   $             -   

Delivery Days ARO required

< 5 Tons  $109.00          > 
5 Tons   $97.00

Payment Terms 100%, 30 Net 30
EXTENDED TOTALS  $                     91,112.92 $                                  -   
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