Buyer: Doug Holz

16780of
Game Parks Commission

Opening Date: 10/11/06

AWARD

; Description oty |uom Jacob North Companies Omabha Print V.G.Reed & Sons Western Web Printing

- Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 2/2 Recy 32 pg 125-M-149,999 125 M $ 93.92| $11,740.00| $ 109.14| $13,642.50 127.800| 15,975.000( $ 96.53| $12,066.25
2 |2/2 Recy 32 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 88.93| $ 13,339.50 no bid $ - 122.927| 18,439.050| $ 91.42| $13,713.00
3 2/2 Recy 32 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 85.34| $ 14,934.50 no bid $ - 118.486| 20,735.050| $ 89.86| $ 15,725.50
4 |2/2 Recy 32 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 82.68| $ 16,536.00 no bid $ - 115.835| 23,167.000| $ 88.60( $ 17,720.00
5 2/2 Recy 32 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M $ 80.60| $ 18,135.00 no bid $ - 115.262| 25,933.950| $ 87.71| $19,734.75
6 |2/2 Virg 32 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 92.40( $11,550.00( $ 99.22| $12,402.50 125.680| 15,710.000| $ 94.34| $11,792.50
7 2/2 Virg 32 pg 150M-174,999 150 M $ 87.42| $13,113.00| $ 96.48| $ 14,472.00 120.813| 18,121.950( $ 89.33| $13,399.50
8 2/2 Virg 32 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 83.86| $14,675.50| $ 94.36| $16,513.00 117.274| 20,522.950| $ 87.77| $ 15,359.75
9 2/2 Virg 32 pg 200M-224,999 200 M $ 81.19| $16,238.00| $ 92.64| $18,528.00 113.770| 22,754.000( $ 86.51| $17,302.00
10 2/2 Virg 32 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M $ 79.11| $17,799.75| $ 91.20| $20,520.00 112.930| 25,409.250( $ 85.62| $19,264.50

comments add'l $89.99
11 |2/2 Recy 40 pg 125M-149,999 125 M $ 122.16| $ 15,270.00 no bid $ - 163.952| 20,494.000( $ 123.91| $15,488.75
12 |2/2 Recy 40 pg 150M-174,999 150 M $ 115.58| $17,337.00 no bid $ - 156.287| 23,443.050| $ 117.55| $17,632.50
13 |2/2 Recy 40 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 110.86| $ 19,400.50 no bid $ - 152.246| 26,643.050| $ 115.73| $20,252.75
14 |2/2 Recy 40 pg 200M-249,999 200 M $ 107.34| $ 21,468.00 no bid $ - 148.840| 29,768.000| $ 114.68| $ 22,936.00
15 |2/2 Recy 40 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M $ 104.60| $ 23,535.00 no bid $ - 146.262| 32,908.950( $ 113.64| $ 25,569.00
16 |2/2 Virg 40 pg 125M-149,999 125 M $ 120.24| $15,030.00( $ 129.57| $16,196.25 160.832| 20,104.000( $ 121.17| $15,146.25
17 |2/2 Virg 40 pg 150M-174,999 150 M $ 113.69| $17,053.50( $ 125.42| $18,813.00 154.653| 23,197.950( $ 114.94| $17,241.00
18 |2/2 Virg 40 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 109.00| $19,075.00( $ 122.28| $21,399.00 148.983| 26,072.025| $ 113.12| $19,796.00
19 |2/2 Virg 40 pg 200M-224,999 200 M $ 105.51| $21,102.00( $ 119.37| $23,874.00 145.810| 29,162.000| $ 112.07| $22,414.00
20 2/2 Virg 40 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M $ 102.78| $23,125.50( $ 116.92| $ 26,307.00 144.420| 32,494.500( $ 111.03| $24,981.75
comments add'l $115.73

21 |2/2 Recy 48 pg 125M-149,999 125 M $ 135.92| $16,990.00 no bid $ - 174.648| 21,831.000| $ 140.18| $17,522.50
22 |2/2 Recy 48 pg 150M-174,999 150 M $ 129.14| $19,371.00 no bid $ - 168.740| 25,311.000( $ 133.17| $19,975.50
23 |2/2 Recy 48 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 124.23| $21,740.25 no bid $ - 164.954| 28,866.950| $ 131.55| $ 23,021.25
24 |2/2 Recy 48 pg 200M-224,999 200 M $ 120.67| $24,134.00 no bid $ - 160.070| 32,014.000( $ 130.04| $ 26,008.00
25 |2/2 Recy 48 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M $ 117.84| $26,514.00 no bid $ - 158.987| 35,772.075| $ 129.01| $ 29,027.25
26 |2/2 Virg 48 pg 125M-149,999 125 M $ 133.60| $16,700.00( $ 150.04| $ 18,755.00 173.152| 21,644.000| $ 136.90| $17,112.50
27 |2/2 Virg 48 pg 150M-174,999 150 M $ 126.87| $19,030.50( $ 144,71 $21,706.50 165.720| 24,858.000( $ 130.03| $ 19,504.50
28 |2/2 Virg 48 pg 175M-199,999 175 M $ 122.00| $21,350.00( $ 140.64| $24,612.00 161.611| 28,281.925| $ 128.42| $22,473.50
29 |2/2 Virg 48 pg 200M-224,999 200 M $ 118.45| $23,690.00( $ 137.78| $ 27,556.00 158.635| 31,727.000( $ 126.91| $ 25,382.00

*kkkk NO BIDS *kkkk

Heartland Paper Company
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The Paper Corporation
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Game Parks Commission
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; Description oty |uom Jacob North Companies Omabha Print V.G.Reed & Sons Western Web Printing

- Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
30 |2/2 Virg 48 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M | $ 115.64| $26,019.00{ $ 135.51| $30,489.75 155.764| 35,046.900] $ 125.87| $28,320.75
31 |[2/2 Recy 64 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 167.36| $20,920.00 no bid $ - 217.752| 27,219.000( $ 175.22| $21,902.50
32 |2/2 Recy 64 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 159.55| $23,932.50 no bid $ - 207.947| 31,192.050| $ 166.25| $24,937.50
33 |[2/2 Recy 64 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 153.77| $26,909.75 no bid $ - 202.834| 35,495.950( $ 164.03| $ 28,705.25
34 |2/2 Recy 64 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 149.79| $29,958.00 no bid $ - 198.670| 39,734.000] $ 162.33| $ 32,466.00
35 |[2/2 Recy 64 pg 225M+add'|l M 225 M | $ 146.53| $32,969.25 no bid $ - 196.809| 44,282.025| $ 161.10| $36,247.50
36 |2/2 Virg 64 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 164.28| $20,535.001 $ 174.24| $21,780.00 213.688| 26,711.000] $ 170.85| $21,356.25
37 |2/2 Virg 64 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 156.53]| $23,479.50( $ 169.67| $ 25,450.50 206.033| 30,904.950( $ 162.07| $ 24,310.50
38 |2/2 Virg 64 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 150.83| $26,395.25( $ 166.08| $29,064.00 198.640| 34,762.000] $ 159.85| $27,973.75
39 [2/2 Virg 64 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 146.83] $29,366.00f $ 163.13| $32,626.00 194.710| 38,942.000] $ 158.15( $31,630.00
40 |2/2 Virg 64 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M | $ 143.60| $32,310.00f $ 160.62| $36,139.50 192.578] 43,330.050] $ 156.92| $ 35,307.00
41 [2/2 Recy 72 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 201.24| $25,155.00 no bid $ - 250.688| 31,336.000( $ 203.16| $ 25,395.00
42 |2/2 Recy 72 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 191.24| $28,686.00 no bid $ - 239.400| 35,910.000] $ 193.06| $ 28,959.00
43 [2/2 Recy 72 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 183.97| $32,194.75 no bid $ - 233.446| 40,853.050( $ 190.52| $ 33,341.00
44 |12/2 Recy 72 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 178.74| $ 35,748.00 no bid $ - 228.530| 45,706.000] $ 188.63| $37,726.00
45 [2/2 Recy 72 pg 225M+add'| M 225 M | $ 174.58| $39,280.50 no bid $ - 223.747| 50,343.075( $ 187.31| $42,144.75
46 |2/2 Virg 72 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 197.80| $24,725.00{ $ 205.51| $ 25,688.75 245.648| 30,706.000] $ 198.25| $24,781.25
47 |2/2 Virg 72 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 187.86]| $28,179.00{ $ 199.57| $29,935.50 234.573| 35,185.950( $ 188.36| $ 28,254.00
48 |2/2 Virg 72 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 180.66| $31,61550( $ 194.93| $34,112.75 228.291| 39,950.925| $ 185.82| $32,518.50
49 [2/2 Virg 72 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 175.43] $35,086.00f $ 190.79| $ 38,158.00 223.610| 44,722.000( $ 183.93| $ 36,786.00
50 2/2 Virg 72 pg 225M+add'| M 225 M | $ 171.29| $38,540.25( $ 187.30| $42,142.50 222.880| 50,148.000] $ 182.61| $41,087.25

comments add'l $186.25
51 |2/2 Recy 80 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 217.96| $27,245.00 no bid $ - 264.496| 33,062.000] $ 220.07| $27,508.75
52 |2/2 Recy 80 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 207.43| $31,114.50 no bid $ - 255.233| 38,284.950( $ 209.27| $ 31,390.50
53 |2/2 Recy 80 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 199.71| $34,949.25 no bid $ - 248.966| 43,569.050| $ 206.56| $ 36,148.00
54 |2/2 Recy 80 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 194.26| $38,852.00 no bid $ - 243.800| 48,760.000( $ 205.49| $41,098.00
55 |2/2 Recy 80 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M | $ 189.87| $42,720.75 no bid $ - 238.618| 53,689.050| $ 204.32| $45,972.00
56 |[2/2 Virg 80 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 214.16| $26,770.00f $ 226.00| $ 28,250.00 261.976| 32,747.000( $ 214.61| $ 26,826.25
57 |2/2 Virg 80 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 203.68| $30,552.00f $ 218.00| $32,700.00 250.333| 37,549.950| $ 204.05| $ 30,607.50
58 |[2/2 Virg 80 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 196.00] $34,300.00f $ 213.00| $37,275.00 243.731| 42,652.925( $ 201.34| $ 35,234.50
59 |2/2 Virg 80 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 190.57| $38,114.00{ $ 209.00| $41,800.00 238.800| 47,760.000] $ 200.26| $40,052.00
60 2/2 Virg 80 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M | $ 186.20] $41,895.00{ $ 206.00| $46,350.00 233.542| 52,546.950( $ 199.10| $ 44,797.50
comments add'l $205.00

61 |[2/2 Recy 88 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 237.40| $29,675.00 no bid $ - 298.968| 37,371.000( $ 237.95| $29,743.75
62 |2/2 Recy 88 pg 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 225.88| $33,882.00 no bid $ - 288.387| 43,258.050| $ 226.18| $33,927.00
63 |[2/2 Recy 88 pg 175M-199,999 175 M | $ 217.43| $38,050.25 no bid $ - 281.183| 49,207.025( $ 223.36| $ 39,088.00
64 |2/2 Recy 88 pg 200M-224,999 200 M | $ 211.47| $42,294.00 no bid $ - 272.550| 54,510.000] $ 222.09| $44,418.00
65 |[2/2 Recy 88 pg 225M+add'l M 225 M | $ 206.67| $46,500.75 no bid $ - 269.378| 60,610.050( $ 221.12| $49,752.00
66 |2/2 Virg 88 pg 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 233.16]| $29,145.00{ $ 264.00| $ 33,000.00 293.112| 36,639.000] $ 231.94| $ 28,992.50
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Buyer: Doug Holz

16780of
Game Parks Commission

Opening Date: 10/11/06

; Description oty |uom Jacob North Companies Omabha Print V.G.Reed & Sons Western Web Printing

- Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
67 |2/2 Virg 88 pg 150M-174,999 150 | M | $ 221.73] $33,259.50| $ 255.00| $38,250.00 282.547| 42,382.050| $ 220.43| $33,064.50
68 |2/2 Virg 88 pg 175M-199,999 175 | M | $ 213.34] $37,334.50( $ 248.00| $43,400.00 275.017| 48,127.975] $ 217.61| $38,081.75
69 |2/2 Virg 88 pg 200M-224,999 200 M [ $ 207.43| $41,486.00( $ 243.00| $ 48,600.00 269.410( 53,882.000] $ 216.35| $43,270.00
70 2/2 Virg 88 pg 225M+add'l M 225 | M [$ 202.67| $45,600.75( $ 238.50| $53,662.50 263.387| 59,262.075] $ 215.37| $48,458.25

comments add'l $237.50
71 |4/4 Recy Cov 125M-149,999 125 ( M |' $ 34.52| $ 4,315.00 no bid $ - 37.624| 4,703.000| $ 50.29| $ 6,286.25
72 |4/4 Recy Cov 150M-174,999 150 M |' $ 31.99| $ 4,798.50 no bid $ - 36.187| 5,428.050| $ 49.55| $ 7,432.50
73 |4/4 Recy Cov 175M-199,999 175 [ M | $ 30.77| $ 5,384.75 no bid $ - 34.771| 6,084.925| $ 49.00( $ 8,575.00
74 |4/4 Recy Cov 200M-224,999 200 M [ $ 28.83| $ 5,766.00 no bid $ - 33.840| 6,768.000| $ 48.59| $ 9,718.00
75 |4/4 Recy Cov 225M+add'l M 225 | M [ $ 27.78| $ 6,250.50 no bid $ - 31.444| 7,074.900| $ 48.29| $10,865.25
76 |4/4 Virg Cov 125M-149,999 125 M | $ 3452 $ 4,315.00{ $ 27.99| $ 3,498.75 31.064( 3,883.000| $ 33.93| $ 4,241.25
77 |4/4 Virg Cov 150M-174,999 150 M | $ 31.99] $ 4,798.50{ $ 25.61| $ 3,841.50 29.860| 4,479.000| $ 33.21]| $ 4,981.50
78 |4/4 Virg Cov 175M-199,999 175 [ M | $ 30.77] $ 5,384.75( $ 24.14| $ 4,224.50 28.960( 5,068.000| $ 32.69| $ 5,720.75
79 |4/4 Virg Cov 200M-224,999 2001 M [ 8 28.83| $ 5,766.00( $ 22.77] $ 4,554.00 27.990| 5,598.000| $ 32.30| $ 6,460.00
80 |[4/4 Virg Cov 225M+add'l M 225 | M [ $ 27.78| $ 6,250.50{ $ 21.93| $ 4,934.25 26.045 5,860.125| $ 32.01| $ 7,202.25
81 [Cost per pkg-prepare drop ship 1 LO [ $ 4.50| $ 450( $ -1 $ - 2.000 2.000| $ 1.50| $ 1.50
Delivery Days ARO 5-10 5-10 net 30
Payment Terms net 30 100% 30 1% 20 14
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