
Buyer: Doug Holz 1612 OF
Games Parks Commission

Opening Date: 08/23/06

AWARD

Line# Trail Tales Qty UM  Banta  Colonial Press 

1 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 120,000-160,000 160 M 140.20$         173.06$            
2 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 160,001-200,000 200 M 134.80$         161.74$            
3 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 200,001-240,000 240 M 132.80$         152.65$            
4 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin add'l 31-35M 35 M 113.25$          $           140.10 
5 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin add'l 36-40M 40 M 113.25$          $           140.10 
6 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin add'l 41M+ 41 M 113.25$          $           140.10 

7 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 30-50M 50 M  N/A  No Bid recycled 
N/A 

8 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 51-70M 70 M N/A  No Bid    
9 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 71-90M 90 M N/A  No Bid  
10 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 91M+ 91 M N/A  No Bid 
11 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 30-50M 50 M 101.20$          $             99.86 
12 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 51-70M 70 M 77.60$            $             90.91 
13 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 71-90M 90 M 66.50$            $             85.88 
14 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 91+M 91 M 66.50$            $             84.11 

Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 120,000-160,000 160 M N/A  $           190.41 
 Qty Vendor 
changed to 100 

16 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 160,001-200,000 200 M N/A  $           178.74 
17 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 200,000-240,000 240 M N/A  $           170.96 
18 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled add'l 31-35 35 M N/A  $           150.08 
19 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled add'l 36-40M 40 M N/A  $           150.08 
20 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled add'l 41+ 41 M N/A  $           150.08 
21 Trail Tales 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 31-35M 35 M
22 Trail Tales 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 36-40M 40 M
23 Trail Tale 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 41-45M 41 M
24 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 31-35M 35 M
25 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 36-40M 40 M
26 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 41-45M 45 M

1% 10 Days  30 Days 

15 Comments

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO
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Buyer: Doug Holz 1612 OF
Games Parks Commission

Opening Date: 08/23/06

Line# Trail Tales Qty UM  Prestige Litho  Jacob North 
Printing Company 

1 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 120,000-140,000 140 M 195.18$             147.14$                
2 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 141,000-160,000 160 M 190.13$             141.87$                
3 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 161,000-180,000 180 M 186.22$             137.75$                
4 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 181,000-200,000 200 M 183.03$             133.74$                
5 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 201,000-220,000 220 M 180.48$             131.50$                
6 Trail Tales,60# #2, Virgin 221000-240,000 240 M 178.30$             129.56$                

7 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 30-50M 50 M  Not quoted  $               128.65 

8 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 51-70M 70 M Not quoted 114.50$                
9 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 71-90M 90 M Not quoted 105.26$                
10 Insert Card,Recyl 10 pt #3 gl qty 91M+ 91 M Not quoted 105.26$                
11 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 30-50M 50 M 77.16$               124.87$                
12 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 51-70M 70 M 70.11$               109.61$                
13 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 71-90M 90 M 66.47$               100.83$                
14 Insert Card,Virgin 10 pt #3 gl qty 91+M 91 M 66.32$               100.83$                

Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 120,000-140,000 140 M None available N/A

16 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 140,001-160,000 160 M None available N/A
17 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 160,001-180,000 180 M None available N/A
18 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 180,001-200,000 200 M None available N/A
19 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 200,001-220,000 220 M None available N/A
20 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled 220,001-240,000 240 M None available N/A
21 Trail Tales 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 31-35M 35 M 202.66$             110.13$                
22 Trail Tales 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 36-40M 40 M 194.00$             106.93$                
23 Trail Tale 60# #2, Virgin�add'l 41-45M 41 M 193.05$             104.87$                
24 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 31-35M 35 M None available
25 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 36-40M 40 M None available
26 Trail Tales 60# #2, Recycled�add'l 41-45M 45 M None available

Net% 30 Days 30 Days

No Bids

15

Moore Wallace

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO
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