Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1593 OF REBID
Western Nebraska
Veteran's Home

Opening Date:10/17/06

21st Century Supply
US Food Service

AWARD
o Unit of Cash-Wa Distributing
'5 * Grocery & Frozen Food Qty. Measure Unit Price Ext. Price

1 |Apple Rings,Red,Spiced,Fancy 1 CS $ 26.70| $ 26.70
2 |Apples,Sliced,Solid Pack 2 CS $ 21.85| $ 43.70
3 |Applesauce,Sweetened 37 CS $ 15.28| $ 565.36
4 |Applesauce,Water Pack,Fancy 27 CS $ 1466 $ 395.82
5 [Apricots,Unpeeled Halves 20 CS $ 28.99| $ 579.80
6 |Cherries,Dark Sweet,Pitted 8 CS $ 57.10| $ 456.80
7 [Cherries,Royal Anne,Pitted 2 CS $ 60.27 | $ 120.54
8 |Cherries,Maraschino,Halves 2 CS $ 4772 | $ 95.44
9 |Cherries,Dk Swt,Pitted,Diet 2 CS no bid no bid

10 |Fruit Cocktail,In Heavy Syrup 15 CS $ 26.99| $ 404.85
11 |Fruit Cocktail,Diet Pack 2 CS $ 18.00| $ 36.00
12 |Grapefruit Sections,Hvy Syrup 4 CS $ 3491 $ 139.64
13 |Oranges,Mandarin,Brokensection 12 CS $ 21.02| $ 252.24
14 |Peaches,Yellow Cling,Sliced 29 CS $ 25.30| $ 733.70
15 |Peaches,Yellow Cling,Halves 20 CS $ 25.30| $ 506.00
16 [Peaches,Sliced Y.C.,Diet Pack 38 CS $ 21.39| $ 812.82
17 |Peaches,Halves,Y.C.,Diet Pack 2 CS no bid no bid

18 [Pears,Bartlett Halves 20 CS $ 23.86| $ 477.20
19 [Pears,Bartlett Sliced 11 CS $ 23.86| $ 262.46
20 |Pears,Halves,Diet Pack 29 CS $ 20.23| $ 586.67
21 |[Pears Nectar,46 Oz. 27 CS $ 18.35| $ 495.45
22 |Pineapple,Crushed,Hvy Syrup 5 CS $ 19.03| $ 95.15
23 |Pineapple, Tidbits 20 CS $ 19.03| $ 380.60
24 |Pineapple,Sliced 9 CS $ 20.23| $ 182.07
25 |Plums,Purple,Halves,Pitted 10 CS $ 2558 | $ 255.80
26 |Plums,Whole,Purple,Pitted 2 CS no bid no bid

27 |Plums,Whole,Pitted 10 CS no bid no bid

28 |Prunes,Pitted,Nectarized Type 11 CS $ 78.36| $ 861.96
29 [Raisins Bulk 5 LB $ 13.38| $ 66.90
30 |[Asparagus,Green,Cuts & Tips 2 CS $ 39.95| $ 79.90
31 [Beans,Green Cut,Stringless 53 CS $ 14.89( $ 789.17
32 |Beans,Green,French Style 4 CS $ 19.26 [ $ 77.04
33 |Beans,Wax Cut,Stringless 2 CS $ 19.26 [ $ 38.52
34 |Beans,Dry,Great Northern 10 CS $ 9.03| $ 90.30
35 |Beans,Kidney,Dark Red 5 CS $ 1773 $ 88.65
36 [Beans,Pinto 15 CS $ 2157| $ 323.55
37 |Beans,Lima,Green,Medium 6 CS $ 2227 $ 133.62
38 |Beans,w/Pork & Tomato Sauce 21 CS $ 28.11| $ 590.31
39 [Beans,Refried 6 CS $ 28.98| $ 173.88
40 |Beets,Sliced,Medium 21 CS $ 16.42 | $ 344.82
41 |Carrots,Whole,225/Over 9 CS $ 19.15( $ 172.35
42 |Hominy,Golden 2 CS $ 1545| $ 30.90
43 |[Corn,Cream Style,Yellow 8 CS $ 19.89( $ 159.12
44 |Corn,Whole Kernal,Yellow 2 CS $ 15.23( $ 30.46
45 |Mushrooms,Stems & Pieces 2 CS $ 39.52| $ 79.04
46 |Potatoes,Sweet,Cut,Golden 18 CS $ 21.70| $ 390.60
47 |Sauerkraut,Shredded 11 CS $ 1591 $ 175.01
48 |Tomatoes,Whole,Peeled 32 CS $ 15.28( $ 488.96
49 |Tomato Paste,Hunts 1 CS $ 24.66| $ 24.66
50 |[Tomato Sauce,Hunts 10 CS $ 14.72| $ 147.20
51 |Rice,Converted,Uncle Ben's 13 BG $ 1553 $ 201.89
52 |Peas,Green Split,Re-Cleaned 5 BG $ 8.02] $ 40.10
53 [Spinach 11 CS $ 19.32| $ 212.52
54 |Beef Base,No Msg,Low Sodium 2 CS $ 35.72| $ 71.44
55 [Chicken Base,No Msg,Low Sodium 2 CS $ 35.18| $ 70.36
56 [Crm of Chicken Soup,Condensed 8 CS $ 43.36| $ 346.88

NO BIDS:
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57 |Crm of Mushroom Soup 16 CS $ 4232 $ 677.12
58 [Tomato Soup,Condensed 30 CS $ 33.14| $ 994.20
59 [Tomato Soup Low Sodium 6 CS $ 16.36| $ 98.16
60 |[Vegetable Soup,Condensed 20 CS $ 3931 $ 786.20
61 [Chicken Noodle Soup,Condensed 30 CS $ 34.82| $ 1,044.60
62 [Chicken Broth,Canned 30 CS $ 23.23| $ 696.90
63 |Beef Broth,Canned 30 CS $ 23.23| $ 696.90
64 |Baking Powder,Calumet 2 CS $ 465( $ 9.30
65 |[Baking Soda,Arm & Hammer 2 CS $ 16.08| $ 32.16
66 |Chocolate Chips,Semisweet 7 BG $ 39.77| $ 278.39
67 |Coconut,Med Shred 8 BG $ 12.90( $ 103.20
68 |All Purpose Flour,Enriched 95 BG $ 481 $ 456.95
69 |[Dry Yeast,Active-Vac Pack 16 BG $ 397| $ 63.52
70 [Muffin Mix,Basic Enriched 2 CS no bid no bid
71 [Marshmallow,Minature 13 CS $ 1459| $ 189.67
72 |Cookies,Sandwich,Vanilla 2 CS $ 35.76| $ 71.52
73 |Graham Crackers 1 CS $ 2257| $ 22.57
74 |Crackers,Graham 6 CS $ 17.71( $ 106.26
75 |Saltine Crackers,8# Bulk 3 CS $ 17.04( $ 51.12
76 |Saltine Crackers A7 CS $ 9.88| $ 464.36
77 |Cracker Meal Fine,20 Lb 10 CS $ 13.76 | $ 137.60
78 |[Crackers,Graham,Crumbs 7 CS $ 16.71| $ 116.97
79 [Crackers Oysters 15 CS $ 24.76 | $ 371.40
80 |Vanilla Wafer,12 Oz 2 CS $ 8.50| $ 17.00
81 [Macaroni,Shell 2 CS $ 12.98| $ 25.96
82 |Noodles,Chow Mein,Bulk Pack 3 CS $ 16.13 | $ 48.39
83 [Noodles,Lasagna 5 CS $ 10.18| $ 50.90
84 |[Noodles,Homestyle #1 Grade 2 CS $ 15.88( $ 31.76
85 |[Noodle,Extra Wide 1/2" 16 CS $ 9.12| $ 145.92
86 [Spaghetti,Long Style #7 2 CS $ 1344 $ 26.88
87 |Macaroni,Elbow 9 CS $ 12.98( $ 116.82
88 |Barbeque Sauce,Kraft 2 CS $ 39.78| $ 79.56
89 [Barbeque Sauce,Cattleman's 15 CS $ 38.94| $ 584.10
90 [Cocktail Sauce 5 CS $ 24.96| $ 124.80
91 [Catsup,Red Pack or Equivalent 3 CS $ 17.04| $ 51.12
92 [Catsup,28 Oz 10 CS $ 1.64| $ 16.40
93 [Mustard,Prepared,1/1000 Size 2 CS $ 18.35( $ 36.70
94 |[Mustard,Prepared,4/1 gal 1 CS $ 9.38| $ 9.38
95 [Mustard,Prepared,20 Oz 10 CS $ 1.32| $ 13.20
96 |Diet French,Dry Packets 4 CS no bid no bid
97 [Heinz 57 Sauce 8 CS $ 38.29| $ 306.32
98 |Worcestershire Sauce,5 Oz 3 CS $ 11.70( $ 35.10
99 |Worcestershire Sauce,1 Gal 7 CS $ 24.03| $ 168.21
100 |Tobasco Sauce,?2 Oz 5 CS $ 26.25| $ 131.25
101 |Picante Sauce,Mild,1 Gal 7 CS $ 37.43| $ 262.01
102 |Dressing,1000 Island,Low Cal 2 CS $ 22.80| $ 45.60
103 |Dressing,1000 Island,12 Gr 10 CS $ 13.81( $ 138.10
104 |Dressing,ltalian 10 CS $ 10.92( $ 109.20
105 |Soy Sauce,1 Gal 10 CS $ 33.62| $ 336.20
106 |Peanut Butter,Fine Ground 2 CS $ 32.94| $ 65.88
107 |Honey Bear Squeeze Bottle 5 CS $ 18.48| $ 92.40
108 |Vinegar,Cider,50 Grain 5 CS $ 12.95( $ 64.75
109 |Vinegar,White,50 Grain 28 CS $ 10.05( $ 281.40
110 |[Nondairy Creamer,Powder 6 CS $ 16.67| $ 100.02
111 |Catsup 1.3 Oz 2 CS $ 23.86| $ 47.72
112 |Dressing,Hidden Valley Original 3 CS $ 30.27| $ 90.81
113 |Dressing,Ranch Fat Free 5 CS $ 16.09| $ 80.45
114 |Dressing,Ranch,Ind Packets 20 CS $ 16.76 [ $ 335.20
115 |Dressing,French,Low Calorie 5 CS $ 12.67| $ 63.35
116 |Dressing,French,Ind Packets 20 CS $ 10.27| $ 205.40
117 |Dressing,ltalian,Wishbone 10 CS $ 3242| $ 324.20
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118 |Dressing,Dorothy Lynch,1 Gal 10 CS $ 27.27| $ 272.70
119 |Pimento,Whole,6.5 Oz 2 CS no bid no bid

120 |Pimento,Pieces,28 Oz 8 CS $ 63.20| $ 505.60
121 |Oil,Vegetable,Refined,1 Gal 40 CS $ 3457| $ 1,382.80
122 |Mayonnaise,Lite,Ind Packets 2 CS $ 12.38( $ 24.76
123 |Mayonnaise,1 Gal 10 CS $ 2272 $ 227.20
124 |Maronite,Miracle Whip,Lite 33 CS $ 35.17| $ 1,160.61
125 |Miracle Whip Individuals Pkts 15 CS $ 1243 $ 186.45
126 |Spaghetti Sauce,Prego,106 Oz 20 CS $ 40.36| $ 807.20
127 |Peanut Butter Cups,Individual 31 CS $ 30.34| $ 940.54
128 |Honey,12 Grams,Ind Packaged 2 CS $ 2477 $ 49.54
129 |Sugar,Granulated,White,Ind 16 CS $ 14.15( $ 226.40
130 |Sugar,Granulated,White,25 Lb 113 CS $ 13.92( $ 1,572.96
131 |Sugar,Light Brown,2 Lb 31 CS $ 15.25| $ 472.75
132 |Sugar,Powered,2 Lb 20 CS $ 15.25( $ 305.00
133 |Sugar Substitute 26 CS $ 27.84| $ 723.84
134 |Syrup,Pancake,Maple,1 Gal 28 CS $ 16.39| $ 458.92
135 [Salt,Individual lodized 17 CS $ 534| $ 90.78
136 [Salt,lodized,26 Oz 9 CS $ 10.65| $ 95.85
137 |Pepper,Individual Packets 19 CS $ 8.15( $ 154.85
138 |Gelatin,Cherry 15 CS $ 478| $ 71.70
139 |Gelatin,Lemon 14 CS $ 478| $ 66.92
140 |Gelatin,Lime 13 CS $ 478| $ 62.14
141 |Gelatin,Orange 7 CS $ 4.78[ $ 33.46
142 |Gelatin,Strawberry 13 CS $ 478| $ 62.14
143 |Gelatin,Rasberry 4 CS $ 478| $ 19.12
144 |Pudding Mix, Tapioca,5 Lb 2 CS $ 17.90( $ 35.80
145 |Pudding Mix,Vanilla Instant 8 CS $ 35.88| $ 287.04
146 |Pudding Banana 20 CS $ 2290 $ 458.00
147 |Pudding Vanilla 20 CS $ 22.90| $ 458.00
148 |Tapioca,Minute,Granule 2 CS $ 17.90( $ 35.80
149 |Cream of Wheat,28 Oz 11 CS $ 40.48| $ 445.28
150 [Malt-O-Meal,28 Oz 9 CS $ 3354 $ 301.86
151 |Cheerios,20 Oz 2 CS $ 4775 $ 95.50
152 |Raisin Bran,20 Oz 2 CS $ 4175 $ 83.50
153 |40% Bran Flakes,20 Oz 2 CS $ 4173 $ 83.46
154 |All Bran,18 Oz 2 CS $ 35.85| $ 71.70
155 |Shredded Wheat,12 Biscuit 2 CS $ 44.06| $ 88.12
156 |Oatmeal,Quick,46 Oz 2 CS $ 3147 $ 62.94
157 |Kitchen Bouquet,1 Gal 2 EA $ 5.68| $ 11.36
158 |Black Pepper,5# 24 EA $ 20.10| $ 482.40
159 |Garlic Powder,1 Lb 24 EA $ 5.86| $ 140.64
160 |Paprika,18 oz 24 EA $ 6.97| $ 167.28
161 |Onion Powder,20 Oz 24 EA $ 597 $ 143.28
162 |Cumin,140z 24 EA $ 5.38| $ 129.12
163 |White Ground Pepper,16 Oz 10 EA $ 757 % 75.70
164 |Garlic Salt,38 Oz 10 EA $ 542 $ 54.20
165 |Whole Bay Leaves,10 Oz 10 EA $ 389 $ 38.90
166 |Whole Cinnamon,8 Oz 10 EA $ 7.93| $ 79.30
167 |Cream of Tartar,25 Oz 10 EA $ 13.72 $ 137.20
168 |Pumpkin Pie Spice,1Lb 10 EA $ 7.88| $ 78.80
169 |Ground All Spice,16 Oz 10 EA $ 7.36| $ 73.60
170 |Seasoned Salt,5 Lb 10 EA $ 21.13| $ 211.30
171 |Ground Clover 16 Oz 10 EA $ 9.69| $ 96.90
172 |Cloves Whole,12 Oz 10 EA $ 9.86| $ 98.60
173 |Pickling Spice,13 oz 10 EA $ 6.50| $ 65.00
174 |Food Coloring,16 Oz 10 EA $ 573 $ 57.30
175 |Extract Banana,16 Oz 10 EA $ 6.60| $ 66.00
176 |Extract Lemon,16 Oz 10 EA $ 6.00| $ 60.00
177 |Extract Almond,16 Oz 10 EA $ 5.60| $ 56.00
178 |Extract Cocunut,16 Oz 10 EA $ -
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179 |Hot Mustard,16 Oz 10 EA $ -
180 [Chili Powder,5.5 Oz 10 EA $ 23.67| $ 236.70
181 |Parsley Flakes,10 Oz 10 EA $ 8.42( $ 84.20
182 |Poultry Seasoning,12 Oz 10 EA $ 8.00( $ 80.00
183 |Lemon Pepper,27 Oz 10 EA $ 6.50| $ 65.00
184 |Sage,6 Oz 10 EA $ 460 $ 46.00
185 |Celery Salt,30 Oz 10 EA $ 5.76| $ 57.60
186 |Chopped Dried Onions,3 Lb 10 EA $ 9.00| $ 90.00
187 |Sweet Basil,5 Oz 10 EA $ 3.37| $ 33.70
188 |Whole Celery Seed,1 Lb 10 EA $ 6.35| $ 63.50
189 |Onion Salt,36 Oz 10 EA $ 6.35| $ 63.50
190 |Ground Ginger,1 Lb 10 EA $ 6.61| $ 66.10
191 |Poppy Seed,20 Oz 10 EA $ 7.05| $ 70.50
192 [Vanilla,1 Gal 10 EA $ 8.63| $ 86.30
193 |Cinnamon,4.5 Oz 10 EA $ 13.35| $ 133.50
194 |Pickles,Kosher Dill Spears 6 CS $ 26.53| $ 159.18
195 |Pickles,Sweet Relish,Fancy 7 CS $ 18.97( $ 132.79
196 |Dill Pickle,Stackers 20 CS $ 3432 $ 686.40
197 [Pickles,Sliced 2 CS $ 12.22| $ 24.44
198 [Jellies,Assorted,1/2 Oz 50 CS $ 1050 $ 525.00
199 |Jelly,Ind,Strawberry 30 CS $ 1365 $ 409.50
200 [Jelly,Ind,Diet 31 CS no bid no bid

201 |Apple Juice,46 Oz 133 CS $ 1697 $ 2,257.01
202 |Apricot Nectar,46 Oz 45 CS $ 1755 $ 789.75
203 |Grapefruit Juice,46 Oz 24 CS $ 30.58| $ 733.92
204 |Orange Juice,46 Oz 197 CS $ 23.17| $ 4,564.49
205 |Pinapple Juice,Natural,46 Oz 24 CS $ 17.76 [ $ 426.24
206 |Prune Juice,Natural,46 Oz 78 CS $ 37.43| $ 2,919.54
207 |Vegetable Juice Cocktail, 46 Oz 34 CS $ 23.82| $ 809.88
208 |[Tomato Juice,46 Oz 97 CS $ 1552 $ 1,505.44
209 |Grape Juice,46 Oz 137 CS $ 19.93( $ 2,730.41
210 |Cranberry Juice,46 Oz 20 CS $ 20.28| $ 405.60
211 |Nectar 12 Oz; thickened coffee, 75 per case 10 CS $ 2279 $ 227.90
212 |Honey,12 Oz; thickened coffee, 75 per case 8 CS $ 23.64| $ 189.12
213 [Nectar,48 Oz; thickened cranberry juice, 6 per case 10 CS $ 12.79| $ 127.90
214 |Nectar,48 Oz; thickened apple juice, 6 per case 10 CS $ 12.75| $ 127.50
215 [Nectar,48 Oz; thickened orange juice, 6 per case 10 CS $ 1555| $ 155.50
216 [Honey,48 Oz; thickened cranberry juice, 6 per case 8 CS $ 14.04| $ 112.32
217 |Honey,48 Oz; thickened apple juice ,6 per case 8 CS $ 14.05( $ 112.40
218 [Honey,48 Oz; thickened orange juice, 6 per case 8 CS $ 16.88| $ 135.04
219 |Honey,48 Oz; thickened water, 6 per case 8 CS $ 13.65( $ 109.20
220 |Nectar,48 Oz; thickened water, 6 per case 8 CS $ 13.65( $ 109.20
221 |Honey,32 Oz; thickened milk, 12 per case 8 CS $ 25.86| $ 206.88
222 |Nectar,32 Oz; thickened milk, 12 per case 10 CS $ 25.29| $ 252.90
223 [Salmon,Fancy,Low Sodium 1 CS no bid no bid

224 |Salmon,Pink Canned,Starkist 10 CS $ 51.93| $ 519.30
225 |Clams Chopped 15 CS $ 76.81| $ 1,152.15
226 [Tuna,Light Meat,Fancy 24 CS $ 4227 $ 1,014.48
227 |Chicken Noodle Soup,Low Sodium 2 CS $ 53.64| $ 107.28
228 |Mushroom Soup,Low Sodium 2 CS $ 16.63| $ 33.26
229 [Jellies Assorted,Diet 24 CS no bid no bid

230 [Syrup,Diabetic,No Sugar Added 2 CS no bid no bid

231 [Salt Substitute,Low Sodium 1 CS $ 17.72| $ 17.72
232 [Crackers,Low Sodium,300/2 Ct 1 CS $ 19.98( $ 19.98
233 [Grapefruit Sections,Fancy 1 CS - no bid

234 [Turkey Noodle Soup,Low Sodium 2 CS no bid no bid

235 |Vegetable Soup,Low Sodium 2 CS $ 16.05( $ 32.10
236 [Cheese,American Processed 18 CS $ 53.14| $ 956.52
237 [Cheese,Swiss Processed 11 CS $ 55.43| $ 609.73
238 [Cheese,Mozarella,5 Lb 10 LB $ 1.65| $ 16.50
239 [Cheese,American,5 Lb 26 CS $ 1154 $ 300.04
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240 |Margarine Spread,900/5 Gm 50 CS $ 1997 $ 998.50
241 [Apple Butter Cups,Ind 6 CS no bid no bid

242 |Cream Cheese Block,3 Lb 5 CS $ 464 $ 23.20
243 |[Sour Cream,Ind. Packs 10 CS $ 11.64( $ 116.40
244 |Evaporated Milk,12 Oz 15 CS $ 37.30| $ 559.50
245 [Tuna,Light Meat,Fancy Pouches no water added 7 CS no bid no bid

246 [Nondairy Whipped Topping 5 CS $ 35.27| $ 176.35
247 |1/2" Crinkle Cut French Fries 20 CS $ 12.35( $ 247.00
248 |Simplot Tater Gems (Logs) 11 CS $ 1761 $ 193.71
249 |Seasoned Walffle Fries 10 CS $ 26.28| $ 262.80
250 |Japenese Mix Vegetables 2 CS $ 1952 $ 39.04
251 [Beans,Cut Green Beans 15 CS $ 18.18( $ 272.70
252 |California Country Blend 11 CS $ 16.37| $ 180.07
253 |Asparagus Spears-Med 20 CS $ 44.18| $ 883.60
254 |Broccoli Spears 2 CS $ 22.07| $ 44.14
255 |Broccoli Cuts 27 CS $ 21.13| $ 570.51
256 |Cauliflower 14 CS $ 23.88| $ 334.32
257 |Sliced Carrots 56 CS $ 1285 $ 719.60
258 |Cut Kernel Corn 30 CS $ 1285 $ 385.50
259 [5-Way Mixed Vegetables 1 CS $ 1477 $ 14.77
260 |Chopped Spinach 1 CS $ 27.73| $ 27.73
261 |Peas 1 CS $ 1545 $ 15.45
262 |Cooked Squash 3 CS $ 32.09| $ 96.27
263 |Brussel Sprouts 4 CS $ 26.03| $ 104.12
264 |Mixed Fruit,10 Lb 11 CS $ 29.25| $ 321.75
265 |Cherries,Frozen,5 Lb 10 CS $ 34.69| $ 346.90
266 |Strawberries,Whole,10 Lb 2 CS $ 2439 $ 48.78
267 |Blueberries,No Sugar,30 Lb 3 CS $ 77.10| $ 231.30
268 |Orange Concentrate 100% Pure 1 CS $ 29.26| $ 29.26
269 [Grape Concentrate,32 Oz 1 CS no bid no bid

270 |Grape Juice Cups Frozen,4 Oz 20 CS $ 9.26| $ 185.20
271 |Apple Juice Cups Frozen,4 Oz 20 CS $ 6.30| $ 126.00
272 |Cranberry Juice Cups Frozen 20 CS $ 7.10| $ 142.00
273 |Orange Juice Cups Frozen,4 Oz 20 CS $ 857 $ 171.40
274 [Prune Juice Cups Frozen,4 Oz 5 CS no bid no bid

275 [Lemon Juice,Real Lemon,32 Oz 8 CS $ 1559 | $ 124.72
276 |Reames Egg Noodles,3 Lb 8 CS $ 1588 $ 127.04
277 |Decaf Ind Tea Bags 9 CS $ 3.93[ $ 35.37
278 |Ind Tea Bags 9 CS $ 210 $ 18.90
279 |Dish Soap,Dawn,1 Gal 48 CS $ 31.92| $ 1,532.16
280 |Eggs Large Grade A 195 CS $ 9.80| $ 1,911.00
281 |Coffee Regular 30 CS $ 94.54| $ 2,836.20
282 |Coffee Decaf 40 CS $ 92.25| $ 3,690.00

Payment Terms

Delivery Days ARO
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