Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

Class Il Safety Vests

1414 OF

Opening Date: 05/02/06

Continental Safety

A & A Industrial Supply Chief Comade Inc. Equipment, Inc.
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $13.30 [ $9,975.00 $20.80( $15,600.00 $16.55( $12,412.50| $23.57 | $17,677.50
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $13.30 [ $9,975.00 $20.80( $15,600.00 $16.55( $12,412.50| $23.57 | $17,677.50
Comments
3 vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $13.30 [ $9,975.00 $20.80( $15,600.00 $16.55( $12,412.50| $23.57 | $17,677.50
Comments
4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $13.30 [ $9,975.00 $20.80( $15,600.00 $16.55( $12,412.50| $23.57 | $17,677.50
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $14.29 | $4,287.00 $20.80] $6,240.00 $18.06] $5,418.00] $26.22 [ $7,866.00
Comments
6 vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $15.59 | $779.50 $22.10] $1,105.00 $18.60 $930.00f $28.65 | $1,432.50
Comments
7 vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $15.59 | $779.50 $22.10] $1,105.00 $18.60 $930.00f $32.00 | $1,600.00
Comments
8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $17.99 [ $899.50 $23.40] $1,170.00 $20.25] $1,012.50| $33.40 | $1,670.00
9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $17.99 [ $899.50 $23.40{ $1,170.00 $20.25| $1,012.50] $35.77 [ $1,788.50
10]vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $13.30 [ $332.50 $20.80 $520.00 $16.55 $413.75[ $23.57 | $1,788.50
11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $13.30 [ $332.50 $20.80 $520.00 $16.55 $413.75| $23.57 $589.25
12]vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $13.30 [ $332.50 $20.80 $520.00 $16.55 $413.75] $23.57 $589.25
13]|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $13.30 [ $332.50 $20.80 $520.00 $16.55 $413.75| $23.57 $589.25
14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $14.29 [ $142.90 $20.80 $208.00 $18.06 $180.60] $26.22 $262.20
15]vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $15.59 [ $155.90 $22.10 $221.00 $18.60 $186.00f $28.65 $286.50
16]vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $15.59 [ $155.90 $22.10 $221.00 $18.60 $186.00f $32.00 $320.00
17]vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $17.99 [ $179.90 $23.40 $234.00 $20.25 $202.50{ $33.40 $334.00
18]vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $17.99 [ $179.90 $23.40 $234.00 $20.25 $202.50| $35.77 $357.70
Comments
Terms 1%, 10 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery 30 days 30 days 6-8 weeks
Invalid Bid No Bid
Apex Pinnacle Lawmen's & Shooter's Supply Inc.
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1414 OF
Class Il Safety Vests

Opening Date: 05/02/06

Environmental Safety

Electro Mechanical Ind.| Elvin Safety Supply Elvin Safety Supply Group, Inc.
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $14.17{ $10,627.50 $13.69( $10,267.50 $11.20] $8,400.00 $20.50( $15,375.00
Comments see M/L
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $14.17{ $10,627.50 $13.69] $10,267.50 $11.20] $8,400.00 $20.50( $15,375.00
Comments size M/L
3 vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $14.17{ $10,627.50 $13.69] $10,267.50 $11.20] $8,400.00 $20.50( $15,375.00
Comments size M/L
4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $14.17{ $10,627.50 $13.69] $10,267.50 $11.20] $8,400.00 $20.50( $15,375.00
Comments size XL/2X
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $15.60] $4,680.00 $13.69[ $4,107.00 $11.20] $3,360.00 $20.50] $6,150.00
Comments size XL/2X
6 vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $16.10 $805.00 $16.39]  $819.50 $13.43 $671.50 $20.50] $1,025.00
Comments size 3X/4X
7 vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $16.10 $805.00 $16.39]  $819.50 $13.43 $671.50 $20.50] $1,025.00
Comments size 3X/4X
8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $18.26 $913.00 N/A $14.77 $738.50 $20.50] $1,025.00
9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $18.26 $913.00 N/A $16.24 $812.00 $20.50{ $1,025.00
10]vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $14.17 $354.25 $11.04 $276.00 $9.05 $226.25 $20.50 $512.50
11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $14.17 $354.25 $11.04 $276.00 $9.05 $226.25 $20.50 $512.50
12]vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $14.17 $354.25 $11.04 $276.00 $9.05 $226.25 $20.50 $512.50
13|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $14.17 $354.25 $11.04 $276.00 $9.05 $226.25 $20.50 $512.50
14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $15.60 $156.00 $12.19 $121.90 $9.99 $99.90 $20.50 $205.00
15|vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $16.10 $161.00 $13.39 $133.90 $10.97 $109.70 $20.50 $205.00
16|vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $16.10 $161.00 $14.69 $146.90 $12.04 $120.40 $20.50 $205.00
17|vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $18.26 $182.60 $16.09 $160.90 $13.19 $131.90 $20.50 $205.00
18|vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $18.26 $182.60 N/A $14.51 $145.10 $20.50 $205.00
Comments
Terms 1%, 10 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Delivery 30 days 75 days 84 days
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

Class Il Safety Vests

1414 OF

Opening Date: 05/02/06

Lohmann & Rauscher,

Globe Electric Co. Inc IBT Inc. Libra Safety Products Inc.
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $13.10 | $9,825.00 $11.49] $8,617.50 $22.99( $17,242.50 $14.84( $11,130.00
Comments

5 vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $13.10 | $9,825.00 $11.49] $8,617.50 $22.99| $17,242.50 $15.05( $11,287.50
Comments

3 vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $13.10 | $9,825.00 $11.49] $8,617.50 $22.99| $17,242.50 $15.24( $11,430.00
Comments

4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $13.10 | $9,825.00 $11.49] $8,617.50 $22.99| $17,242.50 $15.63| $11,722.50
Comments

5 vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $13.99 [ $4,197.00 $11.97] $3,591.00 $25.31 $7,593.00 $15.84| $4,752.00
Comments

6 vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $15.45 | $772.50 $11.97 $598.50 $27.62 $1,381.00 $16.04 $802.00
Comments

7 vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $15.45 | $772.50 $11.97 $598.50 $29.94 $1,497.00 $17.38 $869.00
Comments

8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $17.80 | $890.00 $11.97 $598.50 $32.24] $1,612.00 $17.70 $885.00

9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $17.80 [ $890.00 $11.97 $598.50 $34.54 $1,727.00 $17.99 $899.50

10]vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $13.10 | $327.50 $13.56 $339.00 $22.99 $574.75 $14.84 $371.00

11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $13.10 [ $327.50 $13.56 $339.00 $22.99 $574.75 $15.05 $376.25

12]vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $13.10 | $327.50 $13.56 $339.00 $22.99 $574.75 $15.24 $381.00

13|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $13.10 $327.50 $13.56 $339.00 $22.99 $574.75 $15.63 $390.75

14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $13.99 | $139.90 $13.56 $135.60 $25.31 $253.10 $15.84 $158.40

15|vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $15.45 $154.50 $13.56 $135.60 $27.62 $276.20 $16.04 $160.40

16|vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $15.45 | $154.50 $13.56 $135.60 $29.94 $299.40 $17.38 $173.80

17|vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $17.80 $178.00 $13.56 $135.60 $32.24 $322.40 $17.70 $177.00

18|vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $17.80 $178.00 $13.56 $135.60 $34.54 $345.40 $17.99 $179.90
Comments

Terms Net 30 Net 30 N/A
Delivery 14-21 days 20 days
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1414 OF

Class Il Safety Vests

Opening Date: 05/02/06

Magid Glove & Safety

Safety Zone

Loveline Ind. Inc. Mfg. Co. Inc. Northern Calif Glove Specialists, Inc.
Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $20.83| $15,622.50 $7.50] $5,625.00 $18.95| $14,212.50 $17.35( $13,012.50
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $20.83| $15,622.50 $7.50] $5,625.00 $18.95| $14,212.50 $17.35( $13,012.50
Comments
3 vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $20.83| $15,622.50 $7.50] $5,625.00 $18.95(| $14,212.50 $17.35( $13,012.50
Comments
4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $20.83| $15,622.50 $7.50] $5,625.00 $18.95| $14,212.50 $17.35( $13,012.50
Comments
5 |vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $21.43] $6,429.00 $7.50] $2,250.00 $20.20] $6,060.00 $17.90] $5,370.00
Comments
6 vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $21.83] $1,091.50 $7.50 $375.00 $20.80] $1,040.00 $18.25 $912.50
Comments
7 vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $21.83] $1,091.50 $7.50 $375.00 $20.80] $1,040.00 $18.25 $912.50
Comments
8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $22.33] $1,116.50 $7.50 $375.00 $22.60] $1,130.00 $20.20] $1,010.00
9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $22.33[ $1,116.50 $7.50 $375.00 $22.60{ $1,130.00 $20.20{ $1,010.00
10]vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $20.83 $520.75| No Bid $18.95 $473.75 $17.35 $433.75
11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $20.83 $520.75| No Bid $18.95 $473.75 $17.35 $433.75
12]vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $20.83 $520.75| No Bid $18.95 $473.75 $17.35 $433.75
13|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $20.83 $520.75| No Bid $18.95 $473.75 $17.35 $433.75
14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $21.43 $214.30] No Bid $20.20 $202.00 $17.90 $179.00
15|vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $21.83 $218.30[ No Bid $20.80 $208.00 $18.25 $182.50
16|vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $21.83 $218.30| No Bid $20.80 $208.00 $18.25 $182.50
17|vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $22.33 $223.30f No Bid $22.60 $226.00 $20.20 $202.00
18|vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $22.33 $223.30] No Bid $22.60 $226.00 $20.20 $202.00
Comments
Terms Net 30 Net 30 1%,20, net 30
Delivery 30 days 5 days
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1414 OF

Class Il Safety Vests

AWARD

Opening Date: 05/02/06

Stroud Safety Apparel

Sunwest Sales Co.

TCI Industrial Supply

Traffix Devices, Inc

Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $12.71 | $9,532.50 $11.57| $8,677.50] $14.48 | $10,860.00 $17.63] $13,222.50
Comments
5 |vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $12.71 | $9,532.50 $11.57| $8,677.50] $14.48 | $10,860.00 $17.63] $13,222.50
Comments
5 [vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $12.71 | $9,532.50 $11.57| $8,677.50] $14.48 | $10,860.00 $18.13] $13,597.50
Comments
4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $12.71 | $9,532.50 $11.57| $8,677.50| $14.48 | $10,860.00 $18.83| $14,122.50
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $13.65 | $4,095.00 $11.57 $3,471.00] $15.60 | $4,680.00 $20.77] $6,231.00
Comments
6 [vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $14.96 [ $748.00 $11.57 $578.50( $16.98 $849.00 $21.33] $1,066.50
Comments
4 |vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $14.96 [ $748.00 $11.57 $578.50( $16.98 $849.00 $21.88] $1,094.00
Comments
8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $17.08 [ $854.00 $11.57 $578.50[ $19.80 $990.00 $22.63] $1,131.50
9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $17.08 [ $854.00 $11.57 $578.50| $19.80 $990.00 $23.43[ $1,171.50
10|vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $12.71 | $317.75 $11.57 $289.25( $14.48 $362.00 $18.33 $458.25
11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $12.71 | $317.75 $11.57 $289.25| $14.48 $362.00 $18.33 $458.25
12|vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $12.71 | $317.75 $11.57 $289.25( $14.48 $362.00 $18.81 $470.25
13|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $12.71 | $317.75 $11.57 $289.25| $14.48 $362.00 $19.58 $489.50
14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $13.65 | $136.50 $11.57 $115.70[ $15.60 $156.00 $20.77 $207.70
15|vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $14.96 $149.60 $11.57 $115.70[ $16.99 $169.90 $21.85 $218.50
16|vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $14.96 [ $149.60 $11.57 $115.70] $16.99 $169.90 $22.38 $223.80
17|vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $17.08 $170.80 $11.57 $115.70f $19.80 $198.00 $23.13 $231.30
18|vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $17.08 [ $170.80 $11.57 $115.70[ $19.80 $198.00 $23.93 $239.30
Note: We are offering
a 5% cash discount if
Comments paid in 30 days
Terms 5%, 30 1%, 10 Net 30
Delivery 15-20 days 30 days
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Buyer: Todd Dlouhy

1414 OF

Class Il Safety Vests

Utility Products Mfg.

Vinatronic's "Made In
the USA" (A Safety

Co. Inc. and Supply Co.)
Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Description QTY UM Price Price Price Price
1 Vest, mesh, yellow/green small 750 EA $15.10( $11,325.00 $24.90( $18,675.00
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green med 750 EA $15.10{ $11,325.00 $24.90( $18,675.00
Comments
3 vest, mesh, yellow/green large 750 EA $15.10{ $11,325.00 $24.90( $18,675.00
Comments
4 vest, mesh, yellow/green XL 750 EA $15.10{ $11,325.00 $24.90( $18,675.00
Comments
5 vest, mesh, yellow/green 2XL 300 EA $15.10] $4,530.00 $24.90] $7,470.00
Comments
6 vest, mesh, yellow/green 3XL 50 EA $16.60 $830.00 $25.90] $1,295.00
Comments
7 vest, mesh, yellow/green 4XL 50 EA $16.60 $830.00 $25.90] $1,295.00
Comments
8|vest, mesh, yellow/green 5XL 50 EA $18.25 $912.50 $25.90] $1,295.00
9|vest, mesh, yellow/green 6XL 50 EA $18.25 $912.50 $25.90( $1,295.00
10]vest, mesh, orange, small 25 EA $15.10 $377.50 $24.90 $622.50
11|vest, mesh, orange, medium 25 EA $15.10 $377.50 $24.90 $622.50
12]vest, mesh, orange, large 25 EA $15.10 $377.50 $24.90 $622.50
13|vest, mesh, orange, XL 25 EA $15.10 $377.50 $24.90 $622.50
14|vest, mesh, orange, 2XL 10 EA $15.10 $151.00 $24.90 $249.00
15|vest, mesh, orange, 3XL 10 EA $16.60 $166.00 $25.90 $259.00
16|vest, mesh, orange, 4XL 10 EA $16.60 $166.00 $25.90 $259.00
17|vest, mesh, orange, 5XL 10 EA $18.25 $182.50 $25.90 $259.00
18|vest, mesh, orange, 6XL 10 EA $18.25 $182.50 $25.90 $259.00
Comments
Terms Net 30 30 days
Delivery 30 days
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