Buyer: Todd Dlouhy
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Plumbing Supplies
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J A Sexauer Plumbmaster
Brand Model / Part # |Description Usage M_angfacturer Model / Part # | Unit Price Exte_nded Zone 1,2,3 Mangfacturer Model/Part # | Unit Price Extended Zone 1,2,3
Bidding Price or All Bidding Price or All

1.000 F_aucet and Sink Parts and

Fixtures

Sink Strainer Standard 3 1/2 "
1.001 Stainless Steel 11 Sexauer 0062208 $22.64 $249.04 All Plumbmaster 50545 $7.29 $80.19 All

Sink Strainer 2 1/2" Stainless .
1.002 Steel 5 varies 0147884 $2.77 $13.85 All Plumbmaster 36437 $22.68 $113.40 All
1.003 1-1/4" Wheel Chair Lav Drain 9 varies 0144162 $17.84 $160.56 All $0.00 All
1.004 Lavatory Pop-Up Assy 6 varies 0148353 $5.13 $30.78 All Plumbmaster 50654 $8.05 $48.30 All

Male Aerator Vandal Proof .
1.005 (15/16-27) 18 varies 00408736 $4.59 $82.62 All Plumbmaster 97251 $4.05 $72.90 All
1.006 Male Aerator 15/16-27 18 Neoperl 0033530 $0.74 $13.32 All Plumbmaster 36087 $1.72 $30.96 All
1.007 |Acorn .5 GPM Flow Control Assy 55 Acorn 234906 $2.90 $159.50 All Acorn As Spec $16.36 $899.80 All
1.008 |Acorn 0401-015-000 [O-ring 100 Acorn 0341180 $9.89 $989.00 All Acorn As Spec $0.30 $30.00 All
1.009 |Acorn 0401-016-000 |O-ring 100 Acorn 0350546 $0.98 $98.00 All Acorn As Spec $0.78 $78.00 All
1.010 |Acorn 0401-007-000 |O-ring 100 Acorn 0319392 $0.80 $80.00 All $0.00 All
1.011 |Acorn 2570-045-000 |Single Temp Tee Body 10 Acorn 0341214 $7.98 $79.80 All $0.00 All
1.012 |Acorn 2570-042-000 |Flow Control Adapter 50 Acorn 0341172 $4.50 $225.00 All Acorn As Spec $3.84 $192.00 All
1.013 |Acorn 0326-100-000 |Retaining Clip 10 Acorn 0341198 $9.89 $98.90 All Acorn As Spec $0.77 $7.70 All
1.014 |Acorn 2563-009-001 |Orifice Plate Assembly 10 Acorn 0234690 $12.29 $122.90 All Acorn As Spec $13.27 $132.70 All
1.015 |Acorn 2563-010-001 |Water Diaphram Assembly 100 Acorn 0234708 $12.88 | $1,288.00 All Acorn As Spec $15.64 | $1,564.00 All
1.016 |Acorn 2570-000-001 |Strainer Assembly 20 Acorn 0350702 $95.87 $1,917.40 All Acorn As Spec $96.02 $1,920.40 All
1.017 |Acorn 2570-041-000 |Mixing Tee 10 Acorn 0341149 $8.98 $89.80 All $0.00 All
1.018 |Acorn 2590-061-001 |H/C Double Airtrol Valve Body 10 Acorn sp2590061 $368.51 | $3,685.10 All $0.00 All
1.019 |Acorn 2566-056-199 |Diaphram retainer back outlet 10 Acorn 0248500 $19.97 $199.70 All $0.00 All
1.020 [Acorn 2566-055-199 |Diaphram Retainer Side Outlet |10 Acorn 0385609 $21.85 $218.50 All $0.00 All
1.021 |Acorn 2566-050-001 |Push Button Assy Back Outlet 10 Acorn 0341321 $42.91 $429.10 All Acorn As Spec $42.58 $425.80 All
1.022  |Acorn 2566-025-001 |Push Button Assy Side Outlet 10 Acorn 0341842 $36.92 $369.20 All $0.00 All

Repair Kit for T&S B-0107 Spray
1.023 |T&S B-10K Valve 4 T&S 0261065 $13.57 $54.28 All Plumbmaster 36309 $7.55 $30.20 All
1.024 |T&S B-107 Pre-Rinse Spray Valve Complete |2 T&S 0005645 $62.93 $125.86 All T&S B107 $53.52 $107.04 All

Pre-Rinse Squeeze Valve
1.025 |T&S Handle T&S B-107 11 T&S 0004119 $20.16 $221.76 All T&S B107 $51.83 $570.13 All
1.026 |Fisher Glass Filler Repair Kit Fisher 14 Fisher 0129990 $17.80 $249.20 All $0.00 All
1.027 |T&S T&S Glass Filler Lexan Lever 35 T&S 0035337 $8.05 $281.75 All T&S 1145-45M $11.21 $392.35 All

Pedestal Push Back Glass Filler
1.028 |T&S B-1210 T&S Complete T&S 0114173 $78.92 $394.60 All T&S B1210 $77.17 $385.85 All
1.029 |Fisher ;)Z; Stem and Handle Assembly | Fisher 0125377 $38.85 | $194.25 Al $0.00 Al
1.030 |Fisher 3R/':',,' Stem and Handle Assembly | Fisher 0125385 $38.85 | $194.25 Al $0.00 Al
1.031 |Moen M-08 Plastic Cartridge 8 Moen 0092528 $8.51 $68.08 All $0.00 All
1.032 |Moen 1225 Plastic Cartridge 12 Moen 0246868 $5.16 $61.92 All Plumbmaster 16554 $7.55 $90.60 All
1.033 |Moen 1222 Posi-Temp Cartridge 3 Moen 0191320 $36.60 $109.80 All Moen 1222 $47.47 $142.41 All
1.034 |Moen 1225 Genuine Cartridge 40 Moen 0089268 $11.48 $459.20 All moen 1225 $14.03 $561.20 All
1.035 |crane 8'3';26 LeftHand Hot (Stem 1,6 Ioiane 0054650 $0.85 $40.80 Al Plumbmaster | 15117 $1.61 $77.28 Al
1.036 |crane gi‘rfée Pair Right & Left Hand |, Crane 0101345 $5.98 $71.76 Al Plumbmaster | 10189 $6.46 $77.52 Al
1.037 |Crane 1604 White 14"x13" Lav 5 Crane 0350884 $275.61 | $1,378.05 All $0.00 All
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1.038 |Crane C-1216 Push Button Valve 10 Crane 0284141 $359.67 | $3,596.70 All $0.00 All
1.039 |Acorn Acorn Quick Cloz Cartridge 9 Ebco 0106856 $58.07 $522.63 All Plumbmaster 73642 $43.56 $392.04 All
1.040 |Ebco Drinking Fountain Cartridge Chicago 0018119 $27.88 | $111.52 Al $0.00 Al
Brass Repair Cartridge
. Quaturn Ceramic Cartridge Short .
1.041 |Chicago R.H. Concealed Valve 4 Chicago 0302166 $13.82 $55.28 All $0.00 All
1.042  |Chicago Quaturn Ceramic Cartridge Short | Chicago 0302174 $13.82 | $55.28 Al $0.00 Al
L.H. Concealed Valve
1.043 |Chicago Quaturn Cartridge Repair Kit 12 Delta 0251462 $8.51 $102.12 All $0.00 All
1.044 |Delta Metal Lever Handle Repair Kit | Chicago 0185355 $9.28 | $55.68 Al $0.00 Al
Delta Faucet
1.045 |Chicago 395-018jknf Spring For Push Button Unit 20 Delta 0054015 $0.30 $6.00 All Chicago 395-018JK $1.07 $21.40 All
1.046 |Delta Delta Two Handle Stem Unit ) |50, 0049467 $7.55 | $226.50 Al $0.00 Al
Assembly Repair Kit
1.047 |Delta 2100 Kitchen Faucet L/Spray 10 Delta 0131052 $54.05 $540.50 All Delta 2100 $58.73 $587.30 All
1.048 |Delta 2520 Lavatory Faucet 26 Delta 01311136 $55.94 $1,454.44 All Delta 2520 $78.84 $2,049.84 All
1.049 |Luxtra Single Lever Lavatory Faucet g Luxtra 0702332 $27.34 | $218.72 Al $0.00 Al
Less Pop-Up
1.050 |[T&S B-300 Double Pantry Faucet 2 T&S 0114041 $114.70 $229.40 All T&S B300 $109.76 $219.52 All
1.051 |Chicago Single Deck Mounted Faucet 2 Chicago 0192609 $89.11 $178.22 All $0.00 All
1.052 Electronic Faucet W/Plug in 10 0338863 $299.68 | $2,996.80 | Al $0.00 Al
Transformer
2.000 Shower Parts and Supplies $0.00 All
2.001 Hand Shower-White 9 Alsons 0029082 $5.98 $53.82 All Plumbmaster 50836 $7.55 $67.95 All
2.002 Shower Replacement head 26 Sre;‘sas“er 0273995 $3.50 $91.00 All $0.00 All
2.003 Shower Replacement Head 40 Sexauer 0211052 $28.71 | $1,148.40 Al $0.00 Al
W/Vol Control
2.004 |Alsons 462PB White Shower Head 47 alsons 0029074 $10.62 $499.14 All Alsons 462PB $13.92 $654.24 All
2.005 6" Wall Cover 6 0262139 $5.35 $32.10 All $0.00 All
2.006 |Alsons 24" Glide Rall 2 Alsons 247593 $48.01 $96.02 All Alsons 1511C $43.19 $86.38 All
2.007 |Alsons Glide Slide 3 Alsons 0190603 $9.37 $28.11 All Alsons BAS4156BG $9.71 $29.13 All
2.008 |Alsons Deluxe Hand Shower Head 5 Alsons 0190629 $51.21 $256.05 All Alsons 460KCBX $39.99 $199.95 All
2.009 |Alsons ';223 Shower Replacement 53 |Alsons 0029082 $5.98 | $316.94 Al $0.00 Al
2.010 |Acorn Flat Bonnet Gasket 50 Acorn 0106020 $48.49 | $2,424.50 All Acorn 0401-117-001| $1.13 $56.50 All
2.011 |Acomn Sc‘)‘r']‘:nkef'oz Cartridge, Less 28 |Acom 0106062 $0.84 | $2352 Al $0.00 Al
2.012 |Acom V(g::;}o;-g::farmdge Assembly 155 acom 0106856 $58.07 | $1,161.40 Al Plumbmaster | 73641 $53.99 | $1,079.80 All
2.013 |Acomn Standard Shower Head 4 Acorn 0233544 $168.85 | $675.40 Al $0.00 Al
Assembly
2.014 |Acorn 2590-205-001 |Valve body 2.5 GPM 5 Acorn Sp-9947612 $210.50 | $1,052.50 All $0.00 All
2.015 |Acorn 1244-010-002 |Penal Shower Head 5 Acorn sp-9946364 $107.54 | $537.70 All $0.00 All
2.016 |Acorn 4906-032-199 [Back Outlet Strainer 5 Acorn Sp-9931008 $12.09 $60.45 All $0.00 All
2.017 |Acorn 4925-202-199 [Back Outlet Drain 5 Acorn sp-99-60098 $47.32 $236.60 All $0.00 All
2.018 |Acorn 2563-020-001 |Servometer 10 Acorn Sp-9985985 $63.38 $633.80 All Acorn As Spec $110.80 | $1,108.00 All
2.019 |Acorn 4906-025-199 [Strainer Tamper Resistant 5 Acorn sp-998732 $12.51 $62.55 All $0.00 All
2.020 |Moen 14732 s”ﬁ(:‘v‘ler Kitfor single handle Moen 0191379 $1353 | $40.59 All Plumbmaster | 31935 $8.59 $25.77 All
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2021 |Moen 10089 \S/;?\‘/’embe Single Handle Shower|, Moen 0037556 $4.72 $47.20 Al Plumbmaster | 31080 $3.23 $32.30 Al
2.022 |Moen 96797 Replacement Handle 49 Moen 0161430 $3.88 $190.12 All Plumbmaster 30677 $4.59 $224.91 All
2.023 [Moen 10510 Stop Tube 10 Moen 0233239 $13.98 $139.80 All Plumbmaster 31068 $18.66 $186.60 All
2.024 |Moen 16090 Moen Tub Stops 42 Moen 0039800 $17.38 $729.96 All Plumbmaster 32938 $10.78 $452.76 All
3.000 Tools and Supplies $0.00
3.001 1 Acid Brushes 100 varies 0068445 $0.31 $31.00 All Plumbmaster $0.00 All
3.002 1/2" CC Burnish Brushes 10 varies 0068577 $3.40 $34.00 All Plumbmaster 60821 $5.39 $53.90 All
3.003 3/4" Burnish Brushes 10 varies 0068585 $1.98 $19.80 All Plumbmaster 60822 $5.71 $57.10 All
3.004 1" CC Burnish Brushes 10 varies 0068593 $3.79 $37.90 All Plumbmaster 60823 $6.04 $60.40 All
3.005 1-1/2" Emery Cloth 13 10 yards 0105619 $4.33 $56.29 All 30' $3.28 $42.64 All
3.006 Solder 20 1lb 0168906 $10.68 $213.60 All 1lb $8.63 $172.60 All
3.007 Flux 20 8 0z 0029538 $4.75 $95.00 All Nokorode 1lb $6.15 $123.00 All
3.008 Teflon Tape 1/2" x 520" 34 1/2" x 520" 55-5047 $5.35 $181.90 All 520" $0.43 $14.62 All
3.009 Pipe Thread Sealant 2 1/2 pint 0029512 $3.30 $6.60 All Rectorseal 1/2 pint $9.93 $19.86 All
3.010 Tub Caulk 60 10 oz 0288183 $3.40 $204.00 All DAP 5.5 0z $2.91 $174.60 All
3.011 i"cone Waterproof Grease 20 |,, 7502 BN-441146 | $2.89 | $69.36 Al 2.0z $2.43 | $58.32 Al
3.012 Plumbers Putty 14 oz 7 Sexauer 0029504 $1.52 $10.64 All 14 oz $1.29 $9.03 All
3.013 gfezzy'D“ty PVC Cement 160z |, Oatey BN-451028 $5.20 $15.60 Al Hawey 97549 $5.13 $15.39 Al
3.014 Calci-Solve Concentrate, Quart |24 Calci Solve 0263798 $6.95 $166.80 All $0.00 All
3.015 Liquid Drain Cleaner Quart 72 Sexauer Mule 0087072 $6.15 $442.80 All Plumbmaster 97535 $62.18 | $4,476.96 All
3.016 Plumbers' Shoe Covers 1 varies 99-8840 $27.63 $27.63 All Plumbmaster 61401 $18.89 $18.89 All
3.017 3' Closet Auger 3 Sexauer 0007971 $41.52 $124.56 All General Wire 60557 $52.57 $157.71 All
3.018 PVC Pipe Saw 1 varies 0348755 $15.84 $15.84 All $0.00 All
3.019 Super Force Drain Plunger 2 Sexauer 0283432 $5.79 $11.58 All Plumbmaster 90201 $12.34 $24.68 All
4.000 Supply Lines and Hoses $0.00
4.001 9" 3/8" Comp. X 1/2" FIPS 6 varies 0701342 $2.35 $14.10 All Plumbmaster $0.00 All
4.002 12"3/8" Comp. X 1/2" FIP 58 varies 0701359 $2.44 $141.52 All Plumbmaster 59827 $2.59 $150.22 All
4.003 16"3/8"Comp X 1/2" FIPS 14 varies 0701367 $2.99 $41.86 All Plumbmaster 59829 $2.79 $39.06 All
4.004 20" 3/8"Comp. X 1/2" FIPS 64 varies 0701375 $3.48 $222.72 All Plumbmaster 59831 $2.99 $191.36 All
4.005 3/8" Comp x 7/8" BC x 12" Closet|, ;|\ i 0701490 $2.65 $26.50 Al Plumbmaster | 59860 $2.69 $26.90 Al
S/S Connector
4.006 3/8" Comp x 3/8" CMP x 60 1 varies 0701599 $6.96 $6.96 Al Plumbmaster | 59899 $6.29 $6.29 Al
D/Washer S/S Connector
4.007 Isgs ;’(VZS?'”Q Machine Hose 1/2 1, varies 0228163 $13.98 | $55.92 All $0.00 Al
4.008 OEM T&S 44" Flex SS Hose 3 varies 0004218 $39.00 $117.00 All T&S B-0044 $43.15 $129.45 All
4.009 Reinforced Vinyl Hose For Hand |, |2 eg 0327007 $18.42 | $552.60 Al $0.00 Al
Shower, 84
4.010 :ggd Shower Swivel Connector, |, |goyaier 0049569 $9.97 | $568.29 Al Alsons $0.00 Al
Alsons 4002-BX Swivel Conn
4.011 F/Shr WH/CP 144 Alsons 0049577 $4.95 $712.80 All 4002-BX $6.47 $931.68 All
5000 quet and Urinal Parts and $0.00
Fixtures
5.001 Flapper Chain 48 Korky 0255893 $0.30 $14.40 All Plumbmaster 40044 $0.29 $13.92 All
5.002 |Kohler 81352 Flapper 65 Kohler BN-180108 $5.05 $328.25 All Plumbmaster As Spec $1.83 $118.95 All
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5.003 Tank Lever 30 Sexauer 0255927 $1.48 $44.40 All Plumbmaster 41044 $4.31 $129.30 All
American . American
5.004 Standard Trip Lever For Cadet, C.P. 4 Standard 0255414 $5.95 $23.80 All Plumbmaster 40179 $3.23 $12.92 All
5.005 Flapper Valve Hook 24 Sexauer 0255893 $0.30 $7.20 All Plumbmaster 40045 $0.11 $2.64 All
5.006 [Fluidmaster|400A Ballcock Complete 25 Fluidmaster 0053322 $5.71 $142.75 All Fluidmaster 400A $6.49 $162.25 All
5007 |American Repl F/V Disc Screw on 1p  |American 0074708 $0.80 $9.60 Al Plumbmaster | 40425 $0.96 $11.52 Al
Standard Standard
American . American
5.008 Standard Repl F/V Disc Snap on 6 Standard 0074831 $0.71 $4.26 All Plumbmaster 40426 $0.96 $5.76 All
5.009 Toilet Bowl Force Cup-24" Screw | o Sexauer 0039214 $4.99 $39.92 Al 62094 $1.29 $10.32 Al
in Handle. Plumbmaster
American . American
5.010 Standard Aquaseal Diaphram 30 Standard 0074799 $0.21 $6.30 All Plumbmaster 36565 $0.33 $9.90 All
5.011 Toilet Seat Standard White 45 Bemis 0702068 $10.40 $468.00 All Bemis 955C $18.35 $825.75 All
5.012 White Elong with Lid 6 Bemis 0702076 $15.71 $94.26 All Bemis 1500PRO $15.11 $90.66 All
5.013 C\'/:j?m"f Seat EL,OF Less LID- Bemis 0333708 $36.52 | $73.04 Al $0.00 Al
5.014 Plastic Urinal Screen 10 varies 99-0213 $0.62 $6.20 All Plumbmaster 41217 $5.18 $51.80 All
5.015 Paper Holder with Plastic Roller |13 varies 0108829 $7.49 $97.37 All $0.00 All
American American
5.016 Standard Sponge Washer 38 Standard 0002997 $0.60 $22.80 All $0.00 All
5017 |American Cadet Tank Cover White 5 American 0264069 $20.92 | $149.60 Al $0.00 Al
Standard Standard
5.018 |[Crane Toilet Bowl White 2 Crane 0350900 $189.78 $379.56 All $0.00 All
5019 [American Madera ADA 1.6 EL Toilet, White |2 American 0211532 $99.86 | $199.72 Al $0.00 Al
Standard Standard
5.020 1.6 GPF Wall Hung Bowl 3 0211516 $109.85 $329.55 All $0.00 All
5.021 |[Crane Sanwalton Bowl 2 Crane 0350918 $299.72 $599.44 All $0.00 All
5.022 |Zurn Aguavantage Closet Kit-1.6 GPF |35 Zurn 0190470 $9.94 $347.90 All As Spec As Spec $204.00 | $7,140.00 All
American . N American
5.023 Standard 6501 Urinal, 3/4" Top Spud 10 Standard 0205385 $184.83 | $1,848.30 All $0.00 All
American . N American
5.024 Standard 6601 Urinal 1-1/4" Top Spud 10 Standard 0205393 $265.62 | $2,656.20 All $0.00 All
American . N American
5.025 Standard 6581 Urinal, 3/4" Top Spud 10 Standard sp6581 $119.10 | $1,191.00 All $0.00 All
5.026 |Acorn 2563-080-001 |Floodtrol Valve 5 Acorn sp2563080 $247.45 | $1,237.25 All $0.00 All
p-Traps and Related Parts 50.00 e
6.001 1-1/4" P-Trap 17 GA 50 Premier 0086207 $13.98 $699.00 All Plumbmaster 50375 $11.65 $582.50 All
6.002 1-1/2" P-Trap 17 GA 28 Premier 0086173 $16.06 $449.68 All Plumbmaster 50376 $12.82 $358.96 All
1-1/4" 17GA. C.P. P-Trap,No .
6.003 Clean-out 120 Premier 0086215 $9.47 $1,136.40 All Plumbmaster 50371 $8.15 $978.00 All
6.004 élifniZ?A CP.P-TrapNo |, Premier 0086181 $11.15 | $479.45 Al Plumbmaster | 50373 $9.32 | $400.76 Al
6.005 PVC P Trap 1-1/4 with PVC Nuts |10 Premier 0161182 $1.76 $17.60 All Plumbmaster 94004 $1.29 $12.90 All
6.006 PVC P 1-1/2 With PVC Nuts 5 Premier 0007757 $1.92 $9.60 All Plumbmaster 94003 $1.07 $5.35 All
6.007 1-1/4" S Trap 20 GA 6 Premier 0131433 $11.09 $66.54 All Plumbmaster 50380 $12.24 $73.44 All
6.008 1-1/2" S Trap 20 GA 10 Premier 0131441 $9.63 $96.30 All Plumbmaster 50382 $13.40 $134.00 All
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6.009 29 1-1/2" x 12 Tailpiece 17 GA |3 Premier 0076745 $3.63 $10.89 All Plumbmaster 54657 $7.83 $23.49 All
6.010 28 1-1/2" x 8" Tailpiece 17 GA 6 Premier 0062844 $2.71 $16.26 All Plumbmaster 50553 $4.65 $27.90 All
6.011 1-1/4" x 12" Fine THD Tube 36 Premier 0062356 $4.48 $161.28 All Plumbmaster 50503 $4.65 $167.40 All
6.012 1-1/4" x 16 Double Ext Tube 6 Premier 0192294 $7.98 $47.88 All Plumbmaster 54951 $8.74 $52.44 All
6.013 1-1/2" x 8" Slip Ext 17 GA 13 Premier 0076778 $4.18 $54.34 All Plumbmaster 53632 $7.11 $92.43 All
6.014 1-1/2" X 12" Fine THD Tube 10 Premier 0062364 $5.86 $58.60 All Plumbmaster 50506 $5.82 $58.20 All
6.015 1-1/2" x 16 Double Ext Tube 6 Premier 0166264 $4.99 $29.94 All Plumbmaster 50612 $6.47 $38.82 All
6.016 1-1/2" J Bend W/Nuts 4 Premier 0080390 $7.82 $31.28 All Plumbmaster 50463 $10.44 $41.76 All
6.017 6 1-1/2 x 15" Wastebend 8 Premier 0033670 $7.98 $63.84 All Plumbmaster 50639 $8.15 $65.20 All
6.018 (1:-|13/2N5t.§. Offset 17 GA. With 14 Premier 0080929 $13.46 | $40.38 All Plumbmaster | 54917 $5.91 $17.73 Al
7.000 Wax Rings, Orings Etc. $0.00

7.001 #1 O Ring 44 Sexauer 0051219 $0.24 $10.56 All Plumbmaster 35721 $0.11 $4.84 All
7.002 #7 O Ring 10 Sexauer 0051276 $0.12 $1.20 All Plumbmaster 35724 $0.06 $0.60 All
7.003 #16 O Ring 115 Sexauer 0072363 $0.10 $11.50 All Plumbmaster 35733 $0.11 $12.65 All
7.004 #34 O Ring 6 Sexauer 0075879 $0.06 $0.36 All Plumbmaster 35748 $0.17 $1.02 All
7.005 #45 O Ring 36 Sexauer 0084053 $0.20 $7.20 All Plumbmaster 35759 $0.11 $3.96 All
7.006 1 Closet Bowl Wax Ring 90 Sexauer 0060905 $0.92 $82.80 All Harvey #1 $0.54 $48.60 All
7.007 3 Closet Bowl Wax Ring 44 Sexauer 0076216 $1.32 $58.08 All Harvey #3 $2.58 $113.52 All
7.008 #5 Wax Ring (Wall-Hung Urinals) |12 Sexauer 0088385 $1.79 $21.48 All Harvey #5 $2.11 $25.32 All
7.009 #1 Floor Wax Seal w/Bolts 6 Sexauer 0278275 $1.91 $11.46 All Plumbmaster 40638 $1.76 $10.56 All
7.010 1/4" Flat Bibb Washer 10 Sexauer 0064667 $0.11 $1.10 All Plumbmaster 35037 $0.09 $0.90 All
7.011 3/8"L Flat Bibb Washer 20 Sexauer 0064709 $0.11 $2.20 All Plumbmaster 35041 $0.11 $2.20 All
7.012 1/2" Flat Bibb Washer 20 Sexauer 0064717 $0.13 $2.60 All Plumbmaster 35042 $0.14 $2.80 All
7.013 1" Flat Bibb Washer 10 Sexauer 0050633 $0.49 $4.90 All Plumbmaster 35046 $0.29 $2.90 All
7.014 1/4" Beveled Bibb Washer 10 Sexauer 0064584 $0.11 $1.10 All Plumbmaster 35003 $0.09 $0.90 All
7.015 1/2" Beveled Bibb Washer 10 Sexauer 0064634 $0.15 $1.50 All Plumbmaster 35008 $0.14 $1.40 All
7.016 20M Bibb Seat 6 Sexauer sp712347 $0.60 $3.60 All Plumbmaster 30220 $1.93 $11.58 All
7.017 \1/\/;/5 4hzr‘"yethy'e”e Slip Joint 1376 |Sexauer 0063636 $0.10 $37.50 Al Plumbmaster | 36660 $0.09 $33.75 Al
7.018 \1,\/;/5 Zhgro'yethy'e”e Slip Joint o5 |Sexauer 0063628 $0.10 $62.50 Al Plumbmaster | 36661 $0.09 $56.25 Al
7.019 \Zlvazc:gfthy'e”e Slip Joint 300  [Sexauer 0064238 $0.43 | $129.00 Al $0.00 Al
7.020 2" Slip Joint Nut 10 Sexauer 0075317 $1.64 $16.40 All Plumbmaster 36726 $1.93 $19.30 All
7.021 Brass Slip Joint Nut 1-1/4" x 1/4" |25 varies 0075267 $0.89 $22.25 All $0.00 All
7.022 1-1/2 Closet Spud 102 varies 0147777 $4.82 $491.64 All Plumbmaster 40501 $3.55 $362.10 All
7.023 1-1/2 Spud Gasket 50 varies 0059378 $1.12 $56.00 All Plumbmaster 40480 $0.43 $21.50 All
7.024 Closet Bolt 1/4" x 2-1/4" 35 varies 0060459 $0.78 $27.30 All Plumbmaster 40540 $0.69 $24.15 All
7.025 4" Closet Flange 3 varies 0147710 $5.45 $16.35 All Plumbmaster 40637 $4.53 $13.59 All
8.000 Sloan Parts and Assemblies $0.00

8.001 [Sloan 301082 A-6 Handle Coupling 6 Sloan 0090027 $5.29 $31.74 All $0.00 All
8.002 |Sloan 302109 B-7 Sloan Handle Socket 6 Sloan 0090340 $4.99 $29.94 Al $0.00 Al

Assembly
8.003 |[Sloan 302390 B-73-A ADA Compliant Handle (6 Sloan 0232413 $8.98 $53.88 All As spec 11.99 $71.94 All
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8.004 |Sloan 306146 i’slég;ﬂs)f;”d Nutand Flange 5 Sloan 0078600 $10.64 | $53.20 Al $0.00 Al
8.005 |Sloan 308801 gggs%\ll?pi'l‘éa:;jé 1b?yAdj“Stab'e Sloan 0099838 $11.96 | $47.84 Al As spec $11.08 | $44.32 Al
8.006 |Sloan 323015 érlelsé‘;l'” 2 CP Vacuum 6 Sloan 0018266 $19.97 | $119.82 Al As spec $24.94 | $149.64 Al
8.007 |[Sloan 3301036 A-36-A Overhaul Kit 375 Sloan 032540 $9.94 $3,727.50 All As spec $7.99 $2,996.25 All
8.008 |Sloan 3301037 A-37-A Urinal Kit 1.5 GPF a Sloan 0032557 $9.94 | $407.54 Al As spec $7.99 | $327.59 Al
8.009 [Sloan 3301070 Royal Closet Repair Kit 1.6 GPF |32 Sloan 0313494 $26.01 $832.32 All As spec $19.95 $638.40 All
8.010 |Sloan 3302306 Ei't‘r’l'A Sloan F/V Handle Repair |, Sloan 0309294 $4.89 | $244.50 All As spec $5.10 | $255.00 Al
8.011 |Sloan 3305621 Et’:ﬁg‘;ﬁfe”sor For Closet ¢ Sloan 0227553 $125.19 | $751.14 All As spec $141.75 | $850.50 Al
8.012 [Sloan 3308853 Overhaul Kit for Stop 25 Sloan 0098467 $6.26 $156.50 All As spec $4.99 $124.75 All
8.013 [Sloan 3308855 1" Wheel Handle Stop Repair Kit |22 Sloan 0069302 $9.69 $213.18 All As spec $10.55 $232.10 All
8.014 |[Sloan 3317004 Sloan Rebuild Kit-Closet 15 Sloan 0247495 $13.97 $209.55 All $0.00 All
8.015 |Sloan 3323182 i::’a” V651A Vacuum Breaker 1,4, |gjoan 0309252 $2.61 | $522.00 All As spec $2.93 | $586.00 Al
8.016 |[Sloan  [3323192 ;';‘sﬂil\éa}i‘i’f \\/’igultf? Breaker 1542 |Sloan 0093385 $1.56 | $845.52 Al As spec $1.29 | $699.18 Al
8.017 [Sloan 3325001 EBV-1020-A Sloan Optima 4 Sloan 0248930 $32.86 $131.44 All As spec $29.95 $119.80 All
8.018 |Sloan 3393004 ;/,,GOOAA Vacuum Breaker 3/4"x |, Sloan 0309260 $18.50 | $370.00 Al As spec $16.77 | $335.40 Al
8.019 [Sloan 3393006 ;/Z?OAA Vacuum Breaker 1-1/4" |, Sloan 0309278 $18.50 | $185.00 Al $0.00 Al
8.020 |Sloan 3393007 ;/,,GOOAA Vacuum Breaker 1-1/2. x| o Sloan 0309286 $1850 | $111.00 Al As spec $16.77 | $100.62 Al
8.021 [Sloan 5301058 A19AC Sloan Rel Valve 10 Sloan 0008409 $2.90 $29.00 All As spec $2.29 $22.90 All
8.022 |Sloan 5301059 C'rilng‘;fu Plastic Relief valve, |, Sloan 0008417 $2.90 $58.00 All As spec $2.29 $45.80 Al
8.023 [Sloan 5301111 A15A Molded Disc 72 Sloan 0090068 $2.42 $174.24 All As spec $2.29 $164.88 All
8.024 [Sloan 5301188 A156A Diaph for 96 Sloan 0090290 $2.89 $277.44 All As spec $2.79 $267.84 All
8.025 |Sloan 5301236 A163A Guide 50  |Sloan 0098715 $2.22 | $111.00 Al As spec $1.29 $64.50 Al
8.026 [Sloan 5302279 B32A F/V Handle Complete 50 Sloan 0091835 $5.77 $288.50 All As spec $5.99 $299.50 All
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8.027 |[Sloan 5302297 B39 Seal 217 Sloan 0090472 $0.59 $128.03 All As spec $0.41 $88.97 All
8.028 |[Sloan 5302305 Rebuild Kit B-50-A Handle 118 Sloan 090498 $1.83 $215.94 All As spec $1.61 $189.98 All
8.029 [Sloan 5323007 é’é’:kef 9" V-500-AA Vacuum g Sloan 0092585 $13.79 $68.95 All As spec $9.69 $48.45 Al
8.030 |Sloan 110 Royal Closet Flush 40 Sloan 0233783 $90.20 | $3,608.00 Al As spec $84.99 | $3,399.60 Al
Valve,3.5GPF
8.031 |[Sloan 186VB Flush Valve 9 Sloan 0233866 $90.20 $811.80 All $0.00 All
8.032 |[Sloan Regal F/V Closet 115-1.6 ES-S |7 Sloan 0304592 $71.04 $497.28 All $0.00 All
110ES-S-YB Closet Opima
8.033 |[Sloan F\V.COP SWT 27 Sloan 0223651 $315.26 | $8,512.02 All $0.00 All
8.034 |[Sloan ZI?:/lifHOMETER WITH-E VARI. 2 Sloan 0223768 $364.56 $729.12 All $0.00 All
8.035 |[Sloan Sloan Super Wrench A-50 2 Sloan 0190876 $28.77 $57.54 All As spec $34.01 $68.02 All
Sloan EFT-150 LL Sensor F/ELF-
8.036 |[Sloan 10/ESF2030 4 Sloan 0227918 $126.27 $505.08 All $0.00 All
8.037 |[Sloan 318031 Cartridge Assembly 20 Sloan 0322982 $36.64 $732.80 All $0.00 All
8.038 |[Sloan 3318001 Actuator 20 Sloan 0323014 $17.94 $358.80 All As spec $20.99 $419.80 All
9.001 E/:” \(/:;Tep X 5/8"OD Angle Mini |2, a05110 0239830 $5.20 | $163.99 Al Plumbmaster | 53441 $4.31 | $133.61 Al
9.002 3/8" Comp x 5/8" OD Straight |, {05 0239913 $5.08 $60.96 Al Plumbmaster | 53446 $4.53 $54.36 Al
Mini Ball Valve
3/8" Comp x 1/2" FIP Straight
9.003 Mini Ball Valve Apollo 0241844 $5.36 $32.16 All Plumbmaster 53447 $5.39 $32.34 All
9.004 ;’:” \(/:;Té’ X 1/2" FIP Angle Mini Apollo 0241190 $5.48 $21.92 Al Plumbmaster | 53442 $5.39 $21.56 Al
9.005 1/2" CXC Ball Valve 25 Red-White 0202887 $6.25 $156.25 All Plumbmaster 55716 $2.75 $68.75 All
9.006 3/4" CXC Ball Valve 16 Red-White 0202895 $9.15 $146.40 All Plumbmaster 55715 $3.25 $52.00 All
9.007 2" CXC Ball Valve 2 Red-White 0202937 $33.95 $67.90 All Plumbmaster 55719 $17.45 $34.90 All
9.008 1/2 SWT x 1/2 FP Ball Valve 18 Red-White 0102731 $7.64 $137.52 All Plumbmaster 55667 $2.99 $53.82 All
9.009 3/4 SWT x 3/4 FP Ball Valve 18 Red-White 0102749 $12.45 $224.10 All Plumbmaster 55666 $3.99 $71.82 All
9.010 1 SWT x 1 FP Ball Valve 3 Red-White 0202903 $11.45 $34.35 All Plumbmaster 55668 $6.99 $20.97 All
9.011 2 SWT x 2 FP Ball Valve 2 Red-White 0202937 $33.95 $67.90 All Plumbmaster 55673 $25.99 $51.98 All
9.012 1/2" FP Ball Valve 26 Red-White 0202812 $5.75 $149.50 All Plumbmaster 55704 $2.99 $77.74 All
9.013 3/4" FP Ball Valve 12 Red-White 0202820 $9.15 $109.80 All Plumbmaster 55703 $3.99 $47.88 All
9.014 1" FP Ball Valve 9 Red-White 0202838 $11.45 $103.05 All Plumbmaster 55705 $6.99 $62.91 All
9.015 1-1/4" FP Ball Valve 7 Red-White 0202846 $19.96 $139.72 All Plumbmaster 55706 $11.49 $80.43 All
9.016 2" FP Ball Valve 1 Red-White 0202861 $33.95 $33.95 All Plumbmaster 55708 $25.99 $25.99 All
3/8" IPS x 3/8" OD Comp Angle
9.017 Stop 39 Sexauer 0154807 $3.40 $132.60 All Plumbmaster 500900 $1.83 $71.37 All
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9.018 é/ti p'PS X 3/8" OD Comp Angle | Sexauer 0154815 $3.40 | $112.20 Al Plumbmaster | 50092 $1.93 $63.69 Al
9.019 i’:glggtggmp x 3/8" Comp 53 |Sexauer 0154872 $3.40 | $180.20 Al Plumbmaster | 94043 $2.71 | $143.63 Al
9.020 g/tipcomp X 1/2"Comp Straight |, Sexauer 0191254 $6.98 | $20.94 Al $0.00 Al
9.021 1/2"IPS X 3/8" OD Comp 11 Sexauer 0154898 $3.75 $41.25 Al Plumbmaster | 50093 $2.15 $23.65 Al

Straight Stop
9.022 3/8" IPS X 3/8" OD Comp 24 Sexauer 0154880 $3.66 $87.84 Al Plumbmaster | 50091 $2.04 $48.96 Al

Straight Stop
9.023 |Leonard |R/MM 20 E;f)mgs;;‘t'c Mixing Valve 10 Leonard 0189399 $226.58 | $2,265.80 Al Plumbmaster | 74462 $236.52 | $2,365.20 Al
9.024 |Leonard |R/M 50 ;';Erurﬂgsgﬁ‘t'c Mixing Valve 10 |Leonard 0300012 $310.10 | $3,101.00| Al $0.00 All
9.025 |Leonard |R/M 150 E;f)mgs;;‘t'c Mixing Valve 10 |Leonard 0300020 $381.39 | $3,813.90 Al $0.00 Al
10.000 Copper Tube and Fittings $0.00
10.001 1/4 CXC Sweat Union 12 Spl77478 $2.60 $31.20 Al Plumbmaster | 97971 $6.29 $75.48 Al
10.002 1/2" CXC Sweat Union 87 0175745 $2.90 | $252.30 Al Plumbmaster | 52102 $3.80 | $330.60 Al
10.003 3/4 CXC Sweat Union 40 0175742 $4.25 | $170.00 Al Plumbmaster | 52103 $4.78 | $191.20 Al
10.004 1-1/4 CXC Sweat Union 22 0182931 $10.69 | $235.18 Al Plumbmaster | 52900 $13.35 | $293.70 Al
10.005 1-1/2 CXC Sweat Union 9 0175778 $15.59 | $140.31 Al Plumbmaster | 52902 $17.57 | $158.13 Al
10.006 2 CXC Sweat Union 26 0175786 $21.22 | $551.72 Al $0.00 Al
10.007 1/2 CXC 90 Elbow 100 0174474 $0.27 $27.00 Al Plumbmaster | 52133 $0.33 $33.00 Al
10.008 1/2" CXC 90 St Elbow 100 0174656 $0.56 $56.00 Al Plumbmaster | 52096 $0.49 $49.00 Al
10.009 3/4" CXC 90 Elbow 10 0174482 $0.65 $6.50 Al Plumbmaster | 52091 $0.74 $7.40 Al
10.010 1 CXC 90 Elbow 25 0174508 $1.46 $36.50 Al Plumbmaster | 97996 $1.83 $45.75 Al
10.011 1-1/2 CXC 90 Elbow 10 0174532 $3.77 $37.70 Al Plumbmaster | 52815 $4.30 $43.00 Al
10.012 2 CXC 90 Elbow 20 BN-2086 $5.70 | $114.00 Al Plumbmaster | 52817 $7.82 | $156.40 Al
10.013 1/2 CXCXC Sweat Tee 25 0175133 $0.49 $12.25 Al Plumbmaster | 52115 $0.56 $14.00 Al
10.014 1-1/4 X 3/4 CXCXC Sweat Tee |8 BN-4070 $4.77 $38.16 Al $0.00 Al
10.015 1-1/2 CXCXC Sweat Tee 6 0175315 $7.90 $47.40 Al Plumbmaster | 52886 $9.35 $56.10 Al
10.016 1-1/2 X 3/4 CXCXC Sweat Tee |11 Sp712234 $12.35 | $135.85 Al $0.00 Al
10.017 1-1/2 X 1 X 1 CXCXC Sweat Tee |5 sp713581 $11.70 | $58.50 Al $0.00 Al
10.018 2 X 1/2 CXCXC Sweat Tee 9 Sp72265 $14.30 | $128.70 Al $0.00 Al
10.019 2 X 3/4 CXCXC Sweat Tee 4 Sp98a72 $15.90 | $63.60 Al $0.00 Al
10.020 2 X 1 CXCXC Sweat Tee 7 Sp718457 $15.90 | $111.30 Al $0.00 Al
10.021 ieél'” 2 X 1-1/2 CXCXC Sweat |, Sp716634 $12.75 | $51.00 Al $0.00 Al
10.022 2 CXC 45 Elbow 10 0174425 $5.77 $57.70 Al Plumbmaster | 52821 $7.65 $76.50 Al
10.023 3/4" x 172" CXC Reducer 50 0174250 $0.74 | $37.00 Al Plumbmaster | 52114 $0.89 $44.50 Al
10.024 1/2" CC Cap 50 0174185 $0.19 $9.50 Al Plumbmaster | 52108 $0.24 $12.00 Al
10.025 3/4" CC Cap 25 0174193 $0.35 $8.75 Al Plumbmaster | 52109 $0.44 $11.00 Al
10.026 3/8 Typel Hard Copper Tube ¢, 3/8 x 20 355107 $1.30 $78.00 Al $0.00 Al

0.194 FT
10.027 é’ gsT#yFF]i L Hard CopperTube 155, 11/5 x 20 BN-12L.20 $1.44 | $432.00 Al $0.00 Al
10.028 (3)/ j;#ylﬂi L Hard Copper Tube 155|314 20 BN-34L20 $2.22 | $666.00 Al $0.00 Al
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10.029 1 Type L Hard Copper Tube 60  [1x20 BN-1L.20 $3.16 | $189.60 Al $0.00 Al
0.65# FT
10.030 é’éé‘;?#’e L Hard Copper Tube |, 13_1/4x 20 BN-1141.20 $4.44 | $88.80 Al $0.00 Al
10.031 i ;%’zeF'} Hard Copper Tube 260 [1-1/2x 20 BN-112620 $5.72 | $1,487.20 | Al $0.00 Al
3 Type L Hard Copper Tube )

10.032 3.334/FT E 100 BN-2620 $6.50 $650.00 All $0.00 All
10.033 3/8 C x 3/8 FIP Adapter 16 Sp-34722 $0.89 $14.24 All Plumbmaster 97975 $2.42 $38.72 All
10.034 1/2" C x 1/2" FIP Adapter 25 0173773 $0.92 $23.00 All Plumbmaster 52106 $1.11 $27.75 All
10.035 3/4" C x 3/4" FIP Adapter 25 0173779 $1.28 $32.00 All Plumbmaster 52107 $1.51 $37.75 All
10.036 1-1/2 C x 1-1/2 FIP Adapter 6 0173849 $6.57 $39.42 All Plumbmaster 52752 $8.41 $50.46 All
10.037 2 C x 2 FIP Adapter 4 0173864 $9.35 $37.40 All Plumbmaster 52753 $11.43 $45.72 All
10.038 1/2" C x 1/2" MIP Adapter 160 0174110 $2.46 $393.60 All Plumbmaster 52104 $0.69 $110.40 All
10.039 3/4" C x MIP Adapter 76 0174136 $2.99 $227.24 All Plumbmaster 52105 $1.16 $88.16 All
10.040 1/4" Brass Compression Sleeve (100 0076695 $0.08 $8.00 All Plumbmaster 35913 $0.06 $6.00 All
10.041 5/16" Brass Compression Sleeve (200 0076703 $0.08 $16.00 All Plumbmaster 35914 $0.07 $14.00 All
10.042 3/8" Brass Compression Sleeve |100 0076794 $0.11 $11.00 All Plumbmaster 35915 $0.08 $8.00 All
10.043 1/2" Brass Compression Sleeve |100 0076729 $0.20 $20.00 All Plumbmaster 35917 $0.12 $12.00 All
10.044 3/8" Brass Compression Nut 30 0134569 $0.24 $7.20 All Plumbmaster 50334 $0.17 $5.10 All
10.045 3/8" Brass Compression Union |40 0105957 $0.89 $35.60 All Plumbmaster 50186 $0.85 $34.00 All
10.046 1/2" Brass Compression Union |34 0105965 $1.45 $49.30 All Plumbmaster 50237 $1.18 $40.12 All
10.047 5/8" Brass Compression Union |30 105973 $1.70 $51.00 All Plumbmaster 50238 $1.61 $48.30 All
10.048 3/4" Brass Compression Union |23 Sp-99856 $1.85 $42.55 All Plumbmaster 94389 $3.45 $79.35 All
10.049 7/8" Brass Compression Union |4 0183095 $4.45 $17.80 All Plumbmaster 94551 $3.52 $14.08 All
10.050 ff:io’; 1/4" Brass Compression |, 0105981 $1.13 | $22.60 All Plumbmaster | 50239 $0.94 | $18.80 All
10.051 ;e",’,’,a:'lepc"“p"”g 14" Compx g 0184523 $0.81 $6.48 Al $0.00 Al
10.052 EZT?;CO“F’"”Q 3/8" Compx g 0184556 $0.97 $7.76 All $0.00 Al
10.053 mle Coupling 1/4" Comp x 1/8" g BN-6-4-2 $0.35 $2.80 Al $0.00 Al
10.054 m;"‘;e Coupling 3/8" Comp x 1/2* g 0184424 $1.42 | $11.36 Al $0.00 Al
10.055 1-1/2 Female GXC 90 Elbow 6 Sp-223478 $2.40 $14.40 All $0.00 All
11.000 Pipe and Fittings $0.00

11.001 3/4 Std Black 90 ELL 45 092687 $0.32 $14.40 All Plumbmaster 94673 $0.43 $19.35 All
11.002 1-1/4 Std Black 90 ELL 14 0933838 $0.58 $8.12 All $0.00 All
11.003 1 1/2 Std Black 90 ELL 16 0933846 $1.11 $17.76 All $0.00 All
11.004 2 X1 X2 Std BLack CI TEE 3 sp-213345 $2.50 $7.50 All $0.00 All
11.005 1-1/2 Std Black CI TEE 9 0933846 $1.10 $9.90 All $0.00 All
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11.006 3/4 Std Black GJ UNION 38 0930271 $1.30 $49.40 All Plumbmaster 94887 $1.64 $62.32 All
11.007 1 Std Black GJ UNION 14 0930271 $1.30 $18.20 All Plumbmaster 94888 $2.34 $32.76 All
11.008 1-1/4 Std Black GJ UNION 16 0930289 $4.15 $66.40 All $0.00 All
11.009 Pipe Bushing 1/2" MIP x 1/4" FIP |15 0934158 $6.12 $91.80 All $0.00 All
11.010 Pipe Bushing 1/2" MIP x 3/8" FIP |23 BN-45100 $0.23 $5.29 All $0.00 All
11.011 Pipe Bushing 3/4" MIP x 1/2" FIP |10 0934372 $0.73 $7.30 All $0.00 All
11.012 Pipe Bushing 3/4" MIP x 1/4" FIP |9 0928085 $0.26 $2.34 All $0.00 All
11.013 Pipe Bushing 3/8" MIP x 1/4" FIP |10 BN-45119 $0.26 $2.60 All $0.00 All
11.014 3/4 Black Pipe 1.47# FT 210 0934349 $0.95 $199.50 All $0.00 All
11.015 1 Black Pipe 2.17#FT 42 BN-45314 $8.88 $372.96 All $0.00 All
11.016 1-1/4 Black Pipe 3.00# FT 42 BN-45574 $15.46 $649.32 All $0.00 All
11.017 2 Black Pipe 5.03# FT 21 BN40593 $18.08 $379.68 All $0.00 All
11.018 3/4 SCH 80 PVC Pipe .27# FT 200 No Bid $0.00 All $0.00 All
11.019 1 SCH 80 PVC Pipe .40# FT 200 No Bid $0.00 All $0.00 All
11.020 1 1/2 SCH PVC Pipe ..68# FT 200 No Bid $0.00 All $0.00 All
11.021 2 SCH 80 PVC Pipe .94# FT 200 No Bid $0.00 All $0.00 All
11.022 3" Light C/S Brass C.O. Plug 10 0213793 $4.39 $43.90 All Plumbmaster 59332 $2.58 $25.80 All
11.023 4" Light C/S Brass C.O. Plug 5 0213801 $6.71 $33.55 All Plumbmaster 59334 $4.53 $22.65 All
11.024 4" PVC Plug With Raised Head |10 0336826 $2.97 $29.70 All Plumbmaster 59529 $2.04 $20.40 All
Invalid Bid

Midwest Plg, Htg & A/C, Inc.
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