
Buyer:  Robert Thompson HHSS Department of Services
1238 OF

Opening Date:  2/22/06

Line Description QTY Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 3' 6" X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 18 NO BID 927.00       16,686.00  690.17       12,423.06  
2 Norton 7500 closers 12 93.26         1,119.12    156.00       1,872.00    144.41       1,732.92    
3 3' X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 5 NO BID 834.00       4,170.00    722.94       3,614.70    
4 5' X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 6 NO BID 1,774.00    10,644.00  1,305.99    7,835.94    
5 3' X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 6 NO BID 515.00       3,090.00    390.74       2,344.44    
6 2' 8" X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 1 NO BID 912.00       912.00       771.53       771.53       
7 64" X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 1 NO BID 1,706.00    1,706.00    1,320.68    1,320.68    
8 6' X 7' X 1-3/4" Wood Door 1 NO BID 1,455.00    1,455.00    1,373.79    1,373.79    
9 3' 6" X 6' 8" X 1-3/4" Metal Door 1 NO BID 736.00       736.00       1,211.94    1,211.94    

41,271.00  32,629.00  GRAND TOTALS

FIRE RATED DOORS & HARDWARE

Delivery Days ARO 456015
Payment Terms 0% 30 days0% 30 days0% NET 30 days

AWARD

Bell's Security Sales Brunswick Door Century Lumber Center


