Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

1121 OF
Tee-shirts

AWARD

Opening Date: 12/05/06

Acme Supply Co.

American Minority

ATD-American Co.

Bob Barker Company,

Care Apparel, Inc.

Line/Description Qty Business Forms Inc.
Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| ExtPrice |UnitPrice| ExtPrice | Unit Price| ExtPrice | Unit Price| Ext Price
white teeshirt MED $60.00 | $3,600.00 | $24.48 | $1,468.80 | $15.28 $916.80 $21.02 | $1,261.20 | $17.28 | $1,036.80
1 Brand Bidding 60 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA-Domestic UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt LG $60.00 | $15,600.00 | $24.48 | $6,364.80 | $15.28 | $3,972.80 | $21.02 | $5,465.20 [ $17.28 | $4,492.80
2 Brand Bidding 260 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Appatrel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt XL $60.00 | $41,520.00 | $24.48 | $16,940.16 | $15.28 |$10,573.76| $21.02 |$14,545.84| $17.28 [$11,957.76
3 Brand Bidding 692 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 2XL $60.00 | $77,640.00 | $35.52 | $45,962.88 | $23.28 [$30,124.32| $31.68 [$40,993.92( $17.98 [$23,266.12
4 Brand Bidding 1294 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 3XL $60.00 | $75,360.00 | $36.48 | $45,818.88 | $24.98 |$31,374.88| $31.68 |$39,790.08| $19.98 [$25,094.88
5 Brand Bidding 1256 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 4XL $60.00 | $47,160.00 | $37.56 | $29,522.16 | $25.68 |$20,184.48| $39.60 |[$31,125.60| $23.40 [$18,392.40
6 Brand Bidding 786 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 5XL $60.00 | $26,400.00 | $38.64 | $17,001.60 | $26.98 [$11,871.20| $39.60 |$17,424.00| $28.00 [$12,320.00
7 Brand Bidding 440 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 6XL $60.00 | $10,200.00 | $120.84 | $20,542.80 | $48.58 | $8,258.60 | $39.60 | $6,732.00 [ $29.00 | $4,930.00
8 Brand Bidding 170 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA 100%cotton 6.10z #560013 AS SPEC #6300
white teeshirt 7XL $60.00 | $1,320.00 | $134.16 | $2,951.52 | $52.68 | $1,158.96 | $60.00 | $1,320.00 N/A |
9 Brand Bidding 22 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality
Style Bidding 85AAA 100%cotton 6.10z #560013 AS SPEC
white teeshirt 8XL $60.00 | $1,200.00 [ $154.08 | $3,081.60 | $57.18 | $1,143.60 | $64.80 | $1,296.00 N/A |
10| Brand Bidding 20 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality
Style Bidding 85AAA 100%cotton 6.10z #560013 AS SPEC
grey teeshirt MED $120.00 | $1,200.00 | $29.52 | $295.20 | $21.34 | $213.40 | $31.68 | $316.80 [ $20.88 | $208.80
11 Brand Bidding 10 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA-Domestic UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt LG $120.00 | $1,200.00 | $29.52 | $295.20 | $21.34 | $213.40 | $31.68 [ $316.80 [ $20.88 | $208.80
12 Brand Bidding 10 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

1121 OF

Opening Date: 12/05/06

Tee-shirts
Line/Description Qty Acme Supply Co. ABTJ g:](::snsl\ég]r?r:gy ATD-American Co. Bob Bark:er:cc.:ompany, Care Apparel, Inc.
Unit Price| Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt XL $120.00 | $3,600.00 | $29.52 | $885.60 | $21.34 | $640.20 | $31.68 | $950.40 [ $20.88 | $626.40
13 Brand Bidding 30 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 2XL $120.00 | $8,400.00 | $40.56 [ $2,839.20 | $30.82 | $2,157.40 | $42.05 [ $2,943.50 | $32.88 | $2,301.60
14| Brand Bidding 70 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 3XL $120.00 | $2,400.00 | $41.52 | $830.40 | $32.94 | $658.80 | $42.05 [ $841.00 [ $32.88 | $657.60
15 Brand Bidding 20 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 4XL $120.00 | $3,600.00 | $42.46 | $1,273.80 | $33.74 | $1,012.20 [ $43.20 [ $1,296.00 [ $32.88 | $986.40
16 Brand Bidding 30 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 5XL $120.00 | $3,600.00 | $43.56 | $1,306.80 | $35.64 | $1,069.20 | $43.20 [ $1,296.00 | $32.88 | $986.40
17 Brand Bidding 30 Acme Supply Co Gilden TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA UltraBlend 5.60z 50/50 #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 6XL $120.00 | $4,800.00 | $120.84 [ $4,833.60 | $59.54 | $2,381.60 | $43.20 [ $1,728.00 | $38.88 | $1,555.20
18 Brand Bidding 40 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality Care Apparel
Style Bidding 85AAA 90/10 cotton/poly 5.60z #2807 AS SPEC #6310
grey teeshirt 7XL $120.00 | $2,400.00 | $134.16 | $2,683.20 | $64.14 | $1,282.80 | $60.00 | $1,200.00 N/A |
19 Brand Bidding 20 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality
Style Bidding 85AAA 90/10 cotton/poly 5.60z #2807 AS SPEC
grey teeshirt 8XL $120.00 | $1,200.00 | $154.08 | $1,540.80 | $69.14 | $691.40 | $64.80 | $648.00 N/A
20| Brand Bidding 10 Acme Supply Co Just Big Tees TEES-R-US Various 1st Quality
Style Bidding 85AAA 90/10 cotton/poly 5.60z #2807 AS SPEC
Payment Terms 0% 30 Net 30 0% 30
TOTAL $332,400.00 $206,439.00 $129,899.80 $171,490.34 $109,021.96
Standard: 15-30days
Delivery Days 30 5 ARO/Non-standard: 45 10-35
days ARO
Items 1-20 are all or
Comments
none
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

1121 OF
Tee-shirts

Opening Date: 12/05/06

. - Forms Associates Gold Water Industries, Leslee Scott, Inc. Marnex Products Co. | Murray and Company
Line/Description Qty Inc.
Unit Price | Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price
white teeshirt MED $20.16 | $1,209.60 [ $16.11 $966.60 $16.49 $989.40 $16.75 | $1,005.00 | $19.00 [ $1,140.00
1 Brand Bidding 60 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt LG $20.16 | $5,241.60 [ $16.11 | $4,188.60 | $16.49 | $4,287.40 [ $16.75 | $4,355.00 | $19.00 | $4,940.00
2 Brand Bidding 260 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt XL $20.16 [$13,950.72[ $16.11 [$11,148.12| $16.49 [$11,411.08[ $16.75 [$11,591.00| $19.00 [$13,148.00
3 Brand Bidding 692 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt 2XL $29.88 |$38,664.72| $23.00 [$29,762.00| $27.11 [$35,080.34| $29.28 [$37,888.32 $29.00 |$37,526.00
4 Brand Bidding [1294|  Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt 3XL $31.56 |$39,639.36] $25.00 |$31,400.00| $28.31 [$35,557.36[ $31.76 |$39,890.56| $29.00 [$36,424.00
5 Brand Bidding | 1256 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt 4XL $38.16 [$29,993.76] $26.00 [$20,436.00] $29.89 [$23,493.54| $35.40 [$27,824.40 $29.00 |$22,794.00
6 Brand Bidding 786 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 5930 8000
white teeshirt 5XL $75.00 |$33,000.00( $27.00 |$11,880.00| $31.41 [$13,820.40( $66.72 |$29,356.80| $29.00 [$12,760.00
7 Brand Bidding 440 Fruit of the Loom Goldwater Gildon Port & Co. Essential T Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 AP1014 8000 PC61 100%cotton 8000
white teeshirt 6XL $115.80 [$19,686.00] $29.00 | $4,930.00 [ $32.41 [ $5,509.70 | $81.58 |[$13,868.60[ $52.00 | $8,840.00
8 Brand Bidding 170 | Just Big Sportswear Goldwater LSI Port & Co. Essential T Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only AP1014 TSWH PC61 100%cotton 31 S/S
white teeshirt 7XL $129.12 | $2,840.64 | $33.00 | $726.00 | $33.41 | $735.02 NQ | $56.00 | $1,232.00
9 Brand Bidding 22 | Just Big Sportswear Goldwater LSI Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only AP1014 TSWH 31 S/S
white teeshirt 8XL $174.96 | $3,499.20 | $38.00 | $760.00 [ $34.41 | $688.20 NQ | $60.00 | $1,200.00
10| Brand Bidding 20 | Just Big Sportswear Goldwater LSI Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only AP1014 TSWH 31 S/S
grey teeshirt MED $24.00 | $240.00 | $25.52 | $255.20 | $21.89 | $218.90 | $19.96 [ $199.60 | $23.19 | $231.90
11| Brand Bidding 10 | Just Big Sportswear Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 100%cotton only 59300F 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt LG $24.00 | $240.00 [ $25.52 | $255.20 | $21.89 | $218.90 [ $19.96 | $199.60 | $23.19 | $231.90
12|  Brand Bidding 10 Fruit of the Loom Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
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Buyer: Julie Dabydeen

1121 OF

Opening Date: 12/05/06

Tee-shirts
. . Forms Associates Gold Water Industries, Leslee Scott, Inc. Marnex Products Co. | Murray and Company
Line/Description Qty Inc.
Unit Price | Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price [ Unit Price[ Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price
Style Bidding 5930 59300F 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt XL $24.00 | $720.00 | $25.52 | $765.60 | $21.89 | $656.70 | $19.96 [ $598.80 | $23.19 | $695.70
13| Brand Bidding 30 Fruit of the Loom Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 59300F 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt 2XL $29.76 | $2,083.20 [ $35.12 | $2,458.40 | $31.91 [ $2,233.70 [ $35.40 | $2,478.00 | $35.30 | $2,471.00
14 Brand Bidding 70 Fruit of the Loom Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 59300F 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt 3XL $41.76 | $835.20 | $37.12 | $742.40 | $32.97 | $659.40 | $37.00 [ $740.00 | $35.30 | $706.00
15| Brand Bidding 20 Fruit of the Loom Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 59300F 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt 4XL $57.00 | $1,710.00 NB | $34.11 | $1,023.30 | $101.73 | $3,051.90 [ $35.30 | $1,059.00
16 Brand Bidding 30 Fruit of the Loom Gildon Fruit of the Loom Gildan
Style Bidding 5930 8000 5930 / color-ash 8000
grey teeshirt 5XL $82.20 | $2,466.00 NB | $36.11 | $1,083.30 | $82.16 | $2,464.80 [ $35.30 | $1,059.00
17 Brand Bidding 30 | Just Big Sportswear Gildon Port & Co. Essential T Gildan
Style Bidding 100%cotton only 8000 PC61 100%cotton-ash 8000
grey teeshirt 6XL $115.80 | $4,632.00 NB | $38.11 | $1,524.40 | $100.81 | $4,032.40 [ $60.00 | $2,400.00
18 Brand Bidding 40 | Just Big Sportswear LSI Port & Co. Essential T Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only TSAH PC61 100%cotton-ash 31 S/S
grey teeshirt 7XL $132.48 | $2,649.60 NB | $41.21 | $824.20 NQ | $64.00 | $1,280.00
19 Brand Bidding 20 | Just Big Sportswear LSI Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only TSAH 31 S/S
grey teeshirt 8XL $176.64 | $1,766.40 NB | $43.21 | $432.10 NQ | $66.00 | $660.00
20| Brand Bidding 10 | Just Big Sportswear LSI Tarheel
Style Bidding 100%cotton only TSAH 31 S/S
Payment Terms 0% 30 0% 30 1% 10 Net 30
TOTAL $205,068.00 $120,674.12 $140,447.34 $179,544.78 $150,798.50
Delivery Days 30-45 14-21 30
Comments

Page 4 of 6



Buyer: Julie Dabydeen
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Volunteer Knit Apparel,

Line/Description Oty Oak Island Ind. Promo Distributors Inc. QC Supply, LLC USA Fabrics, Inc. Inc.
Unit Price | Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price
white teeshirt MED $16.84 | $1,010.40 | $17.88 [ $1,072.80 | $21.60 | $1,296.00 [ $29.52 $1,771.20 $26.89 | $1,613.40
1 Brand Bidding 60 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt LG $16.84 | $4,378.40 | $17.88 | $4,648.80 | $21.60 | $5,616.00 [ $31.56 | $8,205.60 | $29.17 [ $7,584.20
2 Brand Bidding 260 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt XL $16.84 [$11,653.28] $17.88 [$12,372.96] $21.60 |$14,947.20] $33.00 | $22,836.00 | $31.09 [$21,514.28
3 Brand Bidding 692 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 2XL $25.92 |$33,540.48| $28.08 [$36,335.52] $30.24 |[$39,130.56| $36.00 | $46,584.00 | $33.49 | $43,336.06
4 Brand Bidding 1294 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 3XL $26.88 [$33,761.28[ $31.68 [$39,790.08] $30.24 |$37,981.44| $38.04 | $47,778.24 | $35.89 [ $45,077.84
5 Brand Bidding 1256 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 4XL $27.72 |$21,787.92] $74.28 [$58,384.08] $33.12 |$26,032.32| $44.16 | $34,709.76 | $38.53 | $30,284.58
6 Brand Bidding 786 Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 5XL $28.68 [$12,619.20 $86.88 [$38,227.20] $33.12 |$14,572.80| $47.04 | $20,697.60 | $42.37 [ $18,642.80
7 Brand Bidding 440 Private label Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 6XL $50.23 | $8,539.10 [ $112.20 [$19,074.00] $112.20 |$19,074.00] $50.04 | $8,506.80 | $46.57 | $7,916.90
8 Brand Bidding 170 Anson Private label Platinum USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 7XL $54.55 | $1,200.10 [ $135.48 | $2,980.56 | No Bid | $51.96 | $1,143.12 | $51.25 | $1,127.50
9 Brand Bidding 22 Anson Private label USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
white teeshirt 8XL $58.87 | $1,177.40 [ $159.48 | $3,189.60 | No Bid | $54.48 | $1,089.60 | $56.29 | $1,125.80
10| Brand Bidding 20 Anson Private label USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt MED $19.36 | $193.60 [ $21.48 | $214.80 | $25.08 | $250.80 | $29.52 | $295.20 $28.57 | $285.70
11| Brand Bidding 10 Gildan Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt LG $19.36 | $193.60 | $21.48 | $214.80 | $25.08 | $250.80 | $31.56 | $315.60 $30.97 | $309.70
12 Brand Bidding 10 Gildan Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
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Tee-shirts
Line/Description Qty Oak Island Ind. Promo Distributors Inc. QC Supply, LLC USA Fabrics, Inc. VqunteerIEgn Apparel,
Unit Price | Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price [ Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price | Unit Price| Ext Price
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt XL $19.36 | $580.80 | $21.48 | $644.40 | $25.08 | $752.40 | $33.00 | $990.00 $33.25 | $997.50
13| Brand Bidding 30 Gildan Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 2XL $30.48 | $2,133.60 [ $33.48 | $2,343.60 | $34.44 | $2,410.80 [ $36.00 | $2,520.00 | $35.77 [ $2,503.90
14| Brand Bidding 70 Gildan Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 3XL $31.32 | $626.40 | $33.48 | $669.60 | $34.44 | $688.80 | $38.04 | $760.80 $38.53 | $770.60
15[ Brand Bidding 20 Gildan Fruit of Loom/Gildan Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding 5930/8000 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 4XL $32.28 | $968.40 [ $77.28 | $2,318.40 | $37.44 | $1,123.20 [ $44.16 | $1,324.80 | $41.41 [ $1,242.30
16| Brand Bidding 30 Gildan Private label Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 5XL $33.12 | $993.60 | $89.88 | $2,696.40 | $37.44 | $1,123.20 | $47.04 [ $1,411.20 [ $45.49 | $1,364.70
17 Brand Bidding 30 Gildan Private label Jerzee USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made 29M Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 6XL $58.87 | $2,354.80 [ $115.08 | $4,603.20 | $122.28 | $4,891.20 [ $50.04 | $2,001.60 | $50.05 [ $2,002.00
18] Brand Bidding 40 Anson Private label Platinum USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 7XL $63.19 | $1,263.80 [ $139.08 | $2,781.60 | No Bid | $51.96 | $1,039.20 | $54.97 | $1,099.40
19 Brand Bidding 20 Anson Private label USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
grey teeshirt 8XL $67.51 | $675.10 | $163.08 | $1,630.80 | No Bid | $54.48 | $544.80 $60.49 | $604.90
20| Brand Bidding 10 Anson Private label USA Wear Volunteer Knit Apparel
Style Bidding USA made Made in USA-crew neck 1325A
Payment Terms 1% 15 0% Net 30 100% 30
TOTAL $139,651.26 $234,193.20 $170,141.52 $204,525.12 $189,404.06
Delivery Days 20 on regular .sizes 60 30 30
days on oversized tees
Comments See attachment on bid
No Bid

PRIDE Enterprises
Burgess Promotions



