
Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 1019 OF
2006 1/2 Ton, Regular Cab, 2WD, Pickup Truck (Work Truck)

Bid Opening: 10/05/05

THIRD AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
FFV ONLY PRIMARY AWARD

 Anderson Ford  Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevy Buick 
Pontiac Performance Dodge

$14,390.00 $13,448.00 $13,247.00 $14,650.00
 Net 30 days  0% 15 days 

 Ford  Chevrolet  Chevrolet  Dodge 
 F-150  Silverado  Silverado  Ram Regular Cab 
6,700 6,400 6,400 6,600

 XL  1500CC15903 WT  1500 - CC15903 WT 
custom cloth 

 ST DR1L62 Work 
Truck 1500 

4.6 V-8 4.8 V-8 4.8L V-8 4.7L V-8
15 / 19 NA NA 14 / 19
60 - 60 45 - 120 45 - 120 90 - 120

$15,990.00 $14,580.00 $15,344.00 $14,650.005.4 V-8 late 
availability  5.3 V-8  L59, 5300 V-8  4.7L V-8 FFV 

Engine (other gas).  $1,200.00 ($888.00) ($657.00) ($801.00)

Specify Engine Size: 5.4 V-8 4.3 V-6, does not 
include trailer pkg 4.3L V-6 3.7L V-6

Engine (other gas).  NA $750.00 $2,097.00 N/C
Specify Engine Size: 5.3 V-8 5.3L Vortec 5300 V-8 4.7L V-8 FFV
Engine (other diesel).  NA NA $875.00 
Specify Engine Size: 5.7L V-8 Hemi

4 Air-conditioning (deduct) ($550.00) STD ($597.00) STD
From Automatic to Manual Four-Speed Transmission (deduct) ($550.00) ($956.00) ($697.00) ($1,030.00)

Comment: does not include 
trailering pkg 6-Spd. Manual

6 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar support (deduct) NA Incl. NA NA
7 Bucket type seats - Vinyl covering NA ($190.00) NA NA
8 Bucket type seats - Cloth w/vinyl trim NA ($190.00) NA NA

2 electric remote controlled outside mirrors, swing away type, 6" X 9" $995.00 $843.00 $897.00 $458.00 

Comment: Incl w/ #10 Includes power 
windows & locks Incl w/ #10

Power door Locks $995.00 $155.00 $197.00 $458.00 
Comment: Incl w/ #9 Incl w/ #9

11 Automatic Speed (cruise) control, factory installed $350.00 $214.00 $247.00 $220.00 
12 AM/FM Cassette Stereo Radio <Addition> $360.00 $135.00 $157.00 NA
13 AM/FM CD Stereo Radio $360.00 $243.00 $257.00 STD
14 No Radio (deduct) NA $0.00 NA NA
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Buyer: Connie Heinrichs 1019 OF
2006 1/2 Ton, Regular Cab, 2WD, Pickup Truck (Work Truck)

Bid Opening: 10/05/05

THIRD AWARD SECONDARY AWARD
FFV ONLY PRIMARY AWARD

 Anderson Ford  Husker Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevy Buick 
Pontiac Performance Dodge2006 1/2 Ton Regular Cab Work Truck

15 Tilt Steering Wheel (deduct) Incl. w/ speed control 
w/ # 11 STD NA STD

Factory or dealer installed engine block heater (gas engine) $150.00 $35.00 $50.00 $79.00 
Comment: factory installed
Factory or dealer installed engine block heater (diesel engine) $250.00 NA $177.00 NA
(If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: GM
Model: Delco
Warranty: 90 day
Heavy duty alternator, optional, minimum 120 amp alternator. NA STD NA STD
Bidder state amps: 145 136
Heavy duty battery optional. $56.00 STD $53.00 
Bidder state CCA: 770 600 750
Sliding rear-vision window $250.00 $200.00 $287.00 $123.00 
Comment: Dark tinted

21 Topper, factory or dealer installed $1,200.00 $995.00 $995.00 no bid
22 Lid, factory or dealer installed $750.00 $760.00 $890.00 no bid
23 Air bag, Dual (if not standard) STD STD STD STD
24 Cloth covered seats with carpeted floor NA $75.00 $157.00 $225.00 
25 Power Outlet STD STD STD STD

Deduction for pickup box length of approx. 61/2 feet ($250.00) ($50.00) ($47.00) ($245.00)
Bidder state wheelbase: 119" 119"

27 Trailer towing package (deduct) ($100.00) Incl. ($147.00) ($295.00)
28 Cargo light STD STD STD STD
29 Tube of touch-up paint to match vehicle $12.00 $8.00 $15.95 $3.50 
30 Standard Paint N/C N/C N/C see list

31 For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color OK N/C N/C no bid - 500 unit 
minimum

Extra Cost Paint OK N/C $197.00 see list
Comment: 9V* & 9W* codes only

33 Anti-lock Braking System (ABS) STD $180.00 STD $436.00 
34 Factory installed body side moldings of protective vinyl. NA STD NA $66.00 

Dealer installed body side moldings of protective vinyl $350.00 NA $197.00 $150.00 
Comment: Doors only
Keyless remote entry locking system (if not standard) <Addition> $995.00 $156.00 $1,097.00 NA

Comment: Incl. # 10 Incl. power windows, 
locks & mirrors
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Pontiac Performance Dodge2006 1/2 Ton Regular Cab Work Truck

Additional remote fob from manufacturer $100.00 $50.00 $97.00 NA

Comment: only available w/ 
option # 36

Non-standard gear ratio(s).  $100.00 NA STD
Indicate: 3.73 3.55

39 4 wheel drive model $4,900.00 $3,366.00 $3,497.00 $3,166.00 
On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires and spare $650.00 $200.00 $297.00 NA
Comment: all Terrain B/W

41 Cab chassis truck option (deduct) NA NA ($550.00) NA
42 Equipment & engine service repair manual. $400.00 $125.00 $350.00 $120.00 
43 Equipment & engine service repair manual on CD ROM $750.00 $444.00 $750.00 $40.00 
44 Equipment & engine parts manual $400.00 NA NA NA
45 Equipment & engine parts on CD ROM NA $150.00 NA $40.00 

Extended warranties (Please specify) NA $1,610.00 $1,570.00 no bid
Years 5 5

Miles 75,000; MPP, $0 
deduct

75,000; GMPP Major 
Guard, $0 deduct

47 Discount for Electronic Fund Transfer payment 0% 0% 0% 0%
48 Deduction for delivery with only two (2) sets of keys per vehicle ($2.00) ($5.00) ($5.00) ($50.00)
49 Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment $450.00 $350.00 $400.00 $300.00 
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