

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	E15 AWARD			PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD	
				Anderson Ford	BAXTER C-D-J-R	Gene Steffy Auto Group	Husker Auto Group, LLC	Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick	Sid Dillon Ford
			Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price		
1	2017 or Current Production Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck Flex Fuel Vehicle E85	1	EA	\$ 21,999.00	NO BID	N/A	\$ 21,957.00	\$ 21,583.00	\$ 21,983.00
	1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck FFV E85	1	EA	\$ 21,999.00	NO BID	N/A	\$ 21,957.00	\$ 21,583.00	\$ 21,983.00
	Make:		Ford				Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Ford
	Model:		F150				Silverado	Silverado	F-150
	GVWR:		6750				6800	6800	6750
	Series, Code, Trim Level:		F1C, 100A, XL				1500-CC15903-Base WT	1500, CC15903, WT	F1C, 100A, XL
	Engine:		5.0L V8				L83 5.3L E85	5.3L	5.0L
	Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.:		446/XL3				MYC/GU4 3.08	MYC, 6 speed auto	446, 6 speed auto
	EPA:		15/22/18				16C/23H	16 city - 23 hwy	15 city - 22 hwy
	Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):		90				35/120	40-120	40-120
	MSRP as bid:		\$ 32,520.00				\$ 32,277.00	\$ 32,045.00	\$ 31,955.00
2	1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck E15 Compliant	1	EA	\$ 21,999.00	\$ 22,249.00	\$ 21,453.00		\$ 21,493.00	\$ 21,983.00
	Make:		Ford	Dodge	RAM		Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Ford
	Model:		F150	RAM	1500 RC 4x2		Silverado	Silverado	F-150
	GVWR:		6750	6600	6600		6800	6800	6750
	Series, Code, Trim Level:		F1C, 100A, XL	TRADESMAN 'DS1L62'	DS1L62-Tradesman	1500-CC15903-Base WT	1500, CC15903, WT	1500, CC15903, WT	F1C, 100A, XL
	Engine:		5.0L V8	5.7L V-8 Hemi	5.7L Hemi V8-E15	L83 5.3L Ecotec 3	5.3L	5.3L	5.0L
	Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.:		446, XL3	8HP70 3.21	8HP70/3.21	MYC/GU4 3.08	MYC, 6 speed auto	MYC, 6 speed auto	446, 6 speed auto
	EPA:		11/16/13	15-21	15/21	16C/23H	16 city - 23 hwy	16 city - 23 hwy	15 city - 22 hwy
	Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):		90	90-120	90/120	35/120	40-120	40-120	40-120
	MSRP as bid:		\$ 32,520.00	\$ 31,415.00	\$ 29,720.00	\$ 32,277.00	\$ 32,045.00	\$ 32,045.00	\$ 31,955.00
OPTIONS									
3	Engine (other gas). Alternate engine size.	1	EA						
	Unit price calculated on Line 1		\$ (995.00)	N/A		\$ (597.00)	\$ (639.00)	\$ (639.00)	\$ 1,552.00
	State Engine Size:		3.5L V6			LV3 4.3L V6	4.3L	4.3L	3.5L Ecoboost
	Unit price calculated on Line 2		N/A	\$ (1,822.00)	\$ 19,765.00	\$ (597.00)	\$ (639.00)	\$ (639.00)	\$ 1,552.00
	State Engine Size:			3.6L V-6 FFV	3.6L V6-FFV	LV3 4.3L V6	4.3L	4.3L	3.5L Ecoboost
4	Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or dealer installed.	1	EA						
	Unit price calculated on Line 1		N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Specify Engine Size:								
	Unit price calculated on Line 2		N/A	\$ 6,683.00	\$ 27,593.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Specify Engine Size:			3.0L V-6 Turbo Diesel	3.0L V6 Turbo Diesel				
5	40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench seat W/ lumbar support (vinyl) (deduct).	1	EA						
	Unit price calculated on Line 1		N/A	N/A		N/A	NC	NC	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2		N/A	STD (w/o lumbar)	N/A	N/A	NC	NC	N/A
6	Vinyl covering bucket type seats. Arm rests on right and left side of seat if available from manufacturer.	1	EA						
	Unit price calculated on Line 1		N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2		N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
7	40-20-40 or 60-40 bench with driver power controlled seat if available from manufacturer.	1	EA						
	Unit price calculated on Line 1		N/A	N/A		\$495.00 requires AZ3 Seats	\$ 465.00	\$ 465.00	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2		N/A	N/A		\$495.00 requires AZ3 Seats	\$ 465.00	\$ 465.00	N/A

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	E15 AWARD			PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD
				Anderson Ford	BAXTER C-D-J-R	Gene Steffy Auto Group	Husker Auto Group, LLC	Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
8	2017 or Current Production Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck Flex Fuel Vehicle E85 Cloth w/vinyl trim bucket type seats. Arm rests on right and left side of seat if available from the manufacturer.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
9	Electronic compass/temp display.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			N/A	N/A	\$595.00 Dlr	\$ 738.00	\$ 738.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			N/A	N/A	\$595.00 Dlr	\$ 738.00	\$ 738.00
10	Sliding rear-vision window (dealer installation acceptable).	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 375.00	N/A	\$595.00 Dlr	N/A	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 375.00	\$ 177.00	\$ 200.00	\$595.00 Dlr	N/A
11	Second Power Outlet.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD	N/A		NC	STD
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD	N/A	\$ 75.00	NC	STD
12	Pickup box length minimum of 6.4' feet (76 inches) with corresponding wheelbase.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			N/A	N/A		\$ (140.00)	\$ (200.00)
	State dimensions of Box Bid: Length, width, and width between wheel wells.						78.87 x 64.9 x 51.03	78.87 x 64.6 x 51.03
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			N/A	NO BID	\$ 21,453.00	\$ (140.00)	\$ (200.00)
	State dimensions of Box Bid: Length, width, and width between wheel wells.					76 x 51 x 63	78.87 x 64.9 x 51.03	78.87 x 64.6 x 51.03
13	Trailer towing package (deduct).	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ (150.00)	N/A		\$ (247.00)	\$ (272.00)
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ (150.00)	STD	\$ (200.00)	\$ (247.00)	\$ (272.00)
14	Cargo light. Box area.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD	N/A		\$ 109.00	STD
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD	STD	STD	\$ 109.00	STD
15	Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost Paints.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD - See Attch.	N/A		NC See attached RPO Specs	see attached
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD - See Attch.	See Attached	N/C	NC See attached RPO Specs	see attached
16	For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge PL1, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code (9W3). If not standard (no charge) color. No minimum order required.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 795.00	N/A		\$ 150.00	\$ 450.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 795.00	See Attached	\$ 450.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 450.00
17	Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints.	1	EA					
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 395.00	N/A		\$495.00 See attached SEO specs	see attached
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 395.00	See Attached	\$ 450.00	\$495.00 See attached SEO specs	see attached

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Anderson Ford		BAXTER C-D-J-R	E15 AWARD	Husker Auto Group, LLC	PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
18	2017 or Current Production Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck Flex Fuel Vehicle E85 Additional Fob if equipped with remote keyless entry.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 150.00	N/A			\$ 169.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 149.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 150.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00		\$ 169.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 149.00
19	On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires and spare (can be steel rim). Tire size must meet the minimum wheel size bid on this specification.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 295.00	N/A			\$ 297.00	\$ 326.00	\$ 222.00
	State Size and Ply Rating:			LT245/70R17				P265/70R17 4ply All Terrain	P265/70R17	P265/70R17
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 295.00	\$ 228.00	\$ 250.00		\$ 297.00	\$ 326.00	\$ 222.00
	State Size and Ply Rating:			LT245/70R17	LT265/70R17E OWL O/O ROAD TIRES	LT265/70R17E OWL		P265/70R17 4ply All Terrain	P265/70R17	P265/70R17
20	On/Off road tire with a load range C Minimum that meets the required size and GVW of the vehicle.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			N/A	N/A			\$ 497.00	\$ 447.00	\$ 422.00
	State Size:							LT265/70R17-6ply All Terrain	LT265/70R17C	LT245/70R17E
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			N/A	N/A	\$ 250.00		\$ 497.00	\$ 447.00	\$ 422.00
	State Size:					LT265/70R17E OWL		LT265/70R17-6ply All Terrain	LT265/70R17C	LT245/70R17E
21	Non-standard gear ratio(s).	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 420.00	N/A			\$ 110.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 625.00
	Indicate:			3.73 Elocking				GU6 3.42	3.42	3.73 elec. locking
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 420.00	N/A	\$ 100.00		\$ 110.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 625.00
	Indicate:			3.73 Elocking		\$ 3.92		GU6 3.42	3.42	3.73 elec. locking
22	Four wheel drive model (to include on/off road tires) Skid plates if available from factory or dealer.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 3,995.00	N/A			\$ 4,197.00	\$ 3,349.00	\$ 3,336.00
	State supplier:			Ford				GM	factory	factory
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 3,995.00	\$ 1,821.00	\$ 23,469.00		\$ 4,197.00	\$ 3,349.00	\$ 3,336.00
	State supplier:			Ford	Chrysler	Mopar - Skid Plates		GM	factory	factory
23	Integrated brake controller system, dealer installed if not standard equipment.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD	N/A			\$ 295.00	\$ 342.00	\$ 383.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD	INC IN BID	\$ 300.00		\$ 295.00	\$ 342.00	\$ 383.00
24	Rear vision camera dealer or factory installed.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 250.00	N/A			\$ 249.00	\$ 376.00	\$ 381.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 250.00	\$ 359.00	\$ 400.00		\$ 249.00	\$ 376.00	\$ 381.00
25	Tailgate step dealer or factory installed.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 375.00	N/A			STD	N/A	\$ 375.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 375.00	STD	\$ 375.00		STD	N/A	\$ 375.00
26	Trailer sway control system if not standard.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD	N/A			STD	N/A	N/A
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD	N/A	STD		STD	N/A	N/A
27	Factory bed liner for rear box of truck.	1	EA							
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$525.00 - Spray	N/A			\$ 495.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 475.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$525.00 - Spray	STD	INC		\$ 495.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 475.00

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	E15 AWARD			PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD	
				Anderson Ford Unit Price	BAXTER C-D-J-R Unit Price	Gene Steffy Auto Group Unit Price	Husker Auto Group, LLC Unit Price	Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick Unit Price	Sid Dillon Ford Unit Price
28	Reverse sensing system. Unit price calculated on Line 1 Unit price calculated on Line 2	1	EA						
				\$ 275.00	N/A		\$597.00 Dir	\$ 401.00	\$ 393.00
				\$ 275.00	\$ 228.00	\$ 250.00	\$597.00 Dir	\$ 401.00	\$ 393.00
29	Keyless Remote Entry- Shall include (2) fobs/keys to enter the vehicle. Unit price calculated on Line 1 Unit price calculated on Line 2	1	EA						
				STD	N/A		\$ 297.00	\$ 276.00	\$ 149.00
				STD	STD	INC	\$ 297.00	\$ 276.00	\$ 149.00
30	Towing package upgrade. Unit price calculated on Line 1 Specify equipment, hitch class and maximum trailer weight Unit price calculated on Line 2 Specify equipment, hitch class and maximum trailer weight	1	EA						
				N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	
				N/A					
				N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
31	Front end attached tow hooks if not standard from factory. Unit price calculated on Line 1 Unit price calculated on Line 2	1	EA						
				STD	N/A		\$ 157.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 90.00
				STD	N/A	\$ 225.00	\$ 157.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 90.00
32	Deduct for smaller fuel tank size. Unit price calculated on Line 1 Specify gallons for smaller fuel tank. Unit price calculated on Line 2 Specify gallons for smaller fuel tank.	1	EA						
				\$ (125.00)	N/A		N/A	N/A	\$ (219.00)
				23					23
				\$ (125.00)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ (219.00)
				23					23
33	Service repair manual equipment and engine Unit price calculated on Line 1 State type of service repair manual available: paper copy, CD Rom, or Online. Unit price calculated on Line 2 State type of service repair manual available: paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.	1	EA						
				\$ 295.00	N/A		\$ 695.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 395.00
				CD Rom			Paper Copy	Paper	CD
				\$ 295.00	NOT AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME	\$ 150.00	\$ 695.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 395.00
				CD Rom		CD	Paper Copy	Paper	CD
34	Parts manual equipment and engine Unit price calculated on Line 1 State type of parts manual - equipment and engine available: paper copy, CD Rom, or Online. Unit price calculated on Line 2 State type of parts manual - equipment and engine available: paper copy, CD Rom, or Online.	1	EA						
				N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	
				N/A	NOT AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
35	Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer. Unit price calculated on Line 1 State Years and Miles: Unit price calculated on Line 2 State Years and Miles:	1	EA						
				\$ 2,995.00	N/A		NC	call for options	call for options
				5 yr/100k prem. care			5 yr/100,000 mile Pwr Train		
				\$ 2,995.00	NO BID	\$ 3,210.00	NC	call for options	call for options
				5 yr/100k prem. care		5 yr/100,000 \$100 deductible	5 yr/100,000 mile Pwr Train		

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Anderson Ford		BAXTER C-D-J-R		E15 AWARD	Husker Auto Group, LLC	PRIMARY AWARD	SECONDARY AWARD
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price		
	2017 or Current Production Year 1/2 Ton Regular Cab 2X4 Base Truck Flex Fuel Vehicle E85							Gene Steffy Auto Group	Husker Auto Group, LLC	Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick	Sid Dillon Ford
36	Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles bought by political entities and other Divisions of Government.	1	EA								
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 295.00	N/A			\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$2.00/mile or \$400	\$2.00/mile or \$400
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 295.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$2.00/mile or \$400	\$2.00/mile or \$400
37	Protective vinyl body molding: dealer installed if not standard equipment.	1	EA								
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			\$ 350.00	N/A			\$ 309.00	\$ 309.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			\$ 350.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 231.00	\$ 231.00	\$ 309.00	\$ 309.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00
38	Lumbar support front seats: if not standard equipment	1	EA								
	Unit price calculated on Line 1			STD	N/A			STD	STD	STD - Driver	\$86.00 - Drivers
	Unit price calculated on Line 2			STD	N/A	\$300/seat	\$300/seat	STD	STD	STD - Driver	\$86.00 - Drivers
Payment Terms				0 30	-0-	0 30	0 30	0 15	0 15	0 30	0 30
Delivery Days ARO				90		90/120	90/120	35/120	35/120		
Comments											
Exceptions for Technical Specifications									7. Sustainability: No.		
Technical Specifications				1.O. Fuel tank size:36. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class: IV; Max. trailer weight: 9,000. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.31; Elocking. 4.B. Battery: 610. 4.C. Alternator: 200. Color & trim sheet attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size:32. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class:IV; Max. trailer weight: 8850. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.21; ANTI-SPIN. 4.B. Battery: 730. 4.C. Alternator: 160. Color & trims sheets attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size: 26. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class: IV; Max. trailer weight: 7040. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.21; Mopar. 4.B. Battery: 730. 4.C. Alternator: 160. 9.B. 5 yr/100,000 mile powertrain warranty. Color & trim sheets attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size: 34. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class:IV; Max. trailer weight: 6800. 2.B. Transmission: This is a 2WD Quote. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.08; Locking. 4.B. Battery: 720. 4.C. Alternator: 150. 6.B. Link: GM.com 10.D. Payment: Husker Auto Group LLC/Ally 6833 Telluride Dr Lincoln, NE 68521 402-479-7500 Color & trim sheet not attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size: 34. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class: IV; Max. trailer weight: blank. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.08; HD Locking. 4.B. Battery: 730. 4.C. Alternator: 150. 6.E. Delay delivery orders will be placed as late as possible, to reduce dealer floor plan charges. Trailer specs attached. Color & trims sheets attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size: 34. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class: IV; Max. trailer weight: blank. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.08; HD Locking. 4.B. Battery: 730. 4.C. Alternator: 150. 6.E. Delay delivery orders will be placed as late as possible, to reduce dealer floor plan charges. Trailer specs attached. Color & trims sheets attached.	1.O. Fuel tank size: 36; Vehicle bid with optional 36 gal tank. 1.BB. Trailer tow package: Hitch class:IV; Max. trailer weight: blank. 3.J. Differential: axle ratio: 3.31; elec. locking. 4.B. Battery: 610. 4.C. Alternator: 200. 6.E. Delay delivery orders will be placed as late as possible to reduce dealer floor plan charges. Color & trim sheets attached.	
Exceptions for Master Agreement Terms and Conditions				None	None	None	None	None	None	None	None
Master Agreement Terms and Conditions				NE Dealer License: DL-03970	NE Dealer License: 3943	NE Dealer License: 02298 SOS Letter Included.	NE Dealer License: 02298 SOS Letter Included.	NE Dealer License: Blank.	NE Dealer License: 05458.	NE Dealer License: 05458.	NE Dealer License: 06577.

Vehicle Life Cycle not calculated since the Ford F-150 2WD not listed on Fuel Economy Guide Report.

Primary Award is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications. A Secondary Award may be awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications. A Third Award is possible to the next lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications to allow contract flexibility with options. An E85 Award may be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications.