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 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 
3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4X4 Diesel 4 Door Truck 38,980.00$                   39,022.00$                   38,751.00$                   40,917.00$                   40,703.00$                   38,733.00$                   
Make: DODGE Ram RAM Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model: RAM CC 2500 2500 CC 4X4 Silverado Silverado F-250
GVWR: 9000 10,000 lbs 10,000 10,000 10,000 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level:  'SLT' 'DJ7H92' DJ7H92, SLT Model SLT 2500 - CK25743 - Base LT 2500, CK25743, LT W2B, 603A, XLT

Engine:  6.7L I6 CUMMINS TURBO 
DIESEL 

 6.7L Cummins Diesel  6.7L Cummins  L5P 6.6L Duramax  6.6L  6.7L 

Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.:  68RFE 3.42  6-speed automatic, 
68RFE, 3.42 Axle Ratio 

 68RFE/3.72  MW7/GT4 3.73  MW7, 6 speed auto  44W, 6 speed auto 

EPA: N/A N/A N/A N/A @ This Time N/A N/A
Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):  90-120  120-150 days 90/120 35/120  40-120  40-120 
MSRP as bid: 55,210.00$                   54,995.00$                    $                   55,135.00  $                   56,585.00  $                   55,940.00  $                   54,460.00 
E85 3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Truck N/A No Bid N/A 32,917.00$                   33,161.00$                   31,330.00$                   
Engine: L96 6.0L E85 6.0L 6.2L
Transmission No./Gear Ratio No.: MYD/GT5 4.10 MYD, 6 speed auto 44S, 6 speed auto
Make: Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model:  Silverado  Silverado F-250
GVWR: 9500 9500 10,000
Series, Code, Trim Level:  2500 - CK25743 - Base LT  2500, CK25743, LT  F2B, 603A, XLT 

EPA: N/A @ This Time N/A  N/A 
Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days): 35/120 40-120  40-120 
MSRP as bid:  $                   47,630.00  $                   47,385.00  $                   45,840.00 

Engine (other gas).  
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: (7,124.00)$                    31,398.00$                   31,350.00$                    N/A  $                   (6,519.00) (6,401.00)$                    
State Engine Size: 6.4L V-8 HEMI  5.7L Hemi V8 Gas Engine 

E15 Capable 
6.4L V8 Hemi E-15  6.0L 6.2L

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
State Engine Size:  N/A 

 Engine (other gas) #2   
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: (7,546.00)$                    31,820.00$                   30,075.00$                    N/A  N/A N/A
State Engine Size: 5.7L V-8 HEMI  6.4L Hemi V8 Gas Engine 

E15 Capable 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
State Engine Size:  N/A 

 Engine (other diesel), including block heater, factory or 
dealer installed. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: N/A N/A

Model: N/A
Warranty: N/A
Specify Engine Size: N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A  N/A  $                     8,519.00 8,401.00$                     
If dealer installed, supply Manufacturer: N/A  General Motors Power stroke

Model: N/A  Duramax Ford
Warranty: N/A  5 yr, 100,000 5yr,100,000
Specify Engine Size: N/A  6.6L 6.7L
 Automatic to Manual Four-Speed Transmission (Deduct) 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/C N/A same  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 Electronic Shift 4 Wheel Drive System 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  STD  $                       220.00  $                             285.00 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  STD  $                       220.00  $                             285.00 

 Fog Lights 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 166.00$                        166.00$                        STD  $                       140.00  $                       293.00  $                          1,460.00 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       140.00  $                       293.00  $                          1,460.00 
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 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat w/ Vinyl (deduct) 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 40-20-40 or 60-40 Bench Seat with driver 6 way power 
controlled seat, if available from manufacturer.  
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 803.00$                        803.00$                        950.00$                         $                       295.00  $                       439.00 $1,460.00 Drivers
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       295.00  $                       439.00 $1,460.00 Drivers

 Bucket type seats Cloth w/vinyl trim. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 1,016.00$                      $1,016.00 full coth w/ pwr 

drivers seat 
300.00$                         $                     1,295.00  $                     1,295.00 1,230.00$                     

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                     1,295.00  $                     1,295.00 1,230.00$                     
 Rear seat (deduct) 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A  N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 Two electric remote controlled outside mirrors, swing 
away type, 6" X 9" (deduct). 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 Camper type mirrors, extended arm, min. 7” X 10” 
(deduct). 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A No Bid 195.00$                         $                       370.00  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       370.00  N/A N/A
Right and left telescopic mirrors, minimum 6" X 8".
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A 166.00$                        STD  N/A  $                       393.00 380.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  $                       393.00 380.00$                        

 Second Power Outlet. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD  STD 2nd pwr outlet is a 

USB charge only 
connection in the console 

75.00$                           STD  STD STD

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  STD  STD STD
 Cargo light. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  $                       109.00  STD STD
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       109.00  STD STD

 Keyless remote entry locking system (deduct). 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional 
Cost Paints. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: See Attached STD - See Attached N/C  N/C See Attached RPO 

Specs 
 See Attached See Attached

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/C See Attached RPO 
Specs 

 See Attached See Attached

 For Department of Roads Use: Yellow color of: Dodge 
#PL1, Ford #84S53, Chevrolet/GMC #WA-253A code 
(9W3) with no minimum order required. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: See Attached $383.00 See Attached 450.00$                         $                       150.00  $                       435.00 935.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       150.00  $                       435.00 935.00$                        

 Extra Cost Paint Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost 
Paints. 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: See Attached $383.00 See Attached 450.00$                         $495.00 See Attached 
SEO Specs 

 See Attached See Attached

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $495.00 See Attached 
SEO Specs 

 See Attached See Attached

1 EA

EA

1 EA

EA1

16

EA

19

20

1 $

1

17

18

1

12

EA

1 EA21

10

EA

11 1 EA

EA1

14

13

9

1

1

15

1 EA

1 EA



Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland 5366 OF Rebid
Statewide

Opening Date:    09/21/16

Page 3 of 9

 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

 Two wheel drive model (to include all season tires). 
(deduct). 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid (4,200.00)$                     $                   (1,197.00)  $                   (1,562.00) (1,642.00)$                    
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                   (1,197.00)  $                   (1,562.00) (1,642.00)$                    

 HD Rubberized spray in bed liner (Linex, Rhino or 
equivalent) 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 421.00$                        421.00$                        500.00$                         $                       495.00  $475.00 pickup box

$650.00 utility box 
 $475.00 pickup box
$650.00 utility box 

Bidder state manufacturer:  Chrysler Factory Mopar  Linex/Rhino  Linex or Equivalent Linex or Equivalent
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       495.00  $475.00 pickup box

$650.00 utility box 
 $475 .00pickup box
$650.00 utility box 

Bidder state manufacturer:  N/A  Linex/Rhino  Linex or Equivalent Linex or Equivalent
 Increased pickup box length of approximately 8 feet with 
corresponding wheelbase 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A  8 ft box included 6'4" box 

available at same price 
level 

39,127.00$                    $                       377.00  $                       475.00 479.00$                        

Bidder state wheelbase:  169.5 inches 169"  167.7" 167.7" 176
State Dimensions of box bid:  length, width, and width 
between wheel wells:

98.3, 66.4, 51.0 96x65x51  97.8x64.6x51.02  97.8x64.6x51.02 98.1x66.9x50.5

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       377.00  $                       475.00 479.00$                        
Bidder state wheelbase:  N/A 167.7" 167.7 176.0
State Dimensions of box bid:  length, width, and width 
between wheel wells:

N/A  97.8x64.6x51.02  97.8x64.6x51.02 98.1x66.9x50.5

Snow plow attachment of pickup manufacturer’s (Western, 
Boss and Meyer brands with power angling, 8-foot bolt on 
blade, plow head and turn lights, snow deflector, blade 
markers) to include snow plow prep package.

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid 5,200.00$                      $                     5,995.00  $                     5,673.00 5,673.00$                     
Specify snow plow package manufacturer and details: No Bid Boss  Western or Boss - details 

as requested in bid 
 Boss - 8' straight Boss - 8' straight

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                     5,995.00  $                     5,673.00 5,673.00$                     
Specify snow plow package manufacturer and details: N/A  Western or Boss - details 

as requested in bid 
 Boss - 8' straight Boss - 8' straight

Snow plow package minus snow plow blade.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid 4,354.00$                      $                       695.00  $                       385.00 285.00$                        

Specify plow package minus snow plow blade 
manufacturer and details:

N/A Boss  GM, Pwr feed for backup 
emergency light, 220 Amp 

alternator.  Lamp wiring 
harness, forward provision 

for cab roof mounted 
lamp/beacon, underbody 
shield & HD front springs. 

 Wiring for roof lite, 
harness, HD springs 

HD Springs

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       695.00  $                       385.00 285.00$                        
Specify plow package minus snow plow blade 
manufacturer and details:

N/A  GM, Pwr feed for backup 
emergency light, 220 Amp 

alternator.  Lamp wiring 
harness, forward provision 

for cab roof mounted 
lamp/beacon, underbody 
shield & HD front springs. 

 Wiring for roof lite, 
harness, HD springs 

HD Springs

Sliding rear-vision window.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  $695.00 Required PCV 

Pkg 
 $685.00 power adjustable 

pedals rear defogger 
499.00$                        
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Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $695.00 Required PCV 
Pkg 

 $685.00 power adjustable 
pedals rear defogger 
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 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

Chassis with eight foot (8') Utility Body for single wheel to 
include cost of 8 foot pickup box length. See attachment.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid 6,924.00$                      $                     7,995.00  $                     7,695.00 7,795.00$                     
State make and model: No Bid Warner  Knapheide 696J / 

Warner 598M-SW 
 Knapheide - 696J

Warner - WS298-M-SW-U-
RT 

 Knapheide - 696J
Warner - WS298-M-SW-U-

RT 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                     7,995.00  $                     7,695.00 7,795.00$                     
State make and model: N/A  Knapheide 696J / 

Warner 598M-SW 
 Knapheide - 696J

Warner - WS298-M-SW-U-
RT 

 Knapheide - 696J
Warner - WS298-M-SW-U-

RT 
Color of Utility Body to match manufacturer color charts.

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid N/C - wh or yellow  $                       897.00  $1,100.00 only white is 
N/C 

 $1,100.00 only white is 
N/C 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       897.00  $1,100.00 only white is 
N/C 

 $1,100.00 only white is 
N/C 

No lid on Utility Body (deduct).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid (1,300.00)$                     $                      (550.00)  $                      (600.00) (600.00)$                       
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                      (550.00)  $                      (600.00) (600.00)$                       

Deduction for minimum 7,200 pound GVWR for basic unit 
with LT225/75R16D tires, rear springs of minimum 4,500 
pounds, 60-amp alternator, 500 CCA battery and minimum 
4.3L gasoline engine.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A No Bid N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

Electronic compass/temperature display (deduct).
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

Rearview camera dealer or factory installed.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1:  $                             459.00 459.00$                        250.00$                         $                       299.00  $                       396.00 243.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       299.00  $                       396.00 243.00$                        

Tailgate step dealer or factory installed.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD No Bid 375.00$                         STD  N/A 375.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  STD  N/A 375.00$                        

Dual alternators dealer or factory installed.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A w/ Diesel $336.00 only available w/ 

6.4L Hemi V8 or 6.7L 
Cummins Diesel 6.4L V8 - 
380 Amps. 6.7L Diesel 440 

Amps.
Included w/ premium seat 

packages

N/A  $595.00 Dlr  $390.00 Diesel only  $390.00 Diesel 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $595.00 Dlr  $390.00 Diesel only  $390.00 Diesel 
Seat lumbar support lumbar support in seats if not 
standard equipment.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1:  $803.00  Inc. w/ 

Premium Seat  
 $803.00 Bench 40/20/40
$1,016.00 Bucket Seats 

945.00$                         STD  STD - Drivers STD - Drivers

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  STD  STD - Drivers STD - Drivers
 Protective vinyl side moldings dealer installed if not 
standard equipment. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 300.00$                        250.00$                        285.00$                         $                       309.00  $                       380.00 380.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       309.00  $                       380.00 380.00$                        
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Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

Service repair manual equipment and engine.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A At This Time No Bid 150.00$                         $                       695.00  $                       650.00 450.00$                        

 State type of service repair manual available: paper copy, 
CD Rom, or Online. 

N/A CD  Paper Copy  paper CD

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       695.00  $                       650.00 450.00$                        
 State type of service repair manual available: paper copy, 
CD Rom, or Online. 

N/A  Paper Copy  paper CD

Parts manual equipment and engine.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A At This Time No Bid N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 State type of parts manual available: paper copy, CD 
Rom, or Online. 

No Bid

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
 State type of parts manual available: paper copy, CD 
Rom, or Online. 

N/A

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: No Bid No Bid 3,210.00$                      N/C  call for options call for options
State: Years and Miles No Bid  5yr/100,000 - $100.00 

deductible 
 5yr/100,000 mile pwr train 

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/C  call for options call for options
State: Years and Miles N/A  5yr/100,000 mile pwr train 

 Drop  shipment charges outside the Lincoln area.  
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment 
outside the Lincoln area.  Drop shipment charges would be 
for vehicles bought by political entities and other Divisions 
of Government. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 400.00$                         $2.00 per mile

Not to exceed $500.00 
maximum. 

500.00$                         $                       500.00  $2.00/mile or $400.00 $2.00/mile or $400.00

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       500.00  $2.00/mile or $400.00 $2.00/mile or $400.00
 Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight running lights if 
factory equipped Law enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 50.00$                          STD 40.00$                           $                       327.00  N/A 190.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       327.00  N/A 190.00$                        

 Disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy lamps. Law 
enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 50.00$                          STD switch on dash  $                       217.00  N/A 250.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       217.00  N/A 250.00$                        

Dome Light or Courtesy Lamp:  To be centered not more 
than approximately 4” to 8” from the top of the windshield 
to light the driver’s area. Controlled by rotating headlamp 
switch to maximum position or by a  separate switch. This 
may require adding an additional light. Dealer installation is 
acceptable if not available from the factory. Law 
enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 120.00$                        No Bid 120.00$                         $                       303.00  $                       190.00 190.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       303.00  $                       190.00 190.00$                        

 Auxiliary Battery (Largest available battery) (Dual Purpose 
AGM Battery) with Dual Battery Separator for accessory 
equipment. Installation also to include battery tray and 
bracket, heavy duty fuse, 1 gauge or larger cable. Law 
enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 810.00$                        No Bid 785.00$                         $                       989.00  $                             885.00 885.00$                        
Indicate CCA: No Bid 750 750 750 750
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A  $                       989.00  $                       885.00 885.00$                        
Indicate CCA: N/A 750 750 750
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 #

Alternator with highest output available. Law enforcement 
only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 85.00$                          STD 100.00$                         $                       399.00  $                       293.00 279.00$                        

Indicate Amps: 220  220 Amp Diesel, 220 Amp 
6.4L Hemi, 180 Amp 5.7L 

Hemi 

220 220 Amp / L96 220 240 - gas only

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       399.00  $                       293.00 279.00$                        
Indicate Amps: N/A 220 Amp / L96 220 240 - gas only
Reverse sensing alarm system. Dealer installation is 
acceptable if not available from the manufacturer. Law 
enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 301.00$                        No Bid 310.00$                         $                       397.00  $                       390.00 388.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       397.00  $                       390.00 388.00$                        

Alternating headlight flasher wig-wag module with flasher 
override for optional override at night installed with 
activation lead tagged as such and terminating in or near 
the passenger compartment. Law enforcement only.

Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A No Bid N/A  $                       327.00  $                       573.00 199.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       327.00  $                       573.00 199.00$                        

Vertical mounted two (2) clear/white LED modules 
mounted at a 45-degree angle to front of vehicle on push 
bumper.  Black bezel with clear lenses.  Shock and water 
resistant.  Leads tagged as such that terminate in center 
console area.  LED's meet SAE J845, Class 1 
specifications.  Minimum of three (3) LED in each module.  
Law enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 224.00$                        No Bid 224.00$                         $                       329.00  $                       284.00 284.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       329.00  $                       284.00 284.00$                        

Two (2) clear/white LED module mounted on either side of 
rear license plate on a license plate bracket for two (2) light 
heads.  Black bezel with clear lenses.  Shock and water 
resistant.  Leads tagged as such that terminate in center 
console area.  LED's meet SAE J845, Class 1 
specifications.  Minimum of three (3) LED in each module.  
Law enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 224.00$                        No Bid 244.00$                         $                       329.00  $                       294.00 294.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       329.00  $                       294.00 294.00$                        

100 WATT siren speaker installed behind front grill with 
vehicle specific mounting bracket.  Leads tagged as such 
that terminate in or near the passenger compartment. Law 
enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 264.00$                        No Bid 264.00$                         $                       399.00  $                       369.00 364.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2 N/A N/A  $                       399.00  $                       369.00 364.00$                        

 Pro-Gard X Push bumper with installation on front of 
vehicle. Law enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: N/A No Bid N/A  N/A  N/A N/A
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  N/A  N/A N/A

 Setina PB 400 Push Bumper with installation on front of 
vehicle. Law enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 634.00$                        No Bid 549.00$                         $                       799.00  $                       694.00 694.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       799.00  $                       694.00 694.00$                        

 Bluetooth hands free wireless network to make and 
receive phone calls enabled by a push button or by voice 
command. Law enforcement only. 
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: STD STD STD  $                       177.00  $                       380.00 355.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       177.00  $                       380.00 355.00$                        

46

47
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48
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 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

Roof mounted antenna.  Located ten (10) inches forward 
from the rear of cab by twelve (12) inches left from roof 
center line. Location to be determined by buyer to 
dealer/outfitter. NMO mount with RG58 cable ran into rear 
seating area. Law enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 120.00$                        No Bid 120.00$                         $                       359.00  $                       140.00 160.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       359.00  $                       140.00 160.00$                        

Roof mounted blue tree antenna. Centered on roof ten 
(10) inches forward from the rear of cab. Location to be 
determined by buyer to dealer/outfitter.  Cables ran into 
center console  area.   Make: Antennaplus.  Model: 
AP85/18GPS-QS22.  Tri-Mode Cellular/PCS/GPS Black 
Antenna.  824-896 MHz,  1885-1990 MHz.  1575 MHz.  
Connectors SMA on Cell/PCS & SMA on GPS.  Foam Pad 
& Threaded Bolt.  Web site www.antennaplus.com  Law 
enforcement only.
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 1: 225.00$                        No Bid 225.00$                         $                       359.00  $                       340.00 340.00$                        
Unit price calculated for truck on Line 2: N/A N/A  $                       359.00  $                       340.00 340.00$                        

-0- N/A N/A 0 30 0 15 0 30 0 30
150 90/120 35/120

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid: 
105.3" length,66.4" width, 
51" width between wheel 
wells. 
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 
28, Gasoline 32.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
11,510.
3.G. Wheels, Note: 
LT275/70R18E ALL 
SEASON - STD.
LT275/70R18E OWL O/O 
ROAD - OPTION $191.00.
1.J. Differential: Anti-spin.
4.C. Alternator: 220

Color & trim sheets 
attached.

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid: 
98.3" length, 66.4" width, 51.0" 
width between wheel wells. 
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 32, 
Gasoline 32.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
17,030. 
Remote transmitted and key 
are combined into one fobit 
unit, each truck would come 
standard with two fobits.
2.I Axle ratio note:  Axle ratio 
is 3.73 with gas engines and 
3.42 with the diesel engine.
3.J. Differential: Anti-spin.
4.C. Alternator: 220 Amp 
Diesels, 220 Amp 6.4L Gas, 
180 Amp 5.7L Gas.
7.  Sustainability: Note: 
Unknown from manufacturer. 
Not checked.
9.  3yr/36,000 mile base 
warranty. 5yr/100,000 mile 
powertrain warranty.

Color & trim sheets attached.

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid:  
74" length, 65" width, 51" 
width between wheel wells.
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 
32, Gasoline 32.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
12,630.
3.J. Differential: Mopar.
4.C. Alternator: 220.
9.B. Warranty Note: 
Additional 5yr/100,000 mile 
powertrain warranty.

No color & trim sheet 
attached.

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid: 
78.9" length, 64.9" width, 
51.02" width between 
wheel wells.
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 
36, Gasoline 36. Skid 
plates = comes std with a 
DOT approved, required & 
installed shield.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
14,000.
3.J. Differential: Locking.
4.C. Alternator: 150.
6.G. Link: GM.com.
10.D.  Payment: 
Husker Auto Group 
LLC/Ally 6833 Telluride Dr 
Lincoln, NE 68521 402-479-
7500

Color & trim sheets 
attached.

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid: 
78.9" length, 64.9" width, 
51.02" width between 
wheel wells. 
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 
36, Gasoline 36.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
13,000.
3.J. Differential: HD 
locking.
4.C. Alternator: 150.
6.E. Delay delivery orders 
will be placed as late as 
possible, to reduce dealer 
floor plan charges.

Color & trim sheets 
attached.

1.B. Cab & body: Box bid:  
81.8" length, 66.9" width, 
50.5" width between wheel 
wells.
1.O. Fuel tank size: Diesel 
34, Gasoline 34.
1.AA. Towing capacity: 
blank.
3.J. Differential: elec. 
locking.
4.C. Alternator: 200.
6.E. Delay delivery orders 
will be placed as late as 
possible, to reduce dealer 
floor plan charges.

Color & trim sheet 
attached.

 No bid.  No bid.  1. Cab to Axle: 58 CA - 
(add $400.00 to 60") SRW.
8. Warranty 5 years.
9.A. Towing capacity: 
12,630. 

 1.D.  Floor Width: 56" CA 
only.
8. Warranty: 5yr Warner, 
6yr Knapheide limited 
warranty. See attached.
9.A. Towing capacity: 
14,100.   

Knapheide & Warner 
warranty information 
attached.  

 9.A. Towing capacity: 
blank. 

 9.A. Towing capacity: 
blank. 

Technical Specifications

Exceptions for Attachment Technical Specifications - Utility body for Single 

Exceptions for Technical Specifications

56

55

1 EA

Comments
Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Attachment Technical Specifications - Utility body for Single Rear Wheel 
Chassis

1 EA
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 BAXTER C-D-J-R  Erdkamp Motors, Inc  Gene Steffy Auto Group  Husker Auto Group LLC  Sid Dillon Chevrolet 
Buick 

 Sid Dillon Ford  

Description QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

2017 OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR 3/4 TON CREW CAB 
DIESEL 4X4 4 DOOR TRUCK

Li
ne

 #

 None  None  None  9.A. 14,100  None  None 
 NE Dealer License: 3943  NE Dealer License: Blank.  NE Dealer License: 02298

SOS Letter Included. 
 NE Dealer License: Blank.  NE Dealer License: 05458.  NE Dealer License: 06577. 

Exceptions for Master Agreement Terms and Conditions
Master Agreement Terms and Conditions

 Vehicle Life Cycle not calculated since 3/4 ton 
trucks not listed on Fuel Economy Guide 
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