Buyer: Christie Kelly 5253 OF Opening Date: 04/18/16
State of Nebraska

Helget Inc. Kohll's Northwest

ﬁ Portable Medical Oxygen & Related Supplies DBA Helget Pharmacy & Respiratory
-5 Home Care Homecare Services
Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 WNVH OXYGEN 200 LT CYLINDER 100 EA | 3 550 N/A NO BID

CONTENTS AND RENTAL
WNVH OXYGEN C CYLINDER
2 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 400 EA | $ 5.50 N/A NO BID

WNVH OXYGEN E CYLINDER

3 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 2,500 EA | $ 5.75 N/A NO BID

4 |WNVH BULK OXYGEN 1,750,000| LT N/A N/A NO BID
GIVH OXYGEN E CYLINDER

5 REEILLS 7,500 EA [ $ 3.75 N/A $ 4.49
GIVH NEBULIZER W/ ELONG. MASK

6 AND TUBING 1,350 EA [ $ 1.10 N/A $ 1.99
GIVH NEBULIZER W/ MOUTHPIECE

7 AND TUBING 1,350 EA [ $ 1.10 N/A $ 1.79

8 GIVH CANNULA W/ 7 FT TUBING 1,100 EA | & 156 N/A $ 1.49

AND EAR WRAPS

ENVH OXYGEN D CYLINDER
9 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 150 EA [ $ 495 $ 475| $ 4.25

ENVH OXYGEN E CYLINDER
10 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 4,000 EA | $ 495 $ 475| $ 4.49

ENVH OXYGEN CONCENTRATORS

11 RENTAL 150 EA [ $ 30.000MO| $ 40/MO | $ 22.99
ENVH SMALL OXYGEN

12 REGULATORS RENTAL 250 EA [ $ 100/MO| $ 250/MO $ 0.00
ENVH NEBULIZER KITS WITH

13 MASKS 350 EA | $ 215( $ 200| $ 1.99

14 |ENVH OXYGEN TUBING 250 FT | $ 0.10] $ 200| $ 0.00
NVH OXYGEN E CYLINDER

15 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 600 EA | $ 525| % 550| $ 4.49
NVH OXYGEN GK CYLINDER

16 CONTENTS AND RENTAL 75 EA | $ 26.50 N/A $ 10.00

17 [NVH CONCENTRATOR USAGE 3,000 HR | $ O025HR]| $ 050| % 0.03

18 [INVH BIPAP MACHINE PURCHASE 2,700 $ |'$ 150000 $ 1,750.00| $ 999.00

19 INVH BIPAP MACHINE RENTAL 2,700 $ | $ 90.00/MO| $ 175.00/MO | $83.25/month

20 |INVH CPAP MACHINE PURCHASE 1,000 $ 1% 750.00| $ 700.00| $ 399.00

21 |NVH CPAP MACHINE RENTAL 1,000 $ | $ 45.00/MO| $ 50.00/MO | $33.25/month
NRC OXYGEN TANK E CYLINDER

22 REEILLS 50 EA | $ 450( $ 500| $ 4.49
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 2 bk
State of Nebraska

Helget Inc. Kohll's Northwest
ﬁ Portable Medical Oxygen & Related Supplies DBA Helget Pharmacy & Respiratory
-5 Home Care Homecare Services
Description Qty UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
NRC OXYGEN TANK D CYLINDER
23 REFILLS 100 EA [ $ 450( $ 5.00| $ 4.25
% OF R R
biscounT oFe| % OF DISCOUNT | % OF DISCOUNT
CATALOG ITEMS REGULAR OFF REGULAR | OFF REGULAR
RETAIL ITEMs | RETAIL ITEMS | RETAIL ITEMS
24 [NON-CORE 20 20 30
Payment Terms 510 030
Delivery Days ARO 2 1
Line Items 12
and 14 were bid
at $0.00.
Through
clarification
from the
Comments Vendor this
means these
items will be
provided at no
charge to the
State of
Nebraska.
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