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per 8 Ounce 

Serving Dilution Ratio Yield Factor

Coffee Frozen Liquid Regular - 

Douwe Egberts #63271 or 

Nescafe #10000645 or Equivalent 640 Case Douwe Egberts 063271 2/2LTR 135.25 98.00$        1.87 cents 0.13 cents 38 to 1 879 cups/cs

Coffee Frozen Liquid Decaffinated 

Douwe Egberts #63925 or 

Nescafe #10000644 or equivalent 650 Case Douwe Egberts 063925 2/2LTR 135.25 104.50$      1.98 cents 0.14 cents 38 to 1 879 cups/cs

Tea Unsweetened Decaffinated 

House Recipe #7794837or 

equivalent 70 Case Col Blend Shelf Stable 125007 2/.5GL 128 48.00$        .5 cents 3.5 cents 64 to 1 1388 cups/cs

Ice Tea Mix Bag-in-a-Box Vitality 

#101523 or equivalent 75 Case Shelf Stable 125011 2/.5GL 128 49.00$        .5 cents 3.5 cents 64 to 1 1388 cups/cs

Hot Chocolate Citavo #7677794 or 

equivalent 160 Case Swiss 071051 6/2 LBS 192 21.60$        .03 cents .26 cents 6.2 to 1 180 cups/cs

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Boston's Best #191216 or 

equivalent 100 Case World Finest 5801842 or equivalent 40/8oz 320 59.60$        .003 cents .021 cents 1.5 gal to 1 2360 cups/cs

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Boston's Best 

#156130 or equivalent 100 Case Worlds Finest 5857786 or equivalent 40/8oz 320 75.60$        .004 cents .028 cents 1.5 gal to 1 2360 cups/cs

Coffee Premium Regular Boston's 

Best #522012 or equivalent 100 Case Worlds Finest 7801719 or equivalent 24/14oz 336 69.60$        .003 cents .021 cents 3 Gal to 1 1536 cups/cs

Coffee Premium Decaffeinated 

Boston's Best #520615 or 

equivalent 100 Case Worlds Finest 7873734 or equivalent 24/14oz 336 75.60$        .004 cents .028 cents 1.5 gal to 1 2360 cups/cs

Tea Bag Decaffeinated 100 ct 

Bromley #510007 or equivalent 55 Case Farmer Bros Black Decaf 160101 5/100ct 500ct 21.25$        .04 cents/ea .04 cents/ea 500 cups/cs

Tea Bag Regular 100 ct Boston's 

Best #510396 or equivalent 100 Case Farmers Bros Black 160102 12/100ct 1200ct 39.00$        .03 cents/ea .03 cents/ea 1200 cups/cs

Cappuccino Vanilla Boston's Best 

#186401 or equivalent 50 Case Superior French Van 5866399 6/2lb 192 23.50$        .03 cents .27 cents 6.2 to 1 180 cups/cs
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Ice Tea, Frozen Sunkist 

#310000479 or equivalent 70 Case

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Citavo  #5931492 or equivalent 140 Case MCG FlameRoom 5818192
64/2oz 128 24.80$        .006 cents

.042 cents 64oz to 1 585 cups/cs

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #5931930 or 

equivalent 70 Case MCG FlameRoom 5814753
64/2oz 128 29.60$        .007 cents

.049 cents 64oz to 1 585 cups/cs

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

citavo #6957799 or equivalent 90 Case Worlds Finest 7801719 or equivalent
24/14oz 336 69.60$        .003 cents

.021 cents 3 Gal to 1 1536 cups/cs

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #6958045 or 

equivalent 50 Case World Finest 7873734 or equivalent
24/14oz 336 75.60$        .004 cents

.028 cents 1.5 gal to 1 2360 cups/cs

Herbal Tea Indiv Variety 28 ct 

Bigelow #8080170 or equivalentt 50 Case Farmer Brother Herbal & Flavored
6/25ct 150ct 17.40$        .11 cents/ea

.11 cents/ea 150 cups/cs

Iced Tea Instant Pouch Bromley 

#900101 or equivalent 325 Case Farmer Bros FLPK 3oz 163073
32/3oz 66 15.00$        .0017 cents

.013 cents 3GAL to 1 1536 cups/cs
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Coffee Frozen Liquid Regular - 

Douwe Egberts #63271 or 

Nescafe #10000645 or Equivalent 640 Case

Coffee Frozen Liquid Decaffinated 

Douwe Egberts #63925 or 

Nescafe #10000644 or equivalent 650 Case

Tea Unsweetened Decaffinated 

House Recipe #7794837or 

equivalent 70 Case

Ice Tea Mix Bag-in-a-Box Vitality 

#101523 or equivalent 75 Case

Hot Chocolate Citavo #7677794 or 

equivalent 160 Case

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Boston's Best #191216 or 

equivalent 100 Case Boston's Best 191216 24/16 oz 384 oz gr 111.49$      0.00725 0.058 1.5 oz = 64 oz 15,360 oz 

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Boston's Best 

#156130 or equivalent 100 Case Boston's Best 156130 24/16 oz 384 oz gr 119.49$      0.00777 0.062 1.5 oz = 64 oz 15,360 oz 

Coffee Premium Regular Boston's 

Best #522012 or equivalent 100 Case Interstate 522012 12/8 oz 96 174.00$      0.01462 0.117 1 case = 11,897 oz 11,897 oz

Coffee and Teas Interstate Gourmet Coffee Roasters Inc.
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Coffee Premium Decaffeinated 

Boston's Best #520615 or 

equivalent 100 Case Interstate 520615 12/8 oz. 96 174.00$      0.01462 0.117 1 case = 11,897 oz 11,897 oz

Tea Bag Decaffeinated 100 ct 

Bromley #510007 or equivalent 55 Case Bromley 510007 5/100 500 servings 33.79$        500 servings 0.067 1 individual bag = 1 cup 500 cups

Tea Bag Regular 100 ct Boston's 

Best #510396 or equivalent 100 Case Boston's Best 510900 10/100 1000 servings 35.00$        1000 servings 0.035 1 individual bag = 1 cup 1,000 cups

Cappuccino Vanilla Boston's Best 

#186401 or equivalent 50 Case

Ice Tea, Frozen Sunkist 

#310000479 or equivalent 70 Case

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Citavo  #5931492 or equivalent 140 Case

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #5931930 or 

equivalent 70 Case

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

citavo #6957799 or equivalent 90 Case

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #6958045 or 

equivalent 50 Case

Herbal Tea Indiv Variety 28 ct 

Bigelow #8080170 or equivalentt 50 Case Bigelow Herbal Tea 516002 6128 168 servings 24.00$        168 servings 0.142 1 individual bag = 1 cup 168 cups

Iced Tea Instant Pouch Bromley 

#900101 or equivalent 325 Case
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Coffee Frozen Liquid Regular - 

Douwe Egberts #63271 or 

Nescafe #10000645 or Equivalent 640 Case Nescafe #8908909 2/2 liter 135.2 78.04$        $0.0105 $0.0840 54:1 7436

Coffee Frozen Liquid Decaffinated 

Douwe Egberts #63925 or 

Nescafe #10000644 or equivalent 650 Case Nescafe #0130536 2/2 liter 135.2 77.03$        $0.0104 $0.0829 54:1 7436

Tea Unsweetened Decaffinated 

House Recipe #7794837or 

equivalent 70 Case House Recipe #7794837 2/1.5 gallon 384 73.06$        $0.0119 $0.0951 15:1 6144

Ice Tea Mix Bag-in-a-Box Vitality 

#101523 or equivalent 75 Case Not Sure What This Is

Hot Chocolate Citavo #7677794 or 

equivalent 160 Case Citavo 7677794 12/2 lb 768 47.31$         $0.0176 $0.1408 224:2# 2688

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Boston's Best #191216 or 

equivalent 100 Case no bid

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Boston's Best 

#156130 or equivalent 100 Case no bid

Coffee Premium Regular Boston's 

Best #522012 or equivalent 100 Case no bid

Coffee and Teas Sysco Lincoln
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Coffee Premium Decaffeinated 

Boston's Best #520615 or 

equivalent 100 Case no bid

Tea Bag Decaffeinated 100 ct 

Bromley #510007 or equivalent 55 Case Lipton 5085568 6/72 34.81$         $0.0101 $0.0806 8 oz:1 pk 3456

Tea Bag Regular 100 ct Boston's 

Best #510396 or equivalent 100 Case House Recipe 4202214 10/100 24.50$         $0.0031 $0.0245 8 oz:1 pk 8000

Cappuccino Vanilla Boston's Best 

#186401 or equivalent 50 Case Citavo 7016819 6/32 oz 40.01$         $0.0149 $0.1191 224:2# 2688

Ice Tea, Frozen Sunkist 

#310000479 or equivalent 70 Case Sunkist 2075940 3/3 liter 304.2 61.67$         $0.0169 $0.1352 11:1 3650

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

Citavo  #5931492 or equivalent 140 Case Citavo 5931492 120/1.5 oz 62.44$         $0.0081 $0.0650 64 oz:1.5oz 7680

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #5931930 or 

equivalent 70 Case Citavo 5931930 120/1.5 oz 64.23$         $0.0084 $0.0669 64oz:1.5oz 7680

Coffee Blended Ground Regular 

citavo #6957799 or equivalent 90 Case no bid

Coffee Blended Ground 

Decaffinated Citavo #6958045 or 

equivalent 50 Case no bid

Herbal Tea Indiv Variety 28 ct 

Bigelow #8080170 or equivalent 50 Case no bid

Iced Tea Instant Pouch Bromley 

#900101 or equivalent 325 Case Bromley 3435811 50/.75 19.74$         $0.0494 $0.3948 8 oz :1 Pk 400


