Buyer: Annette Walton

Game and Parks Commission

5221 OF

Opening Date: 03/31/16

Line #

Campgound and Archery Registration Envelopes

ENVELOPES PLUS, INC

FORMS ASSOCIATES, INC

Description

Qty

UoM

Unit Price

Ext. Price

Unit Price

Ext. Price

YELLOW RECYCLE 1-24,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

25

M

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 25-49,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

50

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 50-74,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENEVELOPES

75

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 75-99,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

100

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 100,000-124,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

125

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 125,000-149,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

150

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 150,000-174,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

175

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 175,000-199,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

200

NO BID

NO BID

YELLOW RECYCLE 200,000-224,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

225

NO BID

NO BID

10

YELLOW RECYCLE 225,000-249,999
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

250

NO BID

NO BID

11

YELLOW RECYCLE 250,000M PLUS
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

250

NO BID

NO BID

12

YELLOW VIRGIN 1-24,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

25

$ 1,061.42

$

26,535.50

$

136.00

$

3,400.00

13

YELLOW VIRGIN 25-49,999M
CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION
ENVELOPES

50

$ 132.30

$

6,615.00

$

106.00

$

5,300.00

Page 1 of 3




Buyer: Annette Walton 5221 OF Opening Date: 03/31/16
Game and Parks Commission

Campgound and Archery Registration Envelopes ENVELOPES PLUS, INC FORMS ASSOCIATES, INC

Line #

Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
YELLOW VIRGIN 50-74,999M
14 |CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION| 75| M [ $ 101.15| $ 7,586.25 $ 95.00| $ 7,125.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 75-99,999M
15|CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |100| M | $ 8273 % 8,273.00 $ 90.38 | $ 9,038.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 100,000-124,999M
16 |CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |125| M | $ 70.79( $ 8,848.75 | $ 85.75| $ 10,718.75
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 125,000-149,999M
17 |CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |150| M | $ 63.69| $ 9,553.50 | $ 83.45| ¢ 12,517.50
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 150,000-174,999M
18 |CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |175| M | & 5786 $ 10,12550| $ 83.00| $ 14,525.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 175,000-199,999M
19 |CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |200| M | $ 55.64| $ 11,128.00| $ 8160 $ 16,320.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 200,000-224,999M
20 [CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION |[225| M | $ 5416 | $ 12,186.00| $ 81.04| $ 18,234.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 225,000-249,999M
21 [CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION 2501 M | $ 5251 $ 13,12750| $ 7950 $ 19,875.00
ENVELOPES
YELLOW VIRGIN 250,000M PLUS
22 [CAMPGROUND SELF-REGISTRATION 250 M | $ 52.40| $ 13,100.00| $ 79.00| $ 19,750.00
ENVELOPES
GREEN RECYCLE 1-4,999M
23 [NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF- 5| M NO BID NO BID $ 354.00| $ 1,770.00
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES
GREEN RECYCLE 5,000-9,999M
24 [NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF- 101 M NO BID NO BID $ 250.00| $ 2,500.00
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES
GREEN RECYCLE 10,000-14,999M
25 [NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF- 151 M NO BID NO BID $ 204.00| $ 3,060.00
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES
GREEN RECYCLE 15,000-19,999M
26 [NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF- 20 ™M NO BID NO BID $ 178.00| $ 3,560.00
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

Page 2 of 3



Buyer: Annette Walton

5221 OF

Game and Parks Commission

Opening Date: 03/31/16

Line #

Campgound and Archery Registration Envelopes

ENVELOPES PLUS, INC

FORMS ASSOCIATES, INC

Description

Qty

UoOM

Unit Price Ext. Price

Unit Price Ext. Price

27

GREEN RECYCLE 20,000M PLUS
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

20

M

NO BID NO BID

$ 177.00| $ 3,540.00

28

GREEN VIRGIN 1-4,999M
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

$ 1,089.94 | $ 5,449.70

$ 323.00( $ 1,615.00

29

GREEN VIRGIN 5,000-9,999M
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

10

$ 31470 $ 3,147.00

$ 187.00| $ 1,870.00

30

GREEN VIRGIN 10,000-14,999M
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

15

$ 24400 $ 3,660.00

$ 179.00| $ 2,685.00

31

GREEN VIRGIN 15,000-19,999M
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

20

$ 20966 | $ 4,193.20

$ 15368 | $ 3,073.60

32

GREEN VIRGIN 20,000M PLUS
NOEC OUTDOOR ARCHERY SELF-
REGISTRATION ENVELOPES

20

$ 19320 $ 3,864.00

$ 153.00| $ 3,060.00

Payment Terms

2 10

Delivery Days ARO

45

21

Comments

On line 12 the reason the pricing
seem out of line is because the
quantity range is 1,000-24,999.
We have to protect ourselves
from the lower quantity being
ordered so the 25,000 price is
set to the 1,000 unit price. On
line 28 the quantity range is 1,
000-4,999 so the 5,000 price is
set to the 1,000 unit price
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