
Buyer:  Annette Walton 5198OF
Department of Corrections
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Page 1 of 1

Description Qty Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 6 Stack Multi Gym 1  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       7,625.00  $       7,625.00  n/a  n/a 
2 Flat Bench Press 2  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       1,690.00  $       3,380.00  n/a  n/a 

3 Rear Deltoid & 
Pectoral Contractor 1  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       1,790.00  $       1,790.00  n/a  n/a 

4 Seated Triceps Dip 
Press 1  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       1,790.00  $       1,790.00  n/a  n/a 

5 Bicep Curl 2  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       1,790.00  $       3,580.00  n/a  n/a 
6 Squat Machine 1  No Bid  $                  -    $                  -    $       1,990.00  $       1,990.00  $       3,063.50  $              3,063.50 

 $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    $                  -    $     16,675.00  $     20,155.00  $       3,063.50  $              3,063.50 

AWARD

Award Explanation
Awarded to lowest responsible 

bidder.

No Bids
Belson Outdoors LLC

Delivery Days ARO 60 60

Comments No Bid

Lincoln Correctional Center

Total
Payment Terms 5  10 0  30 0  0

Li
ne

 #

Outdoor Fitness Equipment 
including Weight Stack, 
Hydraulic, and/or Body 

Resistance

MASARTI INTERNATIONAL 
ENTERPRISE LLC

Paris Equipment Manufacturing 
Ltd Promaxima TriActive America


	LCC

