Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

= CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE Danielski Farms Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.

E Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 ESLFGHQPYiigL LEDGE ROCK 2,400.0000 | TN $ - $ -

2 P e e o 1000000 | T : - : -

3 3v?/$ I;(I)stllelﬁléls_ %/{IDISSETROOFCI;(LGIN 1,800.0000 | TN $ i $ i

R e 0000 | ; - ; -

s P SR oo ROk 00000 | : - ; -
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

7 |HWY 116 AND HWY 15 1,800.0000 | TN $ - $ -
MP 166.11 AND 175.13

s ety ST pepGE ROk so0000 | : - : -

9 EA%;:ILPYS@A& LEDGE ROCK 2,681.0000 | TN $ - $ -

10 ?c-:i%TIENSDE ?8 L_ IiA[I)C\-I‘VESSNCDKOLPH 2,378.0000 | TN $ i $ i

11 JDésngliNsDEg\ésfﬁﬂ?\l/EvFgcAéR ON 3,500.0000 [ TN | $ 2439 $ 85,365.00 | $ 25.60| $ 89,600.00

12 5\;5;‘; fu'iAlL‘l;ElzGMEl S%ﬁ;DRON 3,000.0000 | TN | $  2659| $ 79,770.00 | $  27.85| $ 83,550.00

13 5\/‘35 ;”1PRSPE{\1L0L2IED|\(/|3|ESRCORCAT/VF ORD 3,000.0000 [ TN | $ 2747 $ 82,41000| $  30.85( $ 92,550.00
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5181 OF Opening Date: 01/20/2016
Department of Roads

H* CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE Danielski Farms Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.

(O]

£

- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

14 VALENTINE 1,500.0000 | TN | $ 35.00( $ 52,500.00 | $ 39.85( $ 59,775.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

15 MERRIMAN 2,500.0000 | TN | $ 35.00( $ 87,500.00 | $ 35.75( $ 89,375.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

16 AINSWORTH YARD HWY 20 RP 242 300.0000 TN | & 40.75| $ 12,225.00 $ -

17 |D-1 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

18 [D-2 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

19 (D-4 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

20 [D-6 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

21|D-7 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -
PRICE PER TON MILE 0.13 Per

22 FOR ALTERNATIVE DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200.0000 ™ Ton Mile $ Bl s i

Total $ 399,770.00 $ 414,850.00

Payment Terms 030 NC+ 30

Delivery Days ARO 90 As Requested

Comments Line 22: $.13 Per Ton Mile
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE

K4 Trucking L.L.C.

Simon Cont. of SD Inc dba Hills

Spencer Quarries Inc

ﬁ Materials Co.

5 Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1 B'E?’LICGH,J,PYiigL HEDGE ROCK 2,400.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 2850 $ 68,400.00

2 |,y 13 5 CREIGHTON RP 27 1.800.0000 | TN | NoBid No B s 2080]s 4824000

3 | 70 2 MILES WEST OF ELGIN 1,800.0000 | TN | No Bid No Bid $ 30968 55,728.00

4 zl-gé:RH/LF;iEYiLRIE)EDGE ROCK 900.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 2340 $ 21,060.00

5 |y 14 07 14 AND 82 5000000 | TN | Noid No B s 2ea0]s 1220000

6 av?l\?l;(l)PJg_lE_A]\: I;\ENDDG;OROCK 2,700.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 26.55( $ 71,685.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

7 |HWY 116 AND HWY 15 1,800.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 2772 $ 49,896.00
MP 166.11 AND 175.13

8 BSV\(/:&Z?E;\ I{(kEBGE ROCK 590.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 2525(%$ 14,897.50

9 EA:EJ;::_PYSAI?:\,A[;_ LEDGE ROCK 2,681.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 27.05| $ 72,521.05

10 ?;%TIAPNSDEQIO_ 14_ IiA[I)C\j\IEIEA(\)NCDli)LPH 2,378.0000 | TN | No Bid No Bid $ 2465|$ 58,617.70

1 ?ésTglgIKNSDEQIE;SLEI'\DACI;\I/EV%?_'CAERON 3,500.0000 | TN | $ 27.06| $ 94,710.0000 | $ 3350| $ 117,250.00 | $ 46.05| $ 161,175.00

12 3V\SI$|;I8|:'> EiAlLAf;ElZGMEI S(C)ISZ‘DRON 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 3057| $ 91,710.0000 | $ 37.00( $ 111,000.00 | $ 49.75| $ 149,250.00

13 a;/\5/\((3|;|:ll-PRiElAlLoLZEGD'\;-}lESRC%CAI\(NFORD 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 34.09| $ 102,270.0000 | $ 4172 $ 125,160.00 | $ 5350| $ 160,500.00
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

Simon Cont. of SD Inc dba Hills

ﬁ CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE K4 Trucking L.L.C. Materials Co. Spencer Quarries Inc

£

- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

14 VALENTINE 1,500.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 34.64( $ 51,960.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK .

15 MERRIMAN 2,500.0000 | TN | $ 44321 $ 110,800.0000 No Bid $ 3545| $ 88,625.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

16 AINSWORTH YARD HWY 20 RP 242 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 33.75| $ 10,125.00

17 |D-1 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 |D-2 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 |D-4 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 |D-6 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 |D-7 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid
PRICE PER TON MILE .

22 FOR ALTERNATIVE DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200.0000 TN | $ 0.1575| $ 1,575.00 No Bid $ 0.14( $ 28.50

Total $ 136.20] $ 399,490.00| $ 11222 $ 353,410.00( $ 51856| $ 1,094,880.25

Payment Terms 00 0 N/30

Delivery Days ARO 45 **  ** Per Specifications 30

Comments

Lines 1-10, 14, 16-21; No Bid

Lines 1-10, 14-22; No Bid
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA # 1
1/12/2016

Lines 17-21; No Bid
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Award Explanation: Apparent
low bidder did not meet delivery
specifications




