Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF
Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

H* CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE Danielski Farms Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.

()

£

- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

1 |NELIGH YARD 2,400.0000 | TN $ - $ -
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

2 |HWY 13 S CREIGHTON RP 37 1,800.0000 | TN $ ) $ )
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

3 |HWY 70 2 MILES WEST OF ELGIN 1,800.0000 | TN $ ) $ )
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

4 |NIOBRARA YARD 900.0000 TN $ - $ -
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

5 |HWY 14 JCT 14 AND 84 500.0000 ™ $ i $ i
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

6 lhwy 20 JCT 14 AND 20 2,700.0000 | TN $ i $ i
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

7 |HWY 116 AND HWY 15 1,800.0000 | TN $ - $ -
MP 166.11 AND 175.13
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

8 NEWCASTLE YARD 590.0000 ™ $ ) $ )
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

9 | AUREL YARD 2,681.0000 | TN $ - $ -
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

10 JCT 81 AND 20 4 MI W RANDOLPH 2,378.0000 | TN $ ) $ )
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

11| 15T 20 AND 385 3 Ml W CHADRON 3,500.0000 | TN | $ 24.39| $ 85,365.00 | $ 25.60| $ 89,600.00
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

12|00y 385 RP 149 18 Ml S CHADRON 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 2659 $ 79,770.00 | $ 2785 $ 83,550.00
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

130y 71 RP 110 26 MI S CRAWFORD 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 2747 $ 82,410.00 | $ 30.85( $ 92,550.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

1410 A ENTINE 1,500.0000 [ TN | $ 35.00| $ 52,500.00 | $ 39.85| $ 59,775.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

15|V ERRIMAN 2,500.0000 | TN | $ 35.00| $ 87,500.00 | $ 35.75| $ 89,375.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

16 | A INSWORTH YARD HWY 20 RP 242 300.0000 TN | $ 40.75| $ 12,225.00 $ -

17 |D-1 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

18 |D-2 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

19 |D-4 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -
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5181 OF Opening Date: 01/20/2016

Buyer: Rita Schwabe
Department of Roads

H* CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE Danielski Farms Inc. Jeffres Sand & Gravel Inc.

(O]

£

- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

20 |D-6 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -

21|D-7 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN $ - $ -
PRICE PER TON MILE 0.13 Per

22 FOR ALTERNATIVE DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200.0000 ™ Ton Mile $ 0151 % 0.15

Total $ 399,770.00 $ 414,850.00

Payment Terms 030 NC+ 30

Delivery Days ARO 90 As Requested

Comments Line 22: $.13 Per Ton Mile
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE

K4 Trucking L.L.C.

Simon Cont. of SD Inc dba Hills

Spencer Quarries Inc

ﬁ Materials Co.

£

- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

1 NELIGH YARD 2,400.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 28.50( $ 68,400.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

2 HWY 13 S CREIGHTON RP 37 1,800.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 26.80( $ 48,240.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

3 HWY 70 2 MILES WEST OF ELGIN 1,800.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 30.96( $ 55,728.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

4 NIOBRARA YARD 900.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 2340| $ 21,060.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

5 HWY 14 JCT 14 AND 84 500.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 2440| $ 12,200.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

6 HWY 20 JCT 14 AND 20 2,700.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 26.55| $ 71,685.00
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

7 [HWY 116 AND HWY 15 1,800.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 27721 $ 49,896.00
MP 166.11 AND 175.13
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

8 NEWCASTLE YARD 590.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 2525] $ 14,897.50
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

9 LAUREL YARD 2,681.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 27.05| $ 72,521.05
D-3 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

10 JCT 81 AND 20 4 MI W RANDOLPH 2,378.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 2465| $ 58,617.70
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

11 JCT 20 AND 385 3 Ml W CHADRON 3,500.0000 | TN | $ 27.06| $ 94,710.0000 | $ 3350| $ 117,250.00 | $ 46.05| $ 161,175.00
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

12 HWY 385 RP 149 18 MI S CHADRON 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 3057 $ 91,710.0000 | $ 37.00| $ 111,000.00 | $ 49.75] $ 149,250.00
D-5 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK

13 HWY 71 RP 110 26 Ml S CRAWFORD 3,000.0000 | TN | $ 34.09| $ 102,270.0000 | $ 4172 $ 125,160.00 | $ 5350| $ 160,500.00
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

14 VALENTINE 1,500.0000 | TN No Bid No Bid $ 3464 $ 51,960.00

15 D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 2,500.0000 [ TN | $ 44321 $ 110,800.0000 No Bid $ 3545| $ 88,625.00
MERRIMAN
D-8 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK . .

16 AINSWORTH YARD HWY 20 RP 242 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid $ 33.75| $ 10,125.00

17 |D-1 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 |D-2 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 |D-4 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5181 OF

Department of Roads

Opening Date: 01/20/2016

CHIP SEAL (LEDGE ROCK) AGGREGATE

K4 Trucking L.L.C.

Simon Cont. of SD Inc dba Hills

Spencer Quarries Inc

ﬁ Materials Co.
£
- Description Qty UOM| Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
20 |D-6 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid
21|D-7 CHIP SEAL LEDGE ROCK 300.0000 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid

PRICE PER TON MILE .
22 FOR ALTERNATIVE DELIVERY LOCATIONS 200.0000 TN | $ 0.1575| $ 1,575.00 No Bid $ 014 $ 28.50
Total $ 136.20( $ 399,490.00| $ 112.22] $ 353,410.00| $ 51856| $ 1,094,880.25
Payment Terms 00 0 N/30
Delivery Days ARO 45 ** % Per Specifications 30

Comments

Lines 1-10, 14, 16-21; No Bid

Lines 1-10, 14-22; No Bid
ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA # 1
1/12/2016

Lines 17-21; No Bid
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No Bids




