Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5177 OF
Ice Melt

Multiple State Agencies

Opening Date: Dec. 30, 2015

1 Ice Melt Egan Supply Co Ice Melt Omaha Compound Co
2
- Description Qty uom Unit Price Description Qty UoM Unit Price

Ice Melt Blend 120,000.00 LB $ 0.256 |lce Melt Blend 120,000.00 LB $ 0.25
1 |Orders Less Than a Pallet Orders Less Than a Pallet Industrial Strength

Name of Product Bid: Snoplow/Morgro Name of Product Bid: Blue by Scotwood

Industries

Calcium Chloride Pellets 1,000.00 LB Cal-Melt/Morgro No Bid Calcium Chloride Pellets 1,000.00 LB $ 0.35
2 |Orders Less Than a Pallet Orders Less Than a Pallet Excell Calcium

Name of Product Bid: Name of Product Bid: Chloride Pellets by

Scotwood Industries

Calcium Chloride Pellets 12,000.00 LB Cal-Melt/Morgro $ 0.231 JCalcium Chloride Pellets 12,000.00 LB $ 0.32
3 |Orders For Full Pallet Orders For Full Pallet Excell Calcium

Name of Product Bid: MR-146800 Name of Product Bid: Chloride Pellets by

Scotwood Industries

Calcium Magnesium Acetate 3,520.00 LB No Bid Calcium Magnesium Acetate 3,520.00 LB No Bid
4 |Orders Less Than a Pallet Orders Less Than a Pallet

Name of Product Bid: Name of Product Bid:

Calcium Magnesium Acetate 31,000.00 LB $ 4.060 JCalcium Magnesium Acetate 31,000.00 LB No Bid

Orders For Full Pallet OSSIN Calcium Orders For Full Pallet
5 |Name of Product Bid: Mag Pce Name of Product Bid:

0OS-IM7555

Additional Brands - Not Listed as Core Items: Additional Brands - Not Listed as Core Items:

UOM: Pallet Size: 40 Ib /50 per PLT Size:

Brand: Wintergreen Brand:

Vendor Item Number:  OS - IM7040WG Vendor Item Number:

% Discount Off Catalog and/or Price List: 30% 30% Off}% Discount Off Catalog and/or Price List:_30%

Additional Brands - Not Listed as Core Items: Additional Brands - Not Listed as Core Items:

UOM: EA Size: 5gal Size:

Brand: Liquid Ice Melt Brand:

Vendor Item Number:  OS - LO6405TM Vendor Item Number:

% Discount Off Catalog and/or Price List: 30% 30% Off}% Discount Off Catalog and/or Price List: 30%
Payment Terms 0
Delivery Days ARO 0 5

Comments

Attachment "B"
1. Ice Melt Blend LB Full Pallet
Snoplow/Morgro MG. $0.216

2. Ice Melt Calcium Chloride
12,000 LB Full Pallet
Cal-Melt/Morgro MR-146800 $0.231

3. Ice Melt Calcium Magnesium Acetate
No Bid

Attachment "B"

1. Ice Melt Blend - Industrial/Strength Blue
SWI-I1550 Sold in 50 Ib bags 50 bags/Pallet
Order of 25 or more will be accepted. We will
not ship less than 25 bags

2. Ice Melt Calcium Chloride - Excell Calcium
Chloride SWI-EXCL50 Sold in 50 Ib bags 50
bags/Pallet

Scotwood Industries

3. Ice Melt Calcium Magnesium Acetate - No
Bid

* Orders of 25 or more will be accepted. We
will not ship less than 25 bags
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