Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 1
DISTRICT ONE (1) ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong Rentals, |Beatrice Concrete| Lyman Richey | Marxsen Sand & | Overland Sand | Westover Rock &
& SURFACING GRAVEL LLC Co. Corporation Gravel and Gravel Sand, Inc.
. o Unit of S S o Lo o o
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL .
1 S-55G/OLD REST AREA TN $ 18.84/TON $ 15.00 No Bid $ 19.93
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL .
2 HWY 136 MP 173 TN $ 14.65/TON $ 18.00 No Bid $ 22.20
DIST 1 DEICING GRAVEL ]
3 |EAST JCT 15 AND 92 TN $ 21.10/TON 1157 | $ 10.00 No Bid
DIST 1 SURFACING GRAVEL . .

4 3T 8 AND 65 W EDGE OF PAWNEE CITY ™ No Bid $21.79 No Bid $ 19.70
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 00 0 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 20 45 per ITB 30 As ordered
Comments

Page 1

No Bid District #1

K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid

Elmer Wolfe

- Incomplete Bid

G3 Enterprises - Late Bid



Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 3
DISTRICT THREE (3) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Emme Sand 'F'{mz” '\gzrr’]‘j? Matto Sand | Overland Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC | & Gravel Y & Gravel and Gravel
Corporation Gravel
Line Number / Description Unit of Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
5 [AIMIW JCT 22 & 81 MM 88 TN No Bid $ 11.75 No Bid
NW COLUMBUS
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
6 |SCHUYLER YARD E 22ND & H STREET N No Bid ) © 500 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
7 1 MI E MADISON HWY 32 MM 36.5 TN No Bid $ 14.72 $ 15.65 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
8 |1 MI NW JUCT 39 & 56 E SIDE MM 33.8 ™ No Bid e No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
9 2 MI N OF JCT 91 & 57 E SIDE MM2 TN No Bid $ 15.12| $ 17.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
10 13 MINJCT 9 & 15 W SIDE MM 128 TN No Bid $ 16.29| $ 16.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
11 (1 MI W MADISON HWY 32 TN No Bid $ 14.72 $ 15.65 No Bid
MM 33.2
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
12 |11/4A MIW OF JCT 81 & 91 TN No Bid $ 13.46 $ 16.94 No Bid
MM 89
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
13 HWY JCT 32 & 45 RP 18 TN No Bid $ 1795 $ 17.24 $ 18.58 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
14 HWY 59 JCT 59 & 121 TN No Bid $ 16.50 $ 19.36 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
15 HWY 57 mp 15.8 TN No Bid $ 15.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
16 HWY 35 MP 22.5 TN No Bid $ 20.40 $ 1850| $ 17.43 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
17 HWY 81 MP 165 TN No Bid $ 19.56 $ 15.00 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . . . . . .
18 HWY 9 MP 19 5 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
19 [HWY 35 RP 68.1 1MIW TN No Bid $ 25.65 No Bid
DAKOTA CITY
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
20 |HWY 20 RP 415.5 TN No Bid $ 23.08 $ 23.00 No Bid
7 Ml E JACKSON
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
21 |HWY 51 RP 23.6 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Ml E BANCROFT

Page 1



Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 3
DISTRICT THREE (3) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Emme Sand 'F'g’:;qz” '\gzrr’]‘j? Matto Sand | Overland Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC | & Gravel M & Gravel and Gravel
Corporation Gravel
. - Unit of L o o o Lo Lo
Line Number / Description Measure Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . . . . . .
22 JCT 75 & 51 AT DECATUR TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D-3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
23 |HWY 77 RP 167 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 MI S WINNEBAGO

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
24 |[HWY 32 RP 101 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 MIW TEKAMAH

DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
25 WAYNE YARD TN No Bid $ 23.25 $ 1850| $ 19.04 No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . . . . . .
26 1.7 MI N EMERSON MP 30.35 TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL
27 |CONCORD MP 0 TN No Bid $ 20.00 No Bid

JCT 116 & S26B
DIST 3 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL

28 HARTINGTON YARD TN No Bid $ 20.10 $ 22.00| $ 21.44 No Bid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 100 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 20 45 Per ITB 30
Comments

No Bid District #3
Armstong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid
Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete Bid
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date

: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 4
DISTRICT FOUR (4) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong |DeWeese Sand ESDOﬁ;"ggLOdO;& H°§§ﬁ;'38[05 LancIIﬁZQSIers Jeffres Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC & Gravel Gravel Gravel LLC " |& Gravel Inc.
Line Number / Description MUer;;S:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
29 | Wy 11 MP 68 SMI S ORD ™ NoBid 5 1150
30 | Wy 52 MP 3367 5 M £ ASHTON ™ NoBid 5 1675
31 | Wy 281 MP 1202 MI N GREELEY ™ NoBid s 1854 s 1425
32 || 10 MP 90 10 MI§ LOUP GITY ™ NoBid 5 1515
33 | Wy 58 MP 2.2 2 MI N ROCKVILLE ™ NoEid §  1675|$ 1515
34 JDcl:STTségRll\gg ELCIi/IOCA;EGET(AI:l/\I/EVLCRN ST N No Bid
35 |50 EXIT 305 ALDA STOCKPILE ™ NoEid 5 10665 1250
36 EEIS%TEiGRzl\gS zlggéLC;?é\(/:EKII;ILE ™ No Bid $  14.00
3 |PULLERTON YARD. ™ NoBid
B orovarn Ve ™ No Bid $ 840
39 |oT PAULYARD ™ NoBid |$ 1029 s 1043
0 [orerey varD ™ NoBid s 138 s 1100
41 | CENTRAL OITY YARD ™  NoBd |$ 070 s 835
42 [oup CiTy YARD ™ NoBid |$ 1409 s 1065
43 [ W 147 M| SW AURORA ™ NoBd |$ 993 s 803
44 |\ W 30 MP 22 1 MI N GENOA ™ Noid
45 | AW 11 MP 63 5 M1 S ORD ™ No Bid $ 850
4 |, 261 MP 8934 3MI S ST PAUL ™  NoBid |$ 998 s 867
S R W s e s o
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date

: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 4
DISTRICT FOUR (4) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong |DeWeese Sand ESD Brogdfod";& H°§ke;B&r°S . (';'ansl Jeffres Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC & Gravel ons san an andhandlers, & Gravel Inc.
Gravel Gravel LLC
Line Number / Description MUer;:;l:):e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
48 | \wY 281 MP 1128.4 JCT 281 & 91 ™ No Bid $ 10.00
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
49 LWy 66 MP 120 2 MI N GREELEY ™ No Bid $ 1326 $ 1075
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
50 14wy 66 MP 1 1MI S CENTRAL CITY ™ NoBid | $ 8.69
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
51 | Wy 58 MP 29.2 2 MI N ROCKVILLE ™ NoBid | $ 11.58| $ 16.11 $ 11.80
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
52 | 10y 92 MP 290 1 MI N LOUP CITY ™ NoBid |$ 14.14| $ 17.04 $ 1045
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
53 RAVENNA HWY 2 MP 327 98 TN No Bid $ 9.99| $ 12221 $ 10.20 $ 13.65
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
54 WY 6 MP 219 6 MI E HASTINGS ™ NoBid |'$ 9.79 $ 1052
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
55 HWY 4 MP 93 5 Ml W DAVENPORT TN No Bid $ 14.59 $ 15.29
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
56 |\wY 14 MP 5 W EDGE SUPERIOR ™ $ 1590] % 16.19 $ 17.69
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
57 HWY 281 2 MI N RED CLOUD TN $ 19.00( $ 13.94 $ 14.35
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 40 0 30 0 30 30 Net 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 10 45 10 30 As required
Comments

Page 2 of 4



Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

HWY 281 MP 95 2 MI N ST PAUL

DISTRICT 4
DISTRICT FOUR (4) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, IF_z){crEae; '\g:j‘z‘ Mid-Nebraska ggfg'i’;‘g saﬁrt—:\):d Paulsen, Inc. T&&Gﬁ;aerl“d Ulrich Gravel
& SURFACING GRAVEL Corporation Gravel Aggregate Inc. Gravel Gravel Co. Inc. Inc.
Line Number / Description MUer;;S:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
29 | Sy 11 WP 63 5 M SORD. ™ No Bid $ 1111
30 |, 62 MP 336.7 5 I £ ASHTON ™ No Bid s 1315
31 |, 261 MP 120 2 M N GREELEY ™ No Bid s 13.49
32 |, v 10 MP 90 10 MI S LOUP GITY ™ 5 1667 NoBid s 1200
33 | 58 MP 20.2 2 MI N ROGKVILLE ™ 5 1533| NoBid s 1333
34 JDcl:STTségRll\gg ELCIi/IOCA;EGET(AI:l/\I/EVLCRN ST ™ NoBid |$ 1080($ 16.60|$ 13.48
35 |530 EXIT 305 ALDA STOCKPILE ™ 5 1400 NoBid
38 |40 EXIT 205 GIBBON STOCKFILE ™ § 1134| NoBid
37 |FULLERTONYARD ™ |s 14995 1300 5 1169
B oRovarn Ve ™ No Bid $  7.40
39 |oT PAUL YARD. TN $ 1283 $  9.90
40 |Creeiey varD ™ No Bid $  10.90
41 | CENTRAL GITY YARD ™ s 827
42 |Doup ciry vamo N $ 1499 No Bid $  10.65
43 |, W 14 7 MI SW AURORA. ™ 5 1499($ 1239
% |y 39 MP 22 1 i N GENOA ™ |8 83 s 954
45 |, 11 MP 68 5 MI S ORD ™ No Bid s 800
4 |y 281 WP 59.54 WIS ST PAUL ™ s 882 5 1239
47 |DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL ~ P s 1277 s 1000

Page 3 of 4




Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 4
DISTRICT FOUR (4) - ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Lyman | Masen |y Nepraska | Overiand |- Overton T&F Sand | yicn Gravel
Richey Sand & Sand and Sand and |Paulsen, Inc.| & Gravel,
& SURFACING GRAVEL . Aggregate Inc. Inc.
Corporation Gravel Gravel Gravel Co. Inc.
Line Number / Description MUer;:;lj):e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
48 Wy 281 MP 1128.4 JCT 281 & 91 ™ No Bid $ 1014
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
49 HWY 66 MP 120 2 MI N GREELEY ™ No Bid $ 10.50
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL
50 HWY 66 MP 1 1MI S CENTRAL CITY ™ $ 7.98
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
51 HWY 58 MP 29.2 2 MI N ROCKVILLE ™ $ 13.33 No Bid $ 10.65
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
52 | Wy 92 MP 320 1 MI N LOUP CITY ™ $ 1600 NoBid $ 1037
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
53 RAVENNA HWY 2 MP 327.98 ™ $ 12.26 No Bid
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
54 4wy 6 MP 219 6 MI E HASTINGS ™ $ 1440 NoBid
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
55 HWY 4 MP 93 5 MI W DAVENPORT ™ $ 18.00 No Bid
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
56 | Wy 14 MP 5 W EDGE SUPERIOR ™ No Bid
DIST 4 WINDROW GRAVEL .
57 HWY 281 2 MI N RED CLOUD ™ $ 16.66 No Bid
Payment Terms 100 30 0 30 100 30 0
Delivery Days ARO 45 Per ITB 30 30 10 60 45 As needed
Addendum
Comments #1 & #2
received

No Bid District #4
Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC

Invalid Bid
Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid

Award Explanation

Line 42 awarded to Ulrich
per official tie breaker
process

Page 4 of 4



Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads
DISTRICT 5

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT FIVE (5)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Jeffres Sand [Kembel Sand g;’rfé'zz‘i Pauisen. Inc. COnt?em?)?s inc | Simon Western |
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel & Gravel Gravel ' DBA Ogallgla Contractors |Materials Inc.
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Mtier;;?rfe Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

58 gg;\iﬁR%oﬁAﬁﬁﬁifR%AVEL TN No Bid No Bid $ 25.06 | $ 22.95
59 |7 WIN RUSHVILLE Hwo 87 RP 72 ™ | Nosid No 8i Ne |5 076
50 |3 i £ LAKESIDE FWY 87 RP 72 ™ | NoBd |$ 2610 No Bid s ssasls e
52 |5 I ALLIANCE tY 2 RP 76 ™ | Nemid |s 3025 No 81 s 2is0|s 2103
62 E{I\SI:; 2?2:\!2‘? COAT GRAVEL TN No Bid No Bid $ 17.29( $ 17.21
63 3:21; gf\sggg COAT GRAVEL TN No Bid No Bid $ 16.55| $ 17.15
64 |, S RMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ No Bid No Bid $ 1338|$ 1380
65 3ISS|:|I—KSO§T_|MYC’)ARR§OAT GRAVEL TN No Bid No Bid $ 23.20| $ 18.55 NB $ 25.83
6 | RIDGEPORT MANT YARD ™ | Nosid No Bi s wee|s 178
67 a:f/;l; 25?5R|2A|:?§6COAT GRAVEL ™ No Bid No Bid . 2031 3 0138
68 |0 TON SITE HWY 365 RP 52 ™ No Bid No Bid $ 2104|2235
69 |QIONEY W HWY SO RP 85 i No Bid No Bid $ 2525|% 2531
70 E:;E:LALR\K%%COAT GRAVEL N No Bid No Bid $ 19.51| $ 19.67
7L |2 W CHADRON 3CT 20 & 385 ™ | Nosid 5 1616| NoBid Ne s 1049
72 | CRAWFORD MAINT YARD ™ | Nosi s 1299 Nosid s 1875|s 1750
73 | ARRISON MAINT YARD ™ | Nosi s 131 Nosw s 1es|s 1565
74 | CORDON MAINT YARD ™ | Nosid s 1801 Nobid Ne |5 oas3
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 5
Overland Sl
DISTRICT FIVE (5)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Jeffres Sand |Kembel Sand Sandand | Paulsen. Inc Contractors inc Simon Western Elmer Wolfe
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel & Gravel Gravel "7"| DBA Ogallala | Contractors |Materials Inc.
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Mlier;;?rfe Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
75 HEMINGEORD MAINT YARD TN No Bid $ 11.28 No Bid $ 16.16( $ 1479 $ 29.65

Page 2 of 3



Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 5
Overland Sl
DISTRICT FIVE (5)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, Armstrong | Jeffres Sand |Kembel Sand Sandand | Paulsen. Inc Contractors inc Simon Western Elmer Wolfe
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel & Gravel Gravel "7"| DBA Ogallala | Contractors |Materials Inc.
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Mtier;;?rfe Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
76 | ALLIANCE MAINT YARD ™ No Bid $  11.00| NoBid $ 1394|$ 1465 % 2500

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
7 OSHKOSH YARD TN No Bid $ 16.76 No Bid $ 17.08| $ 18.80 NB $ 18.92

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
8 | BRIDGEPORT MAINT YARD ™ No Bid $ 1029 NoBid $ 1096|$ 1223

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
9 | GERING YARD N No Bid $ 6.60( No Bid $ 6.98| $ 8.24

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
80 DALTIN SITE HWY 385 RP 52 TN No Bid $ 13.28 No Bid $ 1468| $ 16.50

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
81 |SIDNEY W HWY 30 RP 55 ™ No Bid $  1548| NoBid $ 1855|$  19.35

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL . .
82 | IMBALL YARD TN No Bid $ 11.90 No Bid $ 14.25( $ 14.22

DIST 5 DEICING GRAVEL

83 HARRISBURG YARD HWY 71 RP 39 TN No Bid $ 9.46 No Bid $ 9.25( $ 11.94
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 30 100 30 0 30 100 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 As required [ As needed 30 60 Per ITB 30

Line 74: *read
Comments Gordon Addendum
#1 and #2

No Bid - District #5

Armstong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid

Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid

Page 3 of 3



Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 6
Simon
. Overland QOverton . . .
DISTRICT SIX (6)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong |Jeffries Sand L &L Gravel| Sand and sand and Pine Bluffs | Contractorsinc [ T & F Sand & Ulrich Gravel Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel Gravel DBA Ogalala Gravel, Inc. Inc. Materials Inc.
Gravel Gravel Co. :
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Mﬂéf:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
84 OCONTO TN No Bid No Bid $ 13.75
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
85 BROKEN BOW WEST TN No Bid No Bid $ 14.09
ge [PIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ No Bid NoBid |$ 13.98 $ 1578 | $ 16.00
ANSLEY
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
87 |LEXINGTON HWY 283 MP 55 BLEND 1 ™ No Bid NoBid (R
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
88 |STAPELTON W HWY 92 RP 225 ™ No Bid No Bid $ )
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
89 TYRON E HWY 92 RP 205 TN No Bid No Bid $ 15.30
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
90 ARTHUR N HWY 61 RP 126 TN No Bid No Bid $ 18.55
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
91 HYANNIS W HWY 2 RP 144 TN No Bid $ 22.00 No Bid $ 26.43
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
92 MULLEN W HWY 2 RP 184 TN No Bid $ 19.57 No Bid
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
93 | THEDFORD N HWY 83 RP 151 ™ NoBid (R RECEEEE No Bid
DIST 6 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL . .
94 COMSTOCK SUPR 21C TN No Bid $ 12.50 No Bid $ 14.50
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
95 BROKEN BOW TN No Bid No Bid $ 10.74
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
96 ANSLEY TN No Bid No Bid $ 11.09 $ 11.49
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
97 ARNOLD TN No Bid No Bid $ 12.14
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
98 CALLAWAY TN No Bid No Bid $ 11.09
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
99 OCONTO TN No Bid No Bid $ 10.24
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
100 SUTHERLAND HWY 25 MP 104 TN No Bid No Bid $ 17.05 $ 8.70
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
101 N PLATTE 30 YARD TN No Bid No Bid $ 7.25
DIST 6 DEICING GRAVEL . .
102 N PLATTE 80 YARD TN No Bid No Bid $ 7.25
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
103 ANSELMO SITE 632 TN No Bid No Bid $ 31.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
104 BROKEN BOW S SITE 635 TN No Bid No Bid $ 10.50( $ 28.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
105 ANSLEY SITE 638 TN No Bid No Bid $ 10.69| $ 30.00 $ 11.49
D-6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
106 OCONTO SITE 636 TN No Bid No Bid $ 9.64| $ 31.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
107 SUTHERLAND HWY 25 MP 104 TN No Bid No Bid $ 13.00| $ 17.18 $ 8.45
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 6
Simon
. Overland QOverton . . .
DISTRICT SIX (6)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong |Jeffries Sand L &L Gravel| Sand and sand and Pine Bluffs | Contractorsinc [ T & F Sand & Ulrich Gravel Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| & Gravel Gravel DBA Ogalala Gravel, Inc. Inc. Materials Inc.
Gravel Gravel Co. :
Ready Mix
Line Number / Description Mﬂéf:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . )
108 DICKENS HWY 23 MP 57 TN No Bid No Bid $ 18.00( $ 19.05 $ 10.75
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . )
109 OGALLALA HWY 26 MP 136 TN No Bid No Bid $ 9.00| $ 12.49
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . )
110 ROSCOE HWY 30 MP 136 TN No Bid No Bid $ 10.00( $ 13.43 $ 10.92
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . )
1111 GOTHENBURG SITE 630 BLEND 1 ™ No Bid No Bid $ 2000
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . )
112 LEXINGTON HWY 283 MP 55 BLEND 1 TN No Bid No Bid $ 7.88| $ 24.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 12.07 )
113 STAPLETON N HWY 83 RP 130 TN No Bid Ton No Bid $ 21.00 $ 11.41
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 11.77 .
114 STAPLETON N HWY 83 RP 127 TN No Bid Ton No Bid $ 20.00 $ 11.38
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 11.57 )
115 STAPLETON N HWY 83 RP 124 TN No Bid Ton No Bid $ 20.00 $ 11.25
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
116 STAPLETON W HWY 92 RP 225 TN No Bid No Bid $ 23.00 $ 11.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ) )
117 TRYON E HWY 92 RP 225 TN No Bid No Bid $ 20.00 $ 10.75
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
118 ARTHUR E HWY 92 RP 175 SITE 621 TN No Bid No Bid $ 16.00 | $ 21.86
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL ) )
119 ARTHUR N HWY 61 RP 126 SITE 619 TN No Bid No Bid $ 14.00 | $ 20.93
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
120 ARTHUR N WHY 61 RP 131 SITE 616 TN No Bid No Bid $ 1500 $ 20.93
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 15.50 .
121 HYANNIS WEST HWY 2 RP 144 TN No Bid $ 19.25 Ton No Bid $ 18.00 | $ 24.68
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 14.50 .
122 MULLEN W HWY 2 RP 174 SITE 604 TN No Bid $ 15.00 T No Bid $ 22.00
DIST 6 WINDROW GRAVEL . $ 14.00 .
123 [MULLEN W HWY 2 RP 184 SITE 605 ™ NoBid | $ 1500 Ton No Bid $ 2400
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 Net 30 100 30 0 30 0 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 10 30 10 45 as needed 30
Comments

Page 2 of 2

Award Explanation

Line 104 awarded to Overton
Sand & Gravel, Co per official
tie breaker process

No Bid District #6

Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid

Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete Bid
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid



Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 7
Ed Broodfoot .
DISTRICT SEVEN (7)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Brads Sand DeWeese & Sons Sand Lakeside Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| and Gravel [Sand & Gravel & Gravel & Gravel LLC
. A Unit of L Lo o s S
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
1241wy 6 MP 181 W EDGE MINDEN ™ No Bid
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
1251wy 6 MP 157 W HOLDREGE ™ No Bid
DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
126 ALMA YARD TN No Bid
127 DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ No Bid $ 28.00

JWY 18 R-1 S CITY LIMITS CURTIS

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
128 | \WY 136 RP 9.4-4 W OF OXFORD ™ No Bid $ 34.00

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
1291\ 6 MP 181 W EDGE OF MINDEN ™ No Bid $ 9.98| $ 2h2E

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL )
130 L 1\wy 23 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE N No Bid $ 11.85

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

131 HWY 136 1 Ml E OF ORLEANS ™ No Bid i %89 i .25
132 3{;1( ;Xvéﬁaﬁow GRAVEL ™ NoBid |$ 12,67 $ 16.75
133 [PIST7 WINDROW GRAVEL ™ | nosd |s 1233 s 1500
154 [DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL ™ | noBid |s 1080 s 1300
A T .z
136 a{/ﬂg\évllal\geow GRAVEL ™ No Bid $ 11.50
138 \(\ov 23 RP 122w OiTv s ELwoop| TN | NoBid

Payment Terms 0 Net 0 30 Net 40 0 30 N/A
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 10 45 15
Comments
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

NE Dept of Roads

5175 OF

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 7
Ed Broodfoot .
DISTRICT SEVEN (7)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Brads Sand DeWeese & Sons Sand Lakeside Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC| and Gravel [Sand & Gravel & Gravel & Gravel LLC
. A Unit of Lo o S o S
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure

Page 2 of 4




Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads

DISTRICT 7
DISTRICT SEVEN (7)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, [ Mid-Nebraska | Overland Sand| Overton Sand Paulsen. Inc T &F Sand & Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Aggregate Inc.| and Gravel [and Gravel Co. T Gravel, Inc. | Materials INC.
. — Unit of o o U oo Lo Lo
Line Number / Description Measure Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL )
1243wy 6 MP 181 W EDGE MINDEN N $ ey °Bd

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
125 HWY 6 MP 157 W HOLDREGE TN No Bid $ 12.24 $ 13.19

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
126 | Al MA YARD ™ No Bid $ 14.00 $ 15.88

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
127 3wy 18 R- 1 S CITY LIMITS CURTIS ™ No Bid $ SEER $ 16.70

DIST 7 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL .
128 | \wY 136 RP 9.4-4 W OF OXFORD ™ NoBid |9 14.04 ) $ 16.05

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL )
1291wy 6 MP 181 W EDGE OF MINDEN ™ $ 10.99  No Bid -

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL )
130 LWy 23 W EDGE OF HOLDREGE N No Bid $ e - $ 8.45

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
131 HWY 136 1 MI E OF ORLEANS TN No Bid $ 10.70 - $ 12.99

DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL

132 HWY 34 RP 10 TN No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
133 HWY 61 RP 24 TN No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
134 HWY 35 RP 34 TN No Bid -
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
135 HWY 61 RP 74 TN No Bid $ 9.99
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
136 HWY 6 RP 58 TN No Bid $ 13.80
DIST 7 WINDROW GRAVEL .
137 HWY 23 RP 13 TN No Bid $ 13.53
DIST 7 SURFACING GRAVEL .
138 HWY 23 RP 132 W CITY LIMITS ELWOOD ™ No Bid $ N * 8.69
Payment Terms 100 30 0 30 100 30 0 - 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 10 60 45 30
Line 133 -
Dundy/Chase Co.
line
Line 135- 12 SO.
Comments Ogallala
Line 136 - East
Palisade
Line 137 - 5miW
Grant
No Bid District #7 Invalid Bid Award Explanation
Armstrong Rentals, LLC Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete Bid T&F Sand & Gravel, Inc - Line
K4 Trucking LLC G3 Enterprises - Late Bid 130 did not meet specifications
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 7
DISTRICT SEVEN (7)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, [ Mid-Nebraska | Overland Sand| Overton Sand Paulsen. Inc T &F Sand & Western
& SURFACING GRAVEL Aggregate Inc.| and Gravel [and Gravel Co. T Gravel, Inc. | Materials INC.
. — Unit of o o U oo Lo Lo
Line Number / Description Measure Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Overland Sand and Gravel
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF
NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

DISTRICT 8
DISTRICT EIGHT (8)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong %%Ei’ogf gg‘:gg Emme Sand |Jeffries Sand g;’:(;'zrr‘]‘é Ulrich Gravel
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC LLC Gravel LLC. & Gravel |& Gravel Inc. Gravel Inc.
Line Number / Description Mi';;?:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
139 ZIg"F: ZSERIAC?ERRCOOI\IALV?Isé\éEL RP 215 TN No Bid $ 10.80 | $ 13.25 No Bid
10 PIST8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ | Nosw s 1246]s 125|s 1130 Nosu
141 ?3IS|\;|?/\¢(F;'\FAE,§|>CE%A(;\JGECV\<(EI1_2 TN No Bid $ 12.60 $ 12.85 No Bid
14 |PIST 8 ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ | Nosw 5 10| Nosa |5 1380
143 EI{JS;VS;LFIQ_’\QOYI?AESAT GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 9.75 No Bid $ 11.00
14 |DIST B ARMOR COAT GRAVEL ™ | Nosw s 105 Nosg |s 1110
145 E,IAS;TSLQ'IBTMA(/?I?( CL:EI\TI;- GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 12.46 | $ 12.85 No Bid $ 13.33
146 \?IIASL-II—EI?I'II?IEIEING GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 1290 | $ 17.46 $ 12.50 No Bid
147 EIOS;'YS DEICING GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 20.22 | $ 22.01 $ 17.90 No Bid
148 a:;:\iﬁi:\jcme GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 2525 |$ 25.25 $ 22.25 No Bid
149 2LSE-I—N%EEI$X\IRGDGRAVEL TN No Bid $ 855 | % 8.55 No Bid
150 DIST 8 DEICING GRAVEL ™ | Nosu s oo No 5
151 gIEEIBLFEL%'SG GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 8.68 | $ 7.95 No Bid
155 [DIST B DEICING GRAVEL - ™ | nosd s 102 s 80| nNosu
163 [PISTBDEICING GRAVEL 1 ™ [\ g s 1270 5 900| Nos
154 Sﬁgzw&:\éDRow GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 1250 | $ 16.46 No Bid
155 '\D/IIESA—SII\\;IVAIEDROW GRAVEL TN No Bid $ 2185 ($ 24.25 $ 23.10 No Bid
156 [PIST 8 WNDROW GRAVEL ™ | nosd s ssi No 81
157 E:JS};—VSI;/XII_NI\?E(?_\ZNCI;ERAVEL TN No Bid $ 7.75 No Bid $ 8.52

Page 1 of 2




Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
Overland Sand and Gravel

Page 2 of 2

Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid

DISTRICT 8
DISTRICT EIGHT (8)- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong %%Ei@gf gg‘:gg Emme Sand |Jeffries Sand g;’:é'zrr‘]‘é Ulrich Gravel
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC & Gravel [& Gravel Inc. Inc.
LLC Gravel LLC. Gravel
Line Number / Description Mlérg;?:e Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
158 BARTLETT MIX LANE TN No Bid $ 9.26 No Bid $ 9.82
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
159 BASSETT HWY183 RP 180 TN No Bid $ 9.00 | $ 7.92 $ 13.00 No Bid
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
160 SPRINGVIEW HWY 183 RP 216 TN No Bid $ 1250 | $ 11.98 $ 17.00 No Bid
DIST 8 WINDROW GRAVEL . .
161 NEWPORT HWY 137 RP 22 TN No Bid $ 9.32 $ 17.00 No Bid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 100 30 0 60 100 30 Net 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 15 45 20 As required 30 as needed
Comments
No Bid District #8 Invalid Bid Award Explanation

Line 49 awarded to Emme
Sand & Gravel per official
tie breaker process




Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads
OPTIONAL LINES

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

ALTERNATE LOCATIONS- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Armstrong | Brad Sand and |D & L SAND & EiEgogdfgc’t Elkhorn Sand
& SURFACING GRAVEL Rentals, LLC Gravel GRAVEL LLC Grgvz = |&cravelLLC.
. - Unit of . o o N L
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON .
162 | \RMOR COAT ALTERNATE LOCATIONS N No Bid $ B3
OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON .
183 | hEICING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS N No Bid $ Uhits
OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON . .
164 | DROW GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ NoBid [0.17 ton mile |$ 0.15 |$ 0.20 | $ 0.15
OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON .
185 | SURFACING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS N No Bid
Payment Terms 0 Net 30 0 30 100 30 0 30 0 60
Delivery Days ARO 30 30 15 45 45
Comments
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe

5175 OF

NE Dept of Roads
OPTIONAL LINES

Opening Date: January 6, 2016

ALTERNATE LOCATIONS- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Emme Sand & | Hooker Bros | Jeffries Sand | | o\ .o o '\ga'z(jz?
& SURFACING GRAVEL Gravel Sand & Gravel| & Gravel Inc. ave Giavel
. L Unit of o o . o L
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON $ .15 Per )
162 \RMOR COAT ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ Ton mile $ ORI LT $ s
OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON $ .15 Per )
163 | 5EICING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ Ton mile $ ORI LT $ s
OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON $ .15 Per .
164 |\ INDROW GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ Ton mile $ GENE Ll
OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON $ .15 Per .
165 | SURFACING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ Ton mile A3 einl
Payment Terms 100 30 0 30 Net 30 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 20 10 As required 10 Per ITB
Line 165 - 1
Ton Ton
Comments $.13 per et
per mile ton -
$.13 per Ton
mile
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads
OPTIONAL LINES

ALTERNATE LOCATIONS- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, | Matteo Sand | Overiand  fOverton Sand| Pine Bluffs
& SURFACING GRAVEL & Gravel Sand and and Gravel | Gravel & Exc
Gravel Co. Inc
. . Unit of o . S oo
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure
162 OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON ™ .17 per ton No Bid .18 per
ARMOR COAT ALTERNATE LOCATIONS mile ton/mile
163 OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON ™ No Bid .18 per
DEICING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ton/mile
OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON . .18 per
164 WINDROW GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS N No Bid ton/mile 14 x25 Ton
165 OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON ™ No Bid .18 per
SURFACING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ton/mile
Payment Terms 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 30 10
Comments
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Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5175 OF Opening Date: January 6, 2016
NE Dept of Roads
OPTIONAL LINES

Simon
ALTERNATE LOCATIONS- ARMOR COAT, DEICING, WINDROW, CF’”“SCBtXrS Simon | Ulrich Gravel | sztcg’er g
& SURFACING GRAVEL inc Contractors Inc. L el
Ogallala Inc.
Ready Mix
. L Unit of o . . L
Line Number / Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Measure

OPTION 1: DELIVERY COST PER TON ——10.19 per Ton 15 per ton
162 | \RMOR COAT ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ AT | $ O i

OPTION 2: DELIVERY COST PER TON ——10.19 per Ton 15 per ton
163 | DEICING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ AT E | $ O i

OPTION 3: DELIVERY COST PER TON ) 15 per ton
164 |\ INDROW GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS ™ AL o Gille $ UEE i
165 |OPTION 4: DELIVERY COST PER TON . $ 0.14 | 15 per ton

SURFACING GRAVEL ALTERNATE LOCATIONS % | mile
Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO Per ITB as needed as needed

*read
Comments Addendum #1
and #2

No Bid Alternate Locations
Armstrong Rentals, LLC
K4 Trucking LLC
L&L Gravel
Overland Sand and Gravel

Invalid Bid
Elmer Wolfe - Incomplete Bid
G3 Enterprises - Late Bid
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