5143 OF

Attachment )
DHHS
ATTACHMENT J
Nebraska Department
of Health and Human
Services
Dairy Core List Dean Holding Company
S : ! : - |Bidder's Product Code| . L rachprice (ifsold | ExtendedPrice | S :
Descripti & Brand S Estay. |0 ; i i "
escription Grade ran e ‘s‘ ay Number e QSe ?(sce | based on case Price u s‘t Anv Chaoges from Spec
e -
BUTTER, U.S. GRADE AA GRADE AA: No Substitution | o>t Foint Creamery 59 CT 17#/CS 1200 20173) $ 52.95 $ 52,95
Meadow Gold
BUTTER, U.S. GRADE AA GRADE AA: No Substitution | <5t Point Creamery - Gold st 1000 14840| $ 14.715 $ 14,715 [* see below
INDIVIDUAL WRAP N Sweet
CHEESE AMERICAN LOAF W o5 1100
YELLOW
CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED [ N/A 454 1500
CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD SHRED
A as 900
REGULAR N/
CHEESE MOZZARELLA SHRED | N/A as# 600
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 2% |N/A Dean Foods - Land O' Lakes st 400 11654 s 652 |% 10.04
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 4% | N/A Dean Foods - Land O' Lakes s 1700 11653 $ 652 (% 1004
CREAM CHEESE LOAF N/A 1034 600
FAT FREE YOGURT ASSORTED varies, see
Foods - , 8/6 0Z 0542 6.504 {12/6
FLAVORS N/A Dean Foods - Land O’ Lakes ./ 300 attachment 'AB' $ $ /602
LACTOSE FREE 2% MILK, :
- K
GRADE A (ot to include soy, |GRADE A: No Substitution | c2" Fo0ds - Land O Lakes 1/2 GAL 1200 56743 $ 298 s 17.88
) Dairy Pure
almond or coconutmilk)
LOW FAT YOGURT ASSORTED " varies, see
FLAVORS N/A Dean Foods - Land O'Lakes 48/6 0Z 700 attachment 'AC’ S 0542 |5 6,504 |12/60z
MARGARINE, SOLID N/A West Point Creamery - Shedds 1 7200 23125 § 216 $ 216
MILK, CHOCOLATE 1%, GRADE ]
A LATE 1%, GRA GRADE A: No Substitution Dean Foods - Tru Moo 1/2 PINT 53000 47284 $ 0.2085 | $ 10.008
ILK, CHOCOLATE )
ZIRADE A SKIM, GRADE A: No Substitution Dean Foods - Tru Moo 1/2 PINT 95000 45837 $ 0.1695 | $ 8.475
D - Land O'tak
MILK, WHITE 1%, GRADEA | GRADE A: No Substitution D::: ;3:':5 tand O'Lakes 1/2 PINT 450000 56982 s 01695 | $ 8.475
Dean Foods - Land O'Lak
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADEA | GRADE A: No Substitution D:;"; P:‘:es tand O'lakes GAL 7250 56832 $ 24840 | $ 9.976
Dean Foods - 'Lak
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADEA | GRADE A: No Substitution D:]ar: N tand O'lakes 1/2 PINT 165000 56986 s 0189 [s 9.45
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, L Dean Foods - Land O'Lakes
GRAI H 6836 R B
GRADE A RADE A: No Substitution Dairy Pure GAL 900 5683 $ 1987 (S 7.948
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, L Dean Foods - Land O'Lakes
:Nos : .
CRADE A GRADE A: No Substitution | =20 20 1/2 PINT 55000 56984 s 0159 | $ 7.95
) ) | GRADE o Dean Foods - Land O'Lak
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, GRADE | - ADE A: No Substitution ean Foods - Land O'lakes GAL 1300 56826 $ 2893 | $ 11.572
A Dairy Pure
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, GRADE o Dean Foods - Land O'Lak
w GRADE A: No Substitution ean Foods - Land O'lakes 1/2 PINT 55000 56969 s 0217 % 1085
A Dairy Pure
SOUR CREAM, HEAVY N/A Dean Foods - Land O'Lakes SH# 600 11573 $ 7.645 | $ 15,29
SOUR CREAM, LIGHT N/A Dean Foods - Country Fresh st 200 54017 s 6845 | $ 13.69

* item listed as butter, US Grd AA individual wrap, however this item is currently supplied under existing contract is
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Dairy Core List Hiland Dairy Foods
i . : Fin : : ; : o . éidaér’ﬁ ﬁré&uct o - h Price (lfsold Extended Pméj ‘ S i
Description 0 o Grade . ‘fManufacturer'& Brand Y Sie i i} :Case Price N 1 “basedon Case | List Any Changes from Speg
: : | i . | ‘Code Number :f . 0T 0T byeach) - | Pl imEno :
BUTTER, U.S. GRADE AA GRADE AA: No Substitution | Grassland/ Hiland 59 CT 17#/CS 1200 A sa20 R 60,688 z:enl;fdi“g 47 CT17H/Cs; 59¢
E;JIJTl:/fSUL/ifV\?:::E AA GRADE AA: No Substitution Grassland/ Country Cream 90 CT 1000 2178
s 16.8 $ 16,800.00 |5 LB BTR-BULK CHIP/PAT 90
CHEESE AMERICAN LOAF N/A Performance Food 654 1100 9544
YELLOW Group/West Creek $ 64.68 | § 10.78 | $ 71,148.00
P d
CHEESE AMERICANSLICED | N/A erformance Foo ask 1500 16915
Group/West Creek $ 4312 1§ 1078 | § 64,680.00
CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD SHRED N/A Performance Food 454 900 18253
REGULAR Group/Northiand Star $ 446 | $ 1115 | § 40,140.00
D
i
CHEESE MOZZARELLA SHRED | N/A Performance Food a5 600 16927
Group/Northland Mtar s 44 | S 11]$ 26,400.00
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 2% | N/A Prairie Farms/ Hiland 5t 400 5762] s s s 04500
7.37 7.37 2,948.
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 4% | N/A Prairie Farms/ Hiland st 1700 5763 s R 77| s 2.526.00
7.37 . 12,529,
CREAM CHEESE LOAF N/A Grassland/Grassland 10 3# 600 9544 s N o5 | s 2.502.0
. 6. ,502.00
ORTED
FAT FREE YOGURT ASS N/A Prairie Farms/ Hiland 48/6 0Z 300 16470-16433
FLAVORS $ 15.84 | $ 0.44 | $ 4,752.00 |Case Pk is 36/6 oz
LACTOSE FREE 2% MILK,
GRADE A (notto include soy, |GRADE A: No Substitution Hifand / 1/2 GAL 1200 25281
almond or coconutmilk) $ 3.95 | § 3951 4,740.00
T ASSORTED
LOW FATYOGUR E N/A Prairie Farms/ Hiland 48/6 02 700 16446-16456
FLAVORS $ 1584 | § 04413 11,088.00 |Case Pk is 36/6 oz
MARGARINE, SOLID N/A Ventura Foods/Golden Sweet 1 7200 10196
$ 1951$ 0.651% 4,680.00
%, GRADE N o i
MILK, CHOCOLATE 1%, GRADE A: No Substitution | Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINT 53000 25281 Price submitted is for 2%; 1%
A S 0.2079 | $ 02079 |3 11,018.7 [N/A
MILK, CHOCOLATE SKIM, §
! GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINT 95000 9178
GRADE A $ 0.1687 | § 0.1687 | $ 16,026.5
MILK, WHITE 1%, GRADE A GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hitand 1/2 PINT 450000 9171
$ 016 $ 0163 72,000.00
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADE A |GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland GAL 7250 1201
$ 28815 28818 20,880.00
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADE A |GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINT 165000 9168
S 0.182 | § 0182 % 30,030.00
FAT FREE, -~ .
MILK, WHITE, GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland GAL 900 1413
GRADE A s 249158 249|$ 2,241.00
WHITE, FAT FREE, -
MILK, GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINT 55000 9173
GRADE A $ 0.1557 | $ 0.1557 | $ 8,563.5
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, GRADE . .
HI LE, GRA GRADE A: No Substitution Hiand/Hiland GAL 1300 1031
A S 339 (% 3395 4,407.00
MILK, HOLE, GRADE
LK, WHITE, W ADE | GRADE A: No Substitution Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINT 55000 9165
A s 0.2117 | § 0.2117 | $ 11,643.50
SOUR CREAM, HEAVY N/A Hiland/Hiland 54 600 9224,
S 7.25|$ 72518 4,350.00
SOUR CREAM, LIGHT N/A Hiland/Hiland 54t 200 25293
$ 613 6[$ 1,200
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Dairy Core List The Thompson Co., LLC
b S : . ] ; e EutendedPrice | oy Changes from
Descri Grade Manufacturer & Brand o oEsteQty, Case Price |  based op Case 310NV Chang n
: Y : ©price L ;
BUTTER, U.S. GRADE AA GRADE AA: No Substitution 59 CT 17#/CS 1200
NO BID
BUTTER, U.5. GRADE AA GRADE AA: No Substitution 90CT 1000
INDIVIDUAL WRAP NO BID
CHEESE AMERICAN LOAF N/A 654 1100
YELLOW NO BID
CHEESE AMERICAN SLICED N/A 45# 1500
NO BiD
SE CHEDDAR N
CHEESE CHEDDAR MILD SHRED N/A a5y 900
REGULAR NO BiD
CHEESE MOZZARELLA SHRED ~ [N/A 45# 600
NO BID
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 2% | N/A 5# 400
NO BID
COTTAGE CHEESE, MILKFAT 4% | N/A S# 1700
NO BID
CREAM CHEESE LOAF N/A 103# 600
NO BID
FAT FREE YOGURT ASSORTED N/A 48/6 07 300
FLAVORS NO BID
LACTOSE FREE 2% MILK,
GRADE A {not to include soy, |GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 GAL 1200
almond or coconutmilk) NO BID
LOW FAT YOGURT ASSORTED N/A 48/6 07 700
FLAVORS NO BID
MARGARINE, SOLID N/A 1# 7200
NO BID
MILK, CHOCOLATE 1%, GRADE -
* GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 53000
A NO BID
MILK, CHOCOLATE SKIM, .
GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 95000
GRADE A NO BID
MILK, WHITE 1%, GRADE A GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 450000
NO BID
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADE A GRADE A: No Substitution GAL 7250
NO BID
MILK, WHITE 2%, GRADE A GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 165000
NO BID
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, GRADE A: No Substitution GAL 900
GRADE A NO BID
MILK, WHITE, FAT FREE, L
GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 55000
GRADE A NO BID
MILK, WHITE, WHOLE, GRADE .
£, GRA GRADE A: No Substitution GAL 1300
A NO BID
MILK, ITE, —
WHITE, WHOLE, GRADE GRADE A: No Substitution 1/2 PINT 55000
A NO BID
SOUR CREAM, HEAVY N/A 5# 600
NO BID
SOUR CREAM, LIGHT N/A 5# 200
NO BID
No Bids
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Bimbo Bakeries U.SA./Earthgrains

Cashwa Distribution Co., Inc
The Thompson Ce., LLC




