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ATTACHMENT D
Nebraska Department of
Correctional Services
Dairy Core List Cashwa Distributing Co. Inc
;  Size Bidding
ROBERTS DAIRY
COTTAGE CHEESE, 2% 5 LBS COMPANY (341) 5LB 100 66281 Roberts 4/5# S 31.58 S 2,093,220.26
ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORT. HILAND ROBERTS
FLAVORS (9243) 3 GAL 100 New Hiland 3 gal S 17.33
HILAND ROBERTS
ICE CREAM, CUP, VANILLA-4 0Z/24PK (9243) 24/4 02 243 57410 Roberts 3/24ct | $ 22.34 $  1,282,596.81
ROBERTS DAIRY
LOW-FAT BUTTERMILK, 1/2 GALLON COMPANY (341) 1/2 GAL 608 66471 Hiland 9/.5Gal | $ 17.26 S 1,147,222.99
MARGARINE, SOLID, 1LBS (SHREDDS
MARG SLT) VENTURA LLC (831) 16 0Z 140,190 58260 Private label $ 14.82 S 863,646.24
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1% 5 GALLON ROBERTS DAIRY
BLADDER COMPANY (341) 5 GAL 500 66309 Hiland 2% 5 Gal | $ 17.07 $  1,132,027.25
ROBERTS DAIRY
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, 1/2 PINT COMPANY (341) 1/2 PINTS 1,056 66468 Hiland FF 50/.5pt | $ 11.33 $  753,082.44
ROBERTS DAIRY
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, GALLON COMPANY (341) 1 GAL 500 66455 Hiland 4/1Gal | $ 15.24 $  1,012,441.93
ROBERTS DAIRY
MILK, CHOCOLATE, SKIM, 1/2 PINT COMPANY (341) 1/2 PINTS 23,748 66468 Hiland 50/.5pt | $ 11.33 $ 753,082.44
ROBERTS DAIRY
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 1/2 PINT COMPANY (341) PINTS 2,071,070 66467 Hiland 50/.5pt | $ 10.80 $  717,843.60
ROBERTS DAIRY
MILK, WHITE, 1% GALLON COMPANY (341) 1GAL 1000 66453 Hiland 4/1 Gal S 12.33 S 819,431.94
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 5 GALLON ROBERTS DAIRY
BLADDER COMPANY (341) 5 GAL 12,681 66153 Hiland 5 gal S 15.46 S 1,022,474.00
ROBERTS DAIRY
SOUR CREAM, 5LB CONTAINER COMPANY (341) 5LB 90 66500 Daisy 4/5# $ 30.58 $  2,033,570.00
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Dean Holding Company

6.52

10.04

COTTAGE CHEESE, 2% 5 LBS NAME BRAND 518 100 11654 LOL 2-54

ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORT.

FLAVORS NAME BRAND 3 GAL 100 varies, attach 'A’ DCF 1-3 Gallon 13.95 13.95
ICE CREAM, CUP, VANILLA-4 0Z/24PK|  NAME BRAND 24/4 02 243 43807 DCF 2-24 Pack 4.25 8.5
LOW-FAT BUTTERMILK, 1/2 GALLON NAME BRAND 1/2 GAL 608 57116 LOL D Pure 9-HG 1.295 11.655
MARGARINE, SOLID, 1LBS (SHREDDS

MARG SLT) NAME BRAND 16 0Z 140,190 23125 Shedds 30-1# $ 21.6 21.6
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1% 5 GALLON

BLADDER NAME BRAND 5 GAL 500 47727 TruMoo1-5Gal | $ 15.88 15.88
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND 1/2 PINTS 1.056 47284 Tru Moo 48-HP 0.2085 10.008
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, GALLON NAME BRAND 1GAL 500 47421 Tru Moo 4-1 Gal 2.765 11.06
MILK, CHOCOLATE, SKIM, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND 1/2 PINTS 23,748 45837 Tru Moo 50-HP 0.1695 8.475
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND PINTS * 2,071,070 56982 LOL D Pure 50-HP 0.1695 8.475
MILK, WHITE, 1% GALLON NAME BRAND 1GAL 1000 56840 LOL D Pure 4-1 Gal 2.195 8.78
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 5 GALLON

BLADDER NAME BRAND 5 GAL 12,681 10998 LOL 1-5 Gal $ 13.63 13.63
SOUR CREAM, 5LB CONTAINER NAME BRAND 5.8 90 11573 LOL 2-54 7.645 15.29

6.F. 24 ft straight truck refrigerated for State Penn Also 20 ft hot shot refrigerated truck

Legend: LOL-Land O' Lakes
D Pure - Dairy Pure

HG - Half Gallon
HP - Half Pint

* unit of measure incorrect @ pints, bid item as half pints
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Hiland Dairy Foods

| C e:‘P(ice“ fsold |

COTTAGE CHEESE, 2% 5 LBS Prarie Farms/Hiland 5LB 100 5763 5LB 7.37 737.00
Price submitted is for
ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORT. vanilla, chocolate,
FLAVORS Hiland/Hiland 3 GAL 100 9324, 8496, 8997 3 GAL 18.88 1,888.00 strawberry
Specialities/ North
ICE CREAM, CUP, VANILLA-4 0Z/24PK Star 24/40Z 243 25524 24/4 0Z S 7.92 0.33 1,924.56
LOW-FAT BUTTERMILK, 1/2 GALLON Hiland/Hiland 1/2 GAL 608 1462 1/2 GAL 1.51 918.08
MARGARINE, SOLID, 1LBS {SHREDDS Ventura Foods/
MARG SLT) Golden Sweet 16 0Z 140,190 10196 16 0Z 0.65 91,123.50
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1% 5 GALLON Price submitted is for 2%;
BLADDER Hiland/Hiland 5 GAL 500 25205 5 GAL 15.25 7,625.00 1% is not available
Price submitted is for 2%;
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, 1/2 PINT Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINTS 1.056 25281 1/2 PINTS 0.22 232.32 1% is not available
Price submitted is for 2%;
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, GALLON Hiland/Hiland 1GAL 500 25144 1 GAL 3.59 1,795.00 1% is not available
MILK, CHOCOLATE, SKIM, 1/2 PINT Hiland/Hiland 1/2 PINTS 23,748 9178 1/2 PINTS 0.17 4,006.29
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 1/2 PINT Hiland/Hiland PINTS 2,071,070 9171 1/2 PINTS 0.16 331,371.20
MILK, WHITE, 1% GALLON Hiland/Hiland 1 GAL 1000 1346 1 GAL 2.67 2,670.00
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 5 GALLON
BLADDER Hiland/Hiland 5 GAL 12,681 1341 5 GAL 10.72 135,940.32
SOUR CREAM, 5LB CONTAINER Hiland/Hiland 5LB 90 9224 5LB 7.25 652.50
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ist Any Changes from
COTTAGE CHEESE, 2% 5 LBS NAME BRAND 5LB 100 No Bid
ICE CREAM, 3 GALLON, ASSORT.
FLAVORS NAME BRAND 3 GAL 100 No Bid
ICE CREAM, CUP, VANILLA-4 0Z/24PK NAME BRAND 24/4 0Z 243 No Bid
LOW-FAT BUTTERMILK, 1/2 GALLON NAME BRAND 1/2 GAL 608 No Bid
MARGARINE, SOLID, 1LBS (SHREDDS
MARG SLT) NAME BRAND 16 0Z 140,190 No Bid
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1% 5 GALLON
BLADDER NAME BRAND 5 GAL 500 No Bid
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND 1/2 PINTS 1.056 No Bid
MILK, CHOCOLATE, 1%, GALLON NAME BRAND 1 GAL 500 No Bid
MILK, CHOCOLATE, SKIM, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND 1/2 PINTS 23,748 No Bid
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 1/2 PINT NAME BRAND PINTS 2,071,070 No Bid
MILK, WHITE, 1% GALLON NAME BRAND 1 GAL 1000 No Bid
MILK, WHITE, 1%, 5 GALLON
BLADDER NAME BRAND 5 GAL 12,681 No Bid
SOUR CREAM, 5LB CONTAINER NAME BRAND 5LB 90 No Bid

1.A. No Bid on Core Milk & Dairy
6. A. Western NE Vets Home 2x/week as in past.
7. NOTES/COMMENTS: Catalog milk & dairy products require 2 wk. lead time.

NO BIDS
Bimbo Bakeries U.SA./Earthgrains
The Thompson Co., LLC
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