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Attachment C

Description
Unit of Measure 

Package Size
Estimated Usage

Bidder's Product 

Code Number

Specify Brand Pack Bidding and 

Individual Weight Size Bidding 
Unit Price

List Any Changes 

from Spec

BREAD, SANDWICH, WHEAT, 24 

OZ SLICED
LV 120,124 5411 Bakers Touch Wheat 24 oz  $              1.12 

BREAD, SANDWICH, WHITE, 24 

OZ SLICED
LV 93,967 3995 Sara Lee Classic White  24 oz  $              1.12 

BREAD, SANDWICH, WHITE, 24 

OZ SLICED KOSHER CERTIFIED
LV 2900 N/A N/A N/A N/A

BREAD, TEXAS TOAST, 24 OZ 

SLICED
LV 598 5275 Sara Lee White Texas Toast 24 oz  $              1.19 

BUNS, HAMBURGER, 4" TOP 

3.75 BOTTOM, 12CT
PK 47,007 6152

Master White Buns, Hamburger 

12 ct
 $              1.54 

BUNS, HAMBURGER, 4" TOP 

3.75 BOTTOM, 60 CT
PK 2,940 5437

R & I 4" White Buns, Hamburger 

30 ct
 $              2.99 

BUNS, HAMBURGER, 4" TOP 

3.75 BOTTOM, WHOLE GRAIN - 

12 CT

PK 510 3447
R & I Whole Grain Buns, 

Hamburger 12 ct
 $              1.46 

BUNS, HOGIE, CLASSIC WHITE 6 

PK
PK 5,146 4143 Sara Lee H & D Stkrl 6 pk 1.26$              

BUNS, STEAK 24 CT CUT PK 11,157 5553 R & I SES Steak, 24 pk  $              3.79 

BUNS, WEINER CUT, 16 CT PK 48,378 6154 Master White Buns, Weiner, 16 ct  $              1.64 

DINNER ROLL, WHITE 12 CT PK 2,000 4145 Sara Lee Dinner Roll WHI 12 ct 1.36$              

ENGLISH MUFFIN, 6 CT PK 500 ? ? ?

ATTACHMENT C

Bread Core List

Nebraska Department of 

Correctional Services               

2. NOTES/COMMENTS:  See 2. -A - A Firm order for Dept of Correctional Services will be 

provided to the contractor by the ordering state facility a minimum of 96 hours before 

delivery is required.  

3. NOTES/COMMENTS:  A firm order for Dept of Health and Human Services will be 

provided to the contractor by the ordering state facility a minimum of 96 hours before 

delivery is required with the exception of item #4326 and item #187, which will require a 

minimum of 120 hours before delivery is required.

Bimbo Bakeries U.SA./Earthgrains

COMMENTS

AWARD
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Nebraska Department of 

Correctional Services               

COMMENTS
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Code Number

Specify Brand Pack Bidding and 

Individual Weight Size Bidding 
Unit Price

List Any Changes 

from Spec

53585 Baker Boy 10/24oz  $           25.44 Baker Boy 10/24oz

134500 Baker Boy 10/24oz  $           24.65 Baker Boy 10/24oz

134500 Baker Boy 10/24oz 24.65$            Baker Boy 10/24oz

134515 Baker Boy 6/28oz  $           18.89 Baker Boy 6/28oz

57549 Baker Boy 12/8ct  $           27.51 Baker Boy 12/8ct

134520 Baker Boy 60/2.  $           27.80 Baker Boy 60/2.

55803 Baker Boy 10/12 ct  $           32.87 Baker Boy 10/12 ct

55771 Baker Boy 60/3.8 oz 28.41$            
Baker boy 60/3.8 

oz

59160 Rotella 6/6 ct.  $           12.81 Rotella 6/6 ct

134540 Baker Boy 12/8ct  $           33.20 Baker Boy 12/8ct

59562 Shubert offer 120ct 15.47$            
Shubert offer 

120ct

59732 Thomas 6/12ct 17.83$            Thomas 6/12ct

ATTACHMENT C
Nebraska Department of 

Correctional Services               

Cashwa Distributing Co. Inc
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12 CT

PK 510

BUNS, HOGIE, CLASSIC WHITE 6 

PK
PK 5,146

BUNS, STEAK 24 CT CUT PK 11,157
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COMMENTS

Bidder's Product 

Code Number

Specify Brand Pack Bidding and 

Individual Weight Size Bidding 
Unit Price

List Any Changes 

from Spec

No Bid

 No Bid

No Bid

 No Bid

No Bid

 No Bid

No Bid

 No Bid

No Bid

 No Bid

No Bid

 No Bid

The Thompson Company LLC

NO BIDS

1.  A.  No Bid-Core Bread & Bakery

4.  A. Western NE Vets Home 2x/week as in past.

5.  NOTES/COMMENTS: Catalog bread & bakery items are frozen.

Dean Holding Company

Hiland Dairy Foods

The Thompson Company LLC
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