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= |Description [ QTY [UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
High Capacity Pleated Filters (13-15 Pleats) Section 1
7-1/2X29-1/2X1/2, PLEATED FILTER $ 457 $ 2941 $ 3.61
1 Manufacturer: 15 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
7-1/2X29-1/2X1/2,
Vendor Part Number: SP7.529.5.5 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-08331
7-3/4X41-3/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 6.00 | $ 6721 $ 3.91
2 Manufacturer: 15 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
7-3/4X41-3/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP7.7541.75.5 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-08421
9-3/4X23-3/4X1/2, PLEATED FILTER $ 450 | $ 2941 $ 4.06
3 Manufacturer: 15 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
9-3/4X23-3/4X1/2,
Vendor Part Number: SP9.7523.75.5 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-08241
10X16X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 286 | $ 2541 % 3.61
4 Manufacturer: 30 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
10X16X1, FSHCP1-
Vendor Part Number: SP10161 HCP PLEATED FILTER 103413341
10X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 266 | % 215| $ 3.10
5 [Manufacturer: 144 | EA Filtration Group KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10436 102-701-001 FSHCP1-12201
12X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 3.00| % 4011 $ 3.56
Manufacturer: FG NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
6 35 | EA 12X20X2,
Vendor Part Number: 10492 PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-13162
12X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 285| % 232 $ 3.18
7 |Manufacturer: 180 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10452 102-701-011 HCP2-12242
12X24X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 4751 % 4111 $ 4.22
8 [Manufacturer: 15 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10465 102.701-023 HCP4-12244
14X14X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 2771 % 2541 $ 3.61
9 Manufacturer: 25 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
14X14X1, FSHCP1-
Vendor Part Number: SP14141 HCP PLEATED FILTER 143417341
14X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 291 (% 2731 $ 3.84
10 |Manufacturer: 92 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10442 102-701-004 FSHCP1-20241
16X18X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 325( % 4011 $ 3.56
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
11 145 | EA 16X18X2,
Vendor Part Number: SP16182 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-13162
16X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 245( % 207 | $ 2.58
12 |Manufacturer: 224 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10444 102-701-006 HCP1-16201
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16X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 275( % 2331 $ 3.05

13 |Manufacturer: 700 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10456 102-701-016 HCP2-16202
16X20X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 4.80 | $ 4431 $ 4.82

14 [Manufacturer: 150 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10466 102-701-025 HCP4-16204
16X22X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 325($% 3361 $ 3.91
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP

15 50 | EA 16X22X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP16221 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-08421
16X22-1/2X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 3251 % 336 | $ 3.91
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP

16 20 | EA 16X22-1/2X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP1622.51 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-08421
16X23X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 3251 % 336 | $ 3.91
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP

o 20 | EA 16X23X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP16231 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-082421
16X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 320 % 280 | $ 4.06

18 |Manufacturer: 75 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10457 102-701-053 FSHCP2-16242
16X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 270 $ 2251 % 2.88

19 |Manufacturer: 548 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10445 102-701-007 HCP1-16251
16X25X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 299 | % 2711 $ 3.54

20 |Manufacturer: 1464 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10458 102-701-017 HCP2-16252
16X25X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 535| % 487 | $ 5.36

21 [Manufacturer: 70 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10467 102-701-026 HCP4-16254
16X33X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 645|% 6.28 | $ 4.06
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP

22 % | EA 16X33X2,
Vendor Part Number: SP16332 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-16242
18X18X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 5751 % 3711 $ 3.84

23 [Manufacturer: 72 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 32033 102-042-007 FSHCP2-24252
18X24X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 318 (% 2761 $ 3.84

24 |Manufacturer: 25 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10488 102-031-016 FSHCP1-20241
18X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 357 % 3.00| $ 7.39

25 [Manufacturer: 50 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10459 102-701-018 FSHCP2-24252
18X25X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 3.60 | % 3471 8% 8.11

26 |Manufacturer: 40 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10495 102-042-009 FSHCP2-25252
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20X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 240 [ $ 2251 % 2.88
27 [Manufacturer: 240 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10447 102-701-008 HCP1-20201
20X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 3.00| % 258 | $ 3.54
28 |Manufacturer: 1104 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10460 102-701-019 HCP2-20202
20X20X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 535($% 4851 $ 5.36
29 [Manufacturer: 15 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10469 102-701-028 HCP4-20204
20X22X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 3751 % 4771 $ 7.39
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
30 70 1 EA 20X22X2,
Vendor Part Number: SP20222 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-24252
20X24X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 320 $ 2811 $ 3.84
31 [Manufacturer: 40 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10489 102-031-017 FSHCP1-20241
20X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 355|% 2921 $ 4.30
32 [Manufacturer: 316 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10461 102-701-020 HCP2-20242
20X24X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 5951 % 5611 $ 6.16
33 [Manufacturer: 75 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10470 102-701-029 HCP4-20244
20X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 2551 % 255| % 3.32
34 [Manufacturer: 254 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10448 102-701-009 HCP1-20251
20X25X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 3401 % 2891 $ 4.03
35 [Manufacturer: 1652 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10462 102-701-021 HCP2-20252
20X25X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 595| % 5471 $ 6.05
36 |Manufacturer: 24 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10471 102-701-030 HCP4-20254
20X33X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 6.00 | $ 9.54 | $ 8.11
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
37 144 | EA 20X33%2,
Vendor Part Number: SP20332 HCP PLEATED FILTER | FSHCP2-2318312
22X22X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 4101 $ 3771 $ 3.84
Manufacturer: FG NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
38 30 | EA 22X22X1,
Vendor Part Number: 10490 PLEATED FILTER FSHCP1-20241
24X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 355|% 292 | $ 4.30
39 [Manufacturer: 24 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10461 102-701-020 HCP2-20242
24X24X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 325( % 2681 $ 3.54
40 |Manufacturer: 72 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10449 102-701-010 HCP1-24241
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24X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 390 (% 316 | $ 4.55
41 |Manufacturer: 825 | EA FG NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10463 102-701-022 HCP2-24242
24X24X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 640 | % 567 $ 6.48
42 |[Manufacturer: 175 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10472 102-701-031 HCP4-24244
25X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 5.60 | $ 6281 $ 7.39
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
43 12 1 EA 25X24X2,
Vendor Part Number: SP25242 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-24252
25X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 385|% 341 | $ 4.04
44 |Manufacturer: 12 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10450 102-031-014 HCP1-25251
25X25X2 PLEATED FILTER $ 450 $ 430 $ 4.32
45 |Manufacturer: 100 | EA FG KOCH XL8-C Airguard DP
Vendor Part Number: 10464 102-701-050 HCP2-25252
25X36X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 840 | % 11.06 | $ 8.11
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
46 216 | EA 25X36X2,
Vendor Part Number: SP25362 HCP PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-2318312
28-1/2X29-1/2X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 790 | $ 11.06 | $ 8.11
Manufacturer: FG NAF SPECIAL Airguard DP
41 24 | EA 28-1/2X29-1/2X2,
Vendor Part Number: 572675 PLEATED FILTER FSHCP2-25252
Standard Capacity Pleated Filters (10-12 Pleats) Section 2
8X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 2241 % 2541 $ 3.46
48 Manufacturer: 25 | Ea LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
8X20X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8201 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-0812201
8-1/4X27-3/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 3201 % 294 | $ 3.46
49 Manufacturer: 35 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
8-1/4X27-3/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8.2527.751 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-0812331
8-1/4X31-3/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 325( % 2941 3% 3.46
50 Manufacturer: 20 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
8-1/4X31-3/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8.2531.751 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-0812331
8-1/4X43-3/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 225( % 336 $ 3.46
51 Manufacturer: 20 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
8-1/4X43-3/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8.2543.751 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-0843341
8-1/2X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 325( % 2541 3% 3.46
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
52 20 | EA
8-1/2X20X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8.5201 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-0812201
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8-1/2X27-3/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 325( % 2941 3% 5.34
53 Manufacturer: 20 | Ea LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX|
8-1/2X27-3/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8.527.751 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-08271
9X21X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 3251 % 2541 $ 3.84
54 Manufacturer: 20 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX|
9X21X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP9211 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-09211
11-3/8X11-3/8X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 225( % 2541 % 2.42
55 Manufacturer: 25 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX|
11-3/8X11-3/8X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP11.37511.3751 SCP| PLEATED FILTER SCP1-12121
12X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 210 $ 232 $ 2.68
56 [Manufacturer: 60 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10380 102-700-012 SCP2-12242
16X16X2,PLEATED FILTER $ 265( 9% 3.06] $ 2.40
57 [Manufacturer: 40 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10420 102-042-005 SCP2-16162
16X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 2201 % 233] $ 2.32
58 [Manufacturer: 265 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10384 102-700-016 SCP2-16202
16X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 230 $ 2801 $ 3.32
59 [Manufacturer: 17 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10385 102-700-053 SCP2-16242
16X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 2151 % 225| $ 2.42
60 |Manufacturer: 50 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX
Vendor Part Number: 10373 102-700-007 SCP1-16251
16X25X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 225 $ 2581 $ 2.70
61 [Manufacturer: 170 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX
Vendor Part Number: 10386 102-700-017 SCP2-16252
17X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 350 | % 336 | $ 2.94
62 Manufacturer: 50 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX
17X20X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP17201 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-17201
18X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 260 (% 2991 $ 3.59
63 [Manufacturer: 65 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10387 102-700-018 SCP2-18242
18X24X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 4951 $ 546 | $ 5.60
64 |Manufacturer: 35 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX
Vendor Part Number: 10396 102-700-027 SCP4-18244
20X20X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 215 $ 225 $ 2.42
65 [Manufacturer: 65 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX
Vendor Part Number: 10375 102-700-008 SCP1-20201
20X25X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 230 $ 2551 $ 2.81
66 |Manufacturer: 30 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX
Vendor Part Number: 10376 102-700-009 SCP1-20251
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20X20X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 225( % 258 | $ 2.70
67 [Manufacturer: 245 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10388 102-700-019 SCP2-20202
20X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 260 | $ 2921 $ 3.66
68 |Manufacturer: 280 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10389 102-700-020 SCP2-20242
20X25X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 260 (% 289 | $ 3.26
69 [Manufacturer: 135 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10390 102-700-021 SCP2-20252
20X25X4, PLEATED FILTER $ 495 $ 5471 $ 5.45
70 |Manufacturer: 25 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10399 102-700-030 SCP4-20254
21X21-1/4X1, PLEATED FILTER $ 4551 $ 3771 $ 3.98
71 Manufacturer: 20 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD DP MAX|
21X21-1/4X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP2121.251 SCP PLEATED FILTER FS1-21211
24X24X2, PLEATED FILTER $ 285| % 3.16 | $ 3.66
72 [Manufacturer: 280 | EA FG KOCH XL8 AIRGUARD DP MAX|
Vendor Part Number: 10391 102-700-022 SCP2-24242
Disposable Cardboard Filters Section 3
7X22X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 180 | $ 2701 $ 2.11
73 [Manufacturer: 80 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP7221 DCP 7X22X1 DCP HD FSDC1-071219121
7-1/2X20X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 180 [ $ 2701 $ 2.11
74 |Manufacturer: 56 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP7.5201 DCP 7X22X1, DCP HD | FSDC1-071219121
7-1/2X25-1/2X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 205( % 2931 $ 2.50
75 |Manufacturer: 42 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP7.525.51 DCP 7-1/2X20X1, DCP HD| FSDC1-075825121
7-1/2X28-1/2X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 205| % 2931 $ 2.50
76 Manufacturer: 36 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
7-1/2X25-1/2X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP7.528.51 DCP DCP HD FSDC1-075825121
7-1/2X36X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 205( $ 293 $ 3.22
77 Manufacturer: 62 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
7-1/2X28-1/2X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP7.5361 DCP DCP HD FSDC1-10361
8X20X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 180 $ 270 | $ 2.11
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
8 5 | EA 7-1/2X36X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP8201 DCP DCP HD FSDC1-08201
8X28X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 205[ % 2931 $ 2.97
79 [Manufacturer: 60 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP8281 DCP 8X20X1, DCP HD FSDC1-08281
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8X32X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 280 [ $ 2931 % 2.97
80 [Manufacturer: 35 [ EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP8321 DCP 8X28X1, DCP HD FSDC1-10361
8X44X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 410 | $ 293 $ 3.58
81 |Manufacturer: 40 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP8441 DCP 8X32X1, DCP HD FSDC1-10441
8X47X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 4101 $ 586 | $ 3.58
82 [Manufacturer: 12 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP8471 DCP 8X44X1, DCP HD FSDC1-10441
8X48X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 410 | $ 586 | $ 3.58
83 |Manufacturer: 30 [ EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP8481 DCP 8X47X1, DCP HD FSDC1-10441
9-1/2X35-1/2X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 4101 $ 586 | $ 3.58
84 [Manufacturer: 20 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP9.535.51 DCP 8X48X1, DCP HD FSDC1-10361
9-1/2X36-1/2X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 410 | $ 586 | $ 3.58
85 Manufacturer: oa | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
9-1/2X35-1/2X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP9.536.51 DCP DCP HD FSDC1-10361
10X36X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 4101 $ 586 | $ 3.58
86 Manufacturer: 12 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
9-1/2X36-1/2X1,
Vendor Part Number: SP10361 DCP DCP HD FSDC1-10361
11X46X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 410 | $ 6.82 | $ 3.58
87 |Manufacturer: 25 | EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP11461 DCP 10X36X1, DCP HD FSDC1-14421
12X25X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 200 $ 2931 $ 1.50
88 [Manufacturer: 80 | EA GLASFLOSS NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: PTA12251 11X46X1, DCP HD DC1-12251
13X45X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 470 | $ 6.82 | $ 3.58
89 |Manufacturer: 2 EA LAF NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: SP13451 DCP 12X25X1, DCP HD FSDC1-14421
16X20X1, HEAVY DUTY FILTER $ 1.70 | $ 3181 $ 1.36
90 [Manufacturer: 20 | EA GLASFLOSS NAF SPECIAL PUROLATOR
Vendor Part Number: PTA16201 13X45X1, DCP HD DC1-16201
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High Efficiency Bag Filters, 90-95% Section 4
6"x120” BAG FILTER,
3” CUFF W/ STEEL SNAP RING BAND, DOUBLE
LAYER DISC W/ 3" WEARSTRIP, 22 OZ.
91 [FIBERGLASS, 992-1 CHEMFLEX FINISH OR 216 | EA
EQUIVALENT N/A NO BID $ 43.84
Manufacturer: N/A NO BID FLSMIDTH
Vendor Part Number: N/A NO BID 2-1075-XX
12X24X12, BAG FILTER 12.80 1595 | $ 16.76
AIRGUARD CLEAN
92 Manufacturer: 20 | EA FG QUALITY PAK
Vendor Part Number: 18311 QP94122412 BG9-241212-3
24X24X12, BAG FILTER 16.80 24431 % 27.12
AIRGUARD CLEAN
93 Manufacturer: 100 1 EA FG QUALITY PAK
Vendor Part Number: 18312 QP98242412 BG9-242412-6
24X24X22, BAG FILTER 29.80 29.39 | $ 32.24
AIRGUARD CLEAN
94 Manufacturer: 48 | EA FG QUALITY PAK
Vendor Part Number: 18324 QP98242422 BG9-242422
Rigid Box Filters 80-85% Efficiency Section 5
24X24X12 RIGID BOX FILTER 56.70 4569 [ $ 52.00
95 [Manufacturer: 80 | EA FG QUALITY AIRGUARD V-PAK
Vendor Part Number: 16443 QCN9242412 VPK S 24241285
Z Line Carbotron Section 6
24X24X2 Z LINE CARBOTRON 16.50 13.70 | $ 18.70
96 20 | EA AIRGUARD FRESH
Manufacturer: FG QUALITY AIR
Vendor Part Number: 16336 0B24242 CP2-24242
24X24X4 Z LINE CARBOTRON 30.00 20.33 | $ 30.14
97 20 | Ea AIRGUARD FRESH
Manufacturer: FG QUALITY AIR
Vendor Part Number: 17087 0B24244 CP4-24244
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Pleated Filters Section 7
14X20X1 PLEATED $ 2451 % 253 $ 2.27
98 |Manufacturer: 15 | EA FG KOCH AIRGUARD
Vendor Part Number: 10441 14X20X1 XL8 SCP1-14201
7X27 1/2X1 PLEATED $ 316 [ $ 2541 % 3.19
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD
99 12| EA 7X27 1/2X1
Vendor Part Number: SP727.51 HCP PLEATED FS1-0730141
7X31X1 PLEATED $ 457 $ 2541 $ 3.19
Manufacturer: LAF NAF SPECIAL AIRGUARD
100 12 | EA X311
Vendor Part Number: SP7311 HCP PLEATED FS1-0730141

Non-Core Items

Section 8

Please Enter

Please Enter

Please Enter

"Yes" or "No" "Yes" or "No" "Yes" or "No"
VENDOR CAN BLOCK AVAILABILITY OF CERTAIN NON-CORE
101 [ITEMS IF REQUESTED BY THE STATE PURCHASING BUREAU YES NO NO
(I.LE., FURNITURE, OFFICE SUPPLIES):
Non-Core ltems Section 9

% OF DISCOUNT OFF
REMAINDER OF

% OF DISCOUNT
OFF REMAINDER

% OF DISCOUNT
OFF REMAINDER

CATALOG OF CATALOG OF CATALOG
102 |HIGH CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (13-15 PLEATS): 30% 30-40% 0%
103 |STANDARD CAPACITY PLEATED FILTERS (10-12 PLEATS): 30% 30-40% 0%
104 |DISPOSABLE CARDBOARD FILTERS: 30% 30-40% 0%
105 [HIGH EFFICIENCY BAG FILTERS, 90-95%: 30% 30-40% 0%
106 |STANDARD EFFICIENCY BAG FILTERS, 80-85%: 30% 30-40% 0%
107 [RIGID BOX FILTERS 80-85% EFFICIENCY: 30% 30-40% 0%
108 |Z LINE CARBOTRON: 30% 30-40% 0%
109 |PLEATED FILTERS: 30% 30-40% 0%
110 |WATER FILTERS: N/A 30-40% 0%
111 |FILTER MEDIA: 30% 30-40% 0%
Payment Terms NET 30 0 N/A 100 30
Delivery Days ARO 7to 10 7-10 7
Comments
Note No Bid

Nebraska Air Filter, Inc. Size bids for lines 74 through
90 of Section 3 are not in compliance with request
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Tri Dim Filter Corporation

Opening Date: 09/04/15



