

				<b>Award E15 Award</b>									
Line #	2016 or Current Production Year Subcompact 4 Door Sedan Flex Fuel Vehicle E85			Anderson Ford		Baxter C-D-J-R		Gene Steffy Auto Group		Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick		Sid Dillon Ford	
	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit Price									
1	Subcompact 4 Door Sedan FFV E85	1	EA	\$ 15,854.00	\$ 15,854.00	\$ 15,822.00	\$ 15,822.00	\$ 17,073.00	\$ 17,073.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 16,133.00	\$ 16,133.00
	Make:			Ford	Ford	Dodge	Dodge	Dart	Dart	Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Ford	Ford
	Model:			Focus	Focus	Dart	Dart	PFDH41	PFDH41	Cruze	Cruze	Focus	Focus
	Series, Code, Trim Level:			P3F, 200A, SE	P3F, 200A, SE	'SE' 'PFDH41'	'SE' 'PFDH41'	SE-24A	SE-24A	1.8L	1.8L	P3F, 200A, SE	P3F, 200A, SE
	Engine:			2.0L I4	2.0L I4	2.0 I4 FFV	2.0 I4 FFV	2.0L I4-DOHC-NON E85	2.0L I4-DOHC-NON E85	1.8L	1.8L	2.0L	2.0L
	EPA:			27/40/21	27/40/21	18-25	18-25	24/34	24/34			27 City/40 Hwy	27 City/40 Hwy
	Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):			90	90	90-120	90-120	90/120	90/120			40-120	40-120
2	Subcompact 4 Door Sedan E15 Compliant	1	EA	\$ 15,854.00	\$ 15,854.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 16,725.00	\$ 16,725.00	\$ 16,133.00	\$ 16,133.00
	Make:			Ford	Ford					Chevrolet	Chevrolet	Ford	Ford
	Model:			Focus	Focus					Cruze	Cruze	Focus	Focus
	Series, Code, Trim Level:			P3F, 200A, SE	P3F, 200A, SE					1PL 69, 1SA, LS	1PL 69, 1SA, LS	P3F, 200A, SE	P3F, 200A, SE
	Engine:			2.0L I4	2.0L I4					1.8L	1.8L	2.0L	2.0L
	EPA:			27/40/31	27/40/31					25 city/36 Hwy	25 city/36 Hwy	27 City/40 Hwy	27 City/40 Hwy
	Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):			90	90					40-120	40-120	40-120	40-120
<b>Options Bid List</b>				<b>Line 1 - E85 FFV Options</b>	<b>Line 2 - Gas Options (Must be E15 Compliant)</b>	<b>Line 1 - E85 FFV Options</b>	<b>Line 2 - Gas Options (Must be E15 Compliant)</b>	<b>Line 1 - E85 FFV Options</b>	<b>Line 2 - Gas Options (Must be E15 Compliant)</b>	<b>Line 1 - E85 FFV Options</b>	<b>Line 2 - Gas Options (Must be E15 Compliant)</b>	<b>Line 1 - E85 FFV Options</b>	<b>Line 2 - Gas Options (Must be E15 Compliant)</b>
3	Engine (other)			\$ 495.00	\$ 495.00	N/A	N/A			NA	NA	\$ 595.00	\$ 595.00
	Specify Engine Size:			1.0L Ecoboost	1.0L Ecoboost			2.0L Non E85		NA	-	1.0L Ecoboost	1.0L Ecoboost
4	Bench front seat, heavy duty.			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA
5	Split front seat, heavy duty.			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA
6	Power heavy duty split front seats.			\$ 295.00	\$ 295.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA
7	Full-size spare tire (rim can be steel).			\$ 495.00	\$ 495.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA
8	Additional fob if equipped with remote keyless entry.			\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	NA	\$ 159.00	\$ 189.00	\$ 189.00
9	Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost Paints.			See Attached	See Attached	See Attached	See Attached	N/C	N/C	NA	See Chart	See Chart	See Chart
10	Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints.			\$ 395.00	\$ 395.00	N/A	N/A	Not Available	Not Available	NA	See Chart	See Chart	See Chart
11	AWD - All Wheel Drive, if available from factory.			N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	NA	NA	NA
12	Reverse sensing system, if available from manufacturer.			\$ 255.00	\$ 255.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	NA	\$ 491.00	\$ 391.00	\$ 391.00
13	Keyless Remote Entry- Shall include two (2) fobs to enter the vehicle.			STD	STD	STD	STD	INC	INC	NA	STD	STD	STD

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Anderson Ford		Baxter C-D-J-R		Gene Steffy Auto Group		Sid Dillon Chevrolet Buick		Sid Dillon Ford	
				Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price		Unit Price	
14	2016 or Current Production Year Subcompact 4 Door Sedan Flex Fuel Vehicle E85 Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.			\$ 2,995.00	\$ 2,995.00	No Bid		\$ 2,010.00		NA	Call for Options	Call for Options	Call for Options
	State: Years and miles			5 yr/100k	5 yr/100k					NA			
15	Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles bought by political entities and other Divisions of Government.			\$ 395.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 400.00		\$ 500.00		NA	\$2.00/per mile 400 Max	\$2.00/per mile 400 Max	\$2.00/per mile 400 Max
16	Protective vinyl body molding; dealer installed if not standard equipment.			\$ 350.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 200.00		N/A		NA	NA	NA	NA
17	Lumbar support front seats: if not standard equipment.			STD	STD	N/A		\$300/ Seat		NA	NA	\$ 364.00	\$ 364.00
Payment Terms				0 30		0		0 30		0 30		0 30	
Delivery Days ARO				90				90/120		40-120		40-120	
Comments													

**No Bid**  
Husker Auto Group LLC

**Award Explanation:**  
Baxter C-D-J-R - withdrew bid.

Sid Dillon Chevy Buick - Secondary Award not granted since model bid had a Cut Off Date of September 24, 2015.

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications and a Secondary Award which may be awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications.