Buyer: Annette Walton

All Native Solutions

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Carpenter Paper Co.

Field Paper Co.

Office Depot /

Office Depot/ Office Depot

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

Omaha Paper

Office Max / Office Max / / Office Max Company
Truckload Case / Pallet
Estimated
Description Line Item Sizes Quantity per Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
M
1 8.5" x 11" 80,000 S 590 | $ 5.87 $4.85 per M $4.848 / M $5.888 / M $5.47 /M 5.65
2 8.5" x 11" 3HP 100 S 6.80 | $ 6.62 $5.45 per M $6.308 / M 5.28/M
3 8.5" x 11" Xprs Pad 4300 S 8.00 | S 7.47 $6.10 per M $5.508 / M 590/M
\éirgin - 20# 4 " x 11" 3HP Xprs | 1500 $ 6.95] $ 7.92 N/A $5.832 /M 6.20/ M
opier Paper, " "
Smooth, White 5 8.5" x 14 1000 S 810 | $ 8.42 $6.90 per M $8.454 /M 6.71 /M
Brightness 92 6 11" x 17" 1000 S 12.80 | $ 13.25 $10.85 per M $12.616 / M 10.55/M
(minimum) Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Laser, and High |Permanence: Yes No Yes
Speec’I Copierg Certified Other Yes Yes / Other Yes Yes Yes Yes
Guaranteed, Ink Boise has Escalator
Jet Compatible. Comments: Lines 1,2,5-5M/CTN Lines |clause on this TSB
' 851001HS,851031,851201, 3,4,6 - 2.5M/CTN All SFI  |quotation, please see
SP8420P, 854001, 117001 Certified attachment.
Boise / Boise
. Multipurpose / Bose .
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Boise X-9
/ 9 Domtar / EG High Speed, | Lines 1,2,5,6 E-Copy - Lines [X-9 / Boise Splox
Willcopy, & Boise 3,4 Spox Boise X-9 Boise X-9 Boise X-9
Brightness: 92/87.5
Opacity: 92 /88 92 /92-94 92 /88 92 /89 92 /89 92/89 )
Value -Virgin- 7 85 x11 6300 | ¢ 590 | § 587|  $4.85Perm $4.848/ M $5.888 / M ssa7/m | 488/M
20# Copier Paper, | Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Smooth, White Permanence: Yes No Yes
Brightne:;s oy Certified Other Yes Yes / Other Yes Yes Yes Yes
(minimum) Laser, | Comments: 5M/CTN SFI Certified
and High Speed . Boise / Boise . )

. Brand / Sheet Bidding: B Multi
Copier Guaranteed, / 9 EG High Speed 851001HS Ecopy Multipurpose Boise X-9 Boise X-9 Boise X-9 oise Tlulipurpose
Ink Jet Compatible. Brightness:

- ! 92 /875
Opacity: 92 /88 92 /92-94 92 /88 92 /89 92 /89 92 /89




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

Virgin - No.1 bond
paper, 20# White
watermarked
(smooth or wove 8 8.5" x 11" 100
finish) Recycled, 87
bright (minimum)
Opacity 86 $ $ 21.89 $20.00 per M $24.52 /M $ 6.75
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence: Y
Yes No Certified Other es Yes / Other Yes Yes Yes
30% PCW / 25%
Comments: 5M/CTN Light Cockle S |Cotton Content
mooth Finish SFI Certified
Neenah / Atlas Bond Platinum Digital - NO
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Southworth, 3162010 Recycled Bright White WATERMARK
Capitol Bond Southworth
Brightness:
Opacity: 95 96 /94 91/88 87 /86 99 /92
9 8.5" x 11" 3,000
S S 8.12 $8.05 per M $7.40 /M 6.90 /M

Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Virgin - No. 1 Permanence: Yes No Yes
Bond / _____ Certified ______ Other Yes Yes Yes Yes
Xerographic Blue, Cherry, Green, Blue, Buff, Canary,
II;alie_r, Orchid, Tan, Buff, Cherry, Cream,

ultipurpose, ) Cream, Goldenrod, Goldenrod, Gray,
20#, Colors. Must Colors Biddina: Blue, Green, Pink, Yellow, Blue. Buff. C ch ) .
contain PC recycled | “010rs Bidding: Goldenrod, Ivory ue, Buff, Canary, Cherry, [Pink, Canary, Gray, Green, Ivory, Lilac,
content (30% Goldenrod, Grey, Green, |lvory, Salmon Orchid, Pink, Salmon,
mi_nimum) Orchid, Pink, Pumpkin, Tan, Turquoise
Bnghtness 92 ) Salmon, Tan 12 Colors
(minimum) Opacity n - o
90 (minimum) Comments: 3R11050, 3R11051, 3R11052, This product is 30%
! 3R11053, 3R11055, 3R11056 5M/CTN 30% PCW Recycled PC
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Xerox Brand Domtar / Earthchoice Hammermill Fore
E-Copy Colors Xerox Pastels Colors
Brightness: 92/ 90
Opacity: _/92-94 N/A on colors 92/90 92 /90




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

10 8.5" x 11" 200
S 9.20 7.83 $7.50 per M $9.20/ M 9.90/M
Virgin - 24# Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Premium or Super |Permanence: Yes No Yes
Premium No. 1, Certified Other Yes / Other Yes Yes
Laser Print, . Comments: 5M/CTN SFI Certified
Smooth, White ) Boise / Boise Polaris
Brand / Sheet Bidding: gtgc;r:éalr/ EG Willcopy Ultra, Premium
Laser Sharp Multipurpose Hammermill Laser Print
Brightness:
Opacity: 98/92 92 /92-94 97 /94 98/92
8.5" x 11" 10
1 S 16.00 17.53 $9.70 per M 9.45 /M
8.5" x 14" 2
S 19.50 22.35 $13.20 per M 12.73 /M
. Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Virgin - 284 Color | pormanence: Yes No yes
Copier Paper Certified Other Yes Yes Yes
Super Premium 8.5x 11 - 4M/CTN Line
No. 1 Ultra Comments:
Smooth White. 8.5x14 - 3M/CTN
Domtar / First Choice Premmi Boise / Boise Polaris
e omtar / First Choice Premium .
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Paper, 85283 / 85291 Premium Color Copy _
firstchoice Paper Navigator Color Copy
Brightness:
Opacity: 98 /94 98/98 98/96 98/94
12 [ ss'xitm | 250 |3 8.00 8.89 $7.85 per M 7.74/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No
Virgin - Text, 60# Certified ___ Other Yes Yes Yes Yes
Uncoated Offset, | Comments: 5M/CTN
White Domtar / Husky
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Domtar / Lynx Digital 2672
/ 9 /Ly § Husky Opaque Offset Williamsburg Offset
Brightness:
Opacity: 9/95 92/92-94 94/ 93 94/92




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

13 8.5" x 11" 200
S 16.50 | $ 22.37 $18.05 per M 17.87 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Virgin - Cover, Permanence: Yes No Yes
65# Uncoated Certified Other Yes Yes Yes
Offset, White Comments: 2M/CTN
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Domtar / Lynx Digital 2677 Domtar / Lynx ‘
E-Copy Opaque Accent Opaquie Cover
Brightness:
" 96 /98
Opacity: / 92 /92-94 96 /98 96 /98
14 8.5" x 11" 200
S 2150 | $ 21.27 N/A See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Virgin - Cover, Certified Other Yes Yes Yes
65# Offset o Blue, Canary, Cream, Gray, Blue, Canary, Cream, Grey,
Opaque, Colors Colors Bidding: Green, Ivory, Green, lvory
. 014052, 014051, 014054,
Comments: 014050, 014053 2.5M/CTN
Brand / Sheet Bidding: 1P /Springhill Earthchoice
Brightness: 08
Opacity: _/92-94
15 8.5" x 11" 5
S 25.40 | $ 19.53 $16.65 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes

Virgin- Cover
67#, Colors

Colors Bidding:

Blue, Canary, Cream,
Goldenrod, Gray, Green, Ivory,

White, Blue, Canary,
Cream, Goldenrod, Grey,
Green, Ivory, Pink, Tan

Blue, Gray, Pink,
Canary, Green, Tan,
Goldenrod, Ivory

026000, 036000, 097000,

Comments: 086008, 066000, 046000,
056000 2M/CTN Colors
Domtar / Earthchoice
Brand / Sheet Bidding: 1P / Springhill Colors Vellum Bristol
Brightness: 97
Opacity: _/92-94 N/A on colors




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

16 11x17 25
S 36.00 30.79 $19.20 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
g:f;MattlS"k Comments: Short Grain 17 x 11 2M/CTN Reams (500)
Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand, 3R11471 Everyday Digital Silk
Brightness:
Opacity: 94/93.5 94/ 97 91/94
17 11x17 25
S 34.33 30.79 $19.20 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Short Grain 17 x 11.Xerox Recycled 10% /
Brand 3R11451
80# Gloss Text  |Comments: 2M/CTN Reams (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand 3R11451

Everyday Digital Gloss

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital

Brightness:

Opacity: 94/93.5 94 /97 89 /94

18 11x17 5

S 51.83 37.09 $24.00 per M See Recycled

Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes

Certified Other Yes Yes

‘lli)rg;‘l;i:tltgllg?llk Recycled 10% /

Comments: Short Grain 17 x 11 1.5M/CTN Reams (500)

Text

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11475

Everyday Digital Silk

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital

Brightness:
Opacity:

94 /94

94 /97

91/96




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

19 11x17 5

S 51.83 38.84 $24.00 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
100# Gloss Text |Comments: 1.5M/CTN Reams (500)
Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand 3R11455 Everyday Digital Gloss
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /95 94 /97 89/96
20 11x17 10
S 64.85 57.64 $36.40 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
. . Certified Other Yes Yes
ngngu?gﬁl Recycled 10% /
Cover Comments: Short Grain 17 x 11 1M/CTN Reams (250)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11479

Everyday Digital Silk

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital

Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /97 94 /97 91/97
21 11x17 5
S 64.85 58.16 $36.40 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
80# Gloss Cover |Comments: Short Grain 17 x 11 1M/CTN Reams (250)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11459

Everyday Digital Gloss

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital

Brightness:

Opacity:

94 /97

94 /97

89/97




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

22 18x12 20

S 70.86 85.78 $52.50 per M See Reycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
o . __ Certified _____ Other Yes Yes
‘1’:;3;‘6:;2:':'& i Satin Finish - Not Dull - Recycled 10% /
short grain Comments: Compatible 5N.CTN Reams (250)
Hansol America Inc. /
Tital Dull Digital
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand, 3R11484 Everyday Digital Silk
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /99 94 /97 91/98
23 12x 18 10
S 59.80 80.23 $27.45 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital ia‘i" Fiﬂti)lsh - Not Dull - Recycled 10% /
100# Dull Text  |Comments: ompatible 1M/CTN Reams of (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11476

Everyday Digital Silk

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital

Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /94 94 /97 91/96
24 12x18 5
S 40.97 35.67 $21.95 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
_ Certified _____ Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
$gftMatte/S|Ik Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 1.5M/CTN Reams (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11472

Everyday Digital Silk

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital

Brightness:

Opacity:

94 /93.5

94 /97

91/94




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

Virgin - Digital
80# Gloss Text

25 12x18 40

S 40.97 35.91 $21.95 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: _ Yes ____ No Yes
__ Certified _____ Other Yes Yes
10% PCW - Reams
Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 1.5M.M (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand. 3R11452

Every Day Digital

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital

Brightness:
Opacity: 94/93.5 94 /97 89/94
26 18 x 12 20
S 40.97 50.65 $43.60 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Virgin - Digital Certified Other Yes Yes
804# Gloss Text - |Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 1.5M/CTN Reams (500)
short grain Mohawk / Mohawk
Color Copy Gloss
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand, 3R11452 Everyday Digital Gloss  [(Pure White)
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /93.5 94 /97 94 /94.5
27 12x 18 25
S 49.86 42.84 $27.45 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified _____ Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
100# Matt/Silk | ens: Short Grain 12 x 18 1M/CTN Reams (500)

Text

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11476

Everyday Digital Silk

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Digital

Brightness:

Opacity:

94 /94

94 /97

91/96




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

28 18x 12 5
S 49.86 64.07 $56.20 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Satin Finish - Not Dull - 1000/ carton {even
100# Dull Text - Compatible, Short Grain 18 x only) / Color- Neon
short grain Comments: 12 1M/CTN White
Mohawk / Mohawk
Color Copy Premium |-
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand, 3R11476 Everyday Digital Silk Tone
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 94 94 /97 100/ 97
29 12x 18 5
S 49.86 44.86 $27.45 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
__ Certified ___ Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
100# Gloss Text |Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 1M/CTN Reams (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11456

Evertday Digital Gloss

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital

Brightness:
Opacity: 95/95 94 /97 89/96
30 18 x 12 20
S 49.86 63.31 $53.05 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Virgin - Digital Certified Other Yes Yes
100# Gloss Text - [Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 1M/CTN Reams (500)
short grain Mohawk / Mohawk

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11456

Color Copy Gloss

Everyday Digital Gloss  [(Pure White)

Brightness:

Opacity:

94 /95

94 /97 94 /96




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OFState Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

31 18x 12 10
S 75.08 67.21 $41.75 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
Virgin - Digital Recycled 10% /
80# Gloss. Cover - | comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 .75M/CTN Reams (250)
Short Grain -
Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand, 3R111460 Everyday Digital Gloss
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /97 94 /97 89/97
32 18 x 12 15
S 70.86 84.02 $52.50 per M See Recycled
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
‘{L’gz‘élmgi::a' Recycled 105% /
oss Cover ) )
Short Grain Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 .5M/CTN Reams (250)
Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Gloss Digital
Brand / Sheet Bidding Xerox Brand 3R11464 Everyday Digital Gloss
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /99 94 /97 89 /98
33 18 x 12 10
S 56.31 66.61 $41.75 per M
Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for
Permanence: Yes No Yes
Certified Other Yes Yes
807 Dull Cover Recycled 10% /
Short Grain Comments: Short Grain 18 x 12 .75M/CTN Reams (250)

Brand / Sheet Bidding

Xerox Brand, 3R11480

Hansol America Inc. /
Titan Dull Cover
Everyday Digital Silk

Brightness:

Opacity: 94 /97 94 /97 91/97

Discount for all other catalog items 42% 55% 20% 30%
PAYMENT TERMS 030 130 1 10/NET30 060 060 060 130
DELIVERY ARO * 1 1T07 7 7 7 1to7

COMMENTS



Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OF

State Paper Contract

Office Depot /

Omaha Paper

All Native Solutions  Carpenter Paper Co. Field Paper Co. Office Max Company
Description Line Item Sizes Estl_mated Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Ouantity per M
34 8.5" x 11" 80,000 6.90 >65/M
> X ! ’ 6.35 | $5.65 per M No bid Boise Repurpos
6.45/M
35 8.5" x 11" 3HP 100 7.30 . / .
7.05 | $6.80 per M No bid Great White
6.45 /M
36 8.5" x 11" Xprs Pac 4200 7.40 X / .
8.00 | N/A No bid Great White
6.45/M
37 8.5" x 11" 3HP Xprs Pac 1400 6.95 X / .
8.35 | N/A No bid Great White
38 8.5" x 14" 1000 9.10 8.20/M
5" x . R
8.75 | $8.65 per M No bid Great White
Recycled - 20# 39 11" x 17" 800 14.60 _ 12.90/M
Copier Paper, 13.85 | $13.60 per M No bid Great White
Smooth, White
Brightness 92 Meets \/{\NSI/NISO 23'\‘9.48-1992(R?:0(:t9_2 fgr Permanerécti: Yes
e es o ertifie er
(Lm|n|mumd)H_ A — —_— E— — Yes / Other Yes
aser, and Hi - -
Speed Copierg Lines 34,35,37 - 5M/CTN Boise has Escalator
Guaranteed, Ink | comments: 651001, 651031, 851601, SP- |Lines 36,37 - 2.5M/CTN All SFI [clause on this TSB 81/2x11-20# Is
Jet Compatible. 8420P, 654001 Certified quotation, please see Boises's
attachment "Repurpose"
Lines 34, 35, 38, 39 - Laser Boise / Boise
) X Sharp Lines 36, 37 - Splox Repurpose 30% Boise's "Repurpose"
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Domtar / Willcopy, & Boise 30% P P B p z 3004 nd Gr tvr\)/hif for
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 30% ° olse Aspen 30 7 a ea eto
all support sizes
30%
% Recycled 50%
Brightness: Brightness -
o;im;‘,ess' 92/388 Repurpose 30 is 92
92/92-94 Aspen30is 92 / 89.5 92/87.5
40 8.5" x 11" 6300 6.90 6.35
Value Recycled $5.65 per M No bid 5.65/M
20# Copier Meets ANSI/NISO 739.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence: Y
Paper, Smooth, Yes No Certified Other es Yes / Other Yes
White
Brightness 92 Comments:
(minimum) SM/CTN
i Boi Boi
Laser, and High | go4 / Sheet Bidding: Willcopy, 651001 oise / Boise o .
Speed Copier % Post Consumer (PC) Content: 30% Repurpose 30% / Boise's "Repurpose
Guaranteed, Ink Laser Sharp 30% Boise Aspen 30% 30%
Jet Compatible.
% Recycled 50% 30%
Brightness: 92/88
Opacity: 92/92-94 Aspen 30is 92 .89.5 92 /87.5

Opening Date: 8/27/2015



Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OF
State Paper Contract

Print, Smooth,
White

41 8.5" x 11" 100 13.00 no bid $20.00 per M No bid See Virgin
Recycled - No.1 | veets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence: v
bond paper, Yes No Certified Other es
20# White
watermarked 30% PCW / 25%
(smooth or wove | Comments: Cotton Content /
finish) Recycled, Remas (500)
87 bright
L Neenah / Atlas Bond
(m|n|_mum) Brand / Sheet Bidding: Neenah / Southworth, 403C | d/ ieht Whi
Opacity 86 % Post Consumer (PC) Content: 25% Recycled Bright White
(minimum)
% Recvycled
Brightness:
Opacity: 0/ 91/ __
42 8.5" x 11" 3,000 7.30 no bid
$8.05 per M No bid 6.90/ M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence: Yes
Recycled - No. Yes No Certified Other Yes
1 Bond / Blue, Cherry, Green, Blue, Buff, Canary,
Xerographic Orchid,Tan, Buff, Cherry, Cream,
:IE:J[:;:urpose Cream, Goldenrod, Goldenrod, Gray,
'’ . . .
20#, Colors. Colors Bidding: Blue, Green, Pink, Yellow, Pink, Canary, Gray, Gree.n, Iv?ry, Lilac,
Must contain PC Goldenrod, Ivory Ivory, Salmon Orchid, Pink,
recycled content Salmon, Tan,
(30% minimum) Turquoise
Brightness 92
(minimum)
Opacity 90 Comments: 3R11050, 3R11051, 3R11052, . )
(minimum) 3R11053, 3R11055, 3R11056 30% PCW 30%
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Xerox Brand Domtar / Earthchoice Hammermill Fore
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 30% Colors Colors
% Recycled N/A on colors
Brightness:
Opacity: /88 92/90
43 8.5" x 11" 150 10.58 no bid
9.75[No bid See Virgin
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Recycled - 24# Yes No Certified Other Yes
Premium or Yes
Super Premium | Comments: Color - True White /
No. 1, Laser Reams (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding:
% Post Consumer (PC) Content:

Finch, 38006004
10%

Rolland / Rolland Hi
Tech

30%

Brightness:
Opacity:

93 /98

96 /94

Opening Date: 8/27/2015



Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OF
State Paper Contract

Opening Date: 8/27/2015

44 8.5" x 11" 10 18.40 no bid $12.10 per M No bid See Virgin
45 8.5" x 14" 2 22.43 no bid $15.50 per M No bid See Virgin
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
i Yes
Recycled- 28# Yes No Certified Other Yes
Color Copier Comments: Color - True White /
Paper Super Reams (500)
Premium No. 1 Brand / Sheet Bidding Rolland / Rolland Hi
Ultra Smooth d 1dding: : ollan olland Hi
White. % Post Consumer (PC) Content: Finch, 38007004, & Domtar / Tech
' First Choice 85291
10%
% Recvcled 30%
Brightness:
Opacity: 95/98 96 /95
46 8.5"x11 2,500 960 no bid $9.75 per M No bid See Virgin
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes
Recycled- Text, [ Comments: Color - True White /
60# Uncoated
Offset, White — Reams (500) _
Brand / Sheet Bidding: Domtar / Earthchoice 9250 Rolland / Rolland Hi
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 30% Tech
% Recvcled 30%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94/ 93 96 /94
47 8.5" x 11" 200 21.50 no bid $26.05 per M No bid See Virgin
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes v
Recycled - s
Cover, 65# Comments: Color - True White /
Uncoated Reams (250)
Offset, White [ Brand / Sheet Bidding: Domtar / Cougar, 5463 Rolland / Rolland Hi
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 10% Tech
% Recycled 30%
Brightness:
Opacity: 98/ 98 96 /94




Buyer: Annette Walton

5073 OF
State Paper Contract

48 8.5"x 11" 200 21.50 no bid N/A No bid 20.06 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z739.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes
Colors Bidding: Cream, Ivor
Recycled - Blue, Canary, Cream, Green, VoY,
Cover, 65# vory Canary, Blue, Green
Offset Opaque,
Colors Comments: 014052, 014051, 014054,
014050, 014053
Brand / Sheet Bidding: IP / Springhill Springhill
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 10% 30%
% Recvcled
Brightness:
Opacity: /98 92/90
49 8.5" x 11" 100 25.40 no bid 16.60 No bid 16.46 / M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes Certified
Colors Bidding: Cream, Ivory, Yellow, Cream, Ivory,
orchid, Blue, Pink, Canary, Goldenrod,
Blue, Canary, Cream, Tan, Green, Peach, Tan, Peach, Pink,
Recycled - Goldenrod, Gray, Green, Ivory, Gray, Gold Orchid, Blue, Green,
Cover 67#, Gray
Colors
Comments: 026000, 036000, 097000,
086008, 066000, 046000,
056000
Brand / Sheet Bidding: o Brand - Neenah / Springhill Vallum
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: IP / Springhill Exact Vellum Bristol Bristol
10%
30%
30% Recycled / Reams
% Recycled (500)
Brightness:
nmgrih,. 197 N/A on Colors 92/90
27.00/CS/111/cs
23 x 35" .026 thickness,
50 111 per bundle 10 17.19 237.68
$21.00 per (100) No bid
28.08 /¢cs/ 900/ cs
51 8.5 x 11", .026 thickness 20 30.45 28.38
$28.00 per M No bid
2808 / cs / 450/ cs
52 11 x 17", .026 thickness 25 60.90 51.19
Chipboard, Must $56.00 per M No bid
contain Post Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Consumer (PC) Yes No Certified Other Yes
recycled content Other no
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Comments:

made from recycled paper.
Thickness 0.022

line 50 - 99/BDL, line 51 -
855/BDL, line 52 - 427/bdl

Brand / Sheet Bidding:
% Post Consumer (PC) Content:

Chipboard,

Beloit Box Board

Recycled Digital
80# Gloss Text

Company
2335022,8511022,1117022 100% 10%
% Recvcled 100% 100%
Brightness:
Opacity: N/A on Chipboard
53 packed in cartons 5 241.00 no bid 243.81/M
$260.00 per M No bid 500/ cs
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Manila Tags, Yes No
24" X 36", 150#, | Comments: 500/carton
Must contain PC | Brand / Sheet Bidding: Wausau / Exact, 49962 Neenah / Exact Springhill Tab
recycled content |% Post Consumer (PC) Content: 30% Manila Tag 10%
% Recycled 30%
Brightness:
Opacity: N/A on Manilla
54 11x17 25 26.00 no bid 19.20 No bid 19.92/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Recycled - Yes No
Digital 80# Comments: Dull Reams (500) silk
Matt/Silk Text Burand / Sheet Bidding ' New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. /
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital 4832 Titan Dull Digital
10% Moorim "Pro Digital"
% Recycled 10%
Brightness: 94 /945 91/91 91/96
55 11x17 25 26.00 no bid 19.20 No bid 1992 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Comments:
Reams (500)

Brand / Sheet Bidding
% Post Consumer (PC) Content:

New Page / Sterling Premium

Hansol America Inc. /

Moorim "Por Digital

Digital 8735 Titan Gloss Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94/94.5 89/94 91/98
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56 11x17 5 28.00 no bid $24.00 per M No bid 2490 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital| Comments: Dull Reams (500) Silk
:’:)‘(,t# Matt/Sill oB/r?Dnd:(S:heet Biddi?;gc Content: New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / MOFJFIT Pro
6 Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Dull Digital Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /96 91/96 91 /98
57 11x17 5 28.00 no bid $24.00 per M No bid 24.90 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital| Comments: Reams (500)
100# Gloss oB/r?Dnd{(S:hiet glg?|rgc Contont. New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / l\/!gornr Pro
Text 6 Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Gloss Digital Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /96 89 /96 91/98
58 11x17 10 41.00 no bid $36.40 per M No bid 38.29/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
. Comments:
Recycled Digital 17 x 11, Dull Reams (250)
go#Matte/s“k (l)arand | Sheet Bidding New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / Moorim "Pro
over % Post Consumer (PC) Content: g Digtal s} Titan Dull Digital Digital"
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /98 91/97 91/98
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59 11x17 5 41.00 no bid $36.40 per M No bid 38.29/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital Comments: Reams (250)
ggfefloss Brand / Sheet Bidding Hansol America Inc. /
o .
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: New Page / Sterling Premium Titan Gloss Digital Moorim "Pro Digital
Digital 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /98 91/98 91/98
60 18 x 12 20 65.00 no bid $52.50 per M No bid 55.29 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
R led Digital Yes No
ecycled Digita - -
100# Dull comments: ___ Reams (250) Silk
Cover - short 5ra'13nd { (S:heet B|dd|r|13gc Contont. New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / o o
grain o Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Dull Digital Moorim "Pro Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94/99 91/98 91/98
61 12 x 18 10 40.00 no bid $27.45 No bid 28.76 /| M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Comments: Reams (500) Silk

Recycled Digital
100# Dull Text

Brand / Sheet Bidding
% Post Consumer (PC) Content:

New Page / Sterling Premium

Hansol America Inc. /

Digital Titan Dull Digital Moorim "Pro Digital
10% 10%

% Recycled 10%

Brightness:

Opacity: 94/ 96 91/96 91 /98
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30.00 no bid 21.95 No bid 23.01/M
62 12 x 18
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital| Comments: Dull Reams (500) Silk
80+# Matte/Silk iddi " —
Text ! 5?:5: gZEELSng?I(rEC) Content: New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / MO.OHT Pro
° : Digital Titan Dull Digital Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /94.5 91/94 91/98
63 12x 18 40 30.00 no bid $21.95 per M No bid 23.01/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital{Comments: Reams (500)
80# Gloss Text [Brang / Sheet Bidding New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. /
9 : L - .
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Gloss Digital Moorim "Pro Digital
10% 10%
|% Recvcled 10%
Brightness: 94 /94.5 89/94 91/98
64 18 x 12 20 30.00 no bid N/A No bid 23.01/M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
No
Recycled Digital| Comments:
80# Gloss Text 4{Brand / Sheet Bidding ]
Appl T
short grain % Post Consumer (PC) Content: ppleton Coaitgg‘( Utopia Two, Moorim "Pro Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled
Brightness:
Opacity: 95/91 91/98
65 12 x 18 25 40.00 no bid $27.45 per M No bid 28.76 / M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital| Comments: .
100# Matt/Silk — Dull Reams (500) ; Silk
Text ran eet Bidding N ' . Hansol America Inc. Moorim "Pro
o . ew Page / Sterling Premium L
% Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Dull Digital Digital"
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94/96 91/96 91/98
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66 18x 12 5 40.00 no bid N/A No bid 28.76 / M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z739.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
No
. Comments:
Recycled Digital Silk
1:30: DuI.I Text 15rand / Sheet Bidding New Page / Sterling Premium Moorim "Pro
short grain . N
9 % Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /96 91/98
67 12x 18 5 40.00 no bid $27.45 per M No bid 28.76 / M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital| Comments: Reams (500)
'::.'::t# Gloss Bo/ragd / Scheet Biddi”gc . _ New Page / Sterling Premium Hansol America Inc. / MO.OHT "Pro
6 Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Gloss Digital Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /96 89 /96 91/98
40.00 no bid N/A No bid 28.76 | M
68 18 x 12 20
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
No
Recycled Digital| Comments:
100# Gloss Brand / Sheet Bidding _ Moorim "Pro
Text - short o4 post Consumer (PC) Content: Appleton Coated / Utopia Two, Digital"
grain 31566 g
10% 10%
% Recycled
Brightness:
Opacity: 96.5/91 91/98
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69 18x 12 10 55.00 no bid $41.75 per M No bid 44.23 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Recycled Digital | Comments: Reams (250)
80# Gloss Brand / Sheet Bidding H i
. . ansol America Inc. /
Cover - Short - New Page / Sterling Premium . o
Grain % Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Gloss Digital Moorim "Pro Digital
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /98 89/97 91/98
70 18 x 12 15 74.00 no bid $52.50 per M No bid 55.29 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
R ed Yes No
ecycled - I ™
Digital 100# Bomg’z: —— Rleams (250) —
Gloss Cover - ran eet Bidding N ' ) Hansol American Inc. oorin "Pro
o . ew Page / Sterling Premium .
Short Grain % Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital / Titan Gloss Digital Digital"
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity: 94 /99 89/98 91/98
71 18 x 12 10 58.00 no bid $41.75 per M No bid 4423 /M
Meets ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992(R2009) for Permanence:
Yes No Certified Other Yes
Yes No
Ci ts: i
Recycled Digital B?a:;nfgrlet Bidding R|eams ('250) / Moori ‘S:I;k
804# Dull Cover- N : . Hansol America Inc. oorim "Pro
0 . ew Page / Sterling Premium
Short Grain % Post Consumer (PC) Content: Digital Titan Dull Digital"
10% 10%
% Recycled 10%
Brightness:
Opacity:
pacty 94/98 91/97 91/98
Discount for all other catalog items: % 42% 55% 20% 30%
PAYMENT TERMS 030 130 110 Net30 060 130
DELIVERY ARO * 1 1to7 7 1to7

COMMENTS
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