
Buyer: Rita Schwabe 5052 OF

Nebraska Dept of Roads
Opening Date: July 15, 2015

Description Qty UOM  Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-1 439500.0000 GL  $1.26 / gal $553,770.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

2 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-2 18000.0000 GL  $1.17 / gal $21,060.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

3 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-3 18000.0000 GL  $1.28 / gal $23,040.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

4 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-4 242000.0000 GL  $1.29 / gal $312,180.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

5 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-5 920000.0000 GL  $1.29 / gal $1,186,800.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

6 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-6 205000.0000 GL  $1.29 / gal $264,450.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

7 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-7 70500.0000 GL  $1.29 / gal $90,945.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

8 MELTDOWN APEX DIST-8 40500.0000 GL  $1.29 / gal $52,245.00  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

9 BEET 55 DIST-1 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.16 $20,880.00

10 BEET 55 DIST-2 75000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.15 $94,875.00

11 BEET 55 DIST-3 445500.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.12 $498,960.00

12 BEET 55 DIST-4 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.21 $21,780.00

13 BEET 55 DIST-5 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.15 $20,700.00

14 BEET 55 DIST-6 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.24 $22,320.00

15 BEET 55 DIST-7 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.31 $23,580.00

16 BEET 55 DIST-8 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID $1.25 $22,500.00

17 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-1 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

18 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-2 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

19 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-3 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

20 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-4 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

21 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-5 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

22 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-6 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

23 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-7 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

24 FREEZGARD ZERO DIST-8 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID  NA 

25 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-1 18000.0000 GL $1.240 $22,320.000  NA 

26 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-2 18000.0000 GL $1.240 $22,320.000  NA 

27 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-3 18000.0000 GL $1.380 $24,840.000  NA 

28 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-4 18000.0000 GL $1.280 $23,040.000  NA 

29 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-5 18000.0000 GL $1.635 $29,430.000  NA 

30 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-6 18000.0000 GL $1.480 $26,640.000

31 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-7 18000.0000 GL $1.380 $24,840.000

32 FREEZGARD CI+ DIST-8 18000.0000 GL $1.495 $26,910.000

33 GEOMELT 55 DIST-1 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

34 GEOMELT 55 DIST-2 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

35 GEOMELT 55 DIST-3 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

36 GEOMELT 55 DIST-4 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

37 GEOMELT 55 DIST-5 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

38 GEOMELT 55 DIST-6 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 
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39 GEOMELT 55 DIST-7 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

40 GEOMELT 55 DIST-8 18000.0000 GL  NO BID  NO BID 

$2,504,490.00 $200,340.00 $725,595.00

0  30

Total

Comments

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms

10

0  0

Alternate product offered-see attached doumentation

IceBan 305 - Dist-1, Qty 40,000, UOM/GL, Unit price 

$1.395, Ext. price $55,800.00

IceBan 305 - Dist-2, Qty 40,000, UOM/GL, Unit price 

$1.395, Ext. price $55,800.00 

IceBan 305 - Dist-3, Qty 40,000, UOM/GL, Unit price 

$1.395, Ext. price $55,800.00

IceBan 305 - Dist-4, Qty 40,000, UOM/GL, Unit price 

$1.430, Ext. price $57,200.00

N/A

53-7
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