
Buyer:  Rita Schwabe 4892 OF Rebid

Department of Roads
Opening Date:  03/03/15

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT HWY 77 & 109 

NE OF WAHOO

4300.0000 CY  $            54.95  $   236,285.00  $            56.63  $   243,509.00 

2

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

WAHOO YARD 1/2 

MI NE OF WAHOO 

ON HWY 77 

2311 ASPEN ST 

WAHOO NE 68066 

550.0000 CY  $            54.95  $     30,222.50  $            56.63  $     31,146.50 

3

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT DWIGHT & 66 

SE OF DAVID CITY

1200.0000 CY  $            54.75  $     65,700.00  $            58.74  $     70,488.00 

4

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 15 & 92 SE OF 

DAVID CITY

1500.0000 CY  $            54.75  $     82,125.00  $            58.74  $     88,110.00 

5

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

SEWARD YARD 

2500 S HWY 15 

SEWARD NE 

68434

500.0000 CY  $            55.05  $     27,525.00  $            57.13  $     28,565.00 

6

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 79 & 34 W OF 

LINCOLN

600.0000 CY  $            52.30  $     31,380.00  $            55.53  $     33,318.00 

Buildex, Inc. TRNLWB LLC-Trinity ES&C
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7

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

GREENWOOD 

YARD 

GREENWOOD 

INTERCHANGE 

12909 238TH ST 

GREENWOOD NE 

68366

900.0000 CY  $            52.60  $     47,340.00  $            55.24  $     49,716.00 

8

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 8 MP 48 

FAIRBURY 

2000.0000 CY  $            52.60  $   105,200.00  $            54.79  $   109,580.00 

9

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 8 MP 62 

FAIRBURY

1500.0000 CY  $            52.60  $     78,900.00  $            54.79  $     82,185.00 

10

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 15 MP 12 

FAIRBURY

1500.0000 CY  $            52.60  $     78,900.00  $            54.79  $     82,185.00 

11

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 15 MP 24 

FAIRBURY 

2500.0000 CY  $            52.60  $   131,500.00  $            54.79  $   136,975.00 

12

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 41 MP 42.5 

DORCHESTER 

2500.0000 CY  $            53.75  $   134,375.00  $            55.78  $   139,450.00 

13

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 33 MP 3 

DORCHESTER

1200.0000 CY  $            53.75  $     64,500.00  $            55.78  $     66,936.00 

14

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 103 MP 50 

SALT VALLEY

2000.0000 CY  $            52.60  $   105,200.00  $            55.78  $   111,560.00 
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15

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 43 1 MI S OF 

EAGLE 

2000.0000 CY  $            51.35  $   102,700.00  $            54.79  $   109,580.00 

16

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 73 & 67 2 MI E 

OF VERDON

2000.0000 CY  $            47.60  $     95,200.00 No Bid

17

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 75 & 67 5 MI N 

OF AUBURN

1000.0000 CY  $            49.00  $     49,000.00 No Bid

18

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 105 AT 

JOHNSON

1500.0000 CY  $            49.40  $     74,100.00 No Bid

19

D-3 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

NORTH SIDE OF N-

32 1 MI EAST OF 

MADISON

600.0000 CY  $            60.60  $     36,360.00  $            60.21  $     36,126.00 

20

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 81 & 74 

STRANG YARD

5500.0000 CY  $            50.75  $   279,125.00  $            54.06  $   297,330.00 

21

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 8 MP 24 

CHESTER 

2700.0000 CY  $            49.50  $   133,650.00  $            54.06  $   145,962.00 

22

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8  

W JCT HWY 81 & 

92 W OF 

OSCELOA

2100.0000 CY  $            54.82  $   115,122.00  $            57.13  $   119,973.00 

23

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 183 MP 50 

ELM CREEK

2100.0000 CY  $            57.00  $   119,700.00  $            60.24  $   126,504.00 
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24

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8  I-

80 EXIT 305 ALDA

550.0000 CY  $            54.27  $     29,848.50  $            59.74  $     32,857.00 

25

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8

 I-80 EXIT 285 

GIBBON 

1000.0000 CY  $            58.05  $     58,050.00  $            59.50  $     59,500.00 

26

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 6 MP 205 5 

MI WEST OF 

HASTINGS

1600.0000 CY  $            54.60  $     87,360.00  $            57.26  $     91,616.00 

27

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 14 MP 7 5 MI 

NORTH OF 

SUPERIOR 

1000.0000 CY  $            50.60  $     50,600.00  $            54.06  $     54,060.00 

28

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 281 MP 20 14 

MI NORTH OF 

RED CLOUD

2000.0000 CY  $            52.60  $   105,200.00  $            54.06  $   108,120.00 

29

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 34 MP 247 

3.5 MI WEST OF 

AURORA

2000.0000 CY  $            53.60  $   107,200.00  $            56.62  $   113,240.00 

30

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

FULLERTON 

YARD E SIDE OF 

N-14 S EDGE OF 

FULLERTON 

54957 STATE 

HWY 14 

FULLERTON NE 

68638 

2000.0000 CY  $            55.10  $   110,200.00  $            59.74  $   119,480.00 
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31

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 11 MP 78 1 

MI N OF ORD 

2000.0000 CY  $            62.42  $   124,840.00  $            60.74  $   121,480.00 

32

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

CENTRAL CITY 

YARD 

INDUSTRIAL 

PARK 1406 6TH 

ST CENTRAL 

CITY, NE 68826 

2000.0000 CY  $            55.80  $   111,600.00  $            59.24  $   118,480.00 

33

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 83 & 23 20 MI 

SOUTH OF 

NORTH PLATTE

2000.0000 CY  $            64.93  $   129,860.00  $            58.53  $   117,060.00 

34

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT 23 & 25 1 MI E 

OF WALLACE 

2500.0000 CY  $            65.50  $   163,750.00  $            58.53  $   146,325.00 

35

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

GOTHENBURG 

YARD HWY N-47 S 

123 LAKE AVE 

GOTHENBURG NE 

69138

5000.0000 CY  $            62.42  $   312,100.00  $            60.74  $   303,700.00 

36

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

OVERTON 

STOCKPILE 3/4 MI 

S OF OF I-80 ON 

THE WEST SIDE 

2000.0000 CY  $            59.76  $   119,520.00  $            60.74  $   121,480.00 

37

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 383 MP 112 

STAPLETON 

YARD 

1000.0000 CY  $            67.37  $     67,370.00  $            62.21  $     62,210.00 
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38

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 83 MP 151 

THEDFORD 

NORTH

1000.0000 CY  $            67.75  $     67,750.00  $            62.21  $     62,210.00 

39

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 2 MP 144 

HYANNIS WEST

1000.0000 CY  $            72.40  $     72,400.00  $            63.68  $     63,680.00 

40

D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

JCT HWY 44 & 

L50A 

1000.0000 CY No Bid  $            59.24  $     59,240.00 

41

D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 283 MP 25 4 

MI NORTH OF 

ARAPAHOE

1200.0000 CY  $            59.85  $     71,820.00  $            59.13  $     70,956.00 

42

D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 136 MP 9 1 

MI W OF OXFORD

1200.0000 CY  $            58.65  $     70,380.00  $            57.76  $     69,312.00 

43

D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 34 MP 30.4

1000.0000 CY  $            63.75  $     63,750.00  $            56.35  $     56,350.00 

44

D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 

HWY 6 MP 9.4

2000.0000 CY  $            69.45  $   138,900.00  $            56.35  $   112,700.00 

45

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 

HWY 50 MP 14 

PAWNEE CITY

1500.0000 CY  $            49.20  $     73,800.00 No Bid

46

D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 

JCT HWY 77 & 112 

BEATRICE

1000.0000 CY  $            53.15  $     53,150.00  $            54.79  $     54,790.00 
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47

D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 

HWY 14 MP 7.5 MI 

NORTH OF 

SUPERIOR

1000.0000 CY  $            50.60  $     50,600.00  $            54.79  $     54,790.00 

48

D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 

OGALLALA YARD 

307 EAST D ST 

OGALLALA NE 

69153

500.0000 CY  $            65.65  $     32,825.00  $            58.35  $     29,175.00 

49
D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
1000.0000 CY  $            55.90  $     55,900.00  $            59.00  $     59,000.00 

50
D-2 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
200.0000 CY  $            55.95  $     11,190.00  $            59.00  $     11,800.00 

51
D-3 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
200.0000 CY  $            67.83  $     13,566.00  $            62.66  $     12,532.00 

52
D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
1000.0000 CY  $            63.50  $     63,500.00  $            59.00  $     59,000.00 

53
D-5 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
200.0000 CY  $            80.85  $     16,170.00  $            62.66  $     12,532.00 

54
D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
1000.0000 CY  $            71.16  $     71,160.00  $            62.66  $     62,660.00 

55
D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
1000.0000 CY  $            69.60  $     69,600.00  $            62.66  $     62,660.00 

56
D-8 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X #8 
200.0000 CY  $            74.80  $     14,960.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

57
D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            55.90  $     11,180.00 No Bid

58
D-2 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            55.95  $     11,190.00 No Bid

59
D-3 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            67.83  $     13,566.00 No Bid

60
D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            63.50  $     12,700.00 No Bid
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61
D-5 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            80.85  $     16,170.00  $            75.75  $     15,150.00 

62
D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            71.16  $     14,232.00  $            75.75  $     15,150.00 

63
D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            69.60  $     13,920.00  $            75.75  $     15,150.00 

64
D-8 EXPANDED 

SHALE 3/4" X 3/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            74.80  $     14,960.00  $            75.75  $     15,150.00 

65
D-1 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            57.30  $     11,460.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

66
D-2 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            57.40  $     11,480.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

67
D-3 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            72.30  $     14,460.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

68
D-4 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            63.50  $     12,700.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

69
D-5 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            84.00  $     16,800.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

70
D-6 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            74.50  $     14,900.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

71
D-7 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            71.44  $     14,288.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

72
D-8 EXPANDED 

SHALE 1/4" X 1/8" 
200.0000 CY  $            78.90  $     15,780.00  $            70.75  $     14,150.00 

 $       4,285.86  $5,032,815.00  $       3,897.38  $4,780,143.50 

N/A

Total

0 0

30Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms
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Comments
All Materials are bid with Delivery 

in End Dump Trailers.
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