Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

4822 OF

Opening Date:10/03/14

Statewide
Secondary Primary
Award Award
E85 Award
ﬁ 2015 Current Production Year Large Sport Utility Vehicle | Anderson Erdkamp Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE|  Sid Dillon Sid Dillon Sid Dillon
= 7 Passenger Ford Motors, Inc | Group, Inc. DODGE Chev Buick | Chev Buick Ford
1) (2)
Description QTY[{UOM]| Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 [2015 Large SUV 7 Passenger 1 EA | $ 26,997.00| $ 26,654.00| $ 24,999.00 | $ 26,074.00| $ 44,570.00| $ 24,793.00| $ 32,530.00
4x4 or AWD: 4X4 AWD AWD AWD 4X4 AWD 4X4
Make: Ford Dodge Chevrolet DODGE Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford
Model: Explorer Durango Traverse DURANGO Tahoe Traverse Expedition
Series, Code, Trim Level: K8B, 100A, SXT/ Traverse- | SXT''WDEL75'| CK15706 - [ CV14526,L$| U1G, 101A,
base WDEL75 CV14526- 1FL XL
Base
Engine: 3.5L 3.6L V6 LLT 3.6L V6 3.6L V-6 5.3L 3.6L 3.5L
SIDI
EPA: 17 city/23 14/22 C16/23H 17-24 16 city - 22 | 16city-23 | 15city - 20
highway Hwy Hwy Hwy
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 60-120 35/125 90-120 40-120 40-120
(number/days).
2 |2015 E85 Large SUV 7 Passenger 1 EA | $ 26,997.00 SAA No Bid $ 26,074.00| $ 44,570.00 No Bid No Bid
Engine: 3.5L SAA LLT 3.6L 3.6L V-6 FFV 5.3L
4x4 or AWD: 4X4 SAA AWD AWD 4X4
Make: Ford SAA NA DODGE Chevrolet
Model: Explorer SAA DURANGO Tahoe
Series Code, Trim Level: K8B, 100A, SAA SXT''WDEL75' | CK15706 -
Base 1FL
EPA: 17 city/23 SAA 13-17 16 city - 22
highway Hwy
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 SAA 90-120 40-120
(number/days).
OPTION BID LIST
3 |Engine, Diesel with block heater, factory or dealer N/a n/a NA N/A NA N/A NA
installed.
Specify Engine Size:
4 |Engine, Gasoline (other). N/a n/a NA N/A NA NA NA

Specify Engine Size:
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Description |QTY| UOM| Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
5 |Heavy duty bench front seat W/lumbar support (deduct). N/a n/a NA N/A NA NA NA
6 |40-40 power bucket electric seats. STd - Drivers n/a $ 660.00 N/A $ 52500 $ 567.00| $ 240.00
w/Pwr lumbar Power Drivers| Drivers side |Power Drivers
Drivers seat seat
7 140-40 manual cloth bucket seats. N/a standard Std STD. NA $ 220.00 NA
8 |Console between front seats (deduct). N/a standard NA STD. NA NA N/A
9 |Third Rear Seat Removed (deduct). N/a no charge NA N/C $ (150.00) NA $ (280.00)
10 |Additional remote fob from manufacturer. $ 150.00( $ 150.00| $ 159.00( $ 160.00 | $ 96.00| $ 83.00( $ 123.00
(DEALER)
11 |Standard Paint- Attach List and Identify as No Additional STD - See no charge NC See SEE see see attached| see attached
Cost Paints Attch attached ATTACHED attachment
12 |Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as $ 395.00 n/a NA SEE see NA NA
Extra Cost Paints. Ruby Red & ATTACHED attachment
White
platinum
13 [Second Power Outlet. STd standard Std N/A STD STD STD
14 |Trailer towing package (deduct). $ (150.00)| $ (370.00)|$ (247.00) NOT BID $ (250.00)[$ (280.00)] $ (249.00)
15 |2 wheel drive model (deduct). $ (1,050.00)| $ (450.00)[ $ (930.00) NO BID $ (1,670.00)| $ (1,160.00)| $ (1,544.00)
Specify: FWD or RWD: FWD RWD FWD FWD RWD
16 |Protective safety cage postion determined by the Fleet $ 695.00 no bid $ 939.00 N/A $ 1,100.00( $ 1,100.00( $ 1195.00
Manager. when avail
17 |Stability traction control system (if not available as STd standard Std STD. STD STD STD
standard equipment).
18 |Reverse sensing system if available from factory. $ 275.00 n/a $ 597.00 N/A $ 220.00 NA NA
Dealer
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19 |Keyless remote entry lock system With (2) fobs if not STd standard Std STD. $ 240.00| $ 220.00( $ 240.00
standard equipment.
20 |Dual mode temp system for interior if not standard N/a standard NA STD. NA NA NA
equipment.
21 |Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. $ 295.00( $ 500.00| $ 500.00( $ 400.00 $ 400.00( $ 400.00( $ 400.00
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment
outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would
be for vehicles bought by political entities and other
Divisions of Government.
22 |Protective vinyl body moulding: dealer installed if not $ 295.00 no bid $ 309.00 N/A NA NA NA
standard equipment.
23 |Lumbar support front seats: if not standard equipment. STD-Drivers n/a Std N/A STD STD STD
Drivers Drivers
Payment Terms: 0 30 0 15 $ - 0 30 0 30 0 30
Delivery Days ARO: $ 90.00 35/125 40-120 40-120

Comments:

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which is
awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications, and a Secondary Award which may be
awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications.

Invalid Bids

Erdkamp Motors, Inc. and Performance Dodge - Do not meet specifications for 1.BB. Trailer Tow.
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