Sy i! : Gerry A. Olignmueller
AdministrativeServices Acting Director

Dave Heineman, Governor

Rejection of Bids

Date: October 10, 2014
To: All Bidders
From: Dianna Gilliland, Buyer

State Purchasing Bureau
RE: Invitation to Bid (ITB) 4819 OF

The State of Nebraska is rejecting all bids received on the above referenced Invitation to Bid for
Police ¥2 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Pickup Truck.

Your firm may participate when new proposals are solicited. Thank you for your interest in doing
business with the State of Nebraska.

Mateniel Division « Bo Botelho, Administrator
Sdnirishative Sewies ® {526K Strest Sute 130 *P.0O. Box 94847 * Lincan, Nekvaska B3509-4847 ® Phone: 402-F 1{-6500 * Fax 402471-2089




Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4819 OF Opening Date: 10/03/14
Statewide
ﬁ 2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton Anderson Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE Sid Dillon
,5 Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle Ford Group, Inc DODGE Chev Buick
(SSV) Pickup Truck
Description QTY| UO Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 |[POLICE1/2 TONCREW CAB4X44 | 1 |EA | $ 30,598.00| $ 33,670.00| $ 28,700.00( $ 30,390.00
DOOR SSV PICKUP TRUCK
Make: Ford Chevrolet DODGE Chevrolet
Model: F150 Silverado RAM Silverado
GVWR: 7050 7200 6900 7200
Series, Code, Trim Level: W1E, 101A, [1500-CK15543{ 1500 'DS6T98' 1500,
SSV Base LS CK15543, WT
Engine: 5.0L V8 L83-5.3L 5.7L V-8 HEMI 5.3L
Ecotec3
Transmission No. /Gear Ratio No.: 3.31/XL3 MYC/3.08 65RFE/3.55 MYC, 6 speed
EPA: 15 city/17 C16/22H 13-19 16 city - 22
highway Hwy
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 35/125 90-150 40-180
(number/days):
2 |E85 POLICE 1/2 TON CREW CAB 1 |EA|$ 30,598.00( $ 33,770.00 N/A $ 30,390.00
4X4 4 DOOR SSV PICKUP TRUCK
Engine: 5.0L V8 L83-5.3L 5.3L
Ecotec3 FHS
Transmission No. /Gear Ratio No.: 3.31/XL3 MYC/3.08 MYC, 6 speed
Make: Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet
Model: F150 Silverado Silverado
GVWR: 7050 7200 7200
Series Code, Trim Level: W1E, 101A, |[1500-CK15543{ 1500,
SSV Base LS CK15543, WT
EPA: 15 city/17 C16/22H 16 city - 22
highway Hwy
Delivery time after receipt of order 90 35/125 40-180
(number/days):
OPTION BID LIST
3 |Engine (other gas). $ 995.00( $  (467.00) N/A NA
LV3
Specify Engine Size: 3.5L Ecoboost| 4.3L Ecotec
V6
4 | Engine (other diesel), including block heater, N/a NA N/A NA
factory or dealer
Specify Engine Size:
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

4819 OF

Opening Date: 10/03/14

Statewide
‘“gt) 2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton Anderson Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE Sid Dillon
,5 Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle Ford Group, Inc DODGE Chev Buick
(SSV) Pickup Truck
Description [QTY]| UO |  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
5 |40-20-40 with driver power controlled seat if N/a $ 354.00 STD. $ 555.00
available from
6 [Factory center seat / console between individual N/A NA N/A NA
front seats deleted (Deduct).
7 |Heavy Duty Vinyl floor covering (Deduct). N/A NA STD. NA
8 |Floor carpet w/front and rear mats. N/A $127.00 $ 94.00 $ 390.00
CARPET
9 |Electronic compass/temp display. $ 49500 $ 497.00 STD. NA
Dealer
10 |Heavy duty highest output alternator from STd $ 557.00 STD. NA
standard equipment. Dealer
Bidder state amps: 240 AMP 220
11 |Sliding rear-vision window (Dealer installation $ 295.00( $ 798.00 NO BID NA
acceptable)
12 |Second Power Outlet. STd. Std STD. STD
13 |Increased pickup box length of approximately 8 N/a $ 399.00 N/A NA
feet with corresponding wheelbase. 6.5'Bx WB =
153
State Dimension of Box Bid: " 78.81/64.6/
Length, " Width, " Width between 51.03
wheel wells.
14 |Trailer towing package (deduct). $ (150.00)| $ (247.00) STD. $ (295.00)
15 |Cargo light. $ 99.00| $ 109.00 STD. $ 95.00
16 |Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No STD. See NC - See SEE ATTACHED| see attached
Additional Cost Paints. Attch. attached
17 |Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra N/C - See $ 397.00 | SEE ATTACHED N/A
Cost Paints. Attch. See Attached
18 |Additional fully functional key that enters and $ 75.00| $ 67.00( $ 60.00| $ 52.00
operates the vehicle.
19 |Additional remote fob. If equipped with remote $ 150.00| $ 159.00 4-STD $ 83.00
keyless entry.
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Opening Date: 10/03/14

Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4819 OF
Statewide
‘“gt) 2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton Anderson Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE Sid Dillon
,5 Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle Ford Group, Inc DODGE Chev Buick
(SSV) Pickup Truck
Description [QTY]| UO |  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
20 [Non-standard gear ratio(s). $ 300.00] $ 110.00 | $ 43.00| $ 190.00
GU6
Indicate: 3.73 3.92 3.42
21 |Four Wheel Drive Model (deduct). $ (2549.00)| $ (1,097.00) STD. NA
22 |Two Wheel Drive Model. included in CC15543 LS N/A $ (1,492.00)
#21
23 |On/Off road mud and snow all terrain tires and $ 300.00| $ 397.00 $ 213.00 $370
spare (can be steel rim). Tire size must meet the P265/70R-17 N/A W/3.92
minimum wheel size bid on this specification. $574.00
LT265/70R-
17C
State size and ply rating: CT245/70R17| P265/70R17 265/70R17E P265/70R17
4dply / OWL O/O ROAD
LT265/70R-17
6ply
24 |Integrated brake controller system, dealer Std $ 276.00 INC. IN BID $340
installed if not standard
25 |Rearview camera - factory installed. $ 295.00| $ 597.00 | $ 298.00 $845
26 |Rearview camera - dealer installed. N/a $ 597.00 NO BID NA
27 |Tailgate step - dealer installed. $ 375.00 Std NO BID NA
factory
28 |Trailer sway control system if not standard. STd Std STD. STD
29 |Keyless-Remote Entry Shall include 3 fully STd $ 67.00 STD. $ 372.00
functional keys and 2 fobs to enter and operate
the vehicle.
30 |Factory bed liner for vehicle box. $ 450.00 $ 575.00 STD. $ 425.00
spray-in
31 |Reverse sensing alarm system. Dealer installation| $ 250.00( $ 599.00 N/A NA
is acceptable if not available from the
manufacturer.
32 |Deduct for smaller tank size. N/A NA $ (64.00) NA
Specify size: 26
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4819 OF Opening Date: 10/03/14
Statewide
‘“gt) 2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton Anderson Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE Sid Dillon
,5 Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle Ford Group, Inc DODGE Chev Buick
(SSV) Pickup Truck
Description [QTY]| UO |  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
33 |Towing package upgrade: Specify equipment, $ 795.00 NA N/A NA
hitch class and maximum trailer weight. upgraded
bumper & rear
stabilizer - Aux
Transmission
oil cooler
34 |Front end attached towing hooks if not standard STd - 4X4 $ 99.00 INC. IN BID $ 85.00
from factory.
35 |Service repair manual - equipment and engine. N/a $ 499.00 N/A $ 395.00
36 |CD ROM service repair manual - equipmentand | $ 295.00( $ 899.00 N/A NA
engine. When available
37 |Parts manual - equipment and engine. N/a NA N/A NA
38 |CD ROM parts manual - equipment and engine. N/a $ 399.00 N/A NA
39 |Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.| $ 2,995.00 NC NO BID (call for
State Years: Miles: 5 100,000 (5 100,000 mile options)
Ford Premium Power train
Care
40 |Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. | $ 295.00] $ 500.00| $ 400.00( $ 400.00
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop
shipment outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment
charges would be for vehicles bought by political
entities and other Divisions of Government.
41 |Protective vinyl body molding: dealer installed if $ 295.00] $ 309.00 NO BID $ 350.00
not standard
42 |Lumbar support front seats: if not standard STD-Driver Std STD. STD Drivers
equipment.
LAW ENFORCEMENT ONLY
43 |Factory or dealer disconnect of daylight running N/C $ (327.00) NOT BID NA
lights if factory equipped (Deduct)
44 |Disconnect of factory dome light or courtesy $ 99.00( $ 217.00( $ 25.00| $ 240.00
lamps.
45 |Alternator with highest output available. STD $ 399.00 STD. NA
Indicate Amps: 240 AMP 220 Dealer 220
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

4819 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 10/03/14

Line #

2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton
Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle
(SSV) Pickup Truck

Anderson
Ford

Husker Auto
Group, Inc

PERFORMANCE
DODGE

Sid Dillon
Chev Buick

Description [QTY] UO

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

100 WATT siren speaker installed on plate of
push bumper,centered, with specific mounting
bracket. Leads tagged as such that terminate in
or near the passenger compartment (Deduct).

$  (150.00)

$  (199.00)

$ (342.00)

$  (199.00)

47

Setina PB400 Push bumper with installation on
front of vehicle (Deduct).

$  (289.00)

$  (409.00)

$ (324.00)

$  (450.00)

48

Bluetooth: Hands free wireless network to make
and receive phone calls enabled by a push button
or voice command.

$ 295.00

$ 177.00

NO BID

$ 290.00

49

Auxiliary Battery (Dual Purpose AGM Battery) with
dual battery Separator for accessory equipment.
Installation also to include battery tray and
bracket, heavy duty fuse, 1 gauge or larger cable
(Deduct).

$  (425.00)

$  (635.00)

$ (1,055.00)

$  (535.00)

Indicate CCA:

750

750

750

50

Dome Light or Courtesy lamp: To be centered not
more than approximately 20" from the top of the
windshield to light the drivers area. Controlled by
rotating headlamp switch to maximum position or
by a separate switch. This may require adding an
additional light. Dealer installation is acceptable if
not available from the factory (Deduct).

$ (50.00)

$ (69.00)

STD.

$ (90.00)

51

Vertical mounted two (2) Clear/White LED
Modules mounted at a 45 degree angle to front of
vehicle on push bumper. Black bezel with clear
lenses. Shock and water resistant. Leads tagged
as such that terminate in the center console area.
LED's meet SAE J845, Class 1 specifications.
Minimum of three (3) LED in each module
(Deduct).

$  (109.00)

$  (124.00)

$ (287.00)

$  (124.00)
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland

4819 OF

Opening Date: 10/03/14

Award which may be awarded to the next lowest responsible
bidder of a different model meeting specifications.
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Statewide
‘“gt) 2015 or Current Production Year Police 1/2 Ton Anderson Husker Auto | PERFORMANCE Sid Dillon
,5 Crew Cab 4X4 4 Door Special Service Vehicle Ford Group, Inc DODGE Chev Buick
(SSV) Pickup Truck

Description [QTY]| UO |  Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
52 [Two (2) Clear/White LED Modules: Mounted on | $ (109.00)| $ (144.00)| $ (330.00)| $ (144.00)

either side of rear license plate on a license plate

bracket for Two (2) light heads. Black Bezel with

clear lenses. Shock and water resistant. Leads

tagged as such that terminate in center console

area. LED's meet SAE J845, Class 1

specifications. Minimum of three (3) LED in each

module (Deduct)
53 [Spotlamp: To be mounted on left side A pillar $ (175.00)| $ (299.00) NOT BID $ (290.00)

(Deduct).

54 |Locking Tailgate. STd Std N/A $ 120.00
Payment Terms 0 30 0 15 -0- 0 30
Delivery Days ARO 90 35/125 40-180
Comments

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles No Bid
may consist of a Primary Award, which is awarded to the lowest
responsible bidder meeting specifications, and a Secondary Sid Dillon Ford



