
Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $    24,327.00  $    28,647.00 $23,782.00  $    28,492.00  $    23,730.00  $    24,330.00 

Ford RAM Chevrolet DODGE Chevrolet Ford

Transit ProMaster Express PROMASTER 

CV
Express Transit 

9500 11,500 9600 9350 9600 9500

W2Z, 101A 

Van

VF3L16 3500-CG33405-

Base Cargo WT
3500 'VF3L16' 3500,CG33405,

1WT
W2Z, 101A,

3.7L V6 3.6L V6 L20-4.8L 

Vortec V8

3.6L V-6 4.8L 3.7L

N/a N/A TBD NA@This 

Time

N/A NA NA

90-120 90/120 35/125 90-120 40-90 60-180

 $    24,327.00  $    28,647.00  $    24,777.00  N/A  $    23,730.00  $    24,330.00 

3.7L V6 3.6L V6 L96 6.0L 

Vortec E85

6.0L 3.7L

Ford RAM Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford 

Transit ProMaster Express Express Transit 

9500 11,500 9600 9600 9500

W2Z, 101A, 

Van

VF3L16 3500-CG33405-

Base Cargo WT

3500,CG33405,

1WT
W2Z, 101A

N/A N/A TBD NA@This 

Time

NA NA

90-120 90/120 35/125 40-90 60-180

 $    36,777.00 N/A  $    35,277.00 N/A $  33,764.00

12GGE

$  34,864.00

21GGE

 $    34,230.00 

3.7L V6 LC8 6.0L 

Vortech 

Gaseous

6.0L 3.7L

Ford Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford

3 1

Series, Code, Trim Level:

Model:

2

EACNG ONE TON FULL SIZE CARGO VAN

Engine:

Make:

Make:

Model:

GVWR:

GVWR:

Series, Code, Trim Level:

E85 ONE TON FULL SIZE CARGO VAN

Engine:

Make:

1 EA

L
in

e
 #

Engine:

EPA:

Delivery time after receipt or order (number/days):

2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

1 ONE TON FULLSIZE CARGO VAN

EPA:

Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):

1 EA
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

Transit Express Express Transit 

3 1

Model:

EA
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

9500 9600 9600 9500

W2Z, 101A 

Van

3500-CG33405-

Base Cargo WT

3500,CG33405,

1WT
W2Z, 101A

N/A TBD NA@This 

Time

NA NA

90-120 35/125 40-90 60-180

 $      1,865.00  $    1,095.00

L96 

 N/A  $      1,350.00  $      1,955.00 

 3.5L Ecoboost  6.0L Vortec  6.0L  3.5L Ecoboost 

 N/A  $     5,500.00

ADD 

 NA  $      4,230.00

BLOCK 

HEATER N/A 

 NA  N/A 

 3.0L Eco 

Diesel 

 3.0 I4 TURBO 

DIESEL  

(DIESEL 

ENGINE PRE-

HEAT) 

 $   995.00

Medium Roof 

100.8" 

 NA  N/A  NA  NA 

 $      1,062.00 

 $   1,050.00

LWB-148"-

Sliding Side 

pass-cargo door 

 155" WB  NO BID  $     1,150.00

155 wb 

 NA 

 Sliding Side 

pass-Rear cargo 

Door 

 60-40 or sliding 

on Curb Side 

8  Std  N/APP  $           57.00  STD  $           40.00  N/A 

OPTION BID LIST

3 1

Additional roof height.  List additonal roof heights and pricing 

in Notes section.

Roof height:

6

Additional cargo length.  List additional lengths, pricing and 

door options in Notes section.

Length:

7

Side and rear door option:

GVWR:

Series, Code, Trim Level:

EPA:

Delivery time after receipt of order (number/days):

Engine (other gas).

Specify Engine Size:

EA

5 Engine Diesel (with block heater).

Specify Engine Size:

Engine console cover.

4
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

9  $         795.00  $         650.00  $         197.00  INC. IN BID  $         177.00  $         433.00 

10  N/A  $         550.00  NA  $    587.00

W/GLASS

 $   467.00

W/O GLASS 

 NA  $      1,704.00 

11  N/A  N/A  NA  N/A  NA  NA 

12  N/A  STD  $   (60.00)

loose-side glass 

also 

 $       (209.00)  NA   $  (79.00)

deducts side 

glass also 

13  $         495.00  N/A  $         378.00  NO BID  $      1,466.00  $         390.00 

14  N/A  N/APP  $         (79.00)  N/A  $       (111.00)  $       (140.00)

15  $         995.00  $      7,430.00  $      1,032.00  N/A  NA  NA 

16  $         495.00  N/A  $     339.00

Driver Only 

 N/A  $  334.00

Drivers Side 

 $   735.00

Drivers 

17  STD-

See attch 

 N/C  NC 

See attached 

 SEE 

ATTACHED 

 see attached  see attached 

18  N/C-

See attch 

 N/C  $     397.00

See attached 

 SEE 

ATTACHED 

 see attached  see attached 

19  N/A  N/A  NA  N/A  NA  NA 

20  STd  $           75.00  $         179.00  $           31.00  NA  NA 

21  N/A  N/APP  NA  STD  NA $0.00 

22  N/a  N/APP  NA  STD  NA $0.00 

23  $         495.00  $         425.00  $         997.00  N/A  $         785.00  $         777.00 

24  $         395.00  N/A  $         499.00  N/A  NA  NA 

25  Std  SEE BID  $         197.00  NO BID  In bid  In bid 

26  $         175.00  $    26,483.00  Std  NO BID  $       (208.00)  see option 

#12 

27  N/C  N/APP  $         (37.00)  N/A  $         127.00  $         (93.00)

28  Std  $         150.00  $         209.00  STD  $         245.00  $         248.00 

No glass right side 60/40 swing doors (deduct).

Cargo type with only driver and front passenger seats with 

glass only in windshield, driver and passenger doors.

Cargo type with driver and front passenger seats and glass as 

described in specifications.

Power electric door locks (deduct).

Power electric windows (deduct).

Full crash screen.

Keyless Remote Entry - shall include two (2) fully functional 

keys and fobs to enter and operate the vehicle. 

Protective safety cage behind driver's seat.

No glass rear doors ( deduct).

Passenger van window package.

Deduction of deep tint glass back to standard tinted 

safety glass.

Rear heating and air conditioning.

Power electric seats.

Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No Additional Cost 

Paints.

Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost Paints.

All-Wheel Drive (AWD).

Second power outlet in rear of vehicle.

Curb, right, sliding side door.

Driver's left side sliding side door.

60/40 split side door, driver's side.
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

29  STd  STD  Std  STD  STD  STD 

30  $         295.00  $         275.00  $  597.00

Dealer 

 $         223.00  $         350.00  $         353.00 

32  $         295.00  N/A  $         309.00  N/A  $         350.00  NA 

33  $         995.00  N/A  $      1,399.00  N/A  $      1,150.00  NA 

34  $         195.00  $         150.00  $         159.00  $         160.00  $           83.00  $         155.00 

35  STD.-

Driver 

 $         175.00  Std  $         134.00  NA  $     450.00

Drivers 

 $         495.00  $  650.00

Factory 

 $         297.00  $         205.00  $         370.00  $         565.00 

 Ford Factory  Factory  Factory  Factory 

37  $           95.00  Factory  $           67.00  $           60.00  $           52.00  $         155.00 

38  $         175.00  $         185.00  $         188.00  INC. IN BID  $         350.00  $         189.00 

39  $         (25.00)  $   275.00

ADD 

 NC-No 

Lumbar 

 NOT BID $0.00 $0.00 

NA
$   1,062.00

additional length

60/40-std

$197.00 = sliding.

146.20 = Cargo 

length

(Floor to Seat 1)

 $         400.00  $         500.00 

36

Additional roof heights and pricing:

Additional cargo lengths, pricing and side/rear door options:

Lumbar support for front seats: if not standard equipment.

Dealer installed rear window defroster if not standard 

equipment.

Protective vinyl body molding: dealer installed if not standard 

equipment.

31 Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. Additional 

costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment outside the Lincoln 

area.  Drop shipment charges would be for vehicles bought by 

political entities and other Divisions of Government.

 $         400.00 

Insulation/sound reducing package.

Additional fob if equipped with keyless remote entry.

 $         295.00 

Stabilizing/rollover traction system if not standard.

Reverse sensing system if available from manufacturer.

 $         500.00  $         400.00 

Rearview camera-dealer or factory installed.

List installation:

Additional fully functional key that enters and operates the 

vehicle.

Vinyl seats with vinyl trim: heavy-duty foam seats w/lumbar 

support (deduct).
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Buyer: Dianna Gilliland 4816 OF

Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Anderson 

Ford 

 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 

Center 

 Husker Auto 

Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 

DODGE 
 Sid Dillon 

Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 

Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

L
in

e
 # 2015 or Current Production Year

One Ton Full Size Cargo Van

Description

 0-30 0-30  0-15 0 0-30 0-30

 90-120 90/120 35/125 40-120 60-180

Comments:  $ (1,095.00)

3/4 Cargo Van 

135" WB 

Express 

Delivery days ARO:

Payment Terms:

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary 

Award which is awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications, and a 

Secondary Award which may be awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different 

model meeting specifications
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