
Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland  4814 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Secondary 
Award         

E85 Award 

 Primary 
Award       

CNG Award 
 Anderson 

Ford 
 Erdkamp 

Motors, Inc. 
 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 
Center 

 Husker Auto 
Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 
DODGE 

 Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 
Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

 $  21,252.00  $  21,480.00  $  21,886.00  $  20,370.00  $       21,246.00  $  20,630.00  $  21,233.00 

Ford Ram RAM Chevrolet DODGE Chevrolet Ford
Trasit 

Connect
CV 

Tradesman
C/V Cargo 

VAN
City Express RAM MINI CV City Express Transit 

Connect
S7E, 100A, 

Van
RTKE53 RTKE53 Mini-15T60-

Base LT
TRADESMAN 

'RTKE 53'
15T60, LT E7E, 100A, 

XL
2.5L 3.6L V6 3.6L V6 L0A-2.0L 

14 DOHC-4c
3.6L V-6 2.0L 2.5L

21 city/29 
highway

18/26 17/25 TBD 17-25 N/A @ this 
time

21 City-29 
Hwy

120-150 60-120 90/120 35/125 90-120 90-180

E85 MINI CARGO VAN FWD 2 FRONT 
BUCKET SEATS

 N/A  SAA  $  21,886.00  NA  $       21,246.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Engine: 3.6L V6 3.6L V-6
FFV

Make: RAM DODGE
Model: C/V Cargo 

Van
RAM MINI CV

Series Code, Trim Level: RTKE53 TRADESMAN 
'RTKE 53'

EPA: 17/25 12-18
Delivery time after receipt of order 
(number/days):

90/120 90-120

CNG MINI CARGO VAN FWD 2 FRONT 
BUCKET SEATS

 $  33,702.00  n/a  N/A  NA  N/A  No Bid  $  31,300.00
12.5 GGE

$   31,500.00
17 GGE 

Engine: 2.5L 2.5L
Make: Ford Ford

Engine:

Li
ne

 #

Description

1 MINI CARGO VAN FWD 2 FRONT 
BUCKET SEATS
Make:

EA

2015 or Current Production Year Mini Cargo Van Front 
Wheel Drive 2 Front Bucket Seats

Model:

Series, Code, Trim Level:

1

EPA:

Delivery time after receipt of order 
(number/days):

2

3 1 EA

1 EA
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Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland  4814 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Secondary 
Award         

E85 Award 

 Primary 
Award       

CNG Award 
 Anderson 

Ford 
 Erdkamp 

Motors, Inc. 
 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 
Center 

 Husker Auto 
Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 
DODGE 

 Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 
Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Mini Cargo Van Front 
Wheel Drive 2 Front Bucket Seats

Model: Transit 
Connect

Transit 
Connect

GVWR: 5020 5270
Series Code, Trim Level: S7E, 100A, 

Van
E7E, 100A, 

XL
EPA: 21 city/29 

highway
NA

Delivery time after receipt of order 
(number/days):

120-150 90-180

Cargo manual 
liftgate

Liftgate Hatch LIFTGATE Cargo liftgate

$       795.00 n/a N/A NA N/A NA $       895.00 
 1.6L 

Ecoboost 
 1.6L 

Ecoboost 

N/A n/a N/App NA N/A NA NA 

 $   (405.00)
105" 

Wheelbase-
SWB 

 n/a  NA  N/A  NA  NA 

 Side 
Sliding/Rear 

Cargo 

 Sliding Door 
Only 

7  N/a  n/a  N/APP  NA  $           (641.00)  $      (121.00)  $      (128.00)

8  N/a n/a (compact 
standard) 

 N/A  Std  N/A  $       256.00  $       238.00 

Deduction of deep tint glass back to standard tinted 
safety glass.
Full-size spare tire (can be steel rim).

Length:

Side and rear door option:

4
Specify Engine Size:

Additional roof height. List additional roof heights and 
pricing in Notes section.

5

6 Additional cargo length.  List additional lengths, pricing 
and door options in Notes section.

OPTION BID LIST

Engine (other).

Please state type of Rear Door Being Used:

Roof height:
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Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland  4814 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Secondary 
Award         

E85 Award 

 Primary 
Award       

CNG Award 
 Anderson 

Ford 
 Erdkamp 

Motors, Inc. 
 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 
Center 

 Husker Auto 
Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 
DODGE 

 Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 
Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Mini Cargo Van Front 
Wheel Drive 2 Front Bucket Seats

9 N/a $       441.00 $       595.00 NA $            441.00 NA NA 
10  N/a  $     178.00

(incl. line 30) 
 $     300.00
Driver Side 

 NA  $         178.00
(DRIVER) 

 NA  NA 

11  STD-See 
Attch 

 standard  N/C  NC -
See attached 

 SEE 
ATTACHED 

 see attached  see attached 

12  N/C-See 
Attch 

 n/a  N/C  NA  SEE 
ATTACHED 

 NA @ this 
time 

 see attached 

13 N/a n/a N/A NA N/A NA NA 
14 Std standard $         75.00  $       259.00 STD NA NA 
15 $       495.00 No Bid $       550.00  $    1,199.00 N/A $       775.00 $       639.00 
16 $       395.00 No Bid N/A  $       707.00 N/A NA NA 
17 N/a n/a N/A  $       499.00 N/A NA NA 
18  $       295.00  n/a  $       135.00  $    899.00

When 
available 

 N/A  NA  $       297.00 

19  N/a  n/a  See 
Attached 

 NA  N/A  NA  NA 

20  N/a  n/a  See 
Attached 

 $       399.00  N/A  NA  NA 

21 $       895.00 n/a N/A  $    1,399.00 N/A NA NA 
$    2,995.00 n/a $    2,840.00 NC NO BID 
 5  100,000

Ford 
Premium 

Care 

 5   100,000
$100 

Deductible 

 5   100,000
Power Train 

23 $       695.00 No Bid N/A  $    1,199.00 N/A NA NA 
24 $       295.00 n/a N/A Std N/A $       290.00 $       353.00 
25  $       495.00  $   1326.00

(factory) 
 $       908.00  $   1139.00

Requires 
CWN Pkg 

 N/A  $       945.00  NA 

Full crash screen with center opening.
Reverse sensing system if available from factory.

Parts manual - equipment and engine.

Rearview camera- dealer or factory installed.

Power electric seats.

Additional costs for warranties from manufacturer.
State: YEARS __________ MILES __________

 (call for 
options) 

 (call for 
options) 

Standard Paint - Attach List and Identify as No 
Additional Cost Paints.

Extra Cost Paint- Attach List and Identify as Extra Cost 
Paints.

CD ROM service repair manual - equipment and 
engine.

Service and repair manual - equipment and engine.

All-Wheel Drive (AWD).

Rear heating and air conditioning.

Full crash screen.
Second Power Outlet in rear of vehicle.

Protective safety cage behind driver's seat.

Insulation/sound reducing package.
22

CD ROM parts manual - equipment and engine.
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Buyer:  Dianna Gilliland  4814 OF
Statewide

Opening Date: 9/29/14

 Secondary 
Award         

E85 Award 

 Primary 
Award       

CNG Award 
 Anderson 

Ford 
 Erdkamp 

Motors, Inc. 
 Gene Steffy 

Chrysler 
Center 

 Husker Auto 
Group, Inc. 

 PERFORMANCE 
DODGE 

 Sid Dillon 
Chev Buick 

 Sid Dillon 
Ford 

QTY UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price  Unit Price 

Li
ne

 #

Description

2015 or Current Production Year Mini Cargo Van Front 
Wheel Drive 2 Front Bucket Seats

26  Std  standard  $       300.00  Std  STD  $       180.00  $       248.00 

27  $       295.00  $       500.00  $       500.00  $       500.00  $            400.00  $       400.00  $       400.00 

28  $       195.00  $       230.00  $       150.00  $       159.00  $            160.00  Price NA @ 
this time 

 $       155.00 

29  $       295.00  n/a  $       500.00  $       309.00  NO BID  $       300.00  NA 

30  STD-Driver  $     178.00
(incl. line 10) 

 $     375.00
per seat 

 Std  N/A  STD
Drivers 

 NA 

31  $        (25.00)  n/a  N/A  NA  N/A  NA $               -   

32  $         95.00  $       230.00  $       150.00  $         67.00  $              60.00  Price NA @ 
this time 

 $       155.00 

N/A NA N/A 
NA N/A 

0  30 0   30 0   15 0 0   30 0   30
90-120 90/120 35/125 40-180 40-120

Additional cargo lengths, pricing and side/rear door options:

Vinyl seats with vinyl trim: heavy-duty foam seats 
w/lumbar support (deduct).
Additional fully functional key that enters and operates 
the vehicle.

Lumbar support for front seats: if not standard 
equipment.

Additional fob if equipped with keyless remote entry.

Protective vinyl body molding: dealer installed if not 
standard equipment.

Delivery days ARO:
Payment Terms:

Keyless Remote Entry - Shall include two (2) fully 
functional keys and fobs to enter and operate the 
vehicle.
Drop shipment charges outside the Lincoln area. 
Additional costs of charges for vehicle drop shipment 
outside the Lincoln area. Drop shipment charges would 
be for vehicles bought by political entities and other 
Divisions of Government.

Comments:

Additional Roof heights and pricing:

Due to the build out dates and estimated contract usage, vehicles may consist of a Primary Award which is 
awarded to the lowest responsible bidder meeting specifications, and a Secondary Award which may be 
awarded to the next lowest responsible bidder of a different model meeting specifications.

Invalid Bids 
Husker Auto Group, Inc. and Sid Dillon Chevy Buick - Do not meet specifications for 1.C. Insulation.
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