
Buyer: Christie Kelly 4749 OF

Department of Roads
Opening Date:  07/24/14

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 PATCHING D-1 SUPERIOR ST LINC 310 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    $          141.00  $     43,710.00  $          110.00  $     34,100.00 

2 PATCHING D-1 DAVID CITY 310 TN  $          119.50  $      37,045.00  $                  -    $          146.00  $     45,260.00  $          117.00  $     36,270.00 

3 PATCHING D-1 FAIRBURY 315 TN  $          129.50  $      40,792.50  $                  -    $          153.50  $     48,352.50  $          120.00  $     37,800.00 

4 PATCHING D-1 FALLS CITY 310 TN  $          125.50  $      38,905.00  $                  -    $          158.00  $     48,980.00  $          125.00  $     38,750.00 

5 PATCHING D-1 PAWNEE CITY 310 TN  $          122.83  $      38,077.30  $                  -    $          153.50  $     47,585.00  $          120.50  $     37,355.00 

6 PATCHING D-3 ALBION 245 TN  $          129.23  $      31,661.35  $                  -    $          169.00  $     41,405.00  $          130.00  $     31,850.00 

7 PATCHING D-3 BLOOMFIELD 320 TN  $          131.50  $      42,080.00  $          164.50  $     52,640.00  $          183.00  $     58,560.00  $          136.50  $     43,680.00 

8 PATCHING D-3 HARTINGTON 335 TN  $          130.43  $      43,694.05  $          157.70  $     52,829.50  $          176.00  $     58,960.00  $          133.50  $     44,722.50 

9 PATCHING D-3 LAUREL 305 TN  $          127.77  $      38,969.85  $          152.60  $     46,543.00  $          170.00  $     51,850.00  $          130.50  $     39,802.50 

10 PATCHING D-3 NIOBRARA 320 TN  $          136.83  $      43,785.60  $          177.15  $     56,688.00  $          190.00  $     60,800.00  $          142.00  $     45,440.00 

11 PATCHING D-3 S SIOUX CITY 330 TN  $          124.57  $      41,108.10  $          141.80  $     46,794.00  $          157.00  $     51,810.00  $          128.00  $     42,240.00 

12 PATCHING D-3 WAYNE 335 TN  $          125.77  $      42,132.95  $          154.30  $     51,690.50  $          161.00  $     53,935.00  $          128.00  $     42,880.00 

13 PATCHING D-4 GENEVA 315 TN  $          129.50  $      40,792.50  $                  -    No Bid  $                  -    $          121.00  $     38,115.00 

14 PATCHING D-4 HASTINGS 200 TN  $          132.97  $      26,594.00  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          124.50  $     24,900.00 

15 PATCHING D-4 ORD 30 TN  $          134.83  $        4,044.90  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          134.00  $       4,020.00 

16 PATCHING D-4 RED CLOUD 270 TN  $          137.37  $      37,089.90  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          135.00  $     36,450.00 

17 PATCHING D-4 ST PAUL 30 TN  $          129.50  $        3,885.00  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          127.00  $       3,810.00 

18 PATCHING D-4 SUPERIOR 300 TN  $          134.97  $      40,491.00  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          132.00  $     39,600.00 

19 PATCHING D-5 CHADRON 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    "  $                  -    $          186.00  $       5,580.00 

20 PATCHING D-5 GERING 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    "  $                  -    $          181.00  $       5,430.00 

21 PATCHING D-5 SIDNEY 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    "  $                  -    $          169.00  $       5,070.00 

22 PATCHING D-6 BROKEN BOW 30 TN  $          141.37  $        4,241.10  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          142.00  $       4,260.00 

23 PATCHING D-6 LEXINGTON 30 TN  $          140.97  $        4,229.10  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          156.00  $       4,680.00 

24 PATCHING D-6 MULLEN 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    No Bid  $                  -    $          162.00  $       4,860.00 

25 PATCHING D-6 NORTH PLATTE 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    "  $                  -    $          146.50  $       4,395.00 

26 PATCHING D-6 OGALLALA 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    "  $                  -    $          156.50  $       4,695.00 

27 PATCHING D-8 AINSWORTH 30 TN  $          145.23  $        4,356.90  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          165.00  $       4,950.00 

PATCHING D-8 O'NEILL 30 TN  $          136.43  $        4,092.90  $                  -    "  $                  -    $          142.00  $       4,260.00 

LINCOLN PLANT PICK-UP 300 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    No Bid  $                  -    $          107.50  $     32,250.00 

OMAHA PLANT PICK-UP 120 TN  $          111.50  $      13,380.00  $                  -    $          108.00  $     12,960.00  No Bid  $                  -   

Flinn Paving Co. Inc.

Brand Name of Material Bidding (Lines 1-28):
28

Plant Address:

Brand Name of Material Bidding:

Pavers Inc
Oldcastle Materials Midwest Co. 

d/b/a Omni Engineering
Knife River Midwest LLC

 UPM 

L
in

e
 # Bituminous Cold Patch Material

30

29

Plant Address:

Brand Name of Material Bidding:

 6506 Grover St 

 QPR and SMP when approved 

 UPM 

 12303 Hwy 6 Waverly NE 

68462 

 UPM  QPR and SMP when approved 

 2991 G Street, Omaha 
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Buyer: Christie Kelly 4749 OF

Department of Roads
Opening Date:  07/24/14

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

Flinn Paving Co. Inc. Pavers Inc
Oldcastle Materials Midwest Co. 

d/b/a Omni Engineering
Knife River Midwest LLC

L
in

e
 # Bituminous Cold Patch Material

S SIOUX CITY PLANT PICK-UP 90 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $          137.50  $     12,375.00  No Bid  $                  -    No Bid  $                  -   

NORTH PLATTE PLANT PICK-UP 30 TN  No Bid  $                   -    $                  -    No Bid  $                  -    No Bid  $                  -   

 $       2,878.07  $    621,449.00  $       1,085.55  $   319,560.00  $       2,066.00  $   624,167.50  $       4,008.00  $   702,215.00 

20

0   30

30

Comments

Delivery Days ARO

Payment Terms

We acknowledge receipt of 

addendums one and two.

required

Net   30 0

Total

32

Plant Address:

Brand Name of Material Bidding:

31  Sioux City, Iowa 

 Unique Paving Materials 

Plant Address:

Brand Name of Material Bidding:
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