Buyer: Annette Walton 4628 OF Opening Date: 02/25/14
Nebraska State Patrol

AWARD

Holsters and Weapons Lights Alamar Uniforms CLYDE ARMORY INC JACIE(SQLLJ‘:E:\EI(E)I\T'IMS & US CAVALRY

Description Qty |UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
Safariland
Standard 6360
Holster - High
Gloss Finish 6360-
3832-910BL -
Right Hand
Safariland
Standard 6360
Holster - High
Gloss Finish 6360-
3832-900BL - Left
Hand
Safariland STX
6360 Holster -
High Gloss Finish
6360-3832-
4910BL - Right
Hand
Safariland STX
6360 Holster -
High Gloss Finish
6360-3832-
4920BL - Left
Hand
Safariland STX
6360 Holster -

5 gggg?gég'zr_“h 150| EA | $ 93.78| $  14,067.00 No Bid $ 86.52| $ 12,978.00| $ 112.62| $  16,893.00
1310BL - Right
Hand
Safariland STX
6360 Holster -
g |actical Finish 50| EA | $ 93.78| $  4,689.00 No Bid $ 86.52| $  4,326.00| $ 11262 $  5,631.00
6360-3832-
1320BL - Left
Hand
Streamlight TLR-1
7 |HL Tactical 550 EA | $ 118.16| $ 64,988.00| $ 108.87| $ 59,878.50| $ 102.78| $ 56,529.00| $ 112.62| $ 61,941.00
Weapon Light
Payment Terms Net 30 0 30 Net 30 0 N30
Delivery Days ARO 30-45 45 30-45 60

7. #69260
CLYDE ARMORY INC

Line #

500| ea | $ 127.05($ 63,525.00 No Bid $ 117.23| $ 58,615.00| $ 151.84( $  75,920.00

50(ea $ 127.05| $ 6,352.50 No Bid $ 117.23| $ 5,861.50 | $ 151.84| $ 7,592.00

500|EA $ 93.78| $  46,890.00 No Bid $ 86.52| $ 43,260.00| $ 112.62| $ 56,310.00

50|EA $ 93.78| $ 4,689.00 No Bid $ 86.52| $ 4,326.00( $ 112.62| $ 5,631.00
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