
RFP 4422 Z1 Cost Evaluation

Optiona A ~ 101 LBS & UP

Location

 Estimated 

Annual 

Usage 

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

AUBURN 230             0.1195$      27.49$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          23.00$              0.15$          34.50$               0.16$          36.80$               

AURORA 139             0.1195$      16.61$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          13.90$              0.13$          18.07$               0.16$          22.24$               

BEATRICE 35,691        0.1195$      4,265.07$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          3,569.10$         0.13$          4,639.83$         0.16$          5,710.56$         

BELLEVUE 6,174          0.0395$      243.87$          No Bid No Bid 0.10$          617.40$             0.08$          493.92$             0.06$          370.44$             

BLAIR 304             0.1195$      36.33$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          30.40$               0.10$          30.40$               0.06$          18.24$              

BROKEN BOW 3,825          0.1195$      457.09$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          382.50$            0.15$          573.75$             0.16$          612.00$             

CENTRAL CITY 155             0.1195$      18.52$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          15.50$              0.13$          20.15$               0.16$          24.80$               

COLUMBUS 5,641          0.1195$      674.10$           0.17$          958.97$         0.10$          564.10$            0.14$          789.74$             0.16$          902.56$             

CRETE 191             0.1195$      22.82$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          19.10$              0.15$          28.65$               0.16$          30.56$               

DAKOTA CITY 2,710          0.1195$      323.85$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          271.00$            0.15$          406.50$             0.16$          433.60$             

DAVID CITY 156             0.1195$      18.64$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          15.60$              0.15$          23.40$               0.16$          24.96$               

FAIRBURY 1,393          0.1195$      166.46$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          139.30$            0.15$          208.95$             0.16$          222.88$             

FALL CITY 1,043          0.1195$      124.64$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          104.30$            0.15$          156.45$             0.16$          166.88$             

FREMONT 14,271        0.1195$      1,705.38$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          1,427.10$         0.14$          1,997.94$         0.16$          2,283.36$         

GENEVA -              0.1195$      -$                 No Bid No Bid 0.10$          -$                  0.16$          -$                   0.16$          -$                   

GRAND ISLAND 21,556        0.1195$      2,575.94$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          2,155.60$         0.13$          2,802.28$         0.10$          2,155.60$         

HASTINGS 9,418          0.1195$      1,125.45$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          941.80$            0.13$          1,224.34$         0.16$          1,506.88$         

HEBRON 386             0.1195$      46.13$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          38.60$              0.16$          61.76$               0.16$          61.76$               

HOLDREDGE 774             0.1195$      92.49$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          77.40$              0.16$          123.84$             0.16$          123.84$             

KEARNEY 7,101          0.1195$      848.57$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          710.10$            0.13$          923.13$             0.16$          1,136.16$         

LEXINGTON 528             0.1195$      63.10$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          52.80$              0.13$          68.64$               0.16$          84.48$               

LINCOLN 488,469      0.0395$      19,294.53$     No Bid No Bid 0.07$          34,192.83$       0.08$          39,077.52$       0.06$          29,308.14$       

MADISON 456             0.1195$      54.49$             0.12$          54.72$           0.10$          45.60$              0.15$          68.40$               0.16$          72.96$               

MC COOK 236             0.1195$      28.20$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          23.60$              0.15$          35.40$               0.16$          37.76$               

NEBRASKA CITY 2,868          0.1195$      342.73$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          286.80$            0.15$          430.20$             0.16$          458.88$             

NORFOLK 30,995        0.1195$      3,703.90$       0.12$          3,719.40$      0.10$          3,099.50$         0.15$          4,649.25$         0.16$          4,959.20$         

NORTH PLATTE 885             0.1195$      105.76$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          88.50$              0.13$          115.05$             0.16$          141.60$             

OMAHA 131,582      0.0395$      5,197.49$       No Bid No Bid 0.07$          9,210.74$         0.08$          10,526.56$       0.06$          7,894.92$         

ORD 98                0.1195$      11.71$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          9.80$                0.15$          14.70$               0.16$          15.68$               

PENDER 1,123          0.1195$      134.20$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          112.30$            0.15$          168.45$             0.16$          179.68$             

PIERCE 308             0.1195$      36.81$             0.17$          52.36$           0.10$          30.80$              0.15$          46.20$               0.16$          49.28$               

PLATTSMOUTH -              0.1195$      -$                 No Bid No Bid 0.10$          -$                  0.14$          -$                   0.16$          -$                   

SEWARD 1,348          0.1195$      161.09$           No Bid No Bid 0.10$          134.80$            0.14$          188.72$             0.16$          215.68$             

TECUMSEH 14,948        0.1195$      1,786.29$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          1,494.80$         0.14$          2,092.72$         0.14$          2,092.72$         

TEKAMAH -              0.1195$      -$                 No Bid No Bid 0.10$          -$                  0.15$          -$                   0.16$          -$                   

WAHOO 592             0.1195$      70.74$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          59.20$              0.15$          88.80$               0.16$          94.72$               

WAYNE 95                0.1195$      11.35$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          9.50$                0.15$          14.25$               0.16$          15.20$               

WEST POINT 108             0.1195$      12.91$             No Bid No Bid 0.10$          10.80$              0.15$          16.20$               0.16$          17.28$               

WILBER -              0.1195$      -$                 No Bid No Bid 0.10$          -$                  0.15$          -$                   0.16$          -$                   

YORK 23,866        0.1195$      2,851.99$       No Bid No Bid 0.10$          2,386.60$         0.14$          3,341.24$         0.16$          3,818.56$         

Total all lines 46,656.73$     N/A 62,364.77$       75,499.90$       65,300.86$       

Additional Locations

None Specified -              0.1195$      N/A N/A 0.15$          N/A

Outside Lincoln & Omaha -              N/A N/A 0.10$          N/A 0.16$          

Lincoln -              N/A N/A 0.07$          N/A 0.06$          

Omaha -              N/A N/A 0.07$          N/A 0.06$          

Optiona B ~ 101 LBS & UP

All Locations Statewide 809,663      0.10$          80,966.30$       

Department of Revenue Annual Document Shredding Project

Lincoln 90,000        0.0395$      3,555.00$       0.07$          6,300.00$         0.06$          5,400.00$         0.08$          7,200.00$         

Miscellaneous Shredding

Material - VHS tapes, ID 

Cards, CD's, Plastic Cards -              0.5000$      N/A N/A N/A 0.50$          

Microfilm, fiche, VHS tapes -              N/A N/A 0.45$          N/A N/A

Other Materials & Clothing -              N/A N/A N/A 0.50$          N/A
Laptops each -              N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Hard drives, Cell Phones, 

Cameras - per hard drive -              N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Card Board (boxes) & Shrink-

wrap -              N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Minimum -              50# N/A 75# 500# 50#

Invalid Bid:  Security Shredding Services

AWARD

 Shredding Solutions, Inc 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

 DataShield 
 John's Disposal Inc / 

Safeside Shredding 
 Paper Tiger Shredding, Inc. 

 Recycling Enterprises of NE, 

Inc. 


